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RESOURCE REPORT 1 - GENERAL PROJECT DESCRIPTION 

1.0 INTRODUCTION 

Dominion Transmission, Inc. (DTI) is proposing to design, construct, operate and 
maintain certain pipeline, storage and related facilities in order to provide incremental 
firm transportation and storage service on the DTI system. These pipeline and storage 
facilities are part of the Cove Point Expansion Project. 

The Cove Point Expansion Project includes an expansion of Dominion Cove Point LNG, 
LP's existing Cove Point LNG Terminal, the Cove Point Pipeline and facilities to expand 
and upgrade DTI's existing pipeline and storage system. The LNG Import Terminal 
expansion will increase the send-out capability by 800 million standard cubic feet per 
day (MMscf/d) and increase storage capacity by approximately 6.8 million dekatherms 
(MMDth). For a more detailed description of the Cove Point Expansion Project, see 
Resource Report 1, Environmental Report, of the Dominion Cove Point LNG Terminal 
Expansion Application. 

DTI proposes to build a 24-inch pipeline (PL-1 EXT2) and two compressor stations in 
central Pennsylvania (PA) to move natural gas from its proposed Perulack StaUon in 
Juniata County to the Dominion South Point Market Center, other interstate pipelines, 
DTrs existing pipeline system, and the Leidy Hub in Clinton County, PA. This project 
includes installing an 81-mile pipeline between the end of DTI's existing PL-t pipeline 
system near Perulack, PA, and its mainline system at Leidy, PA. Over 93 percent of this 
line will parallel an existing Texas Eastern pipeline through Juniata, Mifflin, Huntingdon, 
Centre, and Clinton Counties, PA. Site acquisition for beth compressor stations is 
underway. 

DTI also plans to construct three pipelines in PA and WV that will support the storing of 
natural gas during the injection season as well as delivering gas to the market during 
the withdraw season. The first of these is TL-492 Extension 3. It is an 11-mile, 24-inch 
diameter pipeline loop parallel to DTI's existing TL-342 pipeline in Wetzal County, 
WestVirginla (WV) and Greene County, PA. The second project includes installing a 
12-mile, 24-inch diameter pipeline between DTI's Harrison and Ellisburg Storage 
complexes in Potter County, PA. The third pipeline Indudes a 10-mile, 20-inch diameter 
pipeline between DTI's Sharon Storage Pool and State Line compressor station in 
Potter County, PA. It will parallel DTI's existing LN-257-S pipeline. 

DTI will provide 6 MMDth of annual firm storage service through the utilization of a 
combination of new faciliUes and unsubscribed/tum-back existing storage capacity. DTI 
has proposed to construct and operate the Wolf Run station and to Install two (2) 1,775 
HP gas-fired, reciprocating engine/compressor units, for a total of 3,550 HP as part of 
the Northeast Storage Project, pending in Docket No. CP04-365. As part of this Cove 
Point Expansion Project, DTI proposes to add 3,550 of compression at the Wolf Run 
Compressor Station in Lewis County, West Virginia. If the authorization for the Wolf 
Run Station is granted as requested in the Northeast Storage Project proceeding and in 
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this Application, the Wolf Run Station will have a total capacity of 7,100 HP. DTI also 
proposes to install additional dry bed dehydration equipment to the Quinlan Compressor 
Station in Cattaraugus County, New York. DTI sought authorization to construct and 
operate the Quinlln Compressor Station as part of the proposed Northeast Storage 
Project, pending in Docket No. 04-365. 

DTI also proposes to construct two new compressor stations, the Centre Relay 
Compressor Station and the Perulack Compressor Station, which are explained in a 
separate set of Resource Reports in this Application. The Centre Relay Compressor 
Station will be built in Centre County, PA and have a total of 12,500 HP. The Perulack 
Compressor Station will be built in Juniata County, PA and have a total of 4,735 HP. 

There will be miscellaneous piping changes and other minor facility modifications at 
several existing compressor and meter stations, along with some pipeline upgrades. 
These include additional measurement at DTrs Leidy Compressor Station hub complex 
to measure the increased gas flow. 

The project also includes pipeline upgrades. DTI's existing PL-1 pipeline crosses 
Franklin County, PA. At two locations, the maximum allowable operating pressure 
(MAOP) of PL-1 has been reduced. Since the pipeline was installed, the population 
density increased to the point that action was required per the Department of 
Transportation (DOT) regulations. DTI chose to reduce the maximum operating 
pressure (MOP) in this pipeline segment. This Project requires these pipe sections to 
operate at pressures above the reduced MOP. One of the sections requires replacing, 
and the second section requires retesting. 

Currently, DTl's Leesburg and Chambemburg Compressor Stations are designed to 
pump gas from north to south in the PL-1 pipeline. This Project requires these stations 
to be capable of pumping gas from south to north. This can be accomplished with piping 
changes at each station. Lessburg Station is in Loudoun County, VA, and 
Chambersburg Station is in Franklin County, PA. 

The DTI pipeline facilities, locations, and other Information are provided in the following 
table: 

V 

Dlametm" 
(Jn~ee) r-~my m m ~ ,  Co,my~d ~ 

PL-I EXT2 81 24 Junta. MiffS. Huntingdon. 1.250/1.480 
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The proposed DTI pipeline projects are explained throughout this Environmental Report. 
Compressor stations, metering and regulating stations, block valves, pig launchers, and 
receivers are explained in detail in separate Environmental Reports. All facilities will be 
designed, constructed, operated and maintained pursuant to the following: 

The Federal Energy Regulatory Commission's (Commission's) rules and 
regulations including "Upland Erosion Control, Revegetation, and Maintenance 
Plan" (Appendix l-A), and "Wetland and Waterbody Construction and Mitigation 
Procedures" (Appendix l-B) (the Commission's Plan and Procedures, latest 
versions); and 

DOT's rules and regulations for natural gas pipelines, including the relevant 
sections of 49 Code of Federal Regulations (CFR) 190 through 199. 

These pipeline and storage projects are a key to transporting additional supplies of 
re-gasified LNG to markets throughout the Northern and Eastern U.S 

1.1 P U R P O S E  A N D  N E E D  

Natural gas continues to be the fuel of choice for residential, indusffial and electric 
power ganeratJon because it is efficient, clean and reliable. The Energy Information 
AdministraUon (EIA) expects the growth of natural gas use in the United States to 
continue. However, natural gas production has not kept pace with demand, and gas 
prices reflect the imbalance between supply and demand. The proposed DTI pipeline, 
storage and related facilities are pert of the Cove Point Expansion Project. The purpose 
of the Cove Point Expansion Project is to provide Infrastructure necessary to meet the 
growing demand for natural gas in the U.S. by: (1) providing greater access for supplies 
of imported LNG; and (2) facilitating the deliverability of the re-gasified LNG to markets 
through the expansion and upgrading of downstream pipeline delivery systems, and (3) 
providing enhanced natural gas storage service. For a more detailed explanation of the 
Purpose and Need for the Cove Point Expansion Project, see Resource Report 1, 
Environmental Report, of the Dominion Cove Point LNG Terminal Expansion 
Application. 
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The transportation and storage service has been fully subscribed by Statoil Natural Gas, 
LLC. The services are to be provided for terms of twenty years commencing upon 
placement of the expanded Cove Point LNG Import Terminal facilities in service. 

1.2 PROJECT DESCRIPTION 

Provide a detailed description and location map of the Project facilities 
(380.12(c)(1)). 

1.2.1 PL-1 EXT2 Pipeline Facilities 

The PL-1 EXT2 pipeline will include construction of approximately 81 miles of pipeline. 
No existing facilities will be abandoned as a result of this project, with the exception of 
small segments for tie-Ins at the Leidy Station and existing PL-1 piping. Route 
preference, associated construction areas (i.e., proposed pipeyards and contractor 
yards), access roads, pipeline right-of-way (ROW) cross-sectional drawings, aerial 
photography and nearby towns are shown on the maps submitted concurrently with this 
application in Appendix 1-C, Construction Alignment Sheets. The PL-1 EXT2 pipeline 
location maps are provided on Figures 1.2-1 through 1.2-28. Land requirements 
associated with the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline are provided in Table 1.2-1. This section 
describes the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline, including the pipeline, access roads and non-linear 
associated facilities. 

The PL-1 EXT2 pipeline will consist of 81 miles of 24-inch pipe, starting at the existing 
PL-1 pipeline near the Perulack Facility. Approximately the first 0.25-mile of PL-1 EXT2 
will be 30-inch pipe. The 30-inch pipe will terminate at the new launcher/receiver site 
located adjacent to the fire gates for the proposed Perulack Compressor Station. The 
PL-1 EXT2 pipeline will terminate with a tie-in to existing piping at Leidy Station. Of 
these 81 miles, approximately 75.41 miles will parallel Texas Eastem's pipeline. Where 
the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline parallels the Texas Eastern pipeline, DTI proposes to install the 
PL-1 EXT2 pipeline approximately 30 feet from the Texas Eestem pipeline. This will 
result in the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline sharing 20 feet of permanent ROW with the Texas 
Eastern pipeline. PL-5 will be a new 0.25-mile of 16-Inch pipe, a suction line from 
Texas Eastern to the proposed Perulack Compressor Station. PL-5 will share a 
common ROW with the 30-inch PL-1 EXT2. 

Initial pipeline survey permission was granted by approximately 100 percent of the 
property owners located in the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. The court system was not utilized 
to acquire any survey permission for PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. As a resulL 100 percent 
access was achieved and all of the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline was surveyed. The survey 
consisted of an initial walk over and route flagging; a DTI construction supervisor and a 
surveyor team were Involved In the flagging operation. Once the route flagging was 
completed, a centarllne instrument survey and chain measurement was completed in 
conjunction with an environmental and cultural review of the study corridor. Where the 
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PL-1 EXT2 pipeline parallels the Texas Eastem pipeline, DTI studied a 130-foot wide 
corridor bounded to the Texas Eastam pipeline, and extending 130 feet toward the side 
to be used for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline installation. In the area where the PL-1 EXT2 
pipeline is proposed to be located in new land, DTI studied a 200-foot wide corridor, 
centered on the proposed location of the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. Afler the proposed route 
was finalized, a soil resistivity survey was taken along the proposed ROW to determine 
the cathodic protection current requirements necessary to meet DOT regulation 49 CFR 
192.463. The PL-1 EXT2 pipeline crosses through primarily forested lands and 
agricultural fields. Refer to Table 8.1-5 for land use crossed by proposed pipeline PL-1 
EXT2. The proposed route was selected for many reasons. The proposed route 
parallels an existing gas pipeline corridor for the majority of the project. It minimizes 
impact on both environmental and cultural resources and complies with governmental 
and state agency requests and recommendations. A detailed explanation on 
alternatives is provided in Resource Report 10. 

The PL-1 EXT2 pipeline is proposed to be built using two construction phases. Three 
Horizontal Directional Drills (HDDs) are proposed for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline and are 
shown on Figures 1.2-29, 1.2-30, and 1.2-31. The HDD construction schedule is 
planned for 2006 to allow for contingency conventional lay options in 2007, if any of the 
HDDs cannot be performed. 

The HDD schedule is as follows: 

begin construction - June 2006; 

HDD installation complete - September 2006; and 

complete cleanup - October 2006. 

The primary construction phase will consist of two typical pipeline construction spreads 
worldng sequentially across the ROW with construction crews performing the normal 
functions of cleadng, grading, ditching, stringing, welding, coating, lowering in, back 
filling, and clean up. It is anticipated the primary construction spreads will work 
according to the following schedule. 

• Primary Construction Phase: 

- begin construction - April 2008; 

- pipeline operational - August 2008; 

complete final cleanup - Fall 2008; and 

- complete remedial cleanup - spring/summer 2009. 

V 
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It is estimated that the primary construction phase will require approximately 26 weeks 
to complete the installation of the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. Approximately 280 workers are 
expected to be involved in the construction of the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. It is anticipated 
that during the first four weeks of construction less than 85 personnel will be on site with 
the majority being involved in cleadng and grading operations; some ditching will also 
begin late in this period of construction. During the next four weeks, the number of 
personnel will increase to approximately 225 with the addition of stringing and pipe 
crews as well as specialty crews boring road crossings. Additional personnel are 
expected to continue joining the project for another four to six weeks, including crews 
involved in coating, lowering in, backfill, tie in, and dean up operations. The workforce 
should peak at approximately 280 and remain at that level for about four to six weeks 
before beginning to decline for the remainder of the project. The PL-1 EXT2 pipeline 
will be operated by current DTI employees so no additional positions will be created. 

Refer to Table 8.1-1 for ROW parallels and intersections within the proposed 
PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. The PL-1 EXT2 pipeline will result in a new permanent ROW that 
is 50 feet wide. Temporary work space (TWS) will be 25 feet on the =working" side of 
the new permanent ROW, except in areas where more is needed (refer to Table 8.1-13 
in Resource Report 8 for details). These areas include streams, roads, etc., and are 
shown on the Construction Alignment Sheets. Thus, in areas without extra work space 
(EWS), the construction ROW will be 75 feet wide, which Is the minimum ROW that DTI 
believes will be workable In the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline due to the difficult terrain. The 
contractor will clear only the minimum necessary to safely construct the pipeline, but 
these areas are what DTI believes to be necessary. 

Pipeline markers will be installed at line of sight intervals in addition to being located at 
road, railroad, non-navigable stream crossings, and at any significant changes in 
pipeline direction, per DOT regulation 49 CFR 192.707. 

Cathodic protection test stations will be installed at all foreign, metal line crossings. 
These stations are a four inch diameter PVC pipe protruding approximately four feet 
vertically above the ground surface. The pipe has a plastic cap that covers the 
connections inside the pipe that are used to test the cathodic protection system. These 
test stations are located at a minimum of one-mile apart and are considered at road, 
railroad and stream crossings in compliance with DOT regulation 49 CFR 192.467 
and 491. 

DTI proposes to HDD the pipeline at the Juniata River, Bald Eagle Creek, and 
Route 26/I-99 Interchange. All crossings will be completed in compliance with the 
Commission's approved Plan and Procedures or appropriate Pennsy/vania Department 
of Environmental Protection (PaDEP) stream crossing pen~lts. 

There is one new access road planned for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. All other access 
roads for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline are existing roads. The condition of most roads will be 
improved for use dudng construction with the installation of drain pipes, gravel, and 
grading activities. All roads will remain after construction to provide access to the 
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pipeline for maintenance activities. Refer to Table 8.2-3-1 for detailed information 
regarding access roads in the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. 

The PL-1 EXT2 pipeline crosses Juniata, Mifflin, Huntingdon, Centre, and Clinton 
Counties in PA. Table 1.2-2 presents the length and mileposts (MPs) by county for the 
PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. 

1.2.2 TL-492 EXT3 Pipeline Facllitlee 

The TL-492 EXT3 pipeline will include construction of approximately 10.7 miles of 
pipeline. No existing facilities will be abandoned as a result of this project, with the 
exception of small segments for tie-ins at the existing TL-342 and TL-492 pipelines. 
Route preference, associated construction areas (I.e., proposed pipeyards and 
contractor yards), access roads, pipeline ROW cross-sectional drawings, aerial 
photography and nearby towns are shown on the maps submitted concurrently with this 
application In Appendix 1-C, Construction Alignment Sheets. The TL-492 EXT3 pipeline 
location maps are provided on Figures 1.2-32 through 1.2-36 (Drawing Nos. 2004- 
177-40-A053 through 2004-177-40-A056 and 2004-177-40-ACSL-3). Abovegmund 
facilities and tie-ins are shown on Figure 1.2-37. Land requirements associated with the 
TL-492 EXT3 pipeline are provided in Table 1.2-3. 

The TL-492 EXT3 pipeline will consist of 10.7 miles of 24-inch pipe, starting at the 
existing pipeline near Lambert Junction, Wetzel County, WV. The TL-492 EXT3 
pipeline will terminate at a tie-in to existing pipeline at Bluff Gate, Greene County, PA. 
The entire 10.7 miles will parallel existing pipeline. DTI proposes to install the TL-492 
EXT3 pipeline approxJmately 25 feet from the existing pipeline. This will result in the 
TL-492 EXT3 pipeline sharing 25 feet of permanent ROW with the existing pipeline. 

TL-492 EXT3 will be connected to an existing pipeline at the south end, MP0.0. At the 
north end, DTI is proposing the installation of a pig receiver, a gate valve, and a 
crossover to tie back into the existing TL-342 pipeline. Ground disturbance for 
TL-492 EXT3 can be found in Table 1.2-3. 

Initial pipeline survey permission was granted by 100 percent of the property owners 
located along the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. As a result, all of the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline 
was surveyed. The survey consisted of an initial walk over and route flagging; a DTI 
construction supervisor and a surveyor team were involved in the flagging operation. 
Once the route flagging was completed, a canterline instrument survey and chain 
measurement was completed In conjunction with an environmental and cultural review 
of the study corridor. Where the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline parallels the existing pipeline, 
DTI studied a 150-foot wide corridor, 50 feet on the dirt side of the ditch and 100 feet on 
the working side of the ditch. After the route was finalized, a soil resistivity survey was 
taken along the proposed ROW to determine the cathodic protection current 
requirements necessary to meet DOT regulation 49 CFR 192.463. The TL-492 EXT3 
pipeline crosses through primarily forested lands and open lands. Refer to Table 8.1-6 
for land use crossed by proposed pipeline TL-492 EXT3. The proposed route parallels 

1-7 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 

V 

an existing gas pipeline corridor for the entire length of the project. It minimizes impact 
on both environmental and cultural resources and complies with governmental and state 
agency requests and recommendations. 

The TL-492 EXT3 pipeline is proposed to be built using one phase. No HDDs are 
proposed for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. 

The primary construction phase will consist of a typical pipeline construction spread 
working sequentially across the ROW with construction crews performing the normal 
functions of clearing, grading, ditching, stringing, welding, coating, lowering in, back 
filling, and clean up. It is anticipated the primary construction spreads will work 
according to the following schedule: 

• Primary Construction Phase: 

- begin constru~on - April 2008; 

- pipeline operational - August 2008; 

complete final cleanup - November 2008; and 

complete remedial cleanup - spring/summer 2009. 

It is estimated the primary construction phase will require approximately 10 weeks to 
complete the Installation of the TL-492 EX'T3 pipeline. Approximately 140 workers are 
expected to be involved in the construction of the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. It is 
anticipated that during the first two weeks of construction, less than 45 personnel will be 
on-site with the majority being involved in clearing and grading operations; some 
ditching will also begin late in this pedod of construction. During the next two weeks, 
the number of personnel will increase to approximately 115 with the addition of stringing 
and pipe crews as well as spectal~ crews boring road crossings. Additional personnel 
are expected to continue joining the project for another two to three weeks, including 
crews involved in coating, lowering in, backfill, tie in, and clean up operations. The 
workforce should peak at approximately 140 and remain at that level for about three to 
four weeks before beginning to decline for the remainder of the project. The TL-492 
EXT3 pipeline will be operated by current DTI employees so no additional pos~ons will 
be created. 

Refer to Table 8.1-2 for ROW parallels and intersecUons within the proposed TL-492 
EXT3 pipeline. The TL-492 EXT3 pipeline will result in a new permanent ROW that is 
50 feet wide. TWS will be 25 feet on the "working" side of the new permanent ROW, 
except In areas where more is needed (refer to Table 8.1-14 in Resource Report 8 for 
details). These areas include streams, roads, etc., and are shown on the Construction 
Alignment Sheets. Thus, in areas without EWS, the construction ROW will be 75 feet 
wide, which is the minimum ROW that DTI believes will be workable in the TL-492 EXT3 
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pipeline due to the terrain. The contractor will clear only the minimum necessary to 
safely construct the pipeline, but these areas are what DTI believes to be necessary. 

Pipeline markers will be installed at line of sight intervals in addition to being located at 
road, railroad, non-navigable stream crossings, and at any significant changes in 
pipeline direction, per DOT regulation 49 CFR 192.707. 

Cathodic protection test stations will be installed at all foreign, metal line crossings. 
These stations are a four-inch diameter PVC pipe protruding approximately four feet 
vertically above the ground surface. The pipe has a plastic cap that covers the 
connections inside the pipe that are used to test the cathodic protection system. These 
test stations are located at a minimum of one-mile apart and are considered at road, 
railroad and stream crossings in compliance with DOT regulation 49 CFR 192.467 
and 491. 

No HDDs are planned for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. All crossings will be completed in 
compliance with the Commission's approved Plan and Procedures or appropdate 
PaDEP stream crossing permits. 

There is one new access road planned for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. All other access 
roads for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline are existing roads. The condition of most roads will 
be improved for use dudng construction with the installation of drain pipes, gravel, and 
grading activities. All roads will remain after construction to provide access to the 
pipeline for maintenance activities. Refer to Table 8.2.3-2 for detailed information 
regarding access roads in the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. 

The TL-492 EXT3 pipeline crosses Greene County in PA and Wetzel County in WV. 
Table 1.2-4 presents the length and MPs by county for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. 

1.2.3 TL-536 Pipeline Facilities 

The TL-536 pipeline will include construction of approximately 9.5 miles of pipeline. No 
existing facilities will be abandoned as a result of this project. Route preference, 
associated construction areas (i.e., proposed plpeyards and contractor yards), access 
roads, pipeline ROW cross-sectional drawings, aerial photography and nearby towns 
are shown on the maps submitted concurrently with this application In Appendix 1-C, 
Construction Alignment Sheets. The TL-536 pipeline location maps are provided on 
Figures 1.2-38 through 1.2-42 (Drawing Nos. 2004-177-40-A057 through 2004-177-40- 
A060 and 2004-177-40-ACSL-4). The State Line Station tie-in drawing is provided as 
Figure 1.2-43. The TL-536 tie-in drawing is provided as Figure 1.2-44. Land 
requirements associated with the TL-536 pipeline are provided In Table 1.2-5. 

The TL-538 pipeline will consist of 9.5 miles of 20-Inch pipe, starting at State Line 
Station, Genesee Township, Potter County. The TL-536 pipeline will terminate at a gate 
lot In Sharon Township, Potter County. TL-536 will parallel DTI's existing 12-inch 
L-257-S pipeline for its entire length, approximately 9.5 miles. Where the TL-536 

1-9 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 

pipeline parallels the existing pipeline, DTI proposes to install the TL-536 pipeline 
approximately 25 feet from the existing pipeline. At State Line Station, TL-536 will tie 
into existing station piping and pipelines. These tie-ins and additional piping are 
necessary to move gas from TL-536 into DTI's transmission pipeline system. In 
addition, regulation is required at State Line Station to provide overpressure protection 
from the mismatching MAOP of TL-536. Ground disturbance for TL-536 is summarized 
in Table 1.2-5. 

V 

Initial pipeline survey permission was granted by 100 percent of the property owners 
located in the TL-536 pipeline. The court system was not utilized to acquire any survey 
permission for TL-536 pipeline. As a result, all of the TL-536 pipeline was surveyed. 
The survey consisted of an initial walk over and route flagging; a DTI construction 
supervisor and a surveyor team were involved in the flagging operation. Once the route 
flagging was completed, a centerline instrument survey and chain measurement was 
completed in conjunction with an environmental and cultural review of the study 
corridor. Where the TL-536 pipeline parallels the existing pipeline, DTI studied a 
130-foot wide corridor bounded to the existing pipeline, and extending 130 feet toward 
the side to be used for the TL-536 pipeline installation. In the area where the TL-536 
pipeline is proposed to be located in new land, DTI studied a 200-foot wide corridor, 
cantered on the proposed location of the TL-536 pipeline. After the route is finalized, a 
soil resistivity survey will be taken along the proposed ROW to determine the cathodic 
protection current requirements necessary to meet DOT regulation 49 CFR 192.463. 
The TL-536 pipeline crosses through primarily forested lands and agricultural fields. 
Refer to Table 8.1-7 for land use crossed by proposed pipeline TL-536. The proposed 
route was selected for many reasons. The proposed route parallels an existing gas 
pipeline corridor for the majority of the project. It minimizes impact on both 
environmental and cultural resources and complies with governmental and state agency 
requests and recommendations. A detailed explanation of alternatives is provided in 
Resource Report 10. 

The TL-536 pipeline is proposed to be built using one construction phase. No HDDs 
are proposed for the TL-536 pipeline. 

The pdmary constnJction phase will consist of one typical pipeline construction spread 
working sequentially across the ROW with construction crews performing the normal 
functions of clearing, grading, ditching, stringing, welding, coating, lowering in, back 
filling, end clean up. It is anticipated the pdmary construction spreads will work 
according to the following schedule. 

• Primary Construction Phase: 

- begin construction - April 2008; 

- pipeline operational - August 2008; 

complete final cleanup - November 2008; and 
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complete remedial cleanup - spring/summer 2009. 

It is estimated the primary construction phase will require approximately 12 weeks to 
complete the installation of the TL-536 pipeline. Approximately 200 workers are 
expected to be involved in the constru~on of the TL-536 pipeline. It is anticipated that 
dudng the first two weeks of construction less than 50 personnel will be on site with the 
majority being involved in clearing and grading operations; some ditching will also begin 
late in this period of construction. Dudng the next two weeks, the number of personnel 
will increase to approximately 100 with the addition of stringing and pipe crews as well 
as specialty crews boring road crossings. Additional personnel are expected to 
continue joining the project for another one to two weeks, including crews involved in 
coating, lowering in, backfill, tie in, and clean up operations. The workforce should peak 
at approximately 200 and remain at that level for about three to four weeks before 
beginning to decline for the remainder of the project. The TL-536 pipeline will be 
operated by current DTI employees so no additional positions will be created. 

Refer to Table 8.1-3 for ROW parallels and intersections within the proposed TL-536 
pipeline. The TL-536 pipeline will result in a new permanent ROW that is 50 feet wide. 
TWS will be 25 feet on the "working" side of the new permanent ROW, except in areas 
where more is needed (refer to Table 8.1-15 in Resource Report 8 for details). These 
areas include streams, roads, etc., and are shown on the Construction Alignment 
Sheets. Thus, in areas without EWS, the construction ROW will be 75 feet wide, which 
is the minimum ROW that DTI believes will be workable in the TL-536 pipeline due to 
the terrain. The contractor will clear only the minimum necessary to safely construct the 
pipeline, but these areas are what DTI believes to be necessary. 

Pipeline markers will be installed at line of sight intervals in addition to being located at 
road, railroad, non-navigable stream crossings, and at any significant changes in 
pipeline direction, per DOT regulation 49 CFR 192.707. 

Cathodic protection test stations will be installed at all foreign, metal line crossings. 
These stations are a four inch diameter PVC pipe protruding approximately four feet 
vertically above the ground surface. The pipe has a plastic cap that covers the 
connections inside the pipe that are used to test the cathodic protection system. These 
test stations are located at a minimum of one-mile apart and are considered at road, 
railroad and stream crossings in compliance with DOT regulation 49 CFR 192.487 
and 491. 

No HDDs are proposed for the TL-536 pipeline. All crossings will be completed in 
compliance with the Commission's approved Plan and Procedures or appropdate 
PaDEP stream crossing permits. 

There are no new access roads planned for the TL-536 pipeline. All access roads for 
the TL-536 pipeline are existing roads. The condition of most roads will be improved for 
use during construction with the installation of drain pipes, gravel, and grading activities. 
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All roads will remain after construction to provide access to the pipeline for maintenance 
activities. Refer to Table 8.2.3-3 for detailed information regarding access roads in the 
TL-536 pipeline. 

The TL-536 pipeline crosses Potter County. Table 1.2-6 presents the length and MPs 
by township for the TL-536 pipeline. 

1.2.4 TL-453 EXT1 Pipeline Facilities 

The TL-453 EXT1 pipeline will include construction of approximately 11.55 miles of 
pipeline. No existing facilities will be abandoned as a result of this project. Route 
preference, associated construction areas (i.e., proposed pipeyards and contractor 
yards), access roads, pipeline ROW cross-sectional drawings, aerial photography and 
nearby towns are shown on the maps submitted concurrently with this application in 
Appendix 1-C, Construction Alignment Sheets. The TL-453 EXT1 pipeline location 
maps are provided on Figures 1.2-45 through 1.2-51 (Drawing Nos. 2004-177-40-A061 
through 2004-177-40-A065, 2004-177-40-A145, and 2004-177-40-ACSL-53). The 
Ellisburg plot plan Is provided as Figure 1.2-52. The Harrison plot plan is provided as 
Figure 1.2-53. The Woodhull plot plan is provided as Figure 1.2-54. Land requirements 
associated with the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline are provided in Table 1.2-7. 

V 

The TL-453 EXT1 pipeline will consist of 11.55 miles of 24-inch pipe, starting at the 
existing pipeline near the Ellisburg Station. The TL-453 EXT1 pipeline will terminate at 
Harrison Station. Of these 11.55 miles, approximately 8.5 miles will parallel existing 
pipeline. Where the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline parallels the existing pipeline, DTI proposes 
to install the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline approximately 25 feet from the existing pipeline. 

At Ellisburg Station, TL-453 EXT1 will tie into existing station piping. Also, additional 
station piping will be required to be able to get the gas into DTI's pipeline system. 
Overpressure protection due to mismatching MAOPs will also be Installed. In addition, 
the existing launcher at Harrison Station will be relocated to the beginning of 
TL-453 EXT1 at EIIIsburg Station. 

At Harrison Station, overpressure protection will be installed on TL-453 EXT1 to protect 
TL-453, which has a lower MOAP. Also, the existing launcher on TL-453 at Harrison 
Station will be relocated to the beginning of TL-453 EXT1 at EIIisburg Station. 

At Woodhull Station, overpressure protection will be Installed at the end of TL-453 to 
protect other pipelines from mismatching MAOPs. With the completion of TL-453 EXT1, 
higher gas pressure will be able to flow Into TL-453 than currently exists. Ground 
disturbance for TL-453 EXT1 is summarized in Table 1.2-7. 

V 

InlUal pipeline survey permission was granted by 100 percent of the property owners 
located In the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. The court system was not utilized to acquire any 
survey permission for TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. As a result, 100 percent access was 
achieved and all of the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline was surveyed. TL-453 EXT1 was 
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proposed to be constructed as part of another gas project in 1986. At that time, all 
ROW was secured except for one landowner. DTI is now negotiating with the 
landowner. The survey consisted of an initial walk over and route flagging; a DTI 
construction supervisor and a surveyor team were involved in the flagging operation. 
Once the route flagging was completed, a centedine instrument survey and chain 
measurement was completed in conjunction with an environmental and cultural review 
of the study corridor. Where the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline parallels the existing pipeline, 
DTI studied a 130-foot wide corridor bounded to the existing pipeline, and extending 
130 fset toward the side to be used for the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline installation. In the 
area where the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline Is proposed to be located in new land, DTI 
studied a 200-foot wide corridor, centered on the proposed location of the TL-453 EXT1 
pipeline. After the route is finalized, a soil resistivity survey will be taken along the 
proposed ROW to determine the cathodic protection current requirements necessary to 
meet DOT regulation 49 CFR 192.463. The TL-453 EXT1 pipeline crosses through 
pdmadly forested lands and agricultural fields. Refer to Table 8.1-8 for land use 
crossed by proposed pipeline TL-453 EXT1. The proposed route parallels an existing 
gas pipeline corridor for the majority of the project. It minimizes impact on both 
environmental and cultural resources and complies with governmental and state agency 
requests and recommendations. 

The TL-453 EXT1 pipeline Is proposed to be built in one construction phase. At the 
request of the Pennsylvania Fish and Boat Commission (PFBC), DTI evaluated HDDs 
of the Middle Branch Genesee River, West Branch Genesee River (TI.-453 EXT1 
actually crosses an unnamed tributary of West Branch Genesee River, not the West 
Branch itself), and Main Branch Genesee River. See Section 3.5 for a discussion 
regarding correspondence with the PFBC. The HDDs were determined to be not 
feasible or not practical. Due to the small width of the streams, a conventional crossing 
of each stream can be completed sooner than HDDs. Also, due to the existing terrain, it 
would be difficult to complete an HDD. 

A preliminary HDD crossing design for the Genesee River was produced in order to 
determine the required length of an HDD crossing in this location. The preliminary HDD 
crossing design has a horizontal length of 1,887 feet and a hue (three-dimensional) 
length of 1,920 feet. The entry point is approximately 1,318feet west of the river's 
mid-point, while the exit point is approximately 548 feet east of the river's mid-point. 
The elevation differential between the entry and exit points is approximately 263 feel  

Due to the elevation differential, inadvertent ddlling fluid returns would be likely to occur, 
and it is anticipated that such a crossing would take from one-month to three months to 
comp/ete, depending on subsurface conditions. Therefore, the potential Impact to the 
river due to Inadvertent retoms over the course of HDD operations would be significant. 
An efficiently executed open-cut crossing would Involve substantially less potential 
impact to the river. Consequently, the primary conshuction phase will consist of 
one typical pipeline construction spread working sequentially across the ROW with 
construction crews performing the normal functions of clearing, grading, ditching, 
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stringing, welding, coating, lowering in, back filling, and clean up. It is anticipated the 
primary construction spread will work according to the following schedule: 

• Primary Construction Phase: 

begin construction - April 2008; 

pipeline operational - August 2008; 

complete final cleanup - August 2008; and 

complete remedial cleanup - Spring/Summer 2009. 

It is estimated the primary construction phase will require approximately 12 weeks to 
complete the installation of the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. Approximately 240 workers are 
expected to be involved in the construction of the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. It is 
anticipated that during the first two weeks of construction, less than 50 personnel will be 
on site with the majority being involved in clearing and grading operations; some 
ditching will also begin late in this period of construction. During the next two weeks, 
the number of personnel will increase to approximately 100 with the addition of stringing 
and pipe crews as well as specialty crews bodng road crossings. Additional personnel 
are expected to continue joining the project for another one week including crews 
involved in coating, lowering in, backfill, tie in, and clean up operations. The workfome 
should peak at approximately 240 and remain at that level for about six to seven weeks 
before beginning to decline for the remainder of the project. The TL-453 EXT1 pipeline 
will be operated by current DTI employees so no additional positions will be created. 

Refer to Table 8.1-4 for ROW parallels and intersections within the proposed TL-453 
EXT1 pipeline. The TL-453 EXT1 pipeline will result in a new permanent ROW that is 
50 feet wide. TWS will be 25 feet on the *working" side of the new permanent ROW, 
except in areas where more is needed (refer to Table 8.1-16 in Resource Report 8 for 
details). These areas Include streams, roads, etc., and are shown on the Construction 
Alignment Sheets. Thus, in areas without EWS, the constnJction ROW will be 75 feet 
wide, which Is the minimum ROW that DTI believes will be workable in the TL-453 EXT1 
pipeline due to the terrain. The contractor will clear only the minimum necessary to 
safely construct the pipeline, but these areas are what DTI believes to be necessary. 

Pipeline markers will be installed at line of sight intervals in addition to being located at 
road, railroad, non-navigable stream crossings, and at any significant changes in 
pipeline direction, per DOT regulabon 49 CFR 192.707. 

Cathodic protection test stations will be installed at all foreign, metal line crossings. 
These stations are a four inch diameter PVC pipe protruding approximately four feet 
vertically above the ground surface. The pipe has a plastic cap that covers the 
connections inside the pipe that are used to test the cathodic protection system. These 
test stations are located at a minimum of one-mile apart and are considered at road, 

1-14 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 

v 

railroad and stream crossings in compliance with DOT regulation 49 CFR 192.467 
and 491. 

There is one new access road planned for the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. All other access 
roads for the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline are existing roads, The condition of most roads will 
be improved for use during construction with the installation of drain pipes, gravel, and 
grading activities. All roads will remain after construction to provide access to the 
pipeline for maintenance activities. Refer to Table 8.2.3-4 for detailed information 
regarding access roads in the TL453 EXTt pipeline. 

The TL-453 EXT1 pipeline crosses Potter County. Table 1.2-8 presents the length and 
MPs by township for the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. 

1.3 COMPRESSOR STATION 

DTI is proposing two new compressor stations in order to provide incremental storage 
service. Those compression facilities are identified and analyzed in separate resource 
reports addressing those facilities. 

1.3.1 PL-1 EXT2 

No compressor stations are included in this environmental report. 

1.3.2 TL-492 EXT3 

There are no compressor stations for TL-492 EXT3. 

1.3.3 TL-536 

A launcher/receiver will be installed on TL-536 at DTrs existing State Une Compressor 
Station. 

1.3.4 TL-453 EXT1 

NO compressor stations are part of TL-453 EXT1. 
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1.4 REGULATOR FACILITIES AND TAP VALVES 

1.4.1 PL-1 EXT2 

DTI proposes to construct two new regulator facilities within the existing Leidy 
Compressor Station Complex. One new regulator facility will control the flow of gas 
being delivered into existing DTI piping. The other regulator will control the flow of gas 
delivered into Transco through a DTI pipeline currently delivering gas to Transco. There 
will also be a receiver barrel outside of the new measurement and regulation facility. 
Detailed information will be provided in the Miscellaneous Facilities Modification 
Environmental Report. 

1.4.2 TL-492 EXT3 

TL-492 EXT3 will not require the installation of regulator facilities or tap valves. 

1.4.3 TL-536 

Regulation will be installed at DTI's existing State Line Compressor Station. 

1.4.4 TL-453 EXT1 

There will be regulation facilities added at Ellisburg, Harrison, and Woodhull Stations. 
There will be no tap valves, but one gate valve site will be required to meet DOT 
requirements. 

1.5 METER STATION FACILITIES 

1.5.1 PL-1 EXT2 

DTI proposes to construct two new measurement facilities within the existing Leidy 
Compressor Station Complex. One new measurement facility will measure the flow of 
gas being delivered between the proposed PL-1 EXT2 pipeline and DTi's existing 
mainline system. The other measurement facility will measure the flow of gas delivered 
from DTI into Transco. This measurement will deliver gas to Transco through a DTI 
pipeline currently delivering gas to Transco. There will also be a receiver barrel outside 
of the new measurement and regulation facility. Detailed Information will be provided in 
the Miscellaneous Facilities Modification Environmental Report. 

1.5.2 TL-492 EXT3 

TL-492 EXT3 will not require the installation of new meter stations. 

1.5.3 TL-536 

TL-536 will not require the installation of new meter stations. 
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1.5.4 TL-453 EXT1 

TL-453 EXT1 will not require the installation of new meter stations. 

1.6 NON-LINEAR PROJECT ASSOCIATED CONSTRUCTION FACILITIES 

1.6.1 PL-1 EXT2 

DTI has identified several non-linear project related facilities (i.e., pipeyards, contractor 
yards) for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. There are four pipe yards anticipated for the 
PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. The contractor warehouse will be located within the pipeyards 
identified. All sites will be leased prior to construction from willing owners. These 
proposed facilities are described in Table 8.1-17, and their locations are provided on the 
corresponding United States Geological Survey (USGS) 7.5-minute series maps. 
Plpeyard locations are provided in Appendix 8-B. 

1.6.2 TL-492 EXT3 

DTI has identified several non-linear project related facilities (i.e., plpeyards, contractor 
yards) for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. There are two pipeyards anticipated for the 
TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. The contractor warehouse will be located within the pipeyards 
identified. All sites will be leased prior to construction from willing owners. The other 
related items include a 100-foot by 100-foot gate valve and pig receiver site at MP10.7 
near Bluff Gate (Figure 1.2-36). These proposed facilities are described in 
Table 8.1-18, and their locations are provided on the USGS 7.5-minute series maps. 
Plpeyard locations are provided in Appendix 8-B. 

1.6.3 TL-536 

DTI has identified several non-linear project related facilities (i.e., pipeyards, contractor 
yards) for the TL-536 pipeline. There Is one plpeyard anticipated for the TL-536 
pipeline. The contractor warehouse will be located within the pipeyard. All sites will be 
leased prior to construction from willing owners. These proposed facilities are 
described In Table 8.1-19, and their locations are provided on the corresponding USGS 
7.5-minute sedes maps. Pipeyard locations are provided in Appendix 1-C, Construction 
Alignment Sheets. 

1.6.4 TL.453 EXT1 

DTI has identified several non-linear project related facll~es (i.e., pipeyards, conbactor 
yards) for the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. There is one pipeyard anticipated for the TL-453 
EXT1 pipeline. The contractor warehouse will be located within the pipeyard. All sites 
will be leased prior to construction from willing owners. These proposed facilities are 
described in Table 8.1-20, and their locations are provided on the USGS 7.5-minute 
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series maps. Pipeyard locations are provided in Appendix 1-C, Construction Alignment 
Sheets. 

1.7 NON-JURISDICTIONAL FACILITIES 

Describe any non-jurisdictional facilities that would be built in association with 
the project (380.12(c)(2)). 

There are no non-jurisdictional facilities in the PL-1 EXT2, TL-492 EXT3, TL-536, or 
TL-453 EXT1 pipelines except for facilities of the type listed under Section 2.55(a) of the 
Commission regulations. 

1.8 MAPS AND PHOTOGRAPHS 

Provide current original U.S. Geological Survey 7.5-minuts series topographic 
maps with mileposts showing the Project facilities (380.12(c)(3)). 

Provide aerial Images or photographs or alignment sheets based on these 
sources with mileposts showing the Project facilities (380.12(c)(3)). 

Provide plot~sits plans of compressor stations showing the location of the 
nearest noise-sensitive areas (NSA) within I mile (380.12(c)(3 and 4). 

1.8.1 PL-1 EXT2 

DTI has prepared the required maps, photographs and plot plans describing this project. 
These materials are provided in Figures 1.2-1 through 1.2-28 and in Appendix 1-C. 
Additional copies of these materials have been prepared and will be submitted as 
required under ((380.12(c)(3Xiii)). 

Plot/site plans of compressor stations showing the location of the nearest 
noise-sensitive areas within one-mile are included in the Compressor Stations 
Supplement Environmental Report. 

1.8~2 TL-492 EXT3 

DTI has prepared the required maps, photographs and plot plans describing this projecL 
These materials are provided on Rgures 1.2-32 through 1.2-36 (Drawing Nos. 
2004-177-40-A053 through 2004-177-40-A056), Figure 1.2-37, and in Appendix 1-C. 
Additional copies of these materials have been prepared and will be submitted as 
required under ((380.12(c)(3)(lii)). 

1.8.3 TL-536 

DTI has prepared the required maps, photographs and plot plans describing this project. 
These materials are provided on Figures 1.2-38 through 1.2-42 (Drawing Nos. 
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2004-177-40-A057 through 2004-177-40-A060 and 2004-177-40-ACSL-4), 
Figure 1.2-43 (plot plan for the State Line Station, Figure 1.2-44 (plot plan for the 
Sharon M&R tie-in), and in Appendix 1-C. Additional copies of these materials have 
been prepared and will be submitted as required under ((380.12(c)(3)(iii)). 

1.8.4 TL-453 EXT1 

DTI has prepared the required maps, photographs and plot plans describing this project. 
These materials are provided on Figures 1.2-45 through t.2-51 (Drawing Nos. 
2004-177- 40-A061 through 2004-177-40-A065, 2004-177-40-A145, and 2004-177- 
40-ACSL-6), Figures 1.2-52 through 1.2-54 (plot plans for Ellisburg, Harrison, and 
Woodhull, respectively), and in Appendix 1-C. Additional copies of these materials have 
been prepared and will be submitted as required under ((380.12(c)(3)(iil)). 

1.9 CONSTRUCTION AND RESTORATION METHODS 

Provide construction and restoration methods (380.12(c)(6)). 

1.9.1 General DescdpUon 

All permits will be acquired from the necessary regulatory agencies. A list of those 
regulatory agencies is located in Table 1.10-1 for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline, Table 1.10-2 
for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline, Table 1.10-3 for the TL-536 pipeline, and Table 1.10-4 for 
the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. Once authorization is received for the pipeline project, DTI 
will prepare a contract bid package including all regulatory requirements. These 
documents will define a portion of the required work being bid by contractors. All 
contractors will be required to have a full time environmental crew assigned to the 
project on 24 hours per day seven days per week basis, to address any environmental 
situation that may occur. A set of each of the pipeline alignment drawings sheets will be 
altered to Indicate the location of erosion and sedimentation control devices, based on 
the slope of the terrain, to meet the minimum environmental construction standards per 
the Commission's Plan and Procedures. Additional devices can and will be placed on 
the ROW at the discretion of the third party environmental inspectors or construction 
supervisor. All contractor crew leaders, DTI inspection personnel, and third party 
environmental inspectors will attend kaining and receive manuals addressing the 
environmental requirements of the project prior to the start of any physical construction. 
All DTI inspection personnel will have "stop wori~ authority regarding violations of any 
environmental requirements of the project; as a result all Inspectors will be responsible 
for environmental compliance, with the final responsibility belonging to the 
environmental inspector and the construction supervisor. Any intentional acts of 
non-compliance will result in stoppage of work until the situation is corrected and 
individuals found to be responsible for intentional acts will be removed from the project. 

A cathodic protection system will be installed on the project once the initial construction 
is completed. Surveys have been completed to determine the level of equipment 
required to meet DOT regulations based on soil resistivity in the areas of construction. 
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Based on the surveys, it is estimated that a ground bed will be required every five to 
seven miles along the pipelines. 

Dudng construction, temporary sanitary facilities will be utilized at locations and in 
adequate numbers to meet the needs of personnel in the area of the ROW. Facilities 
will also be located at the various plpeyards and warehouse sites. 

The following sections provide a sequential description of the pipeline construction and 
restoration methods that will be used. 

1.9.2 Clearing 

After the ROW has been surveyed and easements have been secured, the permanent 
and temporary construction ROW, and any existing ROW if necessary, will be cleared of 
obstructions (i.e., trees and stumps, brush, logs, and large rocks). The ROW will be 
cleared to the width required for construction, but not more than specified on the 
pipeline alignment maps. These ROW widths indicate the minimum width necessary 
for construction, operation, and maintenance of the pipeline. At no time will DTI or its 
contractor clear or alter any areas outside of the boundaries of the pipeline corridor area 
shown on the pipeline alignment maps. 

Before any constru~on procedures commence along the corridor, valuable or locally 
unique bee specimens, as identified in ROW agreements, permits or the Commission 
cartification, will be identified. These trees will be protected from potential construction 
damage, and/or avoided depending on the tree's position relative to pipeline alignment. 
The deadng crew will then remove large obstacles such as large rocks, logs, and trees 
situated on the ROW. 

Tree stumps will be cut or removed to facilitate grading and ditching activiUes and to 
provide safe access for crew members operating construction, maintenance, and 
operation equipment. The pulling of tree stumps will be limited only to directly over the 
trench line in wetland areas. Stumps or root systems will not be removed from the 
remainder of the ROW in wetland areas, unless the Chief Inspector and Environmental 
Inspector determine that safety-related consbuction constraints require removal of tree 
stumps from under the work pad per the Commission's Plan and Procedures. 

To protect properties located adjacent to the proposed corridor, brush and trees will be 
felled parallel to and within the ROW. Marketable Umber cut from clearing of the ROW 
will be cut to standard lengths and stacked at the edge of the ROW or removed. 
Generally, cleared wood debds will be chipped and left in place or otherwise disposed 
of according to applicable regulations, permits, and ROW agreements. Large matedal 
that cannot be chipped or otherwise disposed of will be removed off-site and disposed 
of at an approved or otherwise authorized facility. 

V 
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1.9.3 Fence Grosslngs 

If fences (barbed wire, chain link, or other) are encountered along the construction 
ROW, then a fence crew will install temporary gates. The Contractor's fence crew will 
install new posts to brace the areas on either side of the proposed cut to ensure that no 
damage occurs to other portions of the fence or wall. Temporary gates will be installed, 
if necessary, to contain livestock or to prohibit or othenr,'ise control public access across 
the ROW. These temporary fences and/or gates will remain closed at all times except 
as required for construction purposes. 

1.9.4 Erosion and Sedimentation Control 

Erosion and sedimentation controls will be installed along the pipeline corridor to 
minimize the occurrence of erosion of native soils. DTI will adhere to the requirements 
set forth in the Commission's Plan and Procedures. The first plan establishes 
procedures and requirements for the installation of temporary and permanent erosion 
control structures, revegetation, seed and mulch specifications, and periodic 
maintenance activities for the pipeline corridor. The second plan outlines construction 
procedures specific to wetlands and waterbodies. Additionally, DTI will prepare a 
Stormwater Pollution Control Plan to ensure compliance with the terms and conditions 
of a National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System (NPDES) Water Pollution ContTol 
Permit for Storm Water Discharges Associated with Construction Activity. 

Erosion control devices that will be used along the pipeline corridor include hay or straw 
bales, trench breakers, netting, and dewater traps. Temporary sediment barriers that 
will be used include silt fences and hay bales. All erosion and sedimentation control 
devices that are used during construction of the pipeline will be inspected weekly and 
after each significant rainfall event so that they are maintained In good working order 
throughout construction. In addition to the Commission's Plan and Procedures, 
site-specific erosion and sedimentation control measures will be taken along the 
pipeline corridor adjacent to wetlands and waterbodies. 

Significant deviations from the Commission's Plan and Procedures basic practices are 
not anticipated. It is expected that controls will be required at a much higher frequency 
than "normal" on steep terrain. All standard procedures such as trench breakers, 
diversion ditches, silt fence, and sedimentation control devices will be used in these 
areas as well. 

1.9.5 Trenching 

Prior to commencing any trenching actJvl6es along the proposed corridor, buded utility 
lines will be identified and flagged. Trench excavation will be performed with a large 
excavator in unconsolidated deposits, so that the ditch is approximately three feet wide, 
one-foot wider than the diameter of the pipe and approximately six and one-half feet 
deep, providing at least three feet of cover above the pipe. In areas where bedrock 
cannot be ripped with a backhoe, drilling and controlled blasting (explosives will be used 
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in compliance with all applicable permits and authorizations) will be required and a 
backhoe will remove rock and soil from the trench. For bedrock excavations, the 
minimum depth of cover is approximately three feet. Existing land will be returned as 
near as practical to it's original contours including the use of the pre-existing reck, 
located on the ROW, as a portion of the water diversion structures for erosion control. 

To mitigate the loss of soil productivity, topsoil and subsoil will be segregated in 
agricultural, wetland, and residential areas along the route. Topsoil located in all 
actively cultivated lands will be segregated from the trench material for replacement 
during final cleanup. All erosion and sedimentation control structures will be in place 
before topsoil is stockpiled and set aside. 

In areas of shallow bedrock, a reck bucket on a backhoe will be used to excavate the 
trench. As an altemative measure, a hydraulic hammer will be used to excavate the 
rock. Once both these measures have been attempted, it may be necessary to use low 
charge explosives to excavate the trench. If controlled blasting does occur during 
construction, then matting, where appropriate, will be used to contain fly-rock. Safety 
precautions will be taken to prevent injury to workers, livestock, and property. 
Controlled blasting, if required, will take place during the day, and minimum charges will 
be utilized to control vibrations. A seismograph will be used, where necessary, to 
monitor the strength of the explosion. 

DTI's preliminary review has determined that controlled blasting may be necessary on 
shallow bedrock areas as identified in Resource Report 6, Section 6.4. All areas will be 
evaluated in the field during construction to assess the need for additional controlled 
blasting. Table 6.4-1 of Resource Report 6 summarizes the soils information that could 
include shallow bedrock and may require blasting for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline, 
Table 6.4-2 for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline, Table 6.4-3 for the TL-536 pipeline, and 
Table 6.4-4 for the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. 

1.9.6 Stringing, Installation, and Backfilling 

Stringing the pipe involves hauling pipe single joints (averaging 35 feet long, with 
individual joints between 14 and 45 feet long) from the storage yard and stringing the 
pipe along the working side of the ROW parallel to the trench line. The pipe will be bent 
to conform to the trench land surface contour, aligned, welded, and placed on 
temporary supports located alongside the trench. Welds will be visually and 
radiographlcally Inspected and repaired as necessary. The weld area will then be 
coated, and the pipe's mill-applied coating checked for damage and repairs made. The 
pipe then will be lowered into the trench by side-boom tractors and placed on padding 
matedal laid on the trench bottom to protect the pipe coating. As much as is practical, 
pipeline padding materials will come from the ROW. ff adequate supplies are not 
available, other commercial sources will also be considered. Padding may consist of 
sand, selected rock-free materials from the trench excavation, sand bags, or 
polyethylene foam pillows. Both rock shield materials and Powercrete¢ or equivalent 
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coating will be utilized, in selected areas, to protect the Fusion Bonded Epoxy coating 
from rock damage. 

The bench will be backfilled with suitable material that was excavated. The backfill 
material will be slightly crowned in upland areas to allow for settlement that may occur. 
This procedure, however, will not be employed in wetland areas so as not to impede 
drainage flows. If additional fill Is needed In upland areas, new material will be obtained 
from previously reviewed borrow areas or obtained from commercial sources. 

1.9.7 Hydrostatic Testing 

1.9.7.1 PL-1 EXT2 

Prior to placing the pipeline Into service, the new pipeline segment will be hydrostatically 
tested. The new pipeline first will be cleaned using a cleaning pig propelled by 
compressed air. The pipeline then will be filled with water, without the use of additives, 
obtained from a surface water source or a potable water supply and hydrostatically 
tested In a manner that meets or exceeds the Minimum Federal Safety Standards. 
DTI's intent is to test the pipeline using water from one or more of the following creeks 
or rivers which are located along the pipeline route: 

Juniata River PL-1 EXT2 $1MP12.307 

Kishacoquillas Creek PL-1 EXT2 $1MP19.434 

Bald Eagle Creek PL-1 EXT2 $2MP14.368 

West Branch Susquehanna River PL-1 EXT2 $3MP19.053 

The location, size, and state water quality class of these streams can be found in 
Resource Report 2, Table 2.2.1-1. Although municipal water supplies may be utilized 
as sources for test water of soma prefabricated assemblies, such as valve settings or 
pig launcher or receiver barrels, it is not anticipated that they would be utilized as 
sources of test water for any mainline testing. 

Hydrostatic testing will follow the Commission's Plans and Procedures. A screened 
Intake hose In the upper water column will be employed to draw water from the creek or 
river. The hydrostaUc test water will be discharged onto a well-vegetated upland area, 
so that it may flow over land into areas adjacent to surface water bodies, as per the 
required permits. It is not anUdpated that water will be discharged directly into any 
stream or waterbody; the discharge may or may not be within the same drainage basin 
from which the test water was taken initially. It is anticipated that the PL-1 EXT2 
pipeline will be tested in 21 separate test segments; some of the water used for testing 
will be transferred from one segment to another. Refer to Table 2.2.5-1 for hydrostatic 
test locations and quantities. The hydrostatic test water is not anticipated to be 
contaminated as only new natural gas pipeline will be tested; however, during discharge 
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procedures, the water will be periodically sampled and tested for dissolved oxygen, pH, 
total dissolved solids, oil and grease, and any other parameters required in the 
appllcabla permits. Information pertaining to consultations with the state and Federal 
agencies regarding use of any sensitive waterbodles for hydrostatic testing is located in 
Section 3.5. 

Withdrawal and discharge rates will be in accordance with state and local regulations. 
Additionally, the necessary permits for hydrostatic testing will be acquired prior to 
construction. Refer to Table 1.10-1 for permit information on the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline. 
All testing will be performed in compliance with the Commission's Plan and Procedures. 
DTI will comply with National Marine Fisheries Service (NMFS) recommendations 
(Appendix 3-A) on hydrostatic withdrawal on the Juniata River. All testing will be 
performed in compliance with the Commission's Plan and Procedures. 

1.9.7.2 TL-492 EXT3 

Prior to placing the pipeline into service, the new pipeline segment will be hydrostatically 
tested. The new pipeline first will be cleaned using a cleaning pig propelled by 
compressed air. The pipeline then will be filled with water, without the use of additives, 
obtained from a surface water source or a potable water supply and hydrostatically 
tested in a manner that meets or exceeds the Minimum Federal Safety Standards. 
DTI's intent is to test the pipeline using water from The West Fork of Fish Creek located 
in the Town of Hundred. The water will be hauled to Lambert Junction at MP 0.0 where 
it will be utilized for the hydrostatic test. If The West Fork of Fish Creek does not have 
sufficient flow, the water will then need to be withdrawn from a municipal water supply. 

The location, size, and state water quality class of this stream can be found in Resource 
Report 2, Table 2.2.1-2. Municipal water supplies may be utilized as sources for test 
water of some prefabricated assemblies, such as valve settings or pig launcher or 
receiver barrels, and may be utilized as sources of test water for mainline testing. 

A screened intake hose in the upper water column will be employed to draw water from 
the creek or river. The hydrostatic test water will be discharged through a dewatering 
structure onto a well-vegetated upland area, so that it may flow over land into areas 
adjacent to surface water bodies, as per the required permits. It is not anticipated that 
water will be discharged directly Into any stresm or waterbody; the discharge may or 
may not be within the same drainage basin from which the test water was taken initially. 
It is antidpatad that the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline will be tested in two separate test 
segments; some of the water used for testing will be transferred from one segment to 
another. Refer to Table 2.2.5-2 for hydrostatic test locations and quantities. The 
hydrostatic test water is not ant~,ipated to be contaminated as only new natural gas 
pipeline will be tested; however, dudng discharge procedures, the water will be 
periodically sampled and tested for dissolved oxygen, pH, total dissolved solids, oll and 
grease, and any other parameters required in the applicable permits. 

V 
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Withdrawal and discharge rates will be in accordance with state and local regulations. 
Additionally, the necessary permits for hydrostatic te~ng will be acquired prior to 
construction. Refer to Table 1.10-2 for permit informaUon on the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. 
All testing will be performed in compliance with the Commission's Plan and Procedures. 

1.9.7.3 TL-536 

Pdor to placing the pipeline into service, the new pipeline segment will be hydrostatically 
tested. The new pipeline first will be cleaned using a cleaning pig propelled by 
compressed air. The pipeline then will be filled with water, without the use of additives, 
obtained from a surface water source or a potable water supply and hydrostatically 
tested in a manner that meets or exceeds the Minimum Federal Safety Standards. 
DTI's intent is to test the pipeline using water from the Genesee River near Genesee, 
PA, which will be hauled to the pipeline testing location. 

The location, size, and state water quality class of these streams can be found in 
Resource Report 2, Table 2.2.1-3. Although municipal water supplies may be utilized 
as sources for test water of some prefabricated assemblies, such as valve settings or 
pig launcher or receiver barrels, it is not anticipated that they would be utilized as 
sources of test water for any mainline testing. 

v 

A screened intake hose in the upper water column will be employed to draw water from 
the creek or river. The hydrostatic test water will be discharged through a dewatering 
structure onto a well-vegetated upland area, so that it may flow over land into areas 
adjacent to surface waterbodies, as per the required permits. It is not anticipated that 
water will be discharged directly into any stream or waterbody; the discharge may or 
may not be within the same drainage basin from which the test water was taken initially. 
It is anticipated that the TL-536 pipeline will be tasted in one test segment. Refer to 
Table 2.2.5-3 for the hydrostatic test location and quantity. The hydrostatic test water is 
not anticipated to be contaminated as only new natural gas pipeline will be tested; 
however, during discharge procedures, the water will be periodically sampled and 
tested for dissolved oxygen, pH, total dissolved solids, oil and grease, and any other 
parameters required in the applicable permits. 

Withdrawal and discharge rates will be in accordance with state and local regulations. 
Additionally, the necessary permits for hydrostatic testing will be acquired prior to 
construction. Refer to Table 1.10-3 for permit Information on the TL-536 pipeline. All 
testing will be performed in compliance with the Commission's Plan and Procedures. 

1.9.7.4 TL-453 EXT1 

V 

Prior to placing the pipeline into service, the new pipeline segment will be hydrostatically 
tested. The new pipeline first will be cleaned using a deanlng pig propelled by 
compressed air. The pipeline then will be filled with water, without the use of additives, 
obtained from a surface water source or a potable water supply and hydrostatically 
tested in a manner that meets or exceeds the Minimum Federal Safety Standards. 
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DTI's intent is to test the pipeline using water from one or more of the following creeks 
or rivers which are located along the pipeline route: 

• Genesee River:. TL-453 EXT1 MP4.29; and 

Middle Branch Genesee River: TL-453 EXT1 MP2.26. 

The location, size, and state water quality class of these streams can be found in 
Resource Report 2, Table 2.2.1-4. The Commission's Procedures will be followed prior 
to the use of these waterbodies for hydrostatic test water source. DTI is also in 
consultation with the PFBC to obtain specific recommendations to follow regarding use 
of the Middle Branch Genesee River. The PFBC requested more detailed Information 
regarding locations and methods for both water withdrawal and discharge so that 
potential impacts can be assessed. Correspondence to date is discussed in Resource 
Report 3. DTI will supply additional correspondence to the Commission as it becomes 
available. Although municipal water supplies may be utilized as sources for test water 
of some prefabricated assemblies, such as valve seffings or pig launcher or receiver 
barrels, it is not anticipated that they would be utilized as sources of test water for any 
mainline testing. 

A screened intake hose in the upper water column will be employed to draw water from 
the creek or river. The hydrostatic test water will be discharged through a dewataring 
structure onto a well-vegetated upland area, so that it may flow over land into areas 
adjacent to surface water bodies, as per the required permits. It is not anticipated that 
water will be discharged directly into any stream or waterbody; the discharge may or 
may not be within the same drainage basin from which the test water was taken initially. 
It is anticipated that the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline will be tested in five separate test 
segments; some of the water used for testing will be transferred from one segment to 
another. The water will be withdrawn from the Middle Branch Genesee River at MP2.26 
and the Genesee River at MP4.29. The water will then be bucked to the five test 
segments. Refer to Table 2.2.5-4 for hydrostatic test locations and quantities. The 
hydrostatic test water is not anticipated to be contaminated as only new natural gas 
pipeline will be tested; however, dudng discharge procedures, the water will be 
periodically sampled and tested for dissolved oxygen, pH, total dissolved solids, oil and 
grease, and any other parameters required in the applicable permits. 

Withdrawal and discharge rates will be in accordance with state and local regulations. 
Additionally, the necessary permits for hydrostatic testing will be acquired prior to 
construction. Refer to Table 1.10-4 for permit information on the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. 
DTI will comply with PFBC recommendations on hydrostatic withdrawal on the Genesae 
River and Middle Branch Genesee River (Appendix 3-A). All testing will be performed in 
compliance with the Commission's Plan and Procedures. 

V 

1-26 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 

V 

1.9.8 Restoration and Cleanup 

All debris and equipment remaining from construction activities will be removed from the 
ROW and adjacent areas. Debris will be sent to an approved landfill. After the 
construction and installation of the pipeline is complete, the ROW will be graded to 
conform to original, pre-construction contours. In areas where odginal fill in the trench 
and major depressions have settled below ground level, clean fill will be added and 
graded to the original contour. All disturbed pavement will be restored to at least its 
original condition. All disturbed area will be restored as near as practical to the original 
contours, with exception of =knife ridges'. Due to the very narrow nature of these areas 
the restored ROW will remain wider than the odginal ddge top after reclamation is 
completed. 

The topsoil previously segregated from the trench matedal in all agricultural and 
residential areas will be spread on the ROW dudng final cleanup. Topsoil and subsoil in 
agdcuttural and residential areas will be tested for compaction along the disturbed 
pipeline corridor. The entire uplands area disturbed by construction will be fedilized, 
limed, and then seeded with an appropriate grass seed mixture to rapidly stabilize and 
provide permanent erosion control along the ROW. Wetlands areas will not be 
fertilized, limed, or mulched unless directed to do so by local regulatory agencies. DTI 
will consult with the local County Conservation Districts to determine the appropdate 
seed mixtures for the area and soil conditions or in compliance with the Commission's 
Plan and Procedures. 

Upon completion of the natural gas pipeline construction, DTI will commence a 
long-term, periodic monitoring program for the pipeline. This monitodng program will 
consist of checking the integrity of the natural gas pipeline (i.e,, leak surveys); 
monitoring the success of ROW revegetation; continuous telemetedng of gas pressure 
to DTI's Gas Control Department located in Clarksburg, WV; monthly aedal surveillance 
of the pipeline; and a physical walkover inspection of the entire pipeline route every 
three years. All monitoring procedures will he conducted in conformance with DOT 
regulation 49 CFR 192.705 and 706. Inspection with leakage instruments will also be 
required in some class III or IV areas at a higher frequency level should they exist. 

1.9.9 Wetland Crossings 

Disturbance of wetlands will be limited to the minimum necessary to construct the 
pipeline. Special construction and mitigation procedures will be followed when 
construction takes place in a wetland area. DTI plans to file joint PaDEP/United States 
Army Corps of Engineers (USACE) permits for judsdictlonal determination. The USACE 
will determine specific wetland mitigation requirements. The Commission's approved 
Procedures will be followed. Site-specific mitigation practices will also be adhered to 
dudng construction and installation of the pipeline. If possible, wetlands crossing work 
will be scheduled to take place dudng the dry period of summer and eady fall, avoiding 
construction in the wetter spdng months. The location of wetlands is indicated on the 
ConstnJctton Alignment Sheets (refer to Appendix 1-C), and a summary of wetlands 
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crossed by the pipelines can be found in Resource Report 2, Table 2.3-1 for 
PL-1 EXT2, Table 2.3-2 for TL-492 EXT3, Table 2.3-3 for TL-536, and Table 2.3-4 for 
TL-453 EXT1. 

The working side of the pipeline trench will be stabilized with prefabricated mats or 
timber dprap to provide a firm surface for construction equipment. Following trench 
excavations by a backhoe or a clamshell, the pipeline will be carded by sidebooms 
across the wetland area, submerged into the bench and then backfilled. Sediment filter 
devices will be installed to prevent the flow of trench spoil off-site. All exposed soil in 
wetland areas will be restored per local, state, or USACE permit requirements. 

1.9.10 Road and Railroad Crossings 

The roads and railroads crossed by the pipelines by MP are listed in Table 1.9-1 for 
PL-1 EXT2, Table 1.9-2 for TL-492 EXT3, Table 1.9-3 for TL-536, and Table 1.9-4 for 
TL-453 EXT1. 

Dirt roads encountered along the corridor will be open cut. Proper safety precautions 
per the appropriate DOT requirements for flagging, barricades and other safety 
procedures will be in place at all roads that are traversed. Open cut crossings will be 
made using large excavators to dig through gravel and dirt surfaces resulting in some 
minor traffic delays. Individual lane excavation and the use of steal decking or 
temporary road detours will be employed to limit public inconveniences. Roads will be 
restored and graveled to their previous or better condition upon completion of the 
crossing. 

The traditional "slick" boring technique will be employed to install the pipeline under 
hard surfaced roads, unless DOT specifies the usa of cased crossings. Since all work 
ac6vities are outside of the roads traveled surfaces, no significant disruptions of 
roadway traffic are anticipated. All DOT safety preca~ons will be utilized to protect 
both the public and construction personnel. Bore and receiving pits will be excavated to 
a depth adequate to allow a minimum of three feet of dearenca between the top of the 
bore pipe and the bottom of road ditch lines. A road-boring machine that is equipped 
with an auger-type bit will be used to tunnel beneath paved roads creating an aperture. 
A steel casing will be placed in the hole as it is being bored to prevent settlement or 
damage to either the hole or the roadway foundation. After bodng is complete, the 
carrier pipe with factory-applied Powercmte@ or equivalent coating is inserted into the 
steal casing and then the casing is removed. The annulus betwean the carder pipe 
with Powarcrete@ or equivalent coating and the borehole will be sealed with concrete. 
This bodng technique minimizes traffic disruption. Additional temporary ROW (EWS - 
refer to Table 8.1-13 of Resource Report 8) may be required on each side of the 
crossing to accommodate additional excavation for the bodng equipment, spoil storage, 
and pipeline fabdcatlon, ff a cased crossing is specified by DOT, the bore pipe will 
remain in place once the bodng operation is complete. The carder pipe is then inserted, 
with support cradles and seals, into the casing. Vent pipes will be added to the casing 
pipe to allow monltodng of the annular space between the casing and carder pipe per 
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DOT requirements. DTI plans to HDD the 1-99/S.R. 0026 interchange roadway at 
MP $2MP13.5. Figure 1.2-30 shows the detailed plans. 1-80 will be HDD as part of the 
Bald Eagle Creek HDD detailed in Figure 1.2-31. 

It is anticipated that all railroad crossings will be completed using the cased crossing 
method as described above, except the railroad crossings at the Juniata River, and Bald 
Eagle Creek. These crossings will be uncased and installed as part of the HDDs. Refer 
to Table 1.9-1 for a listing of railroad crossings in the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline by MP. 

1.9.11 Other Utility Line Crossings 

When other utility lines such as electric, telephone, sewer, water, natural gas, and oil 
are crossed, DTI and/or its contractor will contact the appropriate utility representatives 
direcb'y when possible, in addition to using the PA "one-call" system. DTI will employ 
extreme care to prevent damage to utilities. In general, the new pipeline will be installed 
to allow at least 12 inches of vertical clearance between the pipeline and the existing 
utility. When this clearance is not possible, additional precautions will be taken to 
protect the existing utility and the new pipeline by installing add~onel coating mataria~ or 
casings. For the location of utility crossings by MP, refer to Resource Report 8, 
Table 8.2.1-1 for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline, Table 8.2.1-2 for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline, 
Table 8.2.1-3 for the TL-536 pipeline, and Table 8.2.1-4 for the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. 

1.9.12 Agricultural Areas 

Agricultural areas on the pipeline include pasture areas used for livestock grazing, 
hayfields, fallow fields, and croplands, such as corn and wheat fields. Additional 
information on the location of these areas is provided in Resource Report 8 (Land Use). 
Resource Report 8 and Resource Report 7 (Soils) Include informaUon on special 
procedures to be utilized in agricultural areas. Measures include the segregation of the 
top 12 inches of topsoil within the ROW, and de-compaction of the soil, as needed, 
once construction is completed. Topsoil will be segregated from the subsoil/trench 
excavation during the grading phase of consVuction and stockpiled on the working side 
of the ROW until installation of the pipeline is complete. The topsoil will be returned to 
the ROW in the final restoration and cleanup phase of pipeline construction. If either 
subsoil or topsoil is severely compacted a paraplow or other deep tillege device will be 
utilized to break up the soils. DTI construction personnel will work with property owners 
to identify locations of drain tiles prior to construction to avoid damage to those 
structures. Should damage occur anyway, DTI will repair these drainage systems with 
the input of the property owners. DTI will coordinate with the landowners prior to 
construction and provide compensation for crop damages. 

1.9.13 Stream Crossings 

DTI will use different sVeam crossing techniques depending on the type of waterbody to 
be traversed (refer to Section 2.2.7 of Resource Report 2 for additional Information). 
Special care will be taken to minimize effects of construction on waterbodies. 
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Specialized procedures that will be followed at stream crossing locations include the 
following: locating staging areas 50 feet away from the stream; storing chemicals, 
washing or refueling equipment in designated areas that are more than 100 feet away 
from the work area; and mixing concrete greater than 100 feet from a river, stream 
bank, or any area where contamination from concrete may reach a water course or 
wetland. Spoil pile placement and erosion control devices will be monitored at all times 
during stream crossing procedures. All stream crossings will be buried to a minimum 
depth of five feet below the stream bottom. Stream crossing techniques that may be 
utilized include: temporary bridges, dry flume, dam and pump, cofferdam, and wet 
trench. For locations by MP, refer to Resource Report 2, Table 2.2.1-1 for the PL-1 
EXT2 pipeline, Table 2.2.1-2 for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline, Table 2.2.1-3 for the TL-536 
pipeline, and Table 2.2.1-4 for the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. DTI will work with applicable 
agencies on stream crossing methods specific to each stream. 

Below is a brief description of the vadous types of stream crossing techniques typically 
used in pipeline constnJction. 

Dry Flume. The dry flume method is typically employed to traverse minor 
streams. This procedure entails constructing two bulkheads (sand bags or 
plastic dams) to direct the stream flow through a flume pipe placed over the 
trench. The flume would not be removed during trenching, pipe laying, or 
backfilling. 

Dam and Pump Method. The dam and pump method of crossing streams 
involves using a pump and hoses to convey water around the trench area. This 
method Is typically employed when stream flow is no more than one cubic foot 
per second at the time of construction. Headwalls are placed upstream and 
downstream of the crossing location and pumps are placed on the upstream 
side. To minimize scouring effects downstream, energy dissipation devices are 
used. 

Wet Trench Method. The wet trench method of crossing waterbodies can be 
used to cross intermediate streams and major rivers. Trenching is conducted 
within the stream or river from the banks. Excavated material is stored on the 
banks and used for backfill. If the dimensions of the stream prohibit this type of 
construction, the trench is excavated and backfilled by the use of equipment 
operated on barges or floating equipment pads. 

Cofferdam Method. The cofferdam method of crossing streams may be used 
for wider channel crossings, and will be designed so as not to prevent the flow of 
the stream. A cofferdam will be constructed within the construction ROW from 
non-erodible materials (riprap, sand bags, jersey barriers, commercial cofferdam 
products, etc.) enclosing approximately half the streambed in a semi-circle. The 
cofferdam should seal tightly to the straambed to minimize water from entering 
the area. Pumps will be needed to keep water out of excavations. All earth 
disturbances will occur in the dry behind the cofferdam. The pipe will be installed 
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and the disturbed areas backfilled and stabilized, and sediment barriers at the 
waterline in good working order before the cofferdam is removed. Stabilization 
will be with either dprap or vegetation. The cofferdam is then set up from the 
opposite bank and extends far enough to Include the tie-in point in mid stream. 
The remainder of the pipe is installed and the tie-in weld is made. Clean up 
follows the same procedures as just descdbed. 

All stream crossings will be completed in compliance with the Commission-approved 
Plan and Procedures or state requirements whichever is more stringent. 
Blasting will only occur in minor and intermediate size streams when trenching 
performed as pert of construction is not possible. Due to the nature of the major stream 
crossings in the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline, some trench excavation may be required to 
determine the extent of blasting needed to complete the final trench. 

Reference drawings for stream crossing methods are located in Appendix 1-E. 

1.9.t4 Specialized Construction 

1.9.14.1 PL.1 EXT2 

At certain locations, the proposed pipeline traverses rugged terrain with slopes greater 
than 50 percent and bedrock at fairly shallow depths or steep sidehill area. Locations of 
rugged terrain for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline include the following: 

Section 3: 

• PL-1 EXT2 $3MP2.06 to $3MP2.26: side hill area; 

• PL-1 EXT2 $3MP6.84 to $3MP7.09: side hill area; 

• PL-1 EXT2 $3MP7.22 to $3MP7.31: side hill area; 

• PL-1 EXT2 $3MP7.50 to $3MP7.53: side hill area; and 

• PL-1 EXT2 $3MP23.69 to $3MP23.77: side hill area. 

Construction on steep slopes involves employing winch tractors (possibly more than 
one) to hold each piece of equipment while working on these slopes. Also, 'dead man' 
cables will be used to hold the pipe in place until the complete stdng of pipe has been 
welded. 

The areas identified as dilflcuit terrain are scheduled for the 2007 construction season. 
DTI has made every effort to avoid side-hill areas during route selection of the PL-1 
EXT2 pipeline, however, in some areas that was not possible. In those areas of side-hill 
construction, the ROW may be "two-toned" to provide two levels of work area. It is 
anticipated that two benches will be cut into the hillside to provide one for spoil storage 
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and trench area and another at a higher elevation (working side) to provide work area 
for equipment operation, pipe welding and coating crews. Once the individual joints of 
pipe are welded, x-rayed, coated and ready to be placed in the trench, side-booms will 
pick up the pipe and lower it from the upper bench into the trench on the lower bench. 
Backfill operations and the other phases of construction will proceed as usual. The 
side-hill areas are then restored to the pre-existing contours during the restoration 
operations. 

Dead-man cables will be utilized to hold the pipe in place in steep areas until the 
complete string of pipe has been welded. This technique consists of burying a 
structure, (timber, short pipe segment, beam) with a cable attached. The cable is 
brought out of the ground and used to tie off the piping to prevent it from moving down 
the steep grade. 

Refer to Table 8.3.1-1 for a list of residences located within 50 feet to the project ROW. 

1.9.14.2 TL-492 EX73 

The proposed pipeline does not traverse any rugged terrain with slopes greater than 
50 percent and bedrock at fairly shallow depths or steep sidehill area. No specialized 
conskuct]on areas have been identified. 

Refer to Table 8.3.1-2 for a list of structures located within 50 feet to the project ROW. 
No residences were identified within 50 feet of the project ROW. 

1.9.14.3 TL-536 and TL-453 EXT1 

At certain locations within TL-536 and TL-453 EXTI, the proposed pipeline traverses 
rugged terrain with steep slopes and bedrock at fairly shallow depths or steep sidehill 
area. 

Construction on steep slopes involves employing winch tractors (possibly more than 
one) to hold each piece of equipment while working on these slopes. Also, 'dead man' 
cables will be used to hold the pipe in place until the complete string of pipe has been 
welded. 

DTI has made every effort to avoid side-hill areas during route selection of the TL-536 
and TL-453 EXT1 pipelines, however, in some areas that was not possible. In those 
areas of side-hill construction, the ROW may be =two-toned" to provide two levels of 
work area. It is anticipated that two benches will be cut into the hnlside to provide one 
for spoil storage and trench area and another at a higher elevation (working side) to 
provide work area for equipment operation, pipe welding and coating crews. Once the 
individual joints of pipe are welded, x-rayad, coated and ready to be placed in the 
trench, side-booms will pick up the pipe and lower it from the upper bench into the 
trench on the lower bench. Backfill operations and the other phases of construction will 
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proceed as usual. The side-hill areas are then restored to the pre-existing contours 
during the restoration operations. 

Deed-man cables will be utilized to hold the pipe in place in steep areas until the 
complete string of pipe has been welded. This technique consists of burying a 
structure, (timber, short pipe segment, beam) with a cable attached. The cable is 
brought out of the ground and used to tie off the piping to prevent it from moving down 
the steep grade. 

Refer to Tables 8.2.1-3 and 8.2.1-4 for a list of residences located within 50 feet to the 
project ROW for TL-536 and TL-453 EXT1, respectively. 

t.10 PERMITS AND APPROVALS 

Identify the permits required for construction across surface waters (380.12(c)(9)). 

DTI has identified a list of environmental and archaeological permits and clearances 
that may be required for the approval of the proposed project. DTI will continue to 
investigate additional permitting requirements at all levels of government and will secure 
any necessary permits or clearances as required. 

Permit applications will be submitted in a timely manner, so as to provide sufficient 
review and processing times for their respective jurisdictional agencies. With the 
exception of this application, DTI intends to initiate the permit application process by 
submitting the USACE Section 4041105 and other permits as indicated in Table 1.10-1 
for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline, Table 1.10-2 for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline, Table 1.10-3 for 
the TL-536 pipeline, and Table 1.10-4 for the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. Other permit 
applications will be submitted theraaffer. 

1.11 AFFECTED LANDOWNERS 

Provide the names and mailing addresses of all affected landowners and certify 
that all affected landowners will be notified as required in 157.6(d). (380.12(c)(10)). 

DTI has identified affected landowners as specified in §157.6(d). A list of these 
landowners will be filed under separate cover as "Privileged Information" from this 
Environmental Report. Refer to Table 1.11-1 for the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline, Table 1.11-2 
for the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline, Table 1.11-3 for the TL-536 pipeline, and Table 1.11-4 for 
the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. 

To date, DTI has communicated directly with the property owners regarding proposed 
route, archaeological and environmental surveys of their property with a letter and a 
phone call. Four open houses, one each in Juniata, Mifflin, Centre, and Clinton 
Counties, were held in the spring of 2004. One open house was held in Greene County 
and one open house was held in Potter County in the summer of 2004. 
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1.12 EXPANSION PLANS 

Describe reasonable foreseeable plans for future expansion of facilities, Including 
additional land requirements and the compatibility of those plans with the current 
proposal (380.12(c)(8)). 

At this time, DTI does not have reasonably foreseeable plans for future expansion of 
facilities. 

1.13 REFERENCES 

Federal Energy Regulatory Commission. 2003. Upland Erosion Control, Revegetation, 
and Maintenance Plan. January 17, 2003. 

Federal Energy Regulatory Commission. 2003. Wetland and Waterbody Construction 
and M#igatlon Procedures. January 17, 2003. 

Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, Certificate of Public Convenience and 
Necessity. http://www.the Commlssion.fad.us/gas/regs/157.html. 

Pennsylvania Department of Transportation. Sections of 49 Code of Federal 
Regulations 190 through 199 (Sections192.463, 192.707, 192.467, 192.491, 
192.705, and 192.706). 

V 
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Table 1.1-1 

COVE POINT PIPELINE CUSTOMER INFORMATION 

Firm Service QuantlUes 
Service 

Dominion 
Transmission FT 
Service 

Service Quantity 
700,000 Dt per Day 

Receipt Point 
Loudoun, VA 

Delivery Point 
200 MDt per Day - 
Chambersburg, PA 
400 MDt per Day- Leidy, PA 
100 MDt per Day - 
Dominion South Point 

Dominion 6 MMDt Capadty, Dominion Dominion Transmission "ST 
Transmission Storage 100 MDt Demand Transmission PoinF 
Service "ST Point" 

V 
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Table 1.2-1 

LAND REQUIREMENTS FOR THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE FACILITIES 

TotalLength 
(miles) 
80.66 

Land Affected Dudn~ 
Constructlon(acms~ 

Land Affected Dudng 
Opemtlon(ac~s) 2 

878.12 488.88 

N o t e s :  

I 

2 

Construction ROWs use a 75-foot width and include EWS and pipeyards. 

Permanent ROWs use a 50-foot width, included within the construction ROW, 

V 
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Table 1.2-2 

LOCATION AND DESCRIPTION OF THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPEUNE FACILITIES 

County 
Juniata 3 

Milepost I 

Pipeline 
Diameter 
(Inches) 

30 

Pipeline 
Type 
New 

Length 
(miles) = 

0.25 SIMP0.0 through $1MP0.25 

Juniata $1 MPO.25 through $1MP8.06 24 New 7.81 

Mifflin $1MP8.06 through $1 MP23.80 24 New 15.40 

Huntingdon $1 MP23.80 through S2MP1.53 24 New 4.51 

Centre S2MP1.53 through $3MP6.88 24 New 33.97 

Clinton $3MP6.88 through $3MP25.50 24 New 18.73 

V 

Notes: 

1 

2 

3 

Milepost measurement taken from Construction Alignment Sheets. 

Length measurement taken from the construction alignment foot stationing and 
converted to miles. 

PL-5, a 16-inch pipeline, will lay parallel to PL-1 EXT2 for the first 0.25-mile 
within the same PL-1 EXT2 ROW. 

V 
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Table 1.2-3 

LAND REQUIREMENTS FOR THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPELINE FACILITIES 

Total Length 
(miles) 

10.7 

Land Affected Dudn~j 
Construction (acres)' 

Land Affected During 
Operation (acres) = 

116.11 65.36 

Notes: 

1 Construction ROWs use a 75-foot width and include EWS, new access roads, 
and pipeyard facilities. 

Permanent ROWs use a 50-foot width, included withln the construction ROW. 
The total includes new access roads. 

V 
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Table 1.2-4 

LOCATION AND DESCRIPTION OF THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPELINE FACILITIES 

County 
and State Milepost t 

Greene, PA 

Wetzel, WV 0.00 to 0.35 

Greene, PA 0.35to 10.7 24 

10.7 Gate Valve 

Greene, PA 10.7 

Pipeline Diameter 
(Inches) 

24 

Pig Receiver Site 

Pipeline 
Type Length = 
New 0.35 Miles 

New 10.35 Miles 

Existing 
100 Feet by 100 Feet 

Existing 

Notes: 

1 Milepost measurement taken from Construction Alignment Sheets. 

Length measurement taken from the construction alignment foot stationing and 
converted to miles. 

V 
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Table 1.2-5 

LAND REQUIREMENTS FOR THE TL-536 PIPELINE FACILITIES 

Total Length 
(mllee) 

9.49 

Land Affected Dudn~ 
Constructlon(acras~ 

102.67 

Land Affected Dudng 
Operation (acres) 2 

70.56 

Notes: 

1 Construction ROWs use a 75-foot width and include EWS. 

Permanent ROWs use a 50-foot width, included within the construction ROW. 
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Table 1.2-6 

LOCATION AND DESCRIPTION OF THE TL-536 PIPELINE FACILITIES 

Township 
Genesee 

Milepost 1 
0.0 through 1.81 

Pipeline Diameter 
(Inches) 

20 

Pipeline 
Type 
New 

Length 
(miles) 2 

1.81 

Oswayo 1.81 through 8.71 20 New 6.90 

Sharon 8.71 through 9.49 20 New 0.78 

Notes: 

1 Milepost measurement taken from Construction Alignment Sheets. 

Length measurement taken from the construction alignment foot stationing and 
converted to miles. 

V 
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Table 1.2-7 

LAND REQUIREMENTS FOR THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPELINE FACILITIES 

Total Length 
(miles) 
11.55 

Land Affected Dudn~ 
ConstrucUon(acms~ 

Land Affected Dudng 
Operation(acres) = 

135.53 70.01 

Notes: 

I 

2 

Construction ROWs use a 75-foot width and include EWS, pipeyards, and 
associated facilities 

Permanent ROWs use a 50-foot width, included within the construction ROW. 

V 
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Table 1.2-8 

LOCATION AND DESCRIPTION OF THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPELINE FACILITIES 

Township 
Genesee 

Bingham 

Harrison 

Milepost t 
0.0 through 2.61 

2.61 through 9.34 

9.34 through 11.55 

Pipeline Diameter 
(Inches) 

24 

24 

24 

Pipeline 
Type 
New 

New 

New 

Length 
(miles) = 

2.61 

6.73 

2.21 

N o t e s :  

1 

2 

Milepost measurement taken from Construction Alignment Sheets. 

Length measurement taken from the construction alignment foot stationing and 
converted to miles. 

v 
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Table 1.9-1 

ROADS AND RAILROADS CROSSED BY THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE 

v 

Abbreviation/Name Milepost 
Section 1 
S.R. 3023/Lick Run Road 
T-387NVillow Run Road 
T-314/l'urkey Ridge Road 
S.R. 0035 
S.R. 4006/Be99ars Row Road 
S.R. 4005/Blacklogg Road 
Pine Ridge Road 
East Lickin~l Creek Road 
T-344 
S.R. 103 
Norfolk and Southern Railroad 
Norfolk and Southern Railroad 
T-307 
T-710 
U.S. Route 22 
S.R. 4013 
T-397 
T-362 
S.R. 655 
T-364/Dq/House Road 
S.R. 4005 

0.50 
3.55 
4.17 
4.53 
4.69 
6.31 
7.75 
9.62 

11.95 
11.95 
12.24 
12.25 
12.73 
13.48 
14.89 
16.04 
16.60 
19.20 
19.98 
20.66 
21.33 

S.R. 4005 21.43 
T-370 22.46 
S.R. 4006 22.72 
Barrville Road 23.19 
Rail Hollow Road 24.17 
Broad Mountain Road 24.7t 
Section 2 
T-603/Treaster Kettle Road 4.09 
T-600 6.43 
Route 322 6.56 
S.R. 0045 8.46 
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Table 1.9-1 (Continued) 

Abbreviation/Name 
Section 2 Continued) 
Pennsylvania Railroad 
S.R. 2006/Upper Brush Valley Road 
S.R. 0144 
T-420/Green Valley Road 
S.R. 0064 
T-432/Witherite Road 
Nittany Bald Eagle Railroad 
S.R. 0026 
T425/Weaver Hill Road 

I T-436/Airport Road 
T-425/Lutz Lane 
S.R. 550 
1-99/U.S. Route 220/Bellefonte Bypass 

' T-147/Jacksonville Road 

Milepost 

9,12 
9.89 

10.41 
11.20 
13.19 
13.37 
13.50 
13.93 
14.66 
15.18 
15.28 
15.79 
16.46 
17.04 

S.R. 1006 18.83 
Interstate 80 Eastbound 19,21 
Interstate 80 Westbound 19.26 
Pennsyk, ania Railroad 19.35 
U.S. Route 220/Route 150 19.37 
T-398 21.83 
S.R. 1002 23.35 
Kato Road 28.60 
Section 3 
New York Central Railroad 2.31 
DeHass Road 5.32 
S.R. 144 9.03 
Jews Run Road 9.64 
Jews Run Road 10.25 
Jews Run Road 10.39 
ConRail Railroad 14.51 
S.R. 120/Renovo Road 14.54 
T-468/Bitumen Road 16.42 
S.R. 4001/Kettle Creek Road 17.49 
Two Mile Road 17.66 

V 
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Table 1.9-1 (Continued) 

AbbrevlaUon/Name Milepost 
Section 3 (Continued) 
Huling Branch Road 
Two Mile Road 

17.71 
18.46 

Robbins Hollow Road 19.11 
Shintown Run Road 20.92 
Bi 9 Basin Road 21.42 
Red Hill Road 24.94 
S.R. 0144/Tamarack Road 25.32 

v 
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Table 1.9-2 

ROADS AND RAILROADS CROSSED BY THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPELINE 

V 

County and State Abbreviation/Name Milepost 

Wetzel, WV S.R. 69 0.09 

1.04 Greene, PA T-305 

T-321 1.99 

T-321 2.36 

T-337 2.39 

T-364 2.62 

T-349 3.15 

S.R. 3008 4.39 

T-406 4.72 

T-369 5.61 

S.R. 3007 6.47 

T-428 6.64 

Railroad Tracks 7.78 

S.R. 3009 7.88 

T432 8.67 

T-724 9.64 

V 
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Table 1.9-3 

ROADS CROSSED BY THE TL-536 PIPELINE IN POTTER COUNTY 

V 

Abbreviation/Name Milepost Township 

S.R. 4018 0.03 Genesee 

T-533 0.40 Genesee 

T-520 0.69 Genesee 

T-386 1.55 Genesee 

T-384 2.08 Oswayo 

Farm Road 3.07 Oswayo 

Farm Road 3.09 Oswayo 

S.R. 4023 3.11 Oswayo 

Farm Road 3.36 Oswayo 

T-382 3.81 Oswayo 

T-379 4.89 Oswayo 

T-375 7.14 Oswayo 

T-371 8.61 Oswayo 

Road 8.95 Sharon 

Road 9.08 Sharon 
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Table 1.9-4 

ROADS CROSSED BY THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPELINE IN POTTER COUNTY 

W 

Abbreviation/Name Milepost Township 

T-459 0.19 Genesee 

T-558 1.27 Genesee 

S.R. 0449 2.21 Genesee 

Well Road 3.79 Bingham 

S.R. 1011 4.34 Bingham 

T-409 6.01 Bingham 

T-409 6.52 Bingham 

S.R. 1015 6.73 Bingham 

T-408 6.88 Bingham 

Woods Road 7.86 Bingham 

S.R. 1010 9.65 Harrison 

T-408 10.24 Harrison 

T-482 10.88 Harrison 

T-457 11.01 Harrison 

v 
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Table 1.10-1 

OTHER PERMITS AND APPROVALS APPLICABLE TO THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE 

V 

V 

Permit/Approval Admlnlstedn~l A~lency Status 
Federal 
Cert~cate of Public Convenience and 
Necessity 
Clean Water Act, Section 404 

Section 7 Consultation Approval under 
the Endangered Species Act 

Essential Fish Habitat, Section 7 ESA 
Consultation 

Commission 

USACE 

United States Fish and 
Wildlife Service (USFWS) 

NMFS 

Submitted December 
2004. 
Ongoing (Indiana bat, 
bald eagle, Northesstem 
bulrush). 
Ongoing. 

State 
Clean Water Act, Section 401 PaDEP 
Permit for Construction Activity 
Stormw ter Discharge/Erosion and 
Sediment Control (PAG-2) 

Hydrostatic Testing Permit (PAG-10) 

Chapters 105 and 106 Joint Federal/ 
State Application in Pennsylvania 
Water Obstruction and Encroachment 
Permit/Submerged Lands License 
Agreement 

Section 401 WQC/NPDES 
Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened and Endangered Species 
Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened and Endangered Species 
Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened and Endangered Species 

Consultation and Approval, National 
Historic Preservation Act of 1966 

25 PA. Code 92 and102; 
Delegated to County 
Conservation Districts and 
Permit issued by PaDEP 
Regional Offices 
PaDEP Bureau of Water 
Quality Protection 

PaDEP for Juniata, Mifflin, 
Huntingdon, Centre, and 
Clinton Counties 105 
Authority Delegated to 
County Conservation 
Districts 

PA Statewide Permit 
issued November 24, 
2004; effective until 
November 22, 2009. 
High-Quality Addendum 
may be required. 

PA Game Commission 
(PGC) 
Pennsylvania Department 
of Conservation and 
Natural Resources 
(PADCNR) 

PaDEP 
PFBC Completed June 7, 2004. 

Completed July 1,2004. 

PA Historic and Museum 
Commission, Bureau of 
Historic Preservation 
(PHMC-BHP) 

Completed June 29, 
2004. 

Ongoing. 
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Table 1.10-1 (Continued) 

Permit/Approval Admlnlsteflng Agency Status 
County 
Juniata County NPDES/Erosion and Juniata County 
Sedimentation Control Conservation District 
Mifflin County NPDES/Erosion and Mifflin County 
Sedimentation Control Conservation District 
Huntingdon County NPDES/Erosion Huntingdon County 
and Sedimentation Control/ Conservation District 
Chapter 105 Review 
Centre County NPDES/Erosion and Centre County 
Sedimentatk)n ControUChapter 105 Conservation District 
Review 
Clinton County NPDES/Erosion and Clinton County 
Sedimentation Control/Chapter 105 Conservation District 
Review 

V 

V 
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Table 1.10-2 

OTHER PERMITS AND APPROVALS APPLICABLE TO THE TL.492 EXT3 PIPELINE 

V 

Permit/Approval Administering Agency Status 
Federal 
Certif'cate of Public Convenience and Commission 
Necessity 
Clean Water Act, Section 404 USACE Application being 

prepared. 
USFWS Complete. Section 7 Consultation Approval under 

the Endangered Species Act 
Pennsylvania - State 
Clean Water Act, Section 401 PaDEP 
Permit for Construction Activity 
Stormwater Discharge/Erosion and 
Sediment Control (PAG-2) 

Hydrostatic Testing Permit (PAG-10) 

25 PA. Code 92 and102; 
Delegated to County 
Conservation Districts and 
Permit issued by PaDEP 
Regional Offices 
PaDEP Bureau of Water 
Quality Protection 

PA Statewide Permit 
issued November 24, 
2004; effective until 
November 22, 2009. 

Chapters 105 and 106 Joint Federal/ PaDEP 
State Application in Pennsylvania 
Water Obstruction and Encroachment 
Permit/Submerged Lands License 
A~reement 
Section 401 WQC/NPDES PaDEP 

PFBC Complete. 

PGC 

PADCNR 

PHMC-BHP 

Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened and Endant~ered Species 
Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened and Endan~lered Species 
Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened and Endangered Species 
Consultation and Approval, National 
Historic Preservation Act of 1966 

Complete. 

Complete. 

Completed 
February 11, 2005. 

West Vir~llnla - State 
Clean Water Act, Section 401 
[WV Department of Envlronmentel 
Protection (WVDEP) has issued 401 
water quality certification pending 
oompliance with certain conditions 
and/or limitations for NWP 12] 

WVDEP In preparation with 
USACE NWP 
application. 

V 
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Table 1.10-2 (Continued) 

Permit/Approval I AdmlnlatedngAgency ] Status 
West VirQInla - State (continued) 
WV/NPDES Permit No. WV0331069 
General Permit for Hydrostatic Testing 
Water (new pipeline and compressor 
station pipelines) 

WVDEP Application in 
preparation. 

NPDES General Permit for Stormwater WVDEP Application in 
Discharges from Construction Activities preparation. 
and ESCP 
Cultural Resources Consultation SHPO Completed February 2, 

2O05. 
County 
Greene County NPDES/Erosion and Greene County 
Sedimentation Control Conservation District 

V 

v 
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Table 1.10-3 

OTHER PERMITS AND APPROVALS APPLICABLE TO THE TL-536 PIPELINE 

V 

Permit/Approval Admlnlstedn~l A~lency 
Federal 

Status 

Certificate of Public Convenience and 
Necessib/ 
Clean Water Act, Section 404 

Section 7 Consultation Approval under 
the Endangered Species Act 

Commission 

USACE 

USFWS 

Application being 
prepared. 
Complete. 

State 
Clean Water Act, Section 401 PaDEP 
Permit for Construction ActNtty 
Stormwater Discharge/Erosion and 
Sediment Control (PAG-2) 

Hydrostatic Testing Permit (PAG-10) 

25 PA. Code 92 and102; 
Delegated to County 
Conservation Districts and 
Permit issued by PaDEP 
Regional Offices 
PaDEP Bureau of Water 
Quality Protection 

PA Statewide Permit 
issued November 24, 
2004; effective until 
November 22, 2009. 
High-Quality Addendum 
may be required. 

Chapters 105 and 106 Joint Federal/ PaDEP 
State Application in Pennsylvania 
Water Obstruction and Encroachment 
Permit/Submerged Lands Ucense 
Agreement 
Section 401 WQC/NPDES PaDEP 

PFBC Completed June 2004. 

PGC Completed June 2004. 

Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened and Endangered Species 
Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened and Endangered Species 
Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened and Endangered Species 
Consultation and Approval, National 
Historic Preservation Act of 1966 

PADCNR Completed June 2004. 

PHMC-BHP I Completed January 26, 
2005.  

Count,/ 
Potter Coun~ NPDES/Ercelon and Potter County 
Sedimentation Conb'ol Conservation District 

v 
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Table 1.10-4 

OTHER PERMITS AND APPROVALS APPLICABLE TO THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPELINE 

V 

Permlt/Approval Admlnlstedn~l A~ency 
Federal 
Certificate of Public Convenience and Commission 
Necessity 
Clean Water Act, Section 404 USACE 

Status 

Section 7 Consultation Approval under 
the Endangered Species Act 
Essential Fish HabitaL Section 7 ESA 
Consultation 

USFWS 

NMFS 

Application being 
prepared. 

Ongoing. 

State 
Clean Water Act, Section 401 PaDEP 
Permit for Construction Activity 
Stormwater Discharge/Erosion and 
Sediment Control (PAG-2) 

Hydrostatic Testing Permit (PAG-10) 

Chapters 105 and 106 Joint Federal/ 
State Application in Pennsylvania 
Water Obstruction and Encroachment 
Permit/Submerged Lands License 
Agreement 

25 PA. Code 92 and102; 
Delegated to County 
Conservation Districts and 
Permit issued by PaDEP 
Regional Offices 
PaDEP Bureau of Water 
Quality Protection 

PaDEP 

Section 401 WQC/NPDES PaDEP 
PFBC Consultation and Approval, 

Threatened and Endangered Species 

Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened end Endangered Species 
Consultation and Approval, 
Threatened end Endangered Species 
ConsuitatJon and Approval, National 
Historic Preservation Act of 1966 

PGC 

PA Statewide Permit 
issued November 24, 
2004; effective until 
November 22, 2009. 
High-Quality Addendum 
may be required. 

Ongoing (Middle Branch 
Geneses River- 
American brook lamprey). 
Completed September 
2004. 

PADCNR Completed September 
2004. 

PHMC-BHP Completed February 14, 
2005. 

county 
Potter County NPDES/Erosion and Potter County I 
Sedimentation Control Conservation District I 
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NON-INTER,NET PUBLIC INFORMATION 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
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V 

FIGURES 1.2-1 THROUGH 1.2-28 FOR PL-1 EXT2 

FIGURES 1.2-32 THROUGH 1.2-36 FOR TL-492 EXT3 

FIGURES 1.2-38 THROUGH 1.2-42 FOR TL.536 
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SITE LOCATION MAPS 
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COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
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V 

FIGURE 1.2-29: HDD PLAN FOR PL-1 EXT2 - JUNIATA RIVER 

FIGURE 1.2-30: HDD PLAN FOR PL-I EXT2 - 1-991S.R. 0026 

FIGURE 1.2.31: HDD PLAN FOR PL-1 EXT2 - BALD EAGLE CREEK 

FIGURE 1.2-37: CONCEPT DRAWING FOR TL-492 EXT3 

FIGURE 1.2-43: STATE LINE STATION PLOT PLAN 

FIGURE 1.2JA: SHARON M&R STATION PLOT PLAN 

FIGURE 1.2-52: ELLISBURG STATION PLOT PLAN 

FIGURE 1.2-53: HARRISON STATION PLOT PLAN 

FIGURE 1.2-54: WOODHULL STATION PLOT PLAN 

(UNDERSEPARATECOVER) 
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UPLAND EROSION CONTROL, REVEGETATION, AND 
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UPLAND EROSION CONTROL, REVEGETATION, AND 

MAINTENANCE PLAN 
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I. 

UPLAND EROSION CONTROL, REVEGETATION, 
AND MAINTENANCE PLAN (PLAN) 

A. The intent of this Plan is to assist applicants by 
identifying baseline mitigation measures for minimizing 
erosion and enhancing revegetation. The project sponsors 
should specify in their applications for a FERC 
Certificate (Certificate) any individual measures in this 
Plan they consider unnecessary, technically infeasible, 
or unsuitable due to local conditions and to fully 
describe any alternative measures they would use. 
Applicants should also explain how those alternative 
measures would achieve a comparable level of mitigation. 

Once a project is certificated, further changes can be 
approved. Any such changes from the measures in this 
Plan (or the applicant's approved plan) will be approved 
by the Director of the Office of Energy Projects 
(Director), upon the applicant's written request, if the 
Director agrees that an alternative measure: 

I. provides equal or better environmental protection; 

. is necessary because a portion of this Plan is 
infeasible or unworkable based on project-specific 
conditions; or 

. is specifically required in writing by another 
Federal, state, or Native American land management 
agency for the portion of the project on its land or 
under its jurisdiction. 

Any requirements in this Plan to file material with the 
Secretary of the FERC (Secretary) do not apply to 
projects undertaken under the provisions of the blanket 
certificate program. This exemption does not apply to a 
request for alternative measures. 

Project-related impacts on wetland and waterbody systems 
are addressed in the staff's Wetland and Waterbody 
Construction and Mitigation Procedures (Procedures). 

V 

] 01/17/20~ VERSION 
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If. SUPERVISION AND INSPECTION 

A. ENVIRONMENTAL INSPECTION 

i. At least one Environmental Inspector is required for 
each construction spread during construction and 
restoration (as defined by section V). The number 
and experience of Environmental Inspectors assigned 
to each construction spread should be appropriate 
for the length of the construction spread and the 
number/significance of resources affected. 

. Environmental Inspectors shall have peer status with 
all other activity inspectors. 

. Environmental Inspectors shall have the authority to 
stop activities that violate the environmental 
conditions of the Certificate, state and Federal 
environmental permit conditions, or landowner 
requirements; and to order appropriate corrective 
action. 

B. RESPONSIBILITIES OF ENVIRONMENTAL INSPECTORS 

At a minimum, the Environmental Inspector(s) shall be 
responsible for: 

. Ensuring compliance with the requirements of this 
Plan, the Procedures, the environmental conditions 
of the Certificate authorization, the mitigation 
measures proposed by the applicant (as approved 
and/or modified by the Certificate), other 
environmental permits and approvals, and 
environmental requirements in landowner easement 
agreements. 

. Identifying, documenting, and overseeing corrective 
actions, as necessary to bring an activity back into 
compliance; 

. Verifying that the limits of authorized construction 
work areas and locations of access roads are 
properly marked before clearing; 

. Verifying the location of signs and highly visible 
flagging marking the boundaries of sensitive 
resource areas, waterbodies, wetlands, or areas with 
special requirements along the construction work 
area; 

01/'17/20~ VERSION 
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V 

. 

. 

7. 

. 

. 

i0. 

ii. 

12. 

13. 

Identifying erosion/sediment control and soil 
stabilization needs in all areas; 

Ensuring that the location of dewatering structures 
and slope breakers will not direct water into known 
cultural resources sites or locations of sensitive 
species; 

Verifying that trench dewatering activities do not 
result in the deposition of sand, silt, and/or 
sediment near the point of discharge into a wetland 
or waterbody. If such deposition is occurring, the 
dewatering activity shall be stopped and the design 
of the discharge shall be changed to prevent 
reoccurrence; 

Ensuring that subsoil and topsoil are tested in 
agricultural and residential areas to measure 
compaction and determine the need for corrective 
action; 

Advising the Chief Construction Inspector when 
conditions (such as wet weather) make it advisable 
to restrict construction activities to avoid 
excessive rutting; 

Ensuring restoration of contours and topsoil; 

Verifying that the soils imported for agricultural 
or residential use have been certified as free of 
noxious weeds and soil pests, unless otherwise 
approved by the landowner; 

Determining the need for and ensuring that erosion 
controls are properly installed, as necessary to 

prevent sediment flow into wetlands, waterbodies, 
sensitive areas, and onto roads; 

Inspecting and ensuring the maintenance of temporary 
erosion control measures at least: 

a. on a daily basis in areas of active 
construction or equipment operation; 

b. on a weekly basis in areas with no construction 
or equipment operation; and 

C. within 24 hours of each 0.5 inch of rainfall; 
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14. Ensuring the repair of all ineffective temporary 
erosion control measures within 24 hours of 
identification; 

15. Keeping records of compliance with the environmental 
conditions of the FERC certificate, and the 
mitigation measures proposed by the project sponsor 
in the application submitted to the FERC, and other 
Federal or state environmental permits during active 
construction and restoration; and 

16. Identifying areas that should be given special 
attention to ensure stabilization and restoration 
after the construction phase. 

III. ~RECONSTRUCTION PLANNING 

The project sponsor shall do the following before 
construction: 

A. CONSTRUCTION WORK AREAS 

1. Identify all construction work areas (e.g., 
construction rlght-of-way, extra work space areas, 
pipe storage and contractor yards, borrow and 
disposal areas, access roads, etc.) that would be 
needed for safe construction. The project sponsor 
must ensure that appropriate cultural resources and 
biological surveys have been conducted. 

. Project sponsors are encouraged to consider 
expanding any required cultural resources and 
endangered species surveys in anticipation of the 
need for activities outside of certificated work 
areas. 

B. DRAIN TILE AND IRRIGATION SYSTEMS 

i. Attempt to locate existing drain tiles and 
irrigation systems. 

. Contact landowners and local soil conservation 
authorities to determine the locations of future 
drain tiles that are likely to be installed within 3 
years of the authorized construction. 

. Develop procedures for constructing through drain- 
tiled areas, maintaining irrigation systems during 
construction, and repairing drain tiles and 
irrigation systems after construction. 

4 o1,~r~o3 
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C. 

D. 

E. 

F. 

G. 

. Engage qualified drain tile specialists, as needed 
to conduct or monitor repairs to drain tile systems 
affected by construction. Use drain tile 
specialists from the project area, if available. 

GRAZING DEFERMENT 

Develop grazing deferment plans with willing landowners, 
grazing permittees, and land management agencies to 
minimize grazing disturbance of revegetation efforts. 

ROAD CROSSINGS AND ACCESS POINTS 

Plan for safe and accessible conditions at all roadway 
crossings and access points during construction and 
restoration. 

DISPOSAL PLANNING 

Determine methods and locations for the disposal of 
construction debris (e.g., timber, slash, mats, garbage, 
drilling fluids, excess rock, etc). Off-site disposal in 
other than commercially operated disposal locations is 
subject to compliance with all applicable survey, 
landowner permission, and mitigation requirements. 

AGENCY COORDINATION 

The project sponsor must coordinate with the appropriate 
local, state, and Federal agencies as outlined in this 
Plan and in the Certificate. 

. Obtain written recommendations from the local soil 
conservation authorities or land management agencies 
regarding permanent erosion control and revegetation 
specifications. 

. Develop specific procedures in coordination with the 
appropriate agency to prevent the introduction or 
spread of noxious weeds and soll pests resulting 
from construction and restoration activities. 

STORMWATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN 

Make available on each construction spread the Stormwater 
Pollution Prevention Plan prepared for compliance with 
the U.S. Environmental Protection Agency's National 
Stormwater Program General Permit requirements. 

01/17/2003VERSION 
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IV. 

A. APPROVED AREAS OF DISTURBANCE 

i. Project-related ground disturbance shall be limited 
to the construction right-of-way, extra work space 
areas, pipe storage yards, borrow and disposal 
areas, access roads, and other areas approved in the 
Certificate. Any project-related ground disturbing 
activities outside these Certificated areas, except 
those needed to comply with the Plan and Procedures 
(e.g., slope breakers, energy-dissipating devices, 
dewatering structures, drain tile system repairs) 
will require prior Director approval. All 
construction or restoration activities outside of 
the Certificated areas are subject to all applicable 
survey and mitigation requirements. 

. The construction right-of-way width for a project 
shall not exceed 75 feet or that described in the 
FERC application unless otherwise modified by a 
Certificate condition. However, in limited, non- 
wetland areas, this construction right-of-way width 
may be expanded by up to 25 feet without Director 
approval to accommodate full construction right-of- 
way topsoil segregation and to ensure safe 
construction where topographic conditions (such as 
side-slopes) or soil limitations require it. 
Twenty-five feet of extra construction right-of-way 
width may also be used in limited, non-wetland or 
non-forested areas for truck turn-arounds where no 
reasonable alternative access exists. 

Project use of these additional limited areas is 
subject to landowner approval and compliance with 

all applicable survey and mitigation requirements. 
When such additional areas are used, each one should 
be identified and the need explained in the weekly 
or biweekly construction reports to the FERC, if 
required. The following material should be included 
in the reports: 

a. the location of each additional area by station 
number and reference to a previously filed 
alignment sheet, or updated alignment sheets 
showing the additional areas; 

b. identification of where the Commission's 
records contain evidence that the additional 
areas were previously surveyed; and 

01/17/200~ ~:~ISJON 
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C. a statement that landowner approval has been 
obtained and is available in project files. 

Prior written approval of the Director is required 
when the Certificated construction right-of-way 
width would be expanded by more than 25 feet. 

TOPSOIL SEGREGATION 

. Unless the landowner or land management agency 
specifically approves otherwise, prevent the mixing 
of topsoil with subsoil by stripping topsoil from 
either the full work area or from the trench and 
subsoil storage area (ditch plus spoil side method) 
in: 

a. actively cultivated or rotated croplands and 
pastures ; 

b. residential areas; 

c. hayfields; and 

d. other areas at the landowner's or land managing 

agency's request. 

. In residential areas importation of topsoil is an 
acceptable alternative to topsoil segregation. 

. In deep soils (more than 12 inches of topsoil), 
segregate at least 12 inches of topsoil. In soils 
with less than 12 inches of topsoil make every 
effort to segregate the entire topsoil layer. 

. Where topsoil segregation is required, maintain 

separation of salvaged topsoil and subsoil 
throughout all construction activities. 

. Segregated topsoil may not be used for padding the 
pipe. 

DRAIN TILES 

. Mark locations of drain tiles damaged during 
construction. 

. Probe all drainage tile systems within the area of 
disturbance to check for damage. 
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. Repair damaged drain tiles to their original or 
better condition. Do not use filter-covered drain 
tiles unless the local soll conservation authorities 
and the landowner agree. Use qualified specialists 
for testing and repairs. 

. For new pipelines in areas where drain tiles exist 
or are planned, ensure that the depth of cover over 
the pipeline is sufficient to avoid interference 
with drain tile systems. For adjacent pipeline 
loops in agricultural areas, install the new 
pipeline with at least the same depth of cover as 
the existing pipeline(s). 

IRRIGATION 

Maintain water flow in crop irrigation systems, unless 
shutoff is coordinated with affected parties. 

ROAD CROSSINGS AND ACCESS POINTS 

i. Maintain safe and accessible conditions at all road 
crossings and access points during construction. 

. If crushed stone access pads are used in residential 
or active agricultural areas, place the stone on 
synthetic fabric to facilitate removal. 

TEMPORARY EROSION CONTROL 

Install temporary erosion controls immediately after 
initial disturbance of the soil. Temporary erosion 
controls must be properly maintained throughout 
construction (on a daily basis) and reinstalled as 
necessary (such as after backfilling of the trench) until 
replaced by permanent erosion controls or restoration is 
complete. 

i. Temporary Slope Breakers 

a° Temporary slope breakers are intended to reduce 
runoff velocity and divert water off the 
construction right-of-way. Temporary slope 
breakers may be constructed of materials such 
as soil, silt fence, staked hay or straw bales, 
or sand bags. 

V 
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b. Install temporary slope breakers on all 
disturbed areas, as necessary to avoid 
excessive erosion. Temporary slope breakers 
must be installed on slopes greater than 5 
percent where the base of the slope is less 
than 50 feet from waterbody, wetland, and road 
crossings at the following spacing (closer 
spacing should be used if necessary): 

Slope {%) 
5 - 15 300 

>15 - 30 200 
>30 I00 

c. Direct the outfall of each temporary slope 
breaker to a stable, well vegetated area or 
construct an energy-dissipating device at the 
end of the slope breaker and off the 
construction right-of-way. 

d. Position the outfall of each temporary slope 
breaker to prevent sediment discharge into 
wetlands, waterbodies, or other sensitive 
resources. 

Sediment Barriers 

a. Sediment barriers are intended to stop the flow 
of sediments and to prevent the deposition of 
sediments into sensitive resources. They may 
be constructed of materials such as silt fence, 
staked hay or straw bales, compacted earth 
(e.g., driveable berms across travelways), sand 
bags, or other appropriate materials. 

b. At a minimum, install and maintain temporary 
sediment barriers across the entire 
construction right-of-way at the base of slopes 
greater than 5 percent where the base of the 
slope is less than 50 feet from a waterbody, 
wetland, or road crossing until revegetation is 
successful as defined in this Plan. Leave 
adequate room between the base of the slope and 
the sediment barrier to accommodate ponding of 
water and sediment deposition. 

V 
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c. Where wetlands or waterbodies are adjacent to 
and downslope of construction work areas, 
install sediment barriers along the edge of 
these areas, as necessary to prevent sediment 
flow into the wetland or waterbody. 

Mulch 

a. Apply mulch on all slopes (except in actively 
cultivated cropland) concurrent with or 
immediately after seeding, where necessary to 
stabilize the soil surface and to reduce wind 
and water erosion. Spread mulch uniformly over 
the area to cover at least 75 percent of the 
ground surface at a rate of 2 tons/acre of 
straw or its equivalent, unless the local soil 
conservation authority, landowner, or land 
managing agency approves otherwise in writing. 

b. Mulch can consist of weed-free straw or hay, 
wood fiber hydromulch, erosion control fabric, 
or some functional equivalent. 

C. Mulch before seeding if: 

(l) final grading and installation of 
permanent erosion control measures, will 
not be completed in an area within 20 days 
after the trench in that area is 
backfilled (10 days in residential areas), 
as required in section V.A.I; or 

(2) construction or restoration activity is 
interrupted for extended periods, such as 
when seeding cannot be completed due to 

seeding period restrictions. 

d. If mulching before seeding, increase mulch 
application on all slopes within 100 feet of 
waterbodies and wetlands to a rate of 3 
tons/acre of straw or equivalent. 

e. If wood chips are used as mulch, do not use 
more than 1 ton/acre and add the equivalent of 
ii ibs/acre available nitrogen (at least 50 
percent of which is slow release). 

v 
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A. CLEANUP 

Ensure that mulch is adequately anchored to 
minimize loss due to wind and water. 

When anchoring with liquid mulch binders, use 
rates recommended by the manufacturer. Do not 
use liquid mulch binders within I00 feet of 
wetlands or waterbodies. 

Install erosion control fabric on waterbody 
banks at the time of final bank recontouring. 
Anchor the erosion control fabric with staples 
or other appropriate devices. 

. 

. 

. 

Commence cleanup operations immediately following 
backfill operations. Complete final grading, 
topsoil replacement, and installation of permanent 
erosion control structures within 20 days after 
backfilling the trench (10 days in residential 
areas). If seasonal or other weather conditions 
prevent compliance with these time frames, maintain 
temporary erosion controls (temporary slope breakers 
and sediment barriers) until conditions allow 
completion of cleanup. 

The project sponsor should file with the Secretary 
for the review and written approval of the Director, 
a winterization plan if construction will continue 
into the winter season when conditions could delay 
successful decompaction, topsoil replacement, or 
seeding until the following spring. 

A travel lane may be left open temporarily to allow 
access by construction traffic if the temporary 
erosion control structures are installed as 
specified in section IV.F. and inspected and 
maintained as specified in sections II.B.12 through 
14. When access is no longer required the travel 
lane must be removed and the right-of-way restored. 

Rock excavated from the trench may be used to 
backfill the trench only to the top of the existing 
bedrock profile. Rock that is not returned to the 
trench should be considered construction debris, 
unless approved for use as mulch or for some other 
use on the construction work areas by the landowner 
or land managing agency. 
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4. Remove excess rock from at least the top 12 inches 
of soil in all actively cultivated or rotated 
cropland and pastures, hayfields, and residential 
areas, as well as other areas at the landowner's 
request. The size, density, and distribution of 

rock on the construction work area should be similar 
to.adjacent areas not disturbed by construction. 
The landowner may approve other provisions in 

writing. 

. Grade the construction right-of-way to restore pre- 
construction contours and leave the soil in the 
proper condition for planting. 

. Remove construction debris from all construction 
work areas unless the landowner or land managing 

agency approves otherwise. 

7. Remove temporary sediment barriers when replaced by 
permanent erosion control measures or when 
revegetation is successful. 

PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL DEVICES 

I. Trench Breakers 

a. Trench breakers are intended to slow the flow 
of subsurface water along the trench. Trench 
breakers may be constructed of materials such 

as sand bags or polyurethane foam. Do not use 
topsoil in trench breakers. 

b. An engineer or similarly qualified professional 
shall determine the need for and spacing of 

trench breakers. Otherwise, trench breakers 
shall be installed at the same spacing as and 
upslope of permanent slope breakers. 

c. In agricultural fields and residential areas 
where slope breakers are not typically 

required, install trench breakers at the same 
spacing as if permanent slope breakers were 
required. 

d. At a minimum, install a trench breaker at the 

base of slopes greater than 5 percent where the 
base of the slope is less than 50 feet from a 
waterbody or wetland and where needed to avoid 

draining a waterbody or wetland. 
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2. Permanent Slope Breakers 

a. Permanent slope breakers are intended to reduce 
runoff velocity, divert water off the 
construction right-of-way, and prevent sediment 

deposition into sensitive resources. Permanent 
slope breakers may be constructed of materials 
such as soil, sand bags, or some functional 
equivalent. 

b. Construct and maintain permanent slope breakers 
in all areas, except cultivated areas and 
lawns, using spacing recommendations obtained 

from the local soil conservation authority or 
land managing agency. 

In the absence of written recommendations, use 
the following spacing unless closer spacing is 

necessary to avoid excessive erosion on the 
construction right-of-way: 

5 - 15 300 
>15 - 30 200 

>30 i00 

c. Construct slope breakers to divert surface flow 
to a stable area without causing water to pool 
or erode behind the breaker. In the absence of 

a stable area, construct appropriate energy- 
dissipating devices at the end of the breaker. 

d. Slope breakers may extend slightly (about 4 
feet) beyond the edge of the construction 

right-of-way to effectively drain water off the 
disturbed area. Where slope breakers extend 
beyond the edge of the construction right-of- 

way, they are subject to compliance with all 
applicable survey requirements. 

SOIL COMPACTION MITIGATION 

. Test topsoil and subsoil for compaction at regular 
intervals in agricultural and residential areas 
disturbed by construction activities. Conduct tests 
on the same soil type under similar moisture 

conditions in undisturbed areas to approximate 
preconstruction conditions. Use penetrometers or 
other appropriate devices to conduct tests. 
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. Plow severely compacted agricultural areas with a 
paraplow or other deep tillage implement. In areas 
where topsoil has been segregated, plow the subsoil 
before replacing the segregated topsoil. 

Alternatively, make arrangements with the landowner 
to plant and plow under a "green manure" crop, such 
as alfalfa, to decrease soil bulk density aDd 
improve soil structure. If subsequent construction 
and cleanup activities result in further compaction, 
conduct additional tilling. 

. Perform appropriate soil compaction mitigation in 
severely compacted residential areas. 

REVEGETATION 

i. General 

a. The project sponsor is responsible for ensuring 
successful revegetation of soils disturbed by 
project-related activities, except as noted in 
section V.D.I.b. 

b. Restore all turf, ornamental shrubs, and 
specialized landscaping in accordance with the 
landowner's request, or compensate the 
landowner. Restoration work must be performed 
by personnel familiar with local horticultural 
and turf establishment practices. 

2. Soil Additives 

Fertilize and add soil pH modifiers in accordance 
with written recommendations obtained from the local 
soil conservation authority, land management 
agencies, or landowner. Incorporate recommended 
soil pH modifier and fertilizer into the top 2 
inches of soil as soon as possible after 
application. 

3. Seeding Requirements 

a. Prepare a seedbed in disturbed areas to a depth 
of 3 to 4 inches using appropriate equipment to 
provide a firm seedbed. When hydroseeding, 
scarify the seedbed to facilitate lodging and 
germination of seed. 
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d. 

e. 

f. 

g. 

Seed disturbed areas in accordance with written 
recommendations for seed mixes, rates, and 
dates obtained from the local soil conservation 
authority or the request of the landowner or 
land management agency. Seeding is not 
required in actively cultivated croplands 
unless requested by the landowner. 

Perform seeding of permanent vegetation within 
the recommended seeding dates. If seeding 
cannot be done within those dates, use 
appropriate temporary erosion control measures 
discussed in section IV.F. and perform seeding 
of permanent vegetation at the beginning of the 
next recommended seeding season. Lawns may be 
seeded on a schedule established with the 
landowner. 

In the absence of written recommendations fr3m 
the local soil conservation authorities, seed 
all disturbed soils within 6 working days of 
final grading, weather and soil conditions 
permitting, subject to the specifications in 
section V.D.3.a-c. 

Base seeding rates on Pure Live Seed. Use seed 
within 12 months of seed testing. 

Treat legume seed with an inoculant specific to 
the species using the manufacturer's 
recommended rate of inoculant appropriate for 
the seeding method (broadcast, drill, or 
hydro). 

In the absence of written recommendations from 
the local soil conservation authorities, 
landowner, or land managing agency to the 
contrary, a seed drill equipped with a 
cultipacker is preferred for seed application. 

Broadcast or hydroseeding can be used in lieu 
of drilling at double the recommended seeding 
rates. Where seed is broadcast, firm the 
seedbed with a cultipacker or roller after 
seeding. In rocky soils or where site 
conditions may limit the effectiveness of this 
equipment, other alternatives may be 
appropriate (e.g., use of a chain drag) to 
lightly cover seed after application, as 
approved by the Environmental Inspector. 
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VI. OFF-ROAD VEHICLE CONTROL 

To each owner or manager of forested lands offer to install 
and maintain measures to control unauthorized vehicle access 
to the right-of-way. These measures may include: 

A. Signs; 

B. Fences with locking gates; 

C. Slash and timber barriers, pipe barriers, or a line of 
boulders across the right-of-way; and 

D. Conifers or other appropriate trees or shrubs across the 
right-of-way. 

VII. pOST-CQNSTRUCTION ACTIVITIES 

A. MONITORING AND MAINTENANCE 

. Conduct follow-up inspections of all disturbed areas 

after the first and second growing seasons to 
determine the success of revegetation. 

. Revegetation in non-agricultural areas shall be 

considered successful if upon visual survey the 

density and cover of non-nuisance vegetation are 
similar in density and cover to adjacent undisturbed 
lands. In agricultural areas, revegetation shall be 

considered successful if crop yields are similar to 
adjacent undisturbed portions of the same field. 

Continue revegetatlon efforts until revegetation is 
successful. 

. Monitor and correct problems with drainage and 
irrigation systems resulting from pipeline 

construction in active agricultural areas until 
restoration is successful. 

. Restoration shall be considered successful if the 
right-of-way surface condition is similar to 
adjacent undisturbed lands, construction debris is 
removed (unless requested otherwise by the land 
owner or land managing agency), revegetation is 

successful, and proper drainage has been restored. 

V 
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. Routine vegetation maintenance clearing shall not be 
done more frequently than every 3 years. However, to 
facilitate periodic corrosion and leak surveys, a 
corridor not exceeding 10 feet in width centered on 
the pipeline may be maintained annually in a 
herbaceous state. In no case shall routine 
vegetation maintenance clearing occur between April 
15 and August 1 of any year. 

. Efforts to control unauthorized off-road vehicle 
use, in cooperation with the landowner, shall 
continue throughout the life of the project. 
Maintain signs, gates, and vehicle trails as 
necessary. 

REPORTING 

. The project sponsor shall maintain records that 
identify by milepost: 

a. method of application, application rate, and 
type of fertilizer, pH modifying agent, seed, 
and mulch used; 

b. acreage treated; 

c. dates of backfilling and seeding; 

d. names of landowners requesting special seeding 
treatment and a description of the follow-up 
actions; and 

e. any problem areas and how they were addressed. 

. The project sponsor shall file with the Secretary 

quarterly activity reports documenting problems, 
including those identified by the landowner, and 
corrective actions taken for at least 2 years 
following construction. 

V 
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WETLAND AND WATERBODY CONSTRUCTION AND MITIGATION PROCEDURES 

(PROCEDURES) 

APPLICABILITY 

A. The intent of these Procedures is to assist applicants by 
identifying baseline mitigation measures for minimizing 
the extent and duration of project-related disturbance on 
wetlands and waterbodies. The project sponsors should 
specify in their applications for a FERC Certificate 
(Certificate) any individual measures in these Procedures 
they consider unnecessary, technically infeasible, or 
unsuitable due to local conditions and to fully describe 
any alternative measures they would use. Applicants 
should also explain how those alternative measures would 
achieve a comparable level of mitigation. 

Once a project is certificated, further changes can be 
approved. Any such changes from the measures in these 
Procedures (or the applicant's approved procedures) will 
be approved by the Director of the Office of Energy 
Projects (Director), upon the applicant's written 
request, if the Director agrees that an alternative 
measure: 

i. provides equal or better environmental protection; 

. is necessary because a portion of these Procedures 
is infeasible or unworkable based on project- 
specific conditions; or 

. is specifically required in writing by another 
Federal, state, or Native American land management 
agency for the portion of the project on its land or 
under its jurisdiction. 

Any requirements in these Procedures to file material 
with the Secretary of the FERC (Secretary) do not apply 
to projects undertaken under the provisions of the 
blanket certificate program. This exemption does not 
apply to a request for alternative measures. 

Project-related impacts on non-wetland areas are 
addressed in the staff's Upland Erosion Control, 
Revegetation, and Maintenance Plan (Plan). 
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B. DEFINITIONS 

. "Waterbody" includes any natural or artificial 
stream, river, or drainage with perceptible flow at 
the time of crQ3~ina, and other permanent 
waterbodies such as ponds and lakes: 

a. "minor waterbody" includes all waterbodies less 
than or equal to 10 feet wide at the water's 
edge at the time of construction; 

b. "intermediate waterbody" includes all 
waterbodies greater than 10 feet wide but less 
than or equal to 100 feet wide at the water's 
edge ~t the ~ime of constr~ction; and 

C. "major waterbody" includes all waterbodies 
greater than 100 feet wide at the water's edge 
at the time of construction. 

2. "Wetland" includes any area that is not in actively 
cultivated or rotated cropland and that satisfies 
the requirements of the current Federal methodology 
for identifying and delineating wetlands. 

II. PRECONSTRUCTION FILIN~ 

A. The following information shall be filed with the 
Secretary prior to the beginning of construction: 

. the hydrostatic testing information specified in 
section VII.B.3. and a wetland delineation report as 
described in section VI.A.I., if applicable; and 

2. a schedule identifying when trenching or blasting 
would occur within each waterbody greater than i0 
feet wide, or within any designated coldwater 
fishery. The project sponsor shall revise the 
schedule as necessary to provide FERC staff at least 
14 days advance notice. Changes within this last 
14-day period must provide for at least 48 hours 
advance notice. 

B. The following site-specific construction plans required 
by these Procedures must be filed with the Secretary for 
the review and written approval by the Director: 

. plans for extra work areas that would be closer than 
50 feet from a waterbody or wetland; 
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2. plans for major waterbody crossings; 

. plans for the use of a construction right-of-way 
greater than 75 feet wide in wetlands; and 

. plans for horizontal directional drill (HDD) 
"crossings" of wetlands or waterbodies. 

III. ENVIRONMENTAL INSPECTORS 

A. At least one Environmental Inspector having knowledge of 
the wetland and waterbody conditions in the project area 
is required for each construction spread. The number and 
experience of Environmental Inspectors assigned to each 
construction spread should be appropriate for the length 
of the construction spread and the number/significance of 
resources affected. 

B. The Environmental Inspector's responsibilities are 
outlined in the Upland Erosion Control, Revegetatlon, 
Maintenance Plan (Plan). 

and 

IV. PRECONSTRUCTION PLANNING 

A. A copy of the Stormwater Pollution Prevention Plan 
(SWPPP) prepared for compliance with the U.S. 
Environmental Protection Agency's (EPA) National 
Stormwater Program General Permit requirements must be 
available in the field on each construction spread. The 
SWPPP shall contain Spill Prevention and Response 
Procedures that meet the requirements of state and 
Federal agencies. 

i. It shall be the responsibility of the project 
sponsor and its contractors to structure their 
operations in a manner that reduces the risk of 
spills or the accidental exposure of fuels or 
hazardous materials to waterbodies or wetlands. 
project sponsor and its contractors must, at a 
minimum, ensure that: 

The 

a. all employees handling fuels and other 
hazardous materials are properly trained; 

b. all equipment is in good operating order and 
inspected on a regular basis; 

V 
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fuel trucks transporting fuel to on-site 
equipment travel only on approved access roads; 

all equipment is parked overnight and/or fueled 
at least 100 feet from a waterbody or in an 
upland area at least I00 feet from a wetland 
boundary. These activities can occur closer 
only if the Environmental Inspector finds, in 
advance, no reasonable alternative and the 
project sponsor and its contractors have taken 
appropriate steps (including secondary 
containment structures) to prevent spills and 
provide for prompt cleanup in the event of a 
spill; 

e. hazardous materials, including chemicals, 
fuels, and lubricating oils, are not stored 
within I00 feet of a wetland, waterbody, or 
designated municipal watershed area, unless the 
location is designated for such use by an 
appropriate governmental authority. This 
applies to storage of these materials and does 
not apply to normal operation or use of 
equipment in these areas; and 

f. concrete coating activities are not performed 
within 100 feet of a wetland or waterbody 
boundary, unless the location is an existing 
industrial site designated for such use. 

The project sponsor and its contractors must 
structure their operations in a manner that provides 
for the prompt and effective cleanup of spills of 
fuel and other hazardous materials. At a minimum, 
the project sponsor and its contractors must: 

a. ensure that each construction crew (including 
cleanup crews) has on hand sufficient supplies 
of absorbent and barrier materials to allow the 
rapid containment and recovery of spilled 
materials and knows the procedure for reporting 
spills; 

b. ensure that each construction crew has on hand 
sufficient tools and material to stop leaks; 
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c. know the contact names and telephone numbers 
for all local, state, and Federal agencies 
(including, if necessary, the U. S. Coast Guard 
and the National Response Center) that must be 
notified of a spill; and 

d. follow the requirements of those agencies in 
cleaning up the spill, in excavating and 
disposing of soils or other materials 
contaminated by a spill, and in collecting and 
disposing of waste generated during spill 
cleanup. 

B. AGENCY COORDINATION 

The project sponsor must coordinate with the appropriate 
local, state, and Federal agencies as outlined in these 
Procedures and in the Certificate. 

WATERBODY CROSSINGS 

A. NOTIFICATION PROCEDURES AND PERMITS 

. Apply to the U.S. Army Corps of Engineers (COE), or 
its delegated agency, for the appropriate wetland 
and waterbody crossing permits. 

. Provide written notification to authorities 
responsible for potable surface water supply intakes 
located within 3 miles downstream of the crossing at 
least 1 week before beginning work in the waterbody, 
or as otherwise specified by that authority. 

. Apply for state-issued waterbody crossing permits 
and obtain individual or generic section 401 water 
quality certification or waiver. 

4. Notify appropriate state authorities at least 48 
hours before beginning trenching or blasting within 
the waterbody, or as specified in state permits. 
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B. INSTALLATION 

i. Time Window for Construction 

Unless expressly permitted or further restricted by 
the appropriate state agency in writing on a site- 
specific basis, instream work, except that required 
to install or remove equipment bridges, must occur 
during the following time windows: 

a. coldwater fisheries - June 1 through September 
30; and 

b. coolwater and warmwater fisheries - June 1 
through November 30. 

2. Extra Work Areas 

a. Locate all extra work areas (such as staging 
areas and additional spoil storage areas) at 
least 50 feet away from water's edge, except 
where the adjacent upland consists of actively 
cultivated or rotated cropland or other 
disturbed land. 

b. The project sponsor shall file with the 
Secretary for review and written approval by 
the Director, a site-specific construction plan 
for each extra work area with a less than 50- 
foot setback from the water's edge, (except 
where the adjacent upland consists of actively 
cultivated or rotated cropland or other 
disturbed land) and a site-specific explanation 
of the conditions that will not permit a 50- 
foot setback. 

c. Limit clearing of vegetation between extra work 
areas and the edge of the waterbody to the 
certificated construction right-of-way. 

d. Limit the size of extra work areas to the 
minimum needed to construct the waterbody 
crossing. 

3. General Crossing Procedures 

a. Comply with the COE, or its delegated agency, 
permit terms and conditions. 
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b. Construct crossings as close to perpendicular 
to the axis of the waterbody channel as 
engineering and routing conditions permit. 

c. If the pipeline parallels a waterbody, attempt 
to maintain at least 15 feet of undisturbed 
vegetation between the waterbody (and any 
adjacent wetland) and the construction right- 
of-way. 

d. Where waterbodies meander or have multiple 
channels, route the pipeline to minimize the 
number of waterbody crossings. 

e. Maintain adequate flow rates to protect aquatic 
life, and prevent the interruption of existing 
downstream uses. 

f. Waterbody buffers (extra work area setbacks, 
refueling restrictions, etc.) must be clearly 
marked in the field with signs and/or highly 
visible flagging until construction-related 
ground disturbing activities are complete. 

Spoil Pile Placement and Control 

a. All spoil from minor and intermediate waterbody 
crossings, and upland spoil from major 
waterbody crossings, must be placed in the 
construction right-of-way at least i0 feet from 
the water's edge or in additional extra work 
areas as described in section V.B.2. 

b. Use sediment barriers to prevent the flow of 
spoil or heavily silt-laden water into any 
waterbody. 

Equipment Bridges 

a° Only clearing equipment and equipment necessary 
for installation of equipment bridges may cross 
waterbodles prior to bridge installation. 
Limit the number of such crossings of each 
waterbody to one per piece of clearing 
equipment. 

V 
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b. Construct equipment bridges to maintain 
unrestricted flow and to prevent soil from 
entering the waterbody. Examples of such 
bridges include: 

(i) equipment pads and culvert(s); 
(2) equipment pads or railroad car bridges 

without culverts; 
(3) clean rock fill and culvert(s); and 
(4) flexi-float or portable bridges. 

Additional options for equipment bridges may be 
utilized that achieve the performance 
objectives noted above. Do not use soil to 
construct or stabilize equipment bridges. 

c. Design and maintain each equipment bridge to 
withstand and pass the highest flow expected to 
occur while the bridge is in place. Align 
culverts to prevent bank erosion or streambed 
scour. If necessary, install energy 
dissipating devices downstream of the culverts. 

d. Design and maintain equipment bridges to 
prevent soil from entering the waterbody. 

e. Remove equipment bridges as soon as possible 
after permanent seeding unless the COE, or its 
delegated agency, authorizes it as a permanent 
bridge. 

f. If there will be more than 1 month between 
final cleanup and the beginning of permanent 
seeding and reasonable alternative access to 
the right-of-way is available, remove equipment 
bridges as soon as possible after final 
cleanup. 

Dry-Ditch Crossing Methods 

a. Unless approved otherwise by the appropriate 
state agency, install the pipeline using one of 
the dry-ditch methods outlined below for 
crossings of waterbodies up to 30 feet wide (at 
the water's edge at the time of construction) 
that are state-designated as either coldwater 
or significant coolwater or warmwater 
fisheries. 
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b. Dam and Pump 

C .  

(1) The dam-and-pump method may be used 
without prior approval for crossings of 
waterbodies where pumps can adequately 
transfer streamflow volumes around the 
work area, and there are no concerns about 
sensitive species passage. 

(2) Implementation of the dam-and-pump 
crossing method must meet the following 
performance criteria: 

(I) use sufficient pumps, including on- 
site backup pumps, to maintain 
downstream flows; 

(ii) construct dams with materials that 
prevent sediment and other pollutants 
from entering the waterbody (e.g., 
sandbags or clean gravel with plastic 
liner); 

(iii)sereen pump intakes; 
(iv) prevent streambed scour at pump 

discharge; and 
(v) monitor the dam and pumps to ensure 

proper operation throughout the 
waterbody crossing. 

Flume Crossing 

The flume crossing method requires 
implementation of the following steps: 

(i) install flume pipe after blasting (if 
necessary), but before any trenching; 

(2) use sand bag or sand bag and plastic 
sheeting diversion structure or equivalent 
to develop an effective seal and to divert 
stream flow through the flume pipe (some 
modifications to the stream bottom may be 
required in to achieve an effective seal); 

(3) properly align flume pipe(s) to prevent 
bank erosion and streambed scour; 

(4) do not remove flume pipe during trenching, 
pipelaying, or backfilling activities, or 
initial streambed restoration efforts; and 
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(5) remove all flume pipes and dams that are 
not also part of the equipment bridge as 
soon as final cleanup of the stream bed 
and bank is complete. 

d. Horizontal Directional Drill (HDD) 

To the extent they were not provided as part of 
the pre-certification process, for each 
waterbody or wetland that would be crossed 
using the HDD method, provide a plan that 
includes: 

(i) site-specific construction diagrams that 
show the location of mud pits, pipe 
assembly areas, and all areas to be 
disturbed or cleared for construction; 

(2) a description of how an inadvertent 
release of drilling mud would be contained 
and cleaned up; and 

(3) a contingency plan for crossing the 
waterbody or wetland in the event the 
directional drill is unsuccessful and how 
the abandoned drill hole would be sealed, 
if necessary. 

Crossings of Minor Waterbodies 

Where a dry-ditch crossing is not required, minor 
waterbodies may be crossed using the open-cut 
crossing method, with the following restrictions: 

a. 

b. 

except for blasting and other rock breaking 
measures, complete instream construction 
activities (including trenching,pipe 
installation, backfill, and restoration of the 
streambed contours) within 24 hours. 
Streambanks and unconsolidated streambeds may 
require additional restoration after this 
period; 

limit use of equipment operating in the 
waterbody to that needed to construct the 
crossing; and 
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c. equipment bridges are not required at minor 
waterbodies that do not have a state-designated 
fishery classification (e.g., agricultural or 
intermittent drainage ditches). However, if an 
equipment bridge is used it must be constructed 
as described in section V.B.5. 

Crossings of Intermediate Waterbodies 

Where a dry-ditch crossing is not required, 
intermediate waterbodies may be crossed using the 
open-cut crossing method, with the following 
restrictions: 

a. complete instream construction activities (not 
including blasting and other rock breaking 
measures) within 48 hours, unless site-specific 
conditions make completion within 48 hours 
infeasible; 

b. limit use of equipment operating in the 
waterbody to that needed to construct the 
crossing; and 

c. all other construction equipment must cross on 
an equipment bridge as specified in section 
V.B.5. 

Crossings of Major Waterbodies 

Before construction, the project sponsor shall file 
with the Secretary for the review and written 
approval by the Director a detailed, site-specific 
construction plan and scaled drawings identifying 
all areas to be disturbed by construction for each 
major waterbody crossing (the scaled drawings are 
not required for any offshore portions of pipeline 
projects). This plan should be developed in 
consultation with the appropriate state and Federal 
agencies and should include extra work areas, spoil 
storage areas, sediment control structures, etc., as 
well as mitigation for navigational issues. 

The Environmental Inspector may adjust the final 
placement of the erosion and sediment control 
structures in the field to maximize effectiveness. 

V 
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10. Temporary Erosion and Sediment Control 

Install sediment barriers (as defined in section 
IV.F.2.a. of the Plan) immediately after initial 
disturbance of the waterbody or adjacent upland. 
Sediment barriers must be properly maintained 
throughout construction and reinstalled as necessary 
(such as after backfilling of the trench) until 
replaced by permanent erosion controls or 
restoration of adjacent upland areas is complete. 
Temporary erosion and sediment control measures are 
addressed in more detail in the Plan; however, the 
following specific measures must be implemented at 
stream crossings: 

a. install sediment barriers across the entire 
construction right-of-way at all waterbody 
crossings, where necessary to prevent the flow 
of sediments into the waterbody. Removable 
sediment barriers (or driveable berms) must be 
installed across the travel lane. These 
removable sediment barriers can be removed 
during the construction day, but must be re- 
installed after construction has stopped for 
the day and/or when heavy precipitation is 
imminent; 

b. where waterbodies are adjacent to the 
construction right-of-way, install sediment 
barriers along the edge of the construction 
right-of-way as necessary to contain spoil and 
sediment within the construction right-of-way; 
and 

C. use trench plugs at all waterbody crossings, as 
necessary, to prevent diversion of water into 
upland portions of the pipeline trench and to 
keep any accumulated trench water out of the 
waterbody. 

Ii. Trench Dewatering 

Dewater the trench (either on or off the 
construction right-of-way) in a manner that does not 
cause erosion and does not result in heavily silt- 
laden water flowing into any waterbody. Remove the 
dewatering structures as soon as possible after the 
completion of dewatering activities. 

]2 01117/2003 VERSION 



Inofficial FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

v 

V 

C. RESTORATION 

i. Use clean gravel or native cobbles for the upper 1 
foot of trench backfill in all waterbodies that 
contain coldwater fisheries. 

. For open-cut crossings, stabilize waterbody banks 
and install temporary sediment barriers within 24 
hours of completing instream construction 

activities. For dry-ditch crossings, complete 
streambed and bank stabilization before returning 

flow to the waterbody channel. 

. Return all waterbody banks to preconstruction 

contours or to a stable angle of repose as approved 
by the Environmental Inspector. 

. Application of riprap for bank stabilization must 
comply with COE, or its delegated agency, permit 

terms and conditions. 

. Unless otherwise specified by state permit, limit 

the use of riprap to areas where flow conditions 
preclude effective vegetative stabilization 
techniques such as seeding and erosion control 

fabric. 

. Revegetate disturbed 'riparian areas with 
conservation grasses and legumes or native plant 
species, preferably woody species. 

. Install a permanent slope breaker across the 
construction right-of-way at the base of slopes 

greater than 5 percent that are less than 50 feet 
from the waterbody, or as needed to prevent sediment 
transport into the waterbody. In addition, install 
sediment barriers as outlined in the Plan. 
In some areas, with the approval of the 

Environmental Inspector, an earthen berm may be 
suitable as a sediment barrier adjacent to the 
waterbody. 

. Sections V.C.3. through V.C.6. above also apply to 

those perennial or intermittent streams not flowing 
at the time of construction. 

V 
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D. POST-CONSTRUCTION M3%INTENANCE 

. Limit vegetation maintenance adjacent to waterbodies 
to allow a riparian strip at least 25 feet wide, as 
measured from the waterbody's mean high water mark, 
to permanently revegetate with native plant species 
across the entire construction right-of-way. 
However, to facilitate periodic pipeline 
corrosion/leak surveys, a corridor centered on the 
pipeline and up to i0 feet wide may be maintained in 
a herbaceous state. In addition, trees that are 
located within 15 feet of the pipeline that are 
greater than 15 feet in height may be cut and 
removed from the permanent right-of-way. 

. Do not use herbicides or pesticides in or within i00 
feet of a waterbody except as allowed by the 
appropriate land management or state agency. 

VI. 

A. GENERAL 

. The project sponsor shall conduct a wetland 
delineation using the current Federal methodology 
and file a wetland delineation report with the 
Secretary before construction. This report shall 
identify: 

a. by milepost all wetlands that would be 
affected; 

b. the National Wetlands Inventory (NWI) 
classification for each wetland; 

c. the crossing length of each wetland in feet; 
and 

d. the area of permanent and temporary disturbance 
that would occur in each wetland by NWI 
classification type. 

The requirements outlined in this section do not 
apply to wetlands in actively cultivated or rotated 
cropland. Standard upland protective measures, 
including workspace and topsoiling requirements, 
apply to these agricultural wetlands. 

V 
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Route the pipeline to avoid wetland areas to the 
maximum extent possible. If a wetland cannot be 
avoided or crossed by following an existing right- 
of-way, route the new pipeline in a manner that 
minimizes disturbance to wetlands. Where looping an 
existing pipeline, overlap the existing pipeline 
right-of-way with the new construction right-of-way. 
In addition, locate the loop line no more than 25 
feet away from the existing pipeline unless site- 
specific constraints would adversely affect the 
stability of the existing pipeline. 

Limit the width of the construction right-of-way to 
75 feet or less. Prior written approval of the 
Director is required where topographic conditions or 
soil limitations require that the construction 
right-of-way width within the boundaries of a 
federally delineated wetland be expanded beyond 75 
feet. Early in the planning process the project 
sponsor is encouraged to identify site-specific 
areas where existing soils lack adequate unconfined 
compressive strength that would result in 
excessively wide ditches and/or difficult to contain 
spoil piles. 

Wetland boundaries and buffers must be clearly 
marked in the field with signs and/or highly visible 
flagging until construction-related ground 
disturbing activities are complete. 

Implement the measures of sections V. and VI. in the 
event a waterbody crossing is located within or 
adjacent to a wetland crossing. If all measures of 
sections V. and VI. cannot be met, the project 
sponsor must file with the Secretary a site-specific 
crossing plan for review and written approval by the 
Director before construction. This crossing plan 
shall address at a minimum: 

a. spoil control; 

b. equipment bridges; 

c. restoration of waterbody banks and wetland 
hydrology; 

d. timing of the waterbody crossing; 

V 
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e. method of crossing; and 

f. size and location of all extra work areas. 

. Do not locate aboveground facilities in any wetland, 
except where the location of such facilities outside 
of wetlands would prohibit compliance with U.S. 
Department of Transportation regulations. 

INSTALLATION 

i. Extra Work Areas and Access Roads 

a. Locate all extra work areas (such as staging 
areas and additional spoil storage areas) at 
least 50 feet away from wetland boundaries, 
except where the adjacent upland consists of 
actively cultivated or rotated cropland or 
other disturbed land. 

b. The project sponsor shall file with the 
Secretary for review and written approval by 
the Director, a site-specific construction plan 
for each extra work area with a less than 50- 
foot setback from wetland boundaries (except 
where adjacent upland consists of actively 
cultivated or rotated cropland or other 
disturbed land) and a site-specific explanation 
of the conditions that will not permit a 50- 
foot setback. 

c. Limit clearing of vegetation between extra work 
areas and the edge of the wetland to the 
certificated construction right-of-way. 

d. The construction right-of-way may be used for 
access when the wetland soil is firm enough to 
avoid rutting or the construction rlght-of-way 
has been appropriately stabilized to avoid 
rutting (e.g., with timber riprap, 
prefabricated equipment mats, or terra mats). 
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In wetlands that cannot be appropriately 
stabilized, all construction equipment other 
than that needed to install the wetland 
crossing shall use access roads located in 
upland areas. Where access roads in upland 
areas do not provide reasonable access, limit 
all other construction equipment to one pass 
through the wetland using the construction 
right-of-way. 

e. The only access roads, other than the 
construction right-of-way, that can be used in 
wetlands without Director approval, are those 
existing roads that can be used with no 
modification and no impact on the wetland. 

Crossing Procedures 

a. Comply with COE, or its delegated agency, 
permit terms and conditions 

b. Assemble the pipeline in an upland area unless 
the wetland is dry enough to adequately support 
skids and pipe. 

c. Use "push-pull" or "float" techniques to place 
the pipe in the trench where water and other 
site condi£ions allow. 

d. Minimize the length of time that topsoil is 
segregated and the trench is open. 

e. Limit construction equipment operating in 
wetland areas to that needed to clear the 
construction right-of-way, dig the trench, 
fabricate and install the pipeline, backfill 
the trench, and restore the construction right- 
of-way. 

f. Cut vegetation just aboveground level, leaving 
existing root systems in place, and remove it 
from the wetland for disposal. 
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j. 

k. 

. 

m. 

Limit pulling of tree stumps and grading 
activities to directly over the trenchline. Do 
not grade or remove stumps or. root systems from 
the rest of the construction right-of-way in 
wetlands unless the Chief Inspector and 
Environmental Inspector determine that safety- 
related construction constraints require 
grading or the removal of tree stumps from 
under the working side of the construction 
right-of-way. 

Segregate the top 1 foot of topsoil from the 
area disturbed by trenching, except in areas 
where standing water is present or soils are 
saturated or frozen. Immediately after 
backfilling is complete, restore the segregated 
topsoil to its original location. 

Do not use rock, soll imported from outside the 
wetland, tree stumps, or brush riprap to 
support equipment on the construction right-of- 
way. 

If standing water or saturated soils are 
present, or if construction equipment causes 
ruts or mixing of the topsoil and subsoil in 
wetlands, use low-ground-weight construction 
equipment, or operate normal equipment on 
timber riprap, prefabricated equipment mats, 
terra mats. 

or 

Do not cut trees outside of the approved 
construction work area to obtain timber for 
riprap or equipment mats. 

Attempt to use no more than two layers of 
timber riprap to support equipment on the 
construction rlght-of-way. 

Remove all project-related material used to 
support equipment on the construction right-of- 
way upon completion of construction. 

1~ 01117/2003 VERSION 



Inofflclal FERC-G~nerated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

v 

V 

. 

4. 

Temporary Sediment Control 

Install sediment barriers (as defined in section 
IV.F.2.a. of the Plan) immediately after initial 
disturbance of the wetland or adjacent upland. 
Sediment barriers must be properly maintained 
throughout construction and reinstalled as necessary 
(such as after backfilling of the trench). Except 
as noted below in section VI.B.3.c., maintain 
sediment barriers until replaced by permanent 
erosion controls or restoration of adjacent upland 
areas is complete. Temporary erosion and sediment 
control measures are addressed in more detail in the 
Plan. 

a. Install sediment barriers across the entire 
construction right-of-way immediately upslope 
of the wetland boundary at all wetland 
crossings where necessary to prevent sediment 
flow into the wetland. 

b. Where wetlands are adjacent to the construction 
right-of-way and the right-of-way slopes toward 
the wetland, install sediment barriers along 
the edge of the construction right-of-way as 
necessary to prevent sediment flow into the 
wetland. 

c. Install sediment barriers along the edge of the 
construction right-of-way as necessary to 
contain spoil and sediment within the 
construction right-of-way through wetlands. 
Remove these sediment barriers during right-of- 
way cleanup. 

Trench Dewatering 

Dewater the trench (either on or off the 
construction right-of-way) in a manner that does not 
cause erosion and does not result in heavily silt- 
laden water flowing into any wetland. Remove the 
dewatering structures as soon as possible after the 
completion of dewatering activities. 
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C. RESTORATION 

. Where the pipeline trench may drain a wetland, 
construct trench breakers and/or seal the trench 
bottom as necessary to maintain the original wetland 
hydrology. 

. For each wetland crossed, install a trench breaker 
at the base of slopes near the boundary between the 
wetland and adjacent upland areas. Install a 
permanent slope breaker across the construction 
right-of-way at the base of a slopes greater than 5 
percent where the base of the slope is less than 50 
feet from the wetland, or as needed to prevent 
sediment transport into the wetland. In addition, 
install sediment barriers as outlined in the Plan. 
In some areas, with the approval of the 
Environmental Inspector, an earthen berm may be 
suitable as a sediment barrier adjacent to the 
wetland. 

. Do not use fertilizer, lime, or mulch unless 
required in writing by the appropriate land 
management or state agency. 

. Consult with the appropriate land management or 
state agency to develop a project-specific wetland 
restoration plan. The restoration plan should 
include measures for re-establishing herbaceous 
and/or woody species, controlling the invasion and 
spread of undesirable exotic species (e.g., purple 
loosestrife and phragmites), and monitoring the 
success of the revegetation and weed control 
efforts. Provide this plan to the FERC staff upon 
request. 

. Until a project-specific wetland restoration plan is 
developed and/or implemented, temporarily revegetate 
the construction right-of-way with annual ryegrass 
at a rate of 40 pounds/acre (unless standing water 
is present). 

. Ensure that all disturbed areas successfully 
revegetate with wetland herbaceous and/or woody 
plant species. 
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. Remove temporary sediment barriers located at the 
boundary between wetland and adjacent upland areas 
after upland revegetation and stabilization of 
adjacent upland areas are judged to be successful as 
specified in section VII.A.5. of the Plan. 

POST-CONSTRUCTION MAINTENANCE 

. Do not conduct vegetation maintenance over the full 
width of the permanent right-of-way in wetlands. 
However, to facilitate periodic pipeline 
corrosion/leak surveys, a corridor centered on the 
pipeline and up to 10 feet wide may be maintained in 
a herbaceous state. In addition, trees within 15 
feet of the pipeline that are greater than 15 feet 
in height may be selectively cut and removed from 
the permanent right-of-way. 

2. Do not use herbicides or pesticides in or within I00 
feet of a wetland, except as allowed by the 
appropriate land management agency or state agency. 

. Monitor and record the success of wetland 
revegetation annually for the first 3 years after 
construction or until wetland revegetation is 
successful. At the end of 3 years after 
construction, file a report with the Secretary 
identifying the status of the wetland revegetation 
efforts. Include the percent cover achieved and 
problem areas (weed invasion issues, poor 
revegetation, etc.). Continue to file a report 
annually until wetland revegetation is successful. 

. Wetland revegetation shall be considered successful 
if the cover of herbaceous and/or woody species is 
at least 80 percent of the type, density, and 
distribution of the vegetation in adjacent wetland 
areas that were not disturbed by construction. If 
revegetation is not successful at the end of 3 
years, develop and implement (in consultation with a 
professional wetland ecologist) a remedial 
revegetation plan to actively revegetate the 
wetland. Continue revegetation efforts until 
wetland revegetation is successful. 

V 
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VII. HYDROSTATIC TESTING 

A. NOTIFICATION PROCEDURES AND PERMITS 

. Apply for state-issued water withdrawal permits, as 
required. 

. Apply for National Pollutant Discharge Elimination 
System (NPDES) or state-issued discharge permits, as 
required. 

. Notify appropriate state agencies of intent to use 
specific sources at least 48 hours before testing 
activities unless they waive this requirement in 
writing. 

B. GENERAL 

. Perform 100 percent radiographic inspection of all 
pipeline section welds or hydrotest the pipeline 
sections, before installation under waterbodies or 
wetlands. 

. If pumps used for hydrostatic testing are within 100 
feet of any waterbody or wetland, address the 
operation and refueling of these pumps in the 
project's Spill Prevention and Response Procedures. 

. The project sponsor shall file with the Secretary 
before construction a list identifying the location 
of all waterbodies proposed for use as a hydrostatic 
test water source or discharge location. 

C. INTAKE SOURCE AND RATE 

i. Screen the intake hose to prevent entrainment of 
fish. 

. Do not use state-designated exceptional value 
waters, waterbodies which provide habitat for 
federally listed threatened or endangered species, 
or waterbodies designated as public water supplies, 
unless appropriate Federal, state, and/or local 
permitting agencies grant written permission. 

. Maintain adequate flow rates to protect aquatic 
life, provide for all waterbody uses, and provide 
for downstream withdrawals of water by existing 
users. 

22 01117/2003VERSION 
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D. 

. Locate hydrostatic test manifolds outside wetlands 
and riparian areas to the maximum extent 
practicable. 

DISCHARGE LOCATION, METHOD, AND RATE 

i. Regulate discharge rate, use energy dissipation 
device(s), and install sediment barriers, as 
necessary, to prevent erosion, streambed scour, 
suspension of sediments, or excessive streamflow. 

. Do not discharge into state-designated exceptional 
value waters, waterbodies which provide habitat for 
federally listed threatened or endangered species, 
or waterbodies designated as public water supplies, 
unless appropriate Federal, state, and local 
permitting agencies grant written permission. 

V 

23 01/17/2003 VERSION 
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APPENDIX 1-C 

CONSTRUCTION ALIGNMENT SHEETS FOR THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE, 
TL.492 EXT3 PIPELINE, TL-536 PIPELINE, AND TL-453-EXT1 PIPELINE 

(PROVIDED UNDER SEPARATE COVER) 

V 
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APPENDIX 1-D 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION TECHNIQUES FOR THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE 

V 
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CAD ~ NO. 03-434-$ecl-Voq'k~s / CD169~ 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

EXCAVATEO SOiL / 

• ,.,.~.~o,~0,,~ ~ ~ 

25' 
SPOIL SIDE 

25' 
PERMANENT 

RIGHT-OF-WAY 

25' 
PERMANENT 

RIGHT-OF-WAY 

u3 i== 
O. 

-= 

75' 
WORKING SJDE 

25' 
• Ji 

pERMANENT 
RIGHT-OF-WAY 

25' 
TEMPORARY 

RIGHT-OF-WA' 

NOTE: 

1. "WPtCAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-O.O0 TO MP-0.24 

2. CONRGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL TEMPORARY WORI<SPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPEUNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTILITY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 
&: 16" PL-5 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

02/01/05 I PL-1 EXT. 2 NOT TO SCALE 
1 of 12 
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CAD FILE N~ 03-434-Se~-Va~et~ls / C~eJe 

EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REOU~O) 

EXCAVATED SOft- / 

25' 
SPOIL SM)E 

25' - - 25' 
• , ~ , ~  p ~  RIGHT-OF-WAy - ~  I 

50' 
WORKING SrD~ 

25' 
TI~PORARY 

RK;HT-OF-WA'~ 

NOTE: 

1. 1YPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-0.24 TO MP-0.85 
MP-11.14. TO MP-12.13 
MP-12.26 TO MP-12.39 

2. CONRGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO k~NTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTILITY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 
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CAD FlUE N[~ 0 3 - 4 3 4 - $ l c t - V o r k ~ t ¢ l =  / CD1692 

TEMPORARY ERO~ON 
CON~OL B~R~ER 

~CAVA~ SO¢ / 

,5: 

SPOIL Si)E WORmNG ~0C 

/ 
25' , • 25' , J  . 25' 

- -  PIERMAN~NT RIGHT-OF-WAY - ~ 1  TEMPORARY 
RIGHT-OF-WAY 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-0.85 TO MP-4.30 
MP-5.29 TO MP-11.14 
MP-13.80 TO MP-14.21 
MP-14.3t TO MP-14.39 
MP-14.56 TO MP-14.67 
MP-14.72 TO MP-15.82 
MP-15.87 TO MP-15.93 
MP-16.55 TO MP-18.68 
MP-19.91 TO MP-20.02 
MP-22.73 TO MP-25.38 
MP-26.06 TO MP-26.84 

2. CONRGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
AOOmONAL "rE:MPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSJNGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTILITY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

II 3 of 12 
II 
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I CAD FILE Nil O~l-434-~¢l-VoekDet~lls / Cm692 

EXCAVATED 501L 

j5 

~ EROS~N 
CONTROL B/~IER 
(AS R [ ~ )  

75' 
WORKING ~DE 

, 25' , , 25' , 'm~TTJdP(~-WAy25' ~ 25' 
~ PSERMANENT I~-OF-WAY'--~ EXTRA 

WORX AR(A 

NOTE: 

1. "WPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

M P - 4 . 3 0  TO MP-4 .90  
MP-14.21  TO hiP-14..31 
MP-14 .39  TO MP-14 .56  
MP-14 .67  TO MP-14 .72  
MP-15 .82  TO MP-15 .87  
MP-15 .93  TO MP-16 .55  
MP-18.68  TO MP-19 .65  
MP-20 .05  TO MP-22 .73  

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADOITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 4 of 1 2 
LmLITY CROSSINGS. 
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~'ILE ~ OQl,.-434-Secl-VoPkDrt4dis / IL~DI69~ 

TOPSOIL 
TEMPORARY EROSION 

EXCAVATED SOIL CONTROL BARRIER 

75' 
WORKING SIDE 

25' 
J SPOIL SI~ 

EXTRA TEMPORARY ~"-PER~ENT RIGHT-OF-WAY- 
WORK AREA RIGHT-OF-WAY | 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-4.90 TO MP-5.29 
MP-12.83 TO MP-13.20 
MP-13.26 TO MP-13.54 

2. CONRGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDnlONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPEUNE TO MAINTNN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTIUTY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

o21oiio5 
5 of 12 
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CAD Fn.E NO~ 03-434-T, rcZ-'#orkDetcdl= / CD~69~ 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 

TOPSOIL (AS REQUIRED) 

EXCAVATED SOIL 

2,5' 
SPOIL SIDE 

25' 25' 25' 

EXTRA • 
WORK AREA 

50' 
WORKING SIDE 

_ [ 25' 

TEMPORARY • 
RIGHT-OF-WAY 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-12.13 TO MP-12.20 

2. CONFIGURA'RON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL TEMPORARY WO~KSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPEUNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTILKY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

EXT. 2 NOT 'ro ~ 
6 o f  12  
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C ~  FILE ~ 03 -434-$ec l -Vork ]Be to l f  / C~69e 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

TOPSOIL \ 

W 
Z 

r . 2 5 '  -- -~ 150' 
SPOIL SIDE WORKING SIDE 

,,~5 25 2~ 2~ I ,25 
EXTRA ~ P E R M A N E  RI HT-OF-WAY--~- ' TEMPORARY EXTRA 

WORK AREA RIGHT-OF-WAY WORK AREA 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-12.20 TO MP-12.26 

2. CONRGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDmONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPEUNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
LrnUTY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

o2,o,o5  1 2  
" , , W . . ~ , , C . i ' = , ~ t , .  7 of 12 
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CAD FILE kl~ 03-434-Se¢l-VoPkDetett= / CD169~ 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

T O P S O I L ~  \ 

EXCAVATED SOIL ~ \ 

, 25' • 225" 
SPOIL SlOE WORKING SIDE 

25 I 2s I 
1 - - ~  PERMANENT RIGHT-OF-WAY-~ TEMPORARY " EXTRA 

RIGHT-OF-WAY WORK AREA 

75' --- 
EXTRA 

WORK AREA 

i 

NOTE: 

1. ~ LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-12.39 TO blP-12 ,80  

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDmONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOl" MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTILITY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24"  PL-1  EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

02 /01 /05  PL-1 EXT. 2 NOT TO SC~ 
8 o f  12 

,, j f . . ~ , ~ , ~ ,  ,~.  
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r I  mr NO. 0 3 - . 4 3 4 - . ~ m ~ . J - V o r k k + ~ l t g  / CDt69e 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

TOPSOIL 

25' 25' 

TEMPORARY 
RIGHT-OF-WAY WORK AREA 

o 2 
O. 

L~ 

25' • m • 
SPOIL SIDE 

25' 25' 

PERMANENT- RIGHT-OF-WAY 

205' 
WORKING SIDE 

.I.s,. I 
- - - i ' ;75 '  
z Ji 

EXTRA 
WORK AREA 

NOTE: 

1. "TYPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

M P - 1 2 . 8 0  TO M P - 1 2 . 8 2  

2. CONRGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADOmONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS, 

3. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

02/01/05 I PL-1  EXT. 2 NOT TO SCALE 
9 o f  1 2  

PROPOSED PIPEUNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
untrr~ CROSS,NGS. ~ " ,R.Ydr.m:.Y =/~"~"~,,,.~--, 
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V 

CAD ~ E  N~ D3-434-S l rc l -VoPk~t : l l l  / ~6qJ~ 

EXCAVA1T.D SOIL TEMPORARY EROS~ 

(AS REQUIRED) 

50' 25' 
WORKING SIDE SPO4L ~DE 

I 
25' _ r 25, 25, 

TEMPORARY ~.--PERMANENT RIGHT-OF-WAY 
~IGHT--O~-WAY 

5' 
1,50' 

EXtrA 
WORK AREA 

NOTE: 

1. "tYPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-12.82 TO MP-12.83 

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIO~ TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPEUNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTILRY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

12 
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V 

FXLE NO, 03-434-$e¢l-VoPtc~'t~¢ / C~69~ 

EXCAVATED SOIL TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 

o a  
Q. 

50' 25' 
IL • m 

WORKING SIDE SPOIL SIDE 

25' . I .  25' 25' _ 5 '  
/ 

TEMPORARY ~ PERMANENT RIGHT-OF-WAY 
RIGHT-OF-WAY | 

NOTE: 

I. TYPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-13.20 TO MP-13.26 
MP-13.54 TO MP-13.80 
MP-25.38 TO MP-26.06 

2. CONRGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTIUTY CROSSINGS, 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

o,/o,/o, I 
11 of  12 
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C.~¢0 ~ NO. 03-434-Secl-Vork~tt~lll / C01692 

TEMPORARY E]~SK)N 
CONTROL BAR~ER 

E:~C, AVATIED SOiL / 

100' 
DCI~A WORK 

5PAC~ 

25' ~ 50' 
S~OIL ~ WORXlN~; SIDE 

25' 25' 2.5' 

PIERMANI~ff I~-OF-WAY ~ TEMPORARY 
RI~-OF-WAY 

~ 0  

EX'rRA WORK 
SPACE 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-19 .65  TO MP-19.91 
MP-20.02 TO MP-2O.05 

2. CONRGURAllON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDlllONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

02101105 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 12 o f  12 
UT]UIY CROSSINGS. 
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I CAI F I L l  N i l  ~O-434-~-.J~-VI~I~iaLILII  I CD17t~ 

q l  

l 

C O N ' ~  I ~  
(As REQ~REO) 

5 '  _ 

26' ~ 50" 
SPOIL ~ WK)RffiNG SlOE 

25,' 26' 

• - - - ~ -  PIB~t&~NtNT I ~ I ~ , ~ ' I " . - O F - W A y . - - - , . -  

RIGHT-OF-WAY 

NOTE: 

I.  "IYPICAL LOCAIDN FROM STA'nON 
MP-O.O0 TO MP-8.23 
MP-6.32 TO MP-6.44. 
MP-6.71 TO MP-6.73 
MP-7.90 TO MP-7.94 
MP-8.06 TO MP-8.20 
MP-9.52 TO MP-9.60 
MP-9.70 TO MP-9.75 
MP-IO.04 TO MP-11.01 
MP-11.32 TO MP-12.70 
¼P-14..44. TO MP- l&49  

2. CONFIOURAllON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDmONN. TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CRO~NG& 

3. PROPOSED P1PEUNE TO MAJNTNN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTIU'IY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 2 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

~' ,4( .g , ,C.~,~ , ,d~e, . ,~  I 1 of 9 
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I CAP FILE NO. O~'-434-.~Vor,~DQ'toRs / C~179e 

11 

1 1 ~  ER(~ON 
CONW~(~. eAmU~ 
O~S R~XJIR~) 

EXCAVA'[ED 

I 
SPOIL SOE 

l 
t~ 75' 

WOm<]NG S~OE 

6 '  L , 25' • ~ 25' :J 9Kl l~pO~ ' 

' = , ~ - - - - ~  N~Hr-OF-¥t~y-~ RIGHlr--OF.-~Y 

25' 
DGPA 

~X~K NtEA 

NO']~: 

1. 1YPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-6.23 TO MP-6.32 
MP-8.44 TO MP-8.71 
MP-8.73 TO MP-7.90 
MP-7.94 TO MP-8.08 
U P - 8 , 2 0  TO M P - 9 . 5 2  
MP-9.60 TO MP-g.70 
MP-9.75 TO MP-IO.04 
MP-11.01 TO MP-11.32 
MP-14.36 TO MP-14.44 
MP-14.49 TO UP-14.60 

2. CONRGURAllON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDiTIONN. TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 2 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 
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TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 

(AS REQUIRED) 
TOPSOIL 

. / 

l 

25' 

EX'rRA 
WORK AREA 

,,b 

75' 25' 
wo~K,,~ s,~ s~o,, s,o~ 

I 2s. I , ,  2~. 
: : ~ . ~  ~ ~ . : - - , ~ ,  ~ ; g , - o ~ - , ~ , - - : "  

RJOHT.-OF-WAY | 

NOTE: 

1. "WPICAL LOCAllON FROM STATION 
MP-12.70 TO MP-12.84 
MP-13.14 TO MP-13.59 
MP-13.82 TO MP-14.36 

2. CONRGURATION DOES NOT iNCLUDE 
ADDmONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPEUNE TO I#klNTAJN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
u'nu'w CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 2 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

" " " X . ~ ' , E . ~ , = , , = a = , , ~ . ~  ~ 3 of 
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I C~O F]L£ NO. O~,-434-t41~=~,-Va~,~Ootdl / ~,7~le 

11 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

TOPSOIL \ 

EXCAYAI~D , ~  

25' 
SPOIL SIDE 

(.~ 

IlL 
75' 

J I  

WORKING SIDE 

2s. ,5. I 25. I 

L 

25' 

EXTRA 
WORK AREA 

NOTE: 

1. "WPICAL LOCATION FROM ~rATION 
MP-12.84. TO MP-13.14 
MP-17.00 TO MP-17.15 

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITION~ "nEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24." PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 2 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAZNTAIN ONE A/ - ,  ~ PL-1 . . . . .  
' ~ r  FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE B = ' / ' / "~"  I EXT. 2 i . u ,  lu =~'11 I 

unuTY CROS~NGS. 
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qll 

1 

~ EROS~N 
TOPSOIL EXCAVA'~D SOIL CONTROL BARRIER 

EXTRA TEMPORARY ~'-PERMANENT RI(3HT-OF-WAY "~ 
AREA RIGHT.-OF'-WAY | 

NOT~ 

1. IYPICAL LOCATION FROM STAllON 
MP-13.59 TO MP-13.82 

2. CONFIGtJRATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADO(IIONAL TEMPORARY WOI~XSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTIUW CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 2 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 
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I CAD FILE NO. O~434-~.L~-¥cmk.~,tclbl / C~BI79e 

~ B~SION 

0~S ~QU~E0) 

EXCAVA'rI~ SOIL 

2 5 '  I 5' 

25' ~ 75' 
5P0¢ SIDE WORffiNO S~OE 

L Ji 

RICHT-OF-WAY WORK AREA 

NOTE: 

1. "P(PICAL LOCAllON FROM STATION 

MP-14.84. TO M P - 1 5 . 0 8  
MP-15.12 TO MP-15.72 
MP-15.86 TO MP-15.99 
MP-16.03 TO MP-16.06 
MP-16.12 TO MP-17.00 
MP-18.69 TO MP-19.04 
WP-23.28 TO MP-23.40 
MP-23.61 TO MP-23.64 

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL "R~MPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 2 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

3. PROPOSED RPEUNE TO MNNTNN ONE - n.. ~ P! - - I  
~l~ FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE i ~ / , / u 4  | EkT--2 n .o r  To s c ~  I _ I 

U~LI~ CROSSINGS. 
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I I  

7 

CONTROL ~ 

2~ 5" ,m 

25' 50' 
sPO¢ ~oE V ~ O E  

. 25' i • 25' L I  J 25' , 
- - . - - ~ - P ~  RI~-OF-t~y~.I ~ E ~  

RIGHT-OF--tK~Y 

NOT~ 

1. TYPCAL LOCAllON FROM STATION 
MP-14.60 TO MP-14.64. 
MP-15.08 TO MP-15.12 
MP-15.72 TO MP-15.86 
MP-15 .99  TO M P - 1 6 . 0 3  
MP-16 .06  TO M P - 1 6 . 1 2  
MP-17 .15  TO MP-18 .69  
MP-19.04 TO MP-19.85 
MP-23.40 TO MP-23.61 
MP-23.64 TO MP-23.85 

2. CONRGURA110N DOES NOT iNCLUDE 
ADDn'IONAL I'~PORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPEUNE TO MAINTNN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
Lr~uPf CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 2 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

7 o f 9  
== I 
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I 
qmu 

q l  

-[ 

EJ~ riLE Ng. 03-434-Sec2-VorkDrte~ / 13~79~ 

8~StON 
E~CAVAllED SO~ ~ B ~ E ~  

50' 
VCORK~G SIDE 

I 
25' . J . 25' 

mGHT- CF-WAy | 

W 
Z 

25' | 
SPOIL SIDE 

25' 
RIGNT--OF'-WAy - -  

! !z 

5' . 25  ° 

NOTE: 

1. 1YPICAL LOCATION FROM STA'nON 

M P - 1 9 . 8 5  TO M P - 1 9 . 8 9  
MP-2O.Ol  TO M P - 2 1 . 6 5  
M P - 2 1 . 9 6  TO M P - 2 2 . 0 5  
MP-22 .09  TO MP-22 .21  
M P - 2 2 . 2 8  TO M P - 2 3 . 2 6  
M P - 2 3 . 8 5  TO M P - 2 8 . 6 2  

2. CONF16URATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
A D D I ~  TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOS£D PIPEUNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SURSURFACE 
UTII-IIY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 2 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

,jTjo, i ,o l 
" = " A f . ~ ' , F _ ~ ~ , =  ~ 8 of 9 
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~m 

I I  

1 

C,,AO FILE NO. 03-.434-$ecZ-V¢~'t=,l~ / C0179~ 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
EXCAVATED SOIL CO N~'04. 

75' 25' 
WORKtNG SlOE SPOtL SIDE 

- - 

WORK A R ~  I ~ G m - ~ - W A Y /  

_ 5'_1_25'_ 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCATION FROM STA]'ION 
MP-19.89 TO MP-20.01 
MP-21.65 TO MP-21.96 
MP-22.05 TO MP-22.09 
MP-22.21 TO MP-22.28 

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDrDON/¢ TEMPORARY WORK.SPACE 
At" CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPE1JNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTIIJW CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 2 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 
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I 
" CAD rILE biB, O~-434-.~.ec3-¥ork]~J~ / C~179~ 

1. 

2. 

'EMPORAI~ rd~'O~ON 
EX~VAI'IED ~ CONTROL B~RRIER 

50' 25' 
i 

~RKqNO S~DE SPOIL SIDE 

25' 25' , I , 25' 
• "-------PERMANEk~ ' R/~HT.-OF-WAY --=- 

RIGHT-OF-WAy 

5' 25' 

T'tPIC, N. LOCKnON FROM STATION 

MP-0.00 TO MP-1.17 
MP-1.4.0 TO MP-2.02 
MP-2.41 TO MP-4..94 
MP-5 .12  TO MP-6 .85  
MP-7.01 TO MP-7 .15  
MP-7.23 TO MP-7.50 
MP-7.53 TO MP-14.15 
MP-14..62 TO MP-16 .52  
MP-16 .98  TO MP-17 .20  
MP-17.68 TO MP-17.84 
MP-18 .38  TO MP-20 .64  
MP-20.74 TO MP-23.80 
MP-24..03 TO MP-24 .89  

CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDfTIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION. INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

1" ~" PROPOSEO ~ U E  "tO ~ ,  ONE | 9/7/04 
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CAD F]B-£ Nil (13-434-.~,ec3-Vork.~rt~ / C~/tle 

~ EROSlOH 
COk'mOL B.~R~ER 

EX~VA~ SOIL / 

25' I 5' 

25' 
W o ~  SaDE 

RIGHT-OF-WAy 

NOTE: 

1. T Y P ~  LOCATION FROM STA'nON 

MP-1.17 TO MP-1.4.0 
MP-2.02 TO MP-2.07 
MP-2.32 TO MP-2.41 
MP-23.60 TO MP-23.70 

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCUJOE 
ADOITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MNNTNN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTILITY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

,/7/o4, I 
p ~ , ~  ~ ~ . ~ _ . . ~ ~  . 2 OF 1 2  
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I ~ NO. 031.-4134-,~c31-.Vm',,Ick, C~l.g / C~79~ 

NOTE: 

1. WPICAL LOCAtiON FROM STATION 

MP-2.28 TO MP-2.32 
MP-14.48 TO MP-14..52 
MP-17.20 TO MP-17.88 
MP-17.84. TO MP-18.36 
MP-24.89 TO MP-24..g8 
MP-25.28 TO MP-25.36 
MP-25.38 TO MP-25.45 

2. CONRGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 

EXCAVATED SO¢ / 

25 '  50 '  
J SPOIL SIDE WORffiNG S~DE 

i 

25 '  25 '  _ i _ 25' 

| ~-oF-~ 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
U'III.~ CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 
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CAD FILE NO. 03-434-~h~l--Vmd4~rt~l~ / CZ79e 

50' 
WOl~<~40 5aOE 

25' 

ligHT-OF-WAy 

,~ 25' 
SPOIL S~E 

25' 25' 
i J 

I ~  I ~ - O F - W A Y - -  

2, 

3. 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-4..94 TO MP-5 .12  
MP-16 .52  TO MP-18 .98  

CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADOf]'K)NAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSJNOS. 

PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MNNTNN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
U ~  CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION ,.'3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

P , ~ l ~  ~ . ~ . . ~ ~ , / / ~ .  i 4 OF 12 
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~ m  

CAD f'XUC NO. OQ--434-.~,ec~l-VoPk~ / C~Dt.7~IE 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
1OPSOL EXCAVAllED SOIL CONTROL BKRRIER 

75' 
i 

WORKING SlO( 

, 2 5 '  L ~ 2 5 '  , , 2 5 '  , 2 5 '  , 

EXTRA "NE~PORARY '~-PERMANENT RIGHT-OF'-WAY "~- 
WORK AREA RIGHT-O¥-WAY 

2 5 '  
L 

SpOIl S~OE 

t ~  
Z 

25' 

7 

NOTE: 

1. TYPfCAL LOCATION FROM STA'nON 

MP-6.85 TO MP-7.01 
MP-7.13 TO MP-7 .23  
MP-7.50 TO MP-7.53  
MP-20.64 TO MP-20 .74  

2. CONFIGURATION OOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDmONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPEIJNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UT1UTY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 5 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

5 OF 12 
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I C/~ FILl[ I~, 03.-434.-.~,ec3.-Vce, k]Det~lll / PmT~B 

~C,a~VA'~ISD 

2B' L ~ 5 ' .  

25' 
SPOIL W O R ~  SlOE 

25' 25' 25' 25' 
L i • • 

RIGHT-OF-WAy t ~  ARE.A 

ql 

NOTE: 

1. 

2, 

1YPICAL LOCA'nO~I FROM STATION 

M P - 2 3 . 7 0  TO M P - 2 3 . 7 8  

CONFIGClRATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
A D D ~  11[MPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION ,.3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MNNTNN ONE 9 F 7 / 0 4  P L - 1  ~ _~,,~lr 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE "~ " "  - -  I : .XI. ;" . . . . . .  J: t~ r  t '~  | 
UTILIIY CROSSINGS. 
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CA~ ~ NB, 03.-434-~mc3-V(~<~etmll / Cm79E 

TEMPORARY EROS~N 
TOPSOIL EXCAVAT[D SO~L CONTROL BARRIE~ 

50'  
WORtQNG SIDE " "- 

I 

25' _ I . 25' 25' 

I~'OHT- OF-WAY I 

• ~lO'. 

l 

I I I  

1 

N01~ 

1. "WPIC~ LOCATION FROM STATION 

M P - 2 4 . . 6 9  TO MP-25.28 

2. CONRGURA'nON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDfllONkL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPC6ED PIPELINE TO MAINTNN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTIUW CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION ,3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

7 OF 12 
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"R:MPORARY O~ISlON 
TOPSO¢ EXCAVATED SOIL CONTROL BARRIER 

50' 
WOf~KING SlOE 

25' _ I ~ 25' 25' 

i 

'I]EMPORARY I"-PERMNNEN'f RJ~HT--OF-WAY 
RIOHT-OF'-WAY I 

t~ 

30' _ _ 15 

45' 

'qB 

7 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCA'nON FROM STATION 

MP-25.38 TO MP-25.56 

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTNN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UT1UTY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

i° i,o 12 
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CA~ F]LIE NO. 0 ~ - 4 3 4 ~ - ~ W ~  / C.m792 

"ng~aOp,~y ~q~ION 
COh'TROL EW~RER 

EXCAVATI~ 50H. / 

25'. . 5 '  

25* 
~DIL ~JDE t l ~  SlOE 

~ '  25' I 25' 

| RI~HT.-OF.-'~Y 

75' 
EXI1A tlC~K 

SPACE 

qB 

NOTE: 

1. 1YPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-2.07 TO MP-2.28 

2. CONF'~URATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

! 
~ 1 '  3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE | 9 / 7 / 0 4  Pr--~- L - 1  1,101" TO SCALE 

FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE ~ r.,,,. ,= o ,',,r ..,', I 
U ~  CROSSINGS. 
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CAD ~ NCL O~-434-Sa¢ '~Vm4~DetLls  / Cm7q~ 

~ EROSION 
COICr~OL BA~ER 

BC, AVA'r ~D SOIL / 

l 
30' 

NOTF.~ 

1. 

• SPOI. SI~ 

50' 
• J i  • 

75' • • 
EXt'RA ~RI( 

SPACE 

41, 50° 

25' 2,5' 25' 

PERI&M41D~IT RIGHT-OF-~y ~ 
R~GHT.-OF-WAY 

100' 

BtTPA WORI< 
SPACE 

2. 

~ l r  3. 

"PfPIC,,AL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-14.15 TO MP-14,48 
MP-14.,52 TO M P - 1 4 . 6 2  

CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCtUDE 
A D O ~  TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

PROPOSED PIPE]JNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTILFIY CRO~NGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION .3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

10 OF 12 
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~VATI~ ~L / 

i i ~=OIL S~OE WORIONG SaOE 
i 

I .  ~ '  _ 3o' ~o ' ,  ~' I. 2s' , ~' 

'qm 

2. 

3. 

NOTE: 

1. IYPh?,,AL LOC, A'nON FROM STATION 

M P - 2 3 . 7 8  TO M P - 2 4 . 0 3  

CONRGURAllON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAJNTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTIUTY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" PL-1 EXT. 2 SECTION 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

P"~'=="d ~"~'~'~"~'¢¢w'~d;da'~"~'/"~" I 11 OF 1 2  
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CA]D FILl[ NIl. 0 3 - - 4 5 4 - ~ e c 3 - V ~ t ~ l  I C~179~ 

'EMPOR~RY EROSION 
TOPSOIL EXCAVATED SO~L CONTROL BARBER 

¢.M 
50' 

i i  
WORKING S1DE 

/ 
25' L 1 .  25. 7 ; ~ 2,5' -- 

1EMPOP, ARY I"-PERtAiI.NENT RIGHT-OF-WAY "~" 
B 

RIGHT-OF-WAY | 

45' 

NOTE: 

1. "tYPICAL LOCATION FROM STAllON 

MP-25.28 TO MP-25.38 

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDrnONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24"  PL-1  EXT. 2 SECTION 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

917104 PL-1 EXT. 2 NGT TO SCN.E 
" " "  " 

.3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
tmLn~ C~OSSINCS. 1 2 OF 12 
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I CA~ FAJ£ ~ 03-434 / ~ 03-434 CO~'~JCTII~ IDO<~IIT$ 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

r 

PROPOSED 24"  PL-1 EXT 2 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR EXTREME INCLINES 

DATE 8/04 IPL-1 EXT 2MNoTTO SC~J~ i 
1 OF4 
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n CAD ~ ~ ~ / ~P.~='TINCt/ 0~-43N C g N S ~  [XYR~II"T~ 

I _  RIDGE TOP 

-- 10' TO 15 ° W1D£ ~ / - - - - - 4 '  MIN. COVt3~ 

/ 

~ G ~  ~D H ~  OF ~,./ ~--2*" ~ ~ 
BENCH WALL. VARIES ~, 

N O T E :  

WHEN PIPELINE RUNS PARALLEL TO THE TOP OF A SMALL RIDGE 
AND "TRENCHING MACHINE CANNOT BE EMPLOYED, CUT A SMALL 
BENCH AND BURY 24" PIPE, WITH A MINIMUM OF 4.' COVER, 
AT THE BASE OF THE BENCH AS SHOWN ABOVE. 

N O T E :  

EXTRA WORK SPACE REQUIRED 
ON THE DOWN SLOPE SIDE 
DEPENDS UPON EXIS]]NG SLOPE. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24" PL-1 EXT. 2 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR SMALL RIDGELINE 

8/04 
2 0 F 4  
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B CAll FILE NB. 03"-434 / l ~  03-434 C O N ~  E ~  

BACK SLOPE (WHEN REQ'O.) 
~ DEPENDS UPON TERRAIN AND 

R/W WlDTH 

• ~ 

° 

,~D' TO 40' (APPROX.) 

THE W1DTH OF THIS WORK AREA 
DEPENDS UPON THE S~ZE OF 
EQUIPMENT AND THE CONTRACTOR 

24" PIPELINE 

N O T E :  

EXTRA WORK SPACE REQUIRED 
ON "ITIE DOWN SLOPE SIDE 
DEPENDS UPON EXIS~NG SLOPE.. 

1" 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24." DG-1 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR TWO-TONE SLOPE 

DATE 8/04. IPL-I Exr 21NOT TO SCALE I 



( ( 

T 
lr 

T,J  

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED PL-1 EXT 2 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION LAY-OUT 
FOR STOVE PIPE CONSTRUCTION 

DATE 8/04. NOT TO SCALE ______[P,- 1 ~ ~  2 L _ _  - 
4 0 F  4 

0 

f l  

M 

I 

fO 

fO 

0 

t~  
Q 
Q 

Q 

t~  

I 
Q 

fO 
f l  
fO 

fO 

M 

0 

M 

Q 

t~  
Q 
Q 

0 
f l  

fO 

0 
U1 

I 

I 
0 
0 
0 
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APPENDIX 1-D 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION TECHNIQUES FOR THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPELINE 
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CAD FOE NO. 04-~42-V~,~N, tds 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

EXCAVATED SOIL / 

S~O,L S,OE : 4' 
WORKING SIDE 

25' 25' 25' 
• • l • L 

• ---PERMANENT RICJ-Fi'-Of'-WAY -,~ TEMPORARY 
RJGHT-OF-WAY 

NOIT.: 

1. 1YPICAL LOCATION FROM STA110N 
MP-O.O0 TO MP-O.O2 

2. CONF1GURKr}ON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDI1~NAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSJNGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-492 EXT. 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

10/7/04 ~ TL-492 EXT. ,3 I NOT TO sc~u-r 
1 of 8 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTNN ONE | | I 
Foot , ,N, ,U,  ON ,U. SU,SU.~,CE 
u . u ~  cRos~NGS. " " "  M - . . ~ , £ . ~ = , Z t . , , ~  
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CA~ ~ NO. 04-e4~¥n~,Je~ 

EXCAVATED SOiL 

TEMPORARY EROSiON 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

25' ~ ~ ~ 1 1 ~  

SPOIL SIDE WORKING SIDE 

I I 
_ 25' 25' I 25' 

- -  |,ERK, U~E~rr =RIGH'r-Or-W,~'--.--J "rE~F'OR,~'Y ' 
/ RIGHT-OF-WAY 

NOTE: 

1. 1YPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 
MP-O.02 TO MP-O.06 
MP-0.11 TO MP-0.28 
MP-0.37 TO MP-0.50 
MP--0.67 TO MP-0.69 
MP-2.08 TO MP-2.19 
MP-2.28 TO MP-2.34 
MP-2.40 TO MP-2,50 
MP-4.88 TO MP-5.04 
MP-5.35 TO MP-5.59 
MP-5.62 TO MP-5.87 
MP-7.05 TO MP-7.51 
M P - g . 6 0  TO MP-g.62 
MP-9.66 TO MP-9.85 
MP-IO.IO TO MP-IO.20 

2. CONRGURA'RON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADOmONAL TE.MPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTILn'Y CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC, 

PROPOSED 
24"  T L - 4 9 2  EXT. 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION R I G H T - O F - W A Y  

lo/7/  ! TL-492 EXT. 3 NO1" TO SCALE 
2 o f 8  



]nofficial FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

CAD IrK[ NO. 04-1Ml~-VoPk~.t~Lim 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

TOPSOIL~  \ 

EXCAVATED SOIL ~ 

75' 
WORKING SIDE 

.= 

=5 
SPOIL SIDE 

, 25' L I ,  25' , • 25' hi ' 25' 
--PERMANENT RIGHT-OF-WAY-- TEMPORARY | E X ~  

RIGHT-OF-WA'~ r WORK AREA 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCAl]ON FROM STATION 

MP-O.06 TO MP-0.11 
MP-O.26 TO MP-0.37 
MP-0.50 TO MP-O.67 
MP-0.69 TO MP-0.87 
MP-2,19 TO MP-2.28 
MP-2.34. TO MP-2.40 
MP-5.59 TO MP-5.62 
MP-7.02 TO MP-7.05 
MP-9.62 TO MP-9.66 
MP-102.0 TO MP-10.37 

2. CONFI~RA'RON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADOrnohthL "I'IDdPORARY ~fORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-492 EXT. 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

10/'7/04 TL-492 EXT. 3 NOT TO S C ~  ~. P R O ~  PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOl" MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE ~ of 8 
u ~  =O= ,N~ .  " "  ~' . , # . . . ~ , F - - ~ , , , , , , . ~  
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2. 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
TOPSOIL EXCAVATED SOIL CONTROL BARRIER 

75' ~ 25' I, 
WORKING SIDE "SPOtL StDE '~ ~- 

25' _1~ 25' ~l  25' 25' . 
EXTR* I ~POR*RY / 

WORK AR~ R~HT-O~-W*~ 1 P~V~NENT ~CHT-OF-W^Y 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCAnON FROM STA~ION 

MP-0.87 TO MP-I .05 
MP-1.70 TO MP-1.87 
MP-1.97 TO MP-2.01 
MP-2.50 TO MP-2.72 
MP-3.00 TO MP-3.10 
MP-3.13 TO MP-3.17 
MP-3.26 TO MP-3.33 
MP-4.37 TO MP-4.40 
MP-4.69 TO MP-4.73 
MP-6.33 TO MP-6.85 
MP-8.45 TO MP-8.50 
MP-8.65 TO MP-8.69 
MP-8.75 TO MP-8.84  
MP-8.g6 TO MP-g.03 
MP-10.55 TO MP-10.89 

GONF1GURAllON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADomONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINT/iJN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
U11UTY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" T L - 4 9 2  EXT. 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

! 4 of 8 
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CAB F'ZUC NID. 0 4 - - 2 4 2 - V ~ t ~  

EXCAVATED SOIL TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 

NOTE: 

z= z°= a 

50' _ ! _  25" -_ r~ 
WORKING SIDE i i SPOIL SIDE 

25' _ [ ~ 25' 25' 

TEMPORARY - ~ PERMANENT- ' - R I G H T - O F - W A Y  - ~ - -  

/ RIGHT-OF-WAY 

1. 

2. 

3. 

TYPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-I.O5 TO MP-1.70 
MP-1.87 TO MP-1.97 
MP-2.01 TO MP-2.08 
MP-2.72 TO MP-3.00 
MP-3.10 TO MP--3.13 
MP-3.17 TO MP-3.26 
MP-3.33 TO MP-4..37 
MP-4.40 TO MP-4.69 
MP-4..73 TO MP-4.B8 
MP-5.04 TO MP-5.35 
MP-5.87 1"0 MP-6.33 
MP-6.85 TO MP-7.02 
MP-7.51 TO MP-7.76 
MP-7.89 TO MP-8.4-5 
MP-8.50 TO MP-8.65 
MP-8.69 TO MP-8,75 
MP-8.84 TO MP-8.g6 
MP-g.03 TO MP-9.60 
MP-10.47 TO MP-10.55 

CONFIGURA'nON DOES NOT INC~D£ 
ADOmONAL TI[MPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-492 EXT. 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

l o / 7 / o 4  TL-,,~2 EXT. 3 NGT TO SC~.E PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
~oT . , . , . u .  ON ~_ su.suRF~E 5 of 8 
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q~ 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
TOPSO4L EXCAVATED SOIL CONTROL BARRIER 

100' 

50' 

EXTRA 
WORK AREA 

WORKING SIDE 

U )  = 

• " SPOIL SIDE L 

25' 25' 
i= • 

RIGHT-OF-WAY PERMANENT RfGHT-OF-WAY 

L 
I _ 25' 
I :rEMPO~U~" " 

NOTE: 

1. 

2. 

"tYPiCAL LOCAI'tON FROM SIAl'tON 

MP-7.76 TO MP-7,89 
MP-10.69 TO MP-10.71 

CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INC~.UDE 
ADOnlONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROS~NGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-492 EXT. 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 
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TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

£XCAVAI'E'D ..~ 

I 

)ii 
G) 

25' 75' 
SPOIL SLOE WORKtNG SLOE 

25' 25' . . 25 ° _ _ 25' 

RiGHT-OF-WAY WORK ARF.A 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL LOCAllON FRO&# STATION 

MP-g .85  TO MP- IO.01 

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDf'rlONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROS~NGS. 

3. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-492 EXT. 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

lo/vo, I PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTNN ONE n I | ]1 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE ~ 7 o f  8 
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£~1 r11LE N~ 04-E42-V=~cDet¢lt= 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

25' 100' 
SPO~L SIDE WORKING SIDE 

I 

25' 25' J 25' ~ • 50' • 

RIGHT-OF-WAY WORK AREA 

NOTE: 

1. ~ LOCA110N FROM STATION 

¼P-10.37 TO MP-10.47 

2. CONFIOURAIION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADOITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-492 EXT. 3 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 1 0 / 7 / 0 4  T L - 4 9 2  
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE EXT. 3 NOT TO SCALE 
UTILII'Y CROSSINGS. 8 o f 8  
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~ N i l  g 4 - e 4 ~ ~ ' t J ~ o d s  / C'~g~ll31 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24"  TL-492 EXT 3 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR EXTREME INCLINES 

NOV. 2004 11.-492 EXT 31 NOT TO SC,~J[ 
1 OF4 
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CAD I~LE NO, 0 4 - E ~  / C]~831 

RIDGE TOP 
10' TO 15' W1DE ~/~ F 4° MIN. COVER 

BENCH WALL VARIES ~ ~ 
oF 

N O T E :  

WHEN PIPELINE RUNS PARALL£L TO THE TOP OF A SMALL RIDGE 
AND TRENCHING MACHINE CANNOT BE EMPLOYED, CUT A SMALL 
BENCH ANO BURY 24" PIPE, WITH A MINIMUM OF 4' COVER, 
AT THE BASE OF THE BENCH AS SHOWN ABOVE. 

N O T E :  

EXTRA WORK SPACE REQUIRED 
ON "ITIE DOWN SLOPE SIDE 
DEPIENDS UPON EXISTING SLOPE. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24"  TL-492  EXT ,5 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR SMALL RIDGEUNE 

NOV. 2004. 11.-492 EXT 3 i NOT TO 
2 0 F 4  
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CAD I r ~  ND, 0 4 - e 4 ~ - C ~ $  I C 3 ~  

BACK SLOPE (WHEN REQ'D.) 
DEPENDS UPON TERRAIN AND 
R/W WIDTH 

b .  o~ 

G]" 

3o' TO ~ '  (~PROX.) 

THE W1DTH OF THIS WORK AREA 
DEPENDS UPON THE SIZE OF 
EQUIPMENT AND THE CONTRACTOR 

24." PIPEUNE 

N O T E :  

EXTRA WORK SPACE REQUIRED 
ON ]HE DOWN SLOPE SIDE 
DEPENDS UPON EXI~NG SLOPE. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24 '° T L - 4 9 2  EXT 3 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR TWO-TONE SLOPE 

NOV. 2004 11.-492 EXT 31 NOT TO SCALE 
3 0 F 4  



. . . . . . . . . .  ( ................................................ ( .................................................. - (  . . . . . . .  

i I• , ~ ~ " "  , 

~,'~ ,,~,, ~ ,  ~,~ 

~'~'~ ~,lr" COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24" TL -492  EXT 5 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION LAY-OUT 
FOR STOVE PIPE CONSTRUCTION 

NOV. 2004. 1"1_-492 EXT5 NOT TO SC, N..E 
~ - , ~ ,  , . " , . , ,  . '  I , o F ,  
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V 

APPENDIX 1-D 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION TECHNIQUES FOR THE TL-536 PIPELINE 

v 
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B CAD rILE Nil 0 ~ 1 - 4 7 4 - V ~ 1 ~  I L~B 1831 

q l  

W ERO~ON 
C01~T1~¢ eARnER (As ~ )  

25' ~ 50' 
sPOil, sI l~ WORIONG SII)( 

25' 25' 25' 
, i m L 

--IME~IANENT RICNT--OF-WAY - -~  TIE]IAP(~C~f 
~HT-OF-WAy 

NOT~ 

1. LOCATION FROM STATION 
MP-O.O0 TO MP-O.03 
MP-O.40 TO MP-0.97 
MP- I . 30  TO MP-2.67 
MP-2.96 TO MP-3.34 
MP-3.50 TO MP-3.81 
MP-3.88 TO MP-8.5,3 

2. CONFICURATION DOES NOT INCLUDIE 
t ~ D I ~  TIEUPORAI~ WORKSPACE 
AT CRCeSING~. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
20" TL-536 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE ^ s , ~  ~ . . . . . .  
q l ~  FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE | ~ /  I O / U ~  | nNUI !0 ~UN.P,~ _ | 

UTII.rTY CROSSINGS. 
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~u 

q= 

"1 

CA]D rILE ~ O~-474-VoPk]De~lLI / P'n 1~11 

TEMPORARY 
CONTROL BAR~BR 

EXCAVATED SOIL 

i 
i 
ck 

SPOIL SlOE 

25'  

m P t ~ t ~ l E a T  

i 
75' 

t ~ ( I N G  S~E  

I 
25' 25' . [ .  25' 

L 

I~-OF-IK~Y ---,,- ~ E X ~  
RIGHT-OF-WAy VIORK AREA 

NOTE: 

1. "WPkT, AL LOCAIlON FROM STATION 

MP-O.03 TO MP-0.40 
MP-0.97 TO MP-I.,,30 
MP-2.67  TO MP-2.98  
MP-3.34  TO MP-3.50 
MP-3.81 TO MP-3.88 

2. 

3. 

CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDmON/¢ TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTNN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTII.J'I~' CROSSINGS, 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
20" TL-536 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

91131o4 I I ~r T° s~i'F'! 
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I C/~ FDJC N~ 03-474-Vo~et~lLs / ~ 18~ 

ql 

co~nRoL BAR.JR 

I" 

I 
25' 

S~L~ 
~ e  

1 

50' 
I woRm~ SIDE 

25' ~ 2~' 

NOT~ 

1. "WPICAL LOCAllON FROM STATION 
MP-8.53 TO UP-8.61 
. P - 8 . 6 3  TO MP-9.50  

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
20" TL-536 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE n / 4  ~ . . . . .  
v ~ . l . l ~ u .  ON ~ su~uRF~ I ol ,~- I I ~' '~ ~'~I _ ~ I 

U n U ~  CROSSINGS. 
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111 

T 

11E~OORARY B4~S=ON 
CONmOL BARRIE~ 
(AS ~ R ~ )  

i l 
! 

30' 

1 ! 
-I i 

Ii 
i 25' 75' 

SPOILSIOE = • | iII)RIIIN~ISIOE 

25' • , 25' ~ , ,  , 25' , 
- - ~  RIGHI"-OF'-WAY T1EUPORARY 

RIGHT---OF-WAY 

25" 
B(mA 

WORK ,,~F.A 

NOTE: 

1. TYPICAL L O C A ~  FROM STATION 

M P - 8 . 6 1  TO M P - 8 . 6 3  

2. CONRGURAT~ON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADOmONAL TEMPORARY WOf~<SPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO t~NTNN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTILITY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
20" TL-536 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

9113104 I I "°T T° =*l'Ei 
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v 

V 

V 

~ NO. 0 3 - 4 7 4 - C o e ~ S ~ l d e ,  od~ / C~|Ei31 

/ 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 20" TL-536 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR EXTREME INCLINES 

DEC. 2004 II TL -536  I NOT TO SCALE 

" = i I O F 4  
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C~D FILE N~ O3-474-CormtructJcw~Exf~s / CDI831 

W 

1 4  RIDGE TOP ~ I 
I-"IO'TO 15' WloE ~ i 

ANGLE AND HE~HT OF//. 
BENCH WALL VARIES - - ' ' 2 . X  

wrrH DEGREE OF SLOPE 

4' MIN. COVER 

> . - - : , -   ,PE 

N O T E :  

WHEN PIPEUNE RUNS PARALLEL TO THE TOP OF A SMALL RIDGE 
AND TRENCHING MACHINE CANNOT BE EMPLOYED CUT A SMALL 
BENCH AND BURY 24" PIPE, WTTH A MINIMUM OF 4' COVER, 
AT THE BASE OF THE BENCH AS SHOWN ABOVE. 

N O T E :  

WORK SPACE REQUIRED 
ON THE DOWN SLOPE SlOE 
DEPENDS UPON EXISTING SLOPE. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 20" TL-536 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR SMALL RIDGELIN£ 

DEC. 2004. I T L - 5 3 6  It NOT TO SCALE 
. . N 2 0 F 4  

I 
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V 

V 

CAD FILE NQ 0 3 - 3 7 4 - ~ t ~ c ~ s  / COt831 

BACK SLOPE (WHEN REO'D.) 
DEPENDS UPON TERRAIN AND 
R/W ~DTH 

b. 
oc/1 

w o  

~r 

3o' TO 40' (APPROX.) 
THE WIDTH OF THIS WORK AREA 
DEPENDS UPON THE SIZE OF 
EQUIPMENT AND THE CONTRACTOR 

24" PIPELINE 

N O T E :  

EXTRA WORK SPACE REQUIRED 
ON THE DOWN SLOPE SIDE 
DEPENDS UPON EXISTING SLOPE.. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 2 0 "  T L - 5 3 6  PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR TWO-TONE SLOPE 



( - 

C A ~  F I L E  N O .  0 4 - 4 7 4 - 1 T , ~ l ~ P t ~ t l ~ l F _ , ~ l ~ ¢ l  / C ~ I 1  

. . .."~ ' . : . ,  . : :  

• : : ~ : . -  . .  • 

" . .  , . 

Y 
J 

v . • 

. . , . .  

( 

,f 

) 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 20"  TL-536 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION LAY-OUT 
FOR STOVE PIPE CONSTRUCTION 

oEc. 200, II ~ - ~ 6  A "° '~  ~ 1  

| 

0 

f l  

M 

I 

fO 

fO 

0 

t~  
Q 
Q 

Q 

t~  

I 
Q 

fO 
f l  
fO 

fO 

M 

0 

M 

Q 

t~  
Q 
Q 

0 
f l  

fO 

C3 

0 
U1 

I 

I 
0 
0 
0 
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V 

V 

APPENDIX 1-D 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION TECHNIQUES FOR THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPELINE 

V 
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V 

v 

rIL£ NO, 03P-475-%~q]l~ nE']i~L,$ / Ci 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 

EXCAVATED SOIL (AS REQUIRED) 

w 

O ~  I=l li- 

9' _ 16' 50' 
S~ 4L SiDE WORKING SiDE 

25' 25' I 25' 
J 

PERMANENT RIGHT-Of'-WAY TEMPORARY 
R GHT-OF-WA~ 

NOTE: 

1. "WPICAL LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-0.27 TO MP-0.36 
MP-0.51 TO MP- I . 00  
MP-1.77 TO MP-2.18 
MP-2.24 TO MP-2.31 
MP-2.40 TO MP-2.61 

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDRIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPAC£ 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPEUNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
UTIUTY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-453 EXT. 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

1 of  7 
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V 

V 

CA~I~U~O3-.475-VBRK~Er~s/CDImS8 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

EXCAVATED SO~L 

16' 
SPOIL SiDE 

25' 
PERMANENT RiG 

W 

75' 

25' 
i'-OF-WAY 

WORKING SiDE 

J 25' 25' 
TEMPORARY : ECrRA 

RIGHT-OF-WAY WORK SPACE 

NOTE: 

1. 1YP~AL L.ocKnON FROM STA~ON 

MP-O.O0 TO MP-0.27 
MP-O.36 TO MP-0.51 
MP-I.00 TO MP-1.77 
MP-2.18 TO MP-2.24 
MP-2.31 TO MP-2.40 

2. CONT1GURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADOmONN. TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO I,¢,INTNN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON AlL SUSSURf"ACE 
UTlUlY CROS~NGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24"  TL -453  EXT. 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

,2/0, I 
2 of 7 
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C~l F'~LI: NO, 0Q-47~-I41ORK ]0k-TNI.$ / C1B IEI~I 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROl. BARRIER 

EXCAVATF.D SOIL (AS REQUIRED) 

10' 

! 
S P O ~ L ~  WORKING SIDE 

25' 25' I _ 25' 
: : - TEMPORARY PERMANENT RIGHT-OF-WAY RIGHT-Of'-WA~' 

1. T ~  LOCATION FROM STATION 

MP-2.61  TO M P - 3 . 2 0  

2. CONFIGURKnON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDfnONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-453 EXT. 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

1 2 / o 4  n _ - ~ 3  EXT. 1 NOT m SCALE 
3 o f 7  

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
Ml. , .u.  ON ~ s u ~ , ~  
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V 

V 

V 

CAD FIB.£ NQ. 03-47~-%~1e< ~IL'T~LS / CO 185~5 

1'~Ek~PORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 

EXCAVATED SOIL (AS REQUIRED} 

! 
SPOIL S~DE WORKING SIDE 

25' 25' I 25' 
- TEMPORARY 

PERMANENT RIGHT-OF-WAY RIGHT-OF-WAY 

NOTE: 

1. WPICAL LOCATION FROM STA'nON 

MP-3.20 TO MP-3.38 
MP-3.40 TO MP-3.43 
MP-3.45 TO MP-4.29 
MP-4.33 1"0 MP-5.68 
MP-5.76 TO MP-5.79 
MP-5.93 TO MP-5.97 
MP-6.06 TO MP-6.13 

2. CON~RAT]ON OOES NOT INCLUDE 
A D O I T ~  TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

3. PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
u'nu1Y CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-453 EXT. 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

4 o f 7  
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V 

V 

V 

"~PORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

25' i 

SPOIL SIDE 
I_ 25' 25' 

PERMANENT RtGHI"-OF-WAY 

75' 
WORKING SIDE 

I 25' I 25' 
"nEMPORARY - 

R GHT-OF-WAY I WORKEXTl~ACE 

NOT~ 

1. "PfP/CAL LOCA'nofl FROM STATION 

MP-3.38 TO MP-3.40 
MP-3.43 TO MP-3.45 
MP-4.29 TO MP-4.33 
kQP-5.68 TO MP-5.76 
MP-5.79 TO MP-5.93 
MP-5.97 TO MP-8.06 
MP-8.13 TO MP-8.37 

2. CONFIGURATION DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDmONN. T I [ M ~  WORKSPACE 
AT CROS~NGS. 

3. PROPOSED P1PEUNE TO MAINTAIN ONE 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE 
U11UTY CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-453 EXT. 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

I 5 o f 7  
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V 

CAD F3LE ND, 03-47~-WI]IRX ]B£'T/CK1.$ / CD 1855 

N01"~ 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 

EXCAVAT~ SOIL (AS REQUIRED) 

LU 

25' 
SPOIL SIDE 

50' 
"j " WORKING SIDE 

25' ; _ 25' I 25' 
PERMANENT R'IGHT-OF-WAY I TEMPORARY ~ 

RIGHT-OF-WAY 

1. TYPICAL LOCAllON FROM STATION 

MP-6.37 TO MP-6.49 
MP-6.54 TO MP-6.68 
MP--6.74 TO MP-6.80 
MP-6.84. TO MP-6.87 
MP-6.92 TO MP-7.40 
MP-7.61 TO MP-7.96 
MP-8.46 TO M P - 8 . 9 6  
M P - 9 . 0 1  TO MP-9.21 
MP-g.33 TO MP-9.54 
MP-9.64 TO M P - 9 . 6 7  
M P - 9 . 6 9  TO M P - g . 7 6  
MP-IO.03 TO MP-IO.20 
MP-IO.30 TO MP-10.65 
MP-10.97 TO M P - 1 0 . 9 9  
MP-11.03 TO MP-11.15 
MP-11.28 TO MP-11.45 

2. CONFI~JRA'nON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDmoNAL 11E~IPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROS~NGS. 

3. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-453 EXT. 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

21o4 g I PROPOSED PIPELINE TO MAJNTAIN ONE g ll I] II 
FOOT MINIMUM ON ALL SUBSURFACE ~ 6 of 7 
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v 

P . ~  RB.E NB, ( I ~ 4 7 ~ % I D R K  DETA~.$ / CO 1~1~5 

TEMPORARY EROSION 
CONTROL BARRIER 
(AS REQUIRED) 

EXCAVATED SOIL 

NOTE: 

t iJ E 
UJ 
Z 

D. 

25' • L i 
SPOIL SlOE 

_ 25' . 25' 

PERMANENT ~IGHT-OF-WAY 

7~' 
WORKING SIDE 

TEMPORARY WORK SPACE RIGHT-OF-WAY 

1. TYPICAL LocAnON FROM STA'RON 

MP-6.49 TO MP-6.54 
MP-6.68 TO MP-6.74 
MP-8.80 TO MP-6.84 
MP-6.87 TO MP-6.g2 
MP-7.40 TO MP-7.61 
MP-7.96 TO MP-8.46 
MP-8.96 TO MP-9.01 
MP-9.21 TO MP-9.33 
MP-9.54 TO MP-9.B4. 
MP-9.67 TO MP-g.6g 
MP-9.76 TO MP-IO.03 
MP-IO.20 TO MP-IO.30 
MP-10.65 TO MP-10.97 
MP-10.99 TO MP-11.03 
MP-11.15 TO MP-11.28 
MP-11.4-5 TO MP-11.55 

2. CONFIGt, IRA'I]ON DOES NOT INCLUDE 
ADDITIONAL TEMPORARY WORKSPACE 
AT CROSSINGS. 

DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. 

PROPOSED 
24" TL-453 EXT. 1 

TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 
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CAD Fa.[ NO. 0 3 - - 4 ~ ~ e d s  / IDD'III~S 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24"  TL-453 EXT 1 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR EXTREME INCLINES 

DEC. 2004 ~-,k53 EXT IINOT TO SC/CE 
1 OF'4 
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C ~  F]LE NO. O ~ 4 7 5 - C o ~ d d b l ~  / C m S ~  

I - RIDGE TOP - I 

~G GgJ"~ ' - -e 'c¢~'~/J~/~ '~ ~ / - ~ ' ~ -  10' TO 15' WIDE - | F 4' kilN. COVER 

, ~ ,  ,NG , ~ , ,  o F . . . - - - f X M  ~ _ _  , 4 -  P,PE ~ ~ ~ ) 7  

N 0 T E : "~,~/>/\\ 

WHEN PIPELINE RUNS PARALLEL TO THE TOP OF A SMALL RIOGE 
AND TRENCHING MACHINE CANNOT BE EMPLOYED. CUT A SMALL 
BENCH AND BURY 24" PIPE, WITH A MINIMUM OF 4' COVER, 
AT THE BASE OF" THE BENCH AS SHOWN 

N O T E :  

EXTRA WORK SPACE REQUIRF.D 
ON THE DOWN SLOPE SIDE 
DEPENDS UPON EXISTING SLOPE. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24"  T L - 4 5 3  EXT 1 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR SMALL RIDGELINE 

DEC. 2004. "n.-45~ EXT IIN01' TO SCALE 
2 0 F 4  
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B CAD FILE I~ ¢13-47=3-Com=tPu¢~o~,,4~s / CD18~5 

BACK SLOPE (WHEN REO'D.) 
DEPENDS UPON TERRAIN AND 
R/~t WIDTH 

30' TO 40' (APPROX.) 

THE WIDTH OF THIS WORK AREA 
DEPENDS UPON THE SIZE OF 
EQUIPMENT AND THE CONTRACTOR 

24" PIPEUNE 

N O T E :  

EXTRA WORK SPACE REOUIRED 
ON "filE DOWN SLOPE SIDE 
DEPENDS UPON EXlSIING SLOPE. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24" TL-453 EXT 1 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION RIGHT-OF-WAY 

FOR TWO-TONE SLOPE 

DEC. 2004 ITL-453 EXT IINOT TO SCALE 
3 O F 4  



( ( ( 
CAD RB.E N~ 0 ~ - 4 ~  / ¢.=~1B~5 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24" TL-453 EXT 1 PIPELINE 
TYPICAL CONSTRUCTION LAY-OUT 
FOR STOVE PIPE CONSTRUCTION 

DEC. 2004 I TL-~.~ EXTll NOT TO SCALE 
4 0 F 4  PO 

0 
U1 

I 

I 
0 
0 
0 
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APPENDIX 1-E 

TYPICAL WATERBODY CROSSING METHODS FOR THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE 

V 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

I CAD FILE NO. 03-454 \ DRN:'nNG \ C'REEX~INGM~ / (:01702 

q 

N O T E S  

1, CONCRETE ¢OATI[D P I P [  IILrGTION FOR ~ CROSSING 18 LOWENEO INTO TRENCH 
BY StDI[  BOOM TRACTORS A N D / O R  CRANIa l  A ~  REQUIRED BY DEPTH* 
LJ[NOTH A N D  mlZE OF CROgS1NO. 

2.  PIPE TO BE "TIE~) INTO pIPEIJNE. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
PROPOSED 24"  PL-1 EXT 2 PIPEUNE 

PUMP-AROUND METHOD 
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CAD FILE NO. 0 3 - 4 3 4  \ DRkrTING \ CREEIO(INGI~rlTIODS / CD1702 

V 

V 

-4, 

N O T E S  

1. PIPE TO B r" IN~rALLEO IN TRENCH WiTH SlDI~BOOM TRACTORS AND/OR CRANE~ 
A5 REQUIREO BY DtEIWTH. LENGTH AND SIZE OF CROSSING° 

2. PIP1[ TO IN[ "11ED INTO PIPELINF-. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
PROPOSED 24" PL-1 EXT 2 PIPEUN[ 

FLUME CROSSING METHOD 

~ , ~  No. 2 OF 4 
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CAD FILE NO. 03-434 \ DRAFTING \ CREEKX1NGMETHOOS / (:01702 

• ~--- - .A&A A ,  A, & 4 

Era' 

N O T E S  

1. PORTABLE  BRIDGE INSTALLED A C R O S S  STREAM OR RIVER. 

2 .  ~ P L U G  LEFT O N  EACH B A N K  1D P R E V E N T  I ITREAMR.OW INTO T R E N C H .  

3 .  P IPE FOR C R O S S ' N O  *'~.~SEMBLJ[O AWAY FROM rI"RF-AM. 

4 .  DrTCH P L U G  C O N l r I ~ U C T E D  B E H I N D  HARD PLUG.  

W 
COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

I PROPOSED 24" PL-1 EXT 2 PIPEUNE 
WET TRENCH METHOD 

Drowlng No. 3 OF 4 
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p,l~lET...~l(" ,D.~/"C~/ " 
& NOT TO SC~-E 

pJ'PE7.,/~ N 0 T r 

; .~ ~ ".'.L": ~'...':,: ~':, -'.".,~ ,", .':"~' c';.,'b;:: '-., ~.":  

T Y P I C A L  C O F F E R D A M  D E T A I L  

~ TO ~CT~D COV~L.ETE3.y N~gU'~I~ 
C ~ S ~ T m N  

K U~(D~ 

I ! 

PIPEUNE 

S E C T I O N  V I E W  
NOlr TO I I P ~  

C O F F E R D A M  P R O C E D U R E  
THE ~ V IM.  )E  CZ]NSTRUCTED ~ THE C~:TRtJCI2~  P IGHT-~ -VAY ~ HD~DqU]~LE 
IMTI~.N.So COHNQ~JN. ~ PRO~¢T$, I~P-RAP, ~ ~ DR JE~EY ~ £~I~DS)NG 
N ~ R C ~ T O - Y  HN-F" THE S'~'1~4 ] ~ 0  m ~, S E H Z ~  1HE C l ] : ' l q ~  S ~ U L ~  S ~ .  "I~GH~Y "~ 
"IH£ ~'l'Rr~mAH )l(~l ~ ~ VA~ F'RI31'I ID(TIE~ING ~ N~[~. ~ VILL I(2 USIEI) 'to I(][D ~ 

THE P~PI~ VI1.L ~ ~ $ T N . U ~  N ~  THE ~ S ' I ~ H I I ~  ~ ~ N ~  S T ~ Z Z E ~ ,  

)I()FI]~E THE ~ |S R£M[~VI[]0, STAJl;LIZ~TI~IN VZLL ar  VZTH EITHE)~ R]P-R.~P OR ~(~ETAI']gBN. 
~ C~:'FER]DAN %S THD~# S~-nJ* F'RON ~ ~ITIC ~ ~ I[XTE:N~S F'~ [k~OLO( ~ %NC~.~ 'FH[ 

CLE.NClP FBJ.OVS THE SAME PRQCE~UR£~ ~ PR£VHI~.y D(SCRI]I~D. 

F 
COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 24" PL-1 EXT 2 PIPEUNE 
COFFERDAM METHOD 

Dr~ir~ No. 4 OF 4 
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V 

APPENDIX 1-E 

TYPICAL WATERBODY CROSSING METHODS FOR THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPELINE 

V 
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CAD FILE NO. 04-24.2 \ D~FTING \ CREEKXINGMETHO0$ / C01851 

N O T E I I  

1. (~NCi~IL 'TI [  COA.TIED PIP r SECTION FOR S~RIGq&4 C ~ N O  IS t .OW~ItED INTO T R E N C H  
BY 81DE l O O M  ~ A N D / O l l l  C l t .k~ r l  A S  RI[QUIRI~D BY DEPTH,  
LENGTH A N D  S IZE OF  C I q O S ~ N G .  

2 .  P i P E  TO l i e  1"11~D INTO PIPKIJNE.  

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

, , , ,  

PROPOSED 24" TL-492 EXT 3 PIPEUNE 
PUMP-AROUND METHOD 

Ormlinq No. 
1 O F 4  
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qa 

I I I  

1 

I CAD FILE NO. 04-242 \ DRAF'I"ING \ CRE~XINGMETHODS / C01831 

N O T E S 

1.  P i P [  TO E [  I N S I " ~  IN T R E N C H  ~ 8IDa[DOOM "FRaI.C'TOtI~S A N D / O N  C R A N E S  
NJ[QUIRIE3) BY D~PTt4° LIE:NOT1< ,~MD S~ZI[ O F  CROSSJNG. 

2 .  P1PI[ TO BE TIED INTO PIPIEUNE.  

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
PROPOSED 24" TL-492 EXT 3 PIPELINE 

I FLUME CROSSING METHOD 

l o,~,~,g No. 2 OF 4 
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I CAD FILl[ NO. 0 4 - 2 4 2  \ DRAFTING \ CREEKXINGMETHODS / (:01831 

N 0 T I r  8 

1. ImORI"ABILI[ BRJDOE INSTAL.LE~D ACROSS IrF/~F.AM ON RIfVER. 

2. I-blMItt) ~ ~ ON F-..ACH BAJMK TO pIRIL~/I[NT S*l'lRr~;./tJ~4~ INTO TNENCH. 

3. PIP/[ FOR CROSSlNO ASSKMIILI[D AWAY FROM ~n'~IEAM. 

4. DITCH pLUO CONST1RUCTED BEHIND I.(ARD PtJ.K]I. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
PROPOSED 24" TL-492 EX]" 3 PIPEUNE 

WET TRENCH METHOD 

~ . o .  3 0 F 4  
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I CAD FILE NO. 0 4 - 2 4 2  \ ORAFnNG \ C R £ ' E K X l N G M ~  / CD1831 

, , ' . , . ' ~  ~.~ , , .  ~ . .  . . . .  ,,.; .. , ' ~ , . . ~  . 

' " -~-" TYPICAL COFFERDAM DETAIL 
pJRE'L~ , l ~  ' 

& NOT TO ~ . ~  

P ~  N n T E  
L ¢OFFEROAN T~ IE:XTEN~ CONM.ETELY ARDUNZI 

C O N ~ I O N  
P-. DTHIER IYPE OF Cg~r i :K '~  ¢ T R ~ $  FlAY 

P I P E U N E  

SECTION VIEW 
NOT IO ~AL£  

C O F F E R D A M  P R O C E D U R E  
~ ~ ~"  ~RSTIWC:TI~ ~ THE ~ I~GHT-I~'-VAY ~ I¢~N-I[~q~0~ILI[ 

I M ' I I ~ L S ,  ~ al3rlF'E:14~ P'Ra~CT$, I~P-RAP, .¢QCCB ~ DR ~ ~ DCLI~B4G 
~ T 1 E 1 Y  t~bl.lr TH[ SI~P~I ~ IN A S ~ I ~  THE ( ~ l r I R ~  ~HQUIJ S~:J~ TmHTLY TID 
THI[ STRr~  ~ TD N ~ £ ~  V A T ~  F1B~I ENTIDII~ TI~ ~ [ A .  IqJIf~ V ~ .  E U ~  TD K £ ~  
VATIER OUT ~F" THIE E 3 [ r ~ A V A ~  ALL ~ ]B~11JIQAIICE VZLL I ~ U R  IN THE JEllY II~¢[N~ THE 

AN~ ~rnZNE~NIT ]I~MIR~]~ AT TH~ V A ~  V~U. w" ]!N~MECTI~ TI~ Ir ~N r~rm ~ ~ 
DER~R[ THI£ ~DFrI~AN ~i: 11[~¢avI[]~ S'TA]tJLIZJ~T~]N V[LL 'mr Vlq'11 EZTHG~ R~P-RAP ~R V[G£TATZ~IN. 
THE C Q F F ~  Z~ THEN l¢~ruP FRaN THE ~ lANK ~lO EXTIE~ IrAR ENOU6H TO INCLU~ THE 
T/E-IN P ~  IN ~ D - C T R ~  THE I ~  DF" THE PIPE lr~ IN~TALLE]B A/~ THE TI£-IN ~ IS 

1 
COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

PROPOSED 2 4 "  T L - 4 9 2  EXT ,5 
COFFERDAM METHOD 

0mwlng No. 
4 0 F 4  

PIPELINE 
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APPENDIX 1-E 

TYPICAL WATERBODY CROSSING METHODS FOR THE TL-536 PIPELINE 

V 
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ql 

CAD FILE NO. 03-374 \ DRAFTING \ CREEKXtNGME-I]~DS / (:01831 

=OSED P I P E L I N E  

T IMBER 

U P S T R E A M  
SAN D BAG 

DOWNSTREAM 
S A N D B A G  DAM 

ql l  

SPOIL  
EROSION C O N T R O L  LEVEE 
(STRAW BALES STAKED 
OR SILT F E N C E )  

N O T E S  

1. CONCRETE COATiE~ PIF l i t  SECT1ON FOR ~TREAM CROSSlNQ IS LOWERED INTO TRENCH 
SIDE BOOM ~ O R S  ~MMD/OR CI¢4.NE~ AS REQUIR r ~  BY DI~prTH. 

LENGTH ~ 0  SIZE OF CROSSING. 

2. PIP/[ TO BE: TIED INTO PIPI~INF-- 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
PROPOSED 20" TL-536 PIPELINE 

PUMP-AROUND METHOD 
Dmw~ No. 
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CAD riLE NO. 03-374 \ 0RAFnNG \ CREEKXINGMETH00S / CD1831 

A 
B U L K H E A D  
S A N D B A G  DAM 

"A 
" ~  T I M B E R  MAT 

B R I D G E  

P I P E L I N E  

S P O I L  --J 
EROSION C O N T R O L  LEVEE 
(STRAW B A L E S  STAKED 
OR S ILT  F E N C E )  

N O T E S  

1. PIPE TO BE INSTALUED IN TRENCH WiTH SIDE;BOOM TRACTORS AND/OR CRANES 
AS R E Q U I R E D  EIY OI[~'I~'H, L£NOTH A N D  S IZE  OF" C R O S S I N O .  

2. PIPE ]'O B~ "lIED INTO PIPEUNE,. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
PROPOSED 20" TL-536 PIPEUNE 

FLUME CROSSING METHOD 

, , ~ . . ~ , ~ _ ~ ~ , ~ . .  p,a,lng No. 2 Of" 4. 
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"1 

CAD RLE NO. 03-374 \ DR.N='gNG \ CRF.EKXINGMETHOOS / CD1831 

PROPOSED 
. ~ PIPELINE 

PIPE ASSEMBLY 
FOR CROSSING 
STAGING AREA-- 
IF" REQUIRED 

N O T E S  

1. PORTABLE BRIDGI[ INST/d.J~[C ACROSS STtqf.AA4 OR RIVER, 

2.  HARD PLUG LEFT ON EACH BANK TO PREVENT STRF-.AMFLOW INTO T!mtL~NCH, 

3. PIPE ~ CROSSING ASS£'MBLKC AWAY FROM STRr, AM. 

4. DITCH PLUG C O N S " T R U C ~  BF..HtNC ~.e~R~D I ~ U O .  

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

I 0rowing 

PROPOSED 20" TL-536 PIPEUNE 
WET TRENCH METHOD 

A ~ . . ~ , e . . ~ ~ l , , ~ .  "°" ,3 OF' 4 
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CAD RLE NO. 0 3 - 3 7 4  \ DRAFT1NO \ CRE£KXlNC44Eff.lODS /CD 18,}I 

STEEL 

L / N ~  IRUC ~£D 

SPOIl. 

• ~ ; ,  .. '-.,.~,," 
2 .* i • ,:-~ TYPICAL COF'F£RDAM DETAIL 

P*tP£'LIN~ DITCH " 
& ~ Tn SCALE 

P/P£LIN~ N a T £ 

L CI3FTER~BN4 Tn EX1TcN1D CI3NP~ETELY AROUND 
CON~TI~JCTI(]N N~A. 

E~ O ~  TYPE a~- CO~'FERI)N~ STR~CTLI2E$ NAY 
BE U~ED, 

PIPEUNE 

SECTION VIEW 
NOT 10 ~.N.E 

C O F F E R D A M  P R O C E D U R E  
C:~¢TrRDAN ~ Jl[ ~TRtJCTED VZT~qN THE CDI4STIttJCTmI4 RII31T-OF-Vky FR~  N[]N-ER[]DI]DLE 

NATERIALS, ~ L  ~ PRO~CT$, RIP-RAP, ~ ~ OR ~ ]IAR~Z£RS ENCLDSING 
APPROXI)~TELY HALF" TH£ STREAN BED IN A S~NI-CIRCLL THI[ COFF'ERZ~N4 ~ SIEN. TIGHTLY TO 
~ SI'IRrc.N4 gE2IO TO ~ VA~ ~ ENTEIRIN6 ~ ,~E.,i~, PUIVPS V%LI.. I~  U~'E%I TO KEEP 

COFF'IDI~K THE PZPE VILL E %NSTALLED At~ TN£ gISTIJIRIIE~ AR£AS BAOKTZUJEg ~ D  S T ~ D ,  
MGI S~I%NENT ~ AT THE VAT~Lg~E: VZLL BE %NSP£CTE~ TO BE IN GOOD ',/ORKZNG ORDER 

TH£ C 1 ~ ' ~  IS R£P4OVE~ $T/~il IZATII~ ~ ~ VITH EITHER RIP-R/~ OR VEGETATIVe 
TNE ~ IS THEN SETUP FRON THE OPPOSITE ]k~NK &ND EXTENI~ FAR ENDUG4 TO ~ICLtJ1E TI4E 
TIE-IN PI31NT IN N I D - ~  THE K'I~N~N~ER OF TNE pI~E IS INST~.I.J~ ~ TN[ TIlE-IN VI~I.D IS 

CLEN4UP ~ ' ~  TNE SANE Pli~DC~W~ ~ ~ y  DE:$CIR[ICD. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
PROPOSED 20"  TL -536  PIPEUNE 

COFFERDAM METHOD 

.o. 4 o r  4 
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APPENDIX 1-E 

TYPICAL WATERBODY CROSSING METHODS FOR THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPELINE 

v 
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I CAD FIE NO. 03-375 \ DRAFTING \ CREEKXlNGMETHOOS / CD1855 

ql 

N O T £ S  

I .  CONCRLPI'~ COATED PIPI[ SE;(~rlON FOR ~I'ltlEAM CROWING IS LOV/I[RED INTO "f~RENCH 
BY SlOE DOOM ~ 0 1 1 ~ $  ~4qO/OR C I ~ E S  AS RI[OUIIqI[:D ElY DEPTH. 

A N D  SIZE: OF" CROSSING. 

2. PIPI[ TO Ell[ "Ttl~O INTO P I P E L I N E .  

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
PROPOSED 2 4 "  T L - 4 5 3  EXT 1 PIPELINE 

PUMP-AROUND METHOD 
[)~-owing No. 

1 01: '4  
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I CAD RLE NO. 03-375 \ DRAFTING \ CREEKXINOMETH00S / CD1855 

N O T E S  

I .  PIP Ir TO BE; INSTALLL=~) IN TRENCH ~ SlOl[BO~k~ TRACTORS A~ID/OR CRANES 
REQUIRf[O B'Y DEPTH, LF.,NOTN AN[;) SIZE OF- CROSSINO. 

2.  PiPE 1"O BE TIeD INTO PIPELINE. 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
PROPOSED 24" TL-453 EXT 1 PIPELINE 

FLUME CROSSING METHOD 
Drowlng No. 

2 0 F 4  
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I 

N O T E S  

1. PORTAIM.J[ BIIUDOE INSTAl .LED A C R O S S  STREAM OR NJVI[R. 

2 .  HARD PLUG LEFT O N  EACH B A N K  TO P R ~  I l iTREAMFI.OW INTO T R E N C H .  

3 .  P i P E  F'OR C ~ S I ~  ~ t~S I [MBLJ~)  A W A ~  F R O M  urr !qF. .~ .  

4 .  DITCH P L U G  GON~I~tUC'TI~D B E H I N D  ~ O  PLUG.  

T 
COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 

I PROPOSED 24" TL-453 EXT 1 PIPEUNE 
WET TRENCH METHOD 

o , ~  No. 3 OF 4 
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CAD FILE NO. 03-375 \ ORAF'nNG \ CREEKXlNGMETHODS /CD 1855 

. . . . .  • ,~,:." TYPICAL COFFERDAM DETAIL 
PIPEL.rI~ DITCH " 

8 NOT TO SCALE 

P]PL~L~ N o T E 

L COFF'~]BAN TO [XTi[ND COMPLL-'r[LY kRDUNO 
CONSTRUCTION AREA. 

2, ~ TYPE or COFFERDAM STRUCTURES MAY 

I, I 
PIPEUNE 

SECTION VIEW 
NOTTO 

C O F F E R D A M  P R O C E D U R E  
THE C ~  WTL,L lIE C~TR'UCTI[D ~ THE CIONSTRUCTI~ RIGHT-OF-W&Y FROM I ~ U l L  t" 
M A T I N S ,  C 1 ~ I A L  COFFERDAM I ~ T $ ,  RIP-RAP, SAND ~ OR JI[RSEY I k q R R l ~  EIqCLO~ING 
APPRDX]~ATE~Y HALF" THE $ ~  ~ IN A S~MI-CZR~ THI£ CIJ'F'E3RDAN sHaLLD ~ TIGHTLy TO 
~ $1'R~r-44q ~E]EI ~ ~ VA~ ~ ~ TNE AI~EA. PUMP~ WILL BE USeD TO KEE~P 
VATI[R OUT OF" 114[ ID(CAVMTlI3NS. ALL EARTH ~ $ ~  WILL ~ %N THE DRY ~ 
COF'r£RDM4. 114[ PIPE WILl. IIC INSTALLE~ AND 114[ MSTURIlt~ AR£AS llACIG'IUJ~ AND STAJILIZ£D, 

~PCElldl" ~ AT TH[ WATI[I~-ZNE ~ ]C ~CI'[]) TO K ~ ~ WORKING QqD[R 

TI~ ~ IS THEN ~ F'RDN THE DI~I~ITE ]lANK AND £XTI[N~: FAR Q4OU~ TO INCLUDE THE 
TIl[-m I ~ T  IN MID--STR~ ~ ~ OF THE PIPE 1S I N S T A ~  A/~ THI£ TIE-IN WELD IS 
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RESOURCE REPORT 2 - WATER USE AND QUALITY 

2.0 INTRODUCTION 

This report describes the current baseline conditions of surface and groundwater 
resources in the PL-1 EXT2, TL-492 EXT3, TL-536, and TL-453 EXT1 pipeline areas. 
Existing water use and water quality is assessed, protected and/or sensitive watersheds 
and waterbodies are identified, and adjacent well locations are identified. Potential 
impacts from pipeline construction and operation are described and protective/mitigation 
measures are provided to minimize impacts to the environment. Refer to Resource 
Report 1 for permitting requirements. 

Section 2.1 presents the existing groundwater resources, existing public and private 
wells, methods for minimizing groundwater impacts, and potential contamination sites, 
based on data obtained from the USGS, PaDEP, and United States Environmental 
Protection Agency (USEPA), as well as information provided by individual property 
owners. 

Section 2.2 presents waterbodies crossed by the pipeline, as determined from field 
surveys conducted between May 2004 and July 2000 for PL-1 EXT2, and between 
August2004 and October2004 for TL-492EXT3, TL-536, and TL-453 EXT1. 
Evaluation includes MP location, waterbody width and type, state water quality 
classification and fishery type. Proposed crossing methods are discussed and 
mitigation/restoration plans provided. Contaminated stream sediments, protected public 
watershed areas, and sensitive surface waters are identified along the pipeline route 
from rogulato~/database seamhes and state/county staff interviews. 

Section 2.3 presents wetlands crossed by the pipeline, as determined from field 
delineations conducted between May 2004 and July 2004 for PL-1 EXT2, and between 
August 2004 and October 2000 for TL-492 EXT3, TL-536, and TL-453 EXTt. 

2.1 GROUNDWATER RESOURCES 

Identify all U.S. Environmental Protection Agency (EPA)- or stata-deaignatad 
aquifers crossed. (380.12(eX2)). 

2.1.1 Groundwater Resources of the Project Area 

2.1.1.1 PL-1 EXT2 

The principal water-yielding geologic units for this project are the carbonates and 
sandstones of the Silurian-aged Miffllntown Formation, the Devonian-aged Onondaga 
Formation, the Mlssisslpplan-aged Pocono Group, and the Pennsylvanian-aged 
Pottsville Group. The reported typical yields of the wells completed range from 20 to 
120 gallons per minute for the Mifflintown through the Onondaga Formations; 30 to 
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300 gallons per minute for the Pocono Group; and 50 to 100 gallons per minute for the 
Pottsville Group. 

All of Section 1 and Section 2, from $1MP0.0 to $2MP25.1, of the pipeline lie within the 
Ridge and Valley Physiographic Region, while Section 2, from $2MP25.1 to $2MP28.6, 
and Section 3 lie within the Appalachian Plateau Physiographic Province. Aquifers of 
the Ridge and Valley Province consist of permeable rocks within folded and faulted 
sedimentary formations. The principal aquifers are carbonate rocks that are located in 
the valleys. The water-yielding characteristic of the carbonate rocks depends on the 
degree of fracturing and the development of cavities. Sandstone formations also yield 
large quantities in areas of high fracturing. Limestones in this region are predominately 
of late-Silurian and early Devonian-age, whereas the sandstones are predominately of 
Ordovician-age and Devonian-age. The drainage pattems directly reflect the aitemating 
resistant and easily eroded rocks of the folded strata in this region. Most major streams 
and tributaries form trellis drainage patterns, which are expressed by the patterns of 
resistant and weak recks. 

Most of the Appalachian Plateau aquifers are Permian-aged and Pennsylvanian-aged 
rocks. Rocks capable of producing usable quantities of water are present along the 
pipeline route and typically consist of local recharge and discharge systems. The water 
table in this region generally follows topography. The depth to groundwater can be as 
great as several hundred feet along ridge tops and can be very near ground surface 
along stream and river banks. Confining units overlying aquifers can result in artesian 
wells in low-lying areas. 

Aquifer recharge occurs in most areas with the greatest recharge occurring in flat-lying 
areas where well-developed soils or deposits of sediment are present and water 
residence time at the surface is great enough to allow percolation. Most precipitation 
that falls on hill slopes is quickly shed to streams and rivers via runoff. The groundwater 
flow path is often affected by secondary flow controls such as fracture, joint and bedding 
planes (USGS, 1997). 

There are no USEPA-deslgnated Sole Source aquifers in the project area. 

2.1.1.2 TL-492 F_X'l'3 

The Appalachian Plateaus Physiographic Province extends over most of WV, more than 
one-half of PA, and small parts of westernmost VA and MD. 

Aquifere in consolidated sedimentary rocks in the Appalachian Plateaus Prevince are 
dMded into the following categories: Misstsslppian aquifers and Permian and 
Pannsyivanian aquifers. Most of the water-yielding rocks are sandstones, but 
carbonate rocks of Mississippian-age locally yield water in parts of VA and WV. Coal 
beds and seams yield water because they commonly are fractured along joint systems 
(cleat) that store and transmit water. 
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The consolidated rocks of the Appalachian Plateaus Province are almost fiat-lying to 
gently folded; the regional dip of the beds rarely exceeds 25 feet per mile. Elongated, 
gentle folds form alternating anticlines and synclines in PA and WV. These gentle 
warps are surface expressions of small displacements along deep-seated faults in many 
cases. Deformation of strata in the Appalachian Plateaus is extremely subtle compared 
to the folding in the Valley and Ridge Province. 

V 

In southwestem PA, the consolidated rocks nearest the surface are mostly 
Pannsylvanian in age. Pennsytvanlan rocks are the principal coal-bearing formations 
and consist of cyclic sequences of sandstone, shale, conglomerate, clay, coal, and 
minor limestone. The sandstones are the most productive aquifers, although coal beds 
and limestones also yield water;, the limestones, however, are thin compared to those of 
the Valley and Ridge Province. Rocks of Permian-aga cover most of Greene and 
Washington Counties in the southwestern comer of the state. Permian rocks are similar 
in lithoiogy and water-yielding characteristics to the Pennsylvanian rocks, but were not 
deposited in cycles; they contain only thin coal beds and consist of more shale and less 
sandstone and conglomerate than the Pennsytvanian strata. Mississippian rocks 
consist mostly of shale, sandstone, and siltstone with minor conglomerate and 
limestone and are exposed north and east of the Pennsylvanian rocks where the beds 
of Pennsylvanian-age have been removed by erosion. The principal water-yielding 
geologic units are sandstones of the Permian and Pannsylvanian Dunkard Group 
through the Mississippian and Devonian Pocono Formation. Reported typical yields of 
wells completed in all these units range from 30 to 300 gallons per minute, but some 
wells yield as much as 600 gallons per minute. 

V 

Bedrock aquifers in the unglaciated part of the Appalachian Plateaus Province accept 
less recharge than those in the Valley and Ridge Province. This is because the 
unglaciated part of the Appalachian Plateaus is highly dissected; much of the area is 
sloping, and the slopes are covered with only thin accumulations of regolith. 
Accordingly, most of the precipitation that falls on the area runs rapidly off the slopes. 
However, a small part of the precipitation infiltrates the Earth's surface and moves 
downward through the unsaturated zone to infiltrate weathered bedrock and shallow 
fractures in unweathered bedrock. The general movement of the water is from areas of 
high head, usually at high altitude, toward areas of low head, usually in low-lying areas. 
The water generally moves vertically downward In areas of recharge, then horizontally 
in the aquifers, and finally upward in discharge areas as it follows paths of least 
resistance. The movement of the water is step-like because it moves vertically through 
fractures, then horizontally through sandstone or coal beds, and vertically again when it 
encounters other fractures. The water will follow permeable beds or a zone of fractures 
laterally for considerable distances. Saline water or bdne is near the surface in much of 
the area because circulation of fresh ground water generally extends no more than a 
few hundred feet below the land surface. Most of the ground water moves through local 
or intermediate-scale flow systems; no regional flow occurs. Water moves down 
tributary valleys toward major rivers, partly as surface water through gaining streams 
and partly as ground water in alluvial or bedrock aquifers. Saline water or brine at 
shallow depths is virtually stagnant. 
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Springs commonly mark the intersection of the water table with a valley wall. 
Low-permeability rocks (such as shale or siltstone) or ironstone layers retard the vertical 
movement of water. The water moves laterally in permeable strata atop the 
low-permeability rocks until it discharges as spring flow. Most of the water that 
discharges from springs, and much that discharges to surface streams, is in the aquifers 
under unconfined conditions. 

Water that leaks downward across shale or other low-permeability confining units is 
present under confined conditions. Water in wells that penetrate an artesian aquifer 
rises above the top of the aquifer and can flow at the land surface. Confined conditions 
frequently occur in the troughs of the gently warped synclines that characterize parts of 
the Appalachian Plateaus. 

Fresh ground water generally circulates only to shallow depths in the Appalachian 
Plateaus Province. tn much of the area, saline water or brine is not far below the land 
surface with only a thin transition zone between the freshwater and saltwater. 

Underground mining of coal disturbs the natural ground-water flow system when the 
mines are active because artificial drains are constructed to dispose of unwanted water, 
and mining activities can create new fractures, and thus, increase permeability. The 
regional water table can be lowered when the drains are effective, and ground-water 
flow directions can be changed in some cases until flow moves across former 
ground-water divides into adjoining basins. Ground water tends to flow toward mines, 
which are usually dewatered by pumping. Adverse effects of mine drainage on well 
yields are greatest where the mines are not much deeper than the bottoms of the wells 
and where vertical fractures connect the aquifers and the mines. Abandoned mines can 
collapse, which causes fracturing of the rocks that ovedie the mine, and might be 
accompanied by an appreciable depression on the land surface. These conditions are 
likely to enhance recharge to the ground-water system and to reduce surface runoff and 
evapotranspiration. 

Although bedrock formations in the Appalachian Plateaus Province can be traced over 
many miles, the distribution of local aquifers within these formations depends, in most 
cases, on the distribution of fracture permeability. Erosion is one factor that controls the 
distribution of fractures. Local aquifers, in some cases, are in valleys. Near-vertical 
tensile fractures and horizontal fractures are associated with slumping that takes place 
along valley walls, and recharge tends to be concentrated by the fractures. Under the 
valley floors, the most significant fractures are parallel to bedding, or nearly horizontal. 
Relief of comprassional stress results when the weight of the rock that ovedles a valley 
is reduced, because part of the rock is removed by erosion. This causes the remaining 
rock to separate along bedding planes and also results in the formation of vertical 
fractures. Fractures that underlie the valley are interconnected with those along the 
valley walls, and the interconnected fracture set enhances the permeabil~ of the rock. 
Away from the valley wa~le, fractures are scarce and less likely to be interconnected; 
accordingly, wells in these areas will tend to have lower yields than those in the valleys. 
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Furthermore, water in the shallow fractures on hilltops tends to drain in dry seasons, 
and yields of some wells might accordingly decline. In general, well yields are directly 
proportional to the number of interconnected fractures. 

Total freshwater withdrawals from consolidated sedimentary-rock aquifers in the 
Appalachian Plateaus and the Central Lowland Provinces were estimated to be 
282 million gallons per day during 1985. Approximately 47 percent of this amount, or 
about 133 million gallons per day, was withdrawn for domestic and commercial 
supplies. Approximately 116 million gallons per day, or about 41 percent of the total 
withdrawals, was pumped for industrial, mining, and thermoelectric power purposes. 
Most of this water was used in coal mining operations. 

There are no USEPA-designated sole source aquifers in the project area. 

2.1.1.3 TL-536 and TL-453 EXT1 

The TL-536 and TL-453 EXT1 pipelines are both located in Potter County, PA. The 
principal water yielding geologic units for this project are sandstones of the Devonian 
Formation. The reported typical yields of the wells completed range from 30 to 
300 gallons per minute, but some yield as much as 600 gallons per minute. 

Most of the productive aquifers consist of sandstone or conglomerate. Devonian 
siltstone, shale, and thin-bedded sandstone locally yield sufficient water for domestic 
and commercial supplies but are not considered to be pdncipal aquifers. 

The pipeline lies within the Appalachian Plateau Physiographic Providence. The 
consolidated rocks of the Appalachian Plateau Providence are almost fiat-lying to gently 
folded; the regional dip of the beds rarely exceeds five feet per mile. Elongated, gentle 
folds form altemating anticlines and synclines in PA. Deformation of strata in the 
Appalachian Plateaus is extremely subtle. 

Bedrock aquifers in the unglaclated part of the Appalachian Plateaus Providence accept 
less recharge than those in the Valley and Ridge Providences. This is because the 
unglaciated part of the Appalachian Plateaus is highly dissected, much of the area is 
sloping, and the slopes are covered with only thin accumulations of regolith. 
Accordingly, most of the precipitation infiltrates the Earth's surface and moves 
downward through the unsaturated zone to infiltrate weathered bedrock and shallow 
fractures in unweathered bedrock. The general movement of the water is from areas of 
high head, usually at high altitude, toward low areas of recharge, then horizontally in the 
aquifers, and finally upward in discharge areas as it follows the path of least resistance. 
The movement of water is step-like because it moves vertically through fractures, then 
horizontally through sandstone or coal beds, and vertically again when it encounters 
other fractures. The water will follow permeable beds or a zone of facturas laterally for 
considerable distances. Saline water or brine is near the surface in much of the area 
because circulation of fresh groundwater moves through local or intermediate-soale flow 
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systems; no regional flow occurs. The fractures also decrease in number with depth, 
and the circulation of water likewise decreases with depth. 

Total freshwater withdrawals from consolidated sedimentary-rock aquifers in the 
Appalachian Plateaus were estimated to be about 282 million gallons per day during 
1985. About 47 percent of this amount, or about 133 million gallons per day, was 
withdrawn for domestic and commercial supplies. About 116 million gallons per day, or 
about 41 percent of the total withdraws, was pumped for industrial, mining, and 
thermoelectric power purposes; most of this water was used in coal mining operations. 

There are no USEPA-designated Sole Source Aquifers within the project areas. 

2.1.2 Public and Private Water Supply Wells 

2.1.2.1 PL-1EXT2 

The PaDEP was contacted to identify public supply wells and springs crossed by the 
PL-t EXT2 pipeline. Private water supply wells were identified during the survey, noted 
on the Construction Alignment Sheets, and by using the ROW agent permission to 
conduct survey form. 

v 

According to the PaDEP data (Appendix 2-A), 23 public water supply wells and one 
spring exist within a one-mile radius of any area disturbed by construction. Four private 
water supply wells exist within a 150-foot radius of any area disturbed by construction. 
Table2.1.2-1 summarizes all public and private wells. No wellhead or similarly 
protected areas were identified during a file review with the PaDEP in February 2005. 

2.1.2.2 TL-492 EXT3 

The PaDEP and WVDEP were contacted to identify public supply wells and springs 
crossed by the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline. Private water supply wells were identified during 
the survey, noted on the Construction Alignment Sheets, and by using the ROW agent 
permission to conduct survey form. 

According to the PaDEP data (Appendix 2-A), no public water supply wells exist within a 
one-mile radius of any area disturbed by construction. No private water supply wells 
exist within a 150-foot radius of any area disturbed by construction. No springs were 
identified during field work or by the PaDEP. Two water wells were identified during 
field investigations within the environmental study areas. Table 2.1.2-2 summarizes all 
public and private wells. According to the WVDEP, no municipal water authorities are 
located within a one-mile radius of any area disturbed by construction; however, 
three groundwater facilities are located within three miles downstream. No spdngs were 
identified during field work or by the WVDEP. No wellhead or similarly protected areas 
were identified through correspondence with the WVDEP (Appendix 2-A). 

V 
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2.1.2.3 TL-536 

The PaDEP was contacted to identify public supply wells and springs crossed by the 
TL-536 pipeline. Private water supply wells were identified during the survey, noted on 
the Construction Alignment Sheets, and by using the ROW agent permission to conduct 
survey form. 

According to the PaDEP data (Appendix2-A), no public water supply wells and 
no spdngs exist within a one-mile radius of any area disturbed by construction. Two 
private water supply wells exist within a 150-foot radius of any area disturbed by 
construction. Table 2.1.2-3 summarizes all public and private wells. 

Wellhead protection areas are designed to protect and prevent contamination of 
wellheads and well fields used by the public water supplies so that contaminants do not 
reach a level that adversely affects the health of the consumers. The PaDEP promotes 
the establishment and delineation of a wellhead protection area to protect public water 
supplies from contamination. There are no established wellhead protection areas 
crossed by the pipeline. 

2.1.2.4 TL-453 EXT1 

The PaDEP was contacted to identify public supply wells and springs crossed by the 
TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. Private water supply wells were identified during the survey, 
noted on the Construction Alignment Sheets, and by using the ROW agent permission 
to conduct survey form. 

According to the PaDEP data (Appendix2-A), no public water supply wells and 
no springs exist within a one-mile radius of any area disturbed by construction. 
No private water supply wells exist within a 150-foot radius of any area disturbed by 
construction. 

Wellhead protection areas will not be affected by the pipeline since there are no known 
public or private water supply wells within the project vicinity. 

2.1.3 Contaminated Sites 

The presence of sites of known or suspected contamination occurring in any area 
disturbed by the pipeline construction was determined by querying the Federal and 
State databases for contamination sites that cover the counties crossed by the PL-1 
EXT2 pipeline. There are three sites on the Comprehensive Environmental Response, 
Compensation, and Liability Index System (CERCLIS) located five miles outside 
construction areas for PL-1 EXT2. Refer to Table 2.1.3-1 for distances. Standard 
procedure includes using a rock bucket on a backhoe, then a hydraulic hammer will be 
utilized before blasting Is used. Shallow blasting is undertaken with only low charge 
explosives to break rock for excavation. No impacts are anticipated due to blasting 
because all of the CERCLIS sites are five or more miles from the construction area. 
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Because shallow blasting will be undertaken only with a low charge explosive, impacts 
to a distance of five miles from the construction will not occur. 

There are no sites on CERCLIS within five miles of construction for the TL-492 EXT3 
pipeline, the TL-536 pipeline, or the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline. 

2.1.4 Groundwater Impacts and Mitigation 

Construction of the pipeline will generally require a trench of eight feet or less in depth 
to be excavated. No adverse impacts to the groundwater or water wells are anticipated 
as a result of the excavation for the pipeline trench. Water collected in trench 
excavations will be removed as necessary during construction activities. Water will be 
discharged as outlined in the project Erosion and Sedimentation Control Plan (E&SCP) 
to be completed at a later date. 

In some areas, blasting may be utilized to excavate the trench. No known or suspected 
areas of groundwater contamination have been identified in the project area. Therefore, 
no special construction measures or mitigation are proposed. 

Blasting, where necessary for excavation of the pipeline trench, may open up additional 
near-surface bedrock fractures and locally increase recharge to the immediately 
underlying aquifer. The charge used during blasting will be just large enough to break 
rock for the excavation. Deep fractures and shallow fractures generally are not 
inter-connected and any change in the shallow aquifer as a result of pipeline 
construction activities is not likely to affect deeper aquifers. The impact to streams, 
wells and springs are dependant on a variety of factors and can include no effect, an 
increase or decrease in productivity and a decline in water quality. Because the 
pipeline area is small compared to the extent of the recharge and discharge systems 
and the blasting is undertaken with low charge explosives, any effects are likely to be 
small. A general discussion of blasting and blasting locations is discussed further in 
Resource Report 6, Section 6.4. 

Water quality and yield of wells end springs used along the pipeline will be tested prior 
to and after installation of the pipeline to identify any negative impacts. Wells installed 
following current water supply well regulations are not expected to be affected by 
pipeline construction activities. Wells that do not meet current standards and wells that 
have other defects have a higher potential to be impacted. Prior to construction, DTI 
will file with the Commission's Secretary the location by MP of all wells within 150 feet of 
the pipeline construction activities. With the well owner's permission, DTI will conduct 
well yield and water quality testing for these wells. Regulatory officials will be contacted 
to determine what parameters will be required for analyses of the well water. The 
parameter list will vary based on the use of the well water. Within 30 days of placing the 
facilities in service, DTI will file a report with the Commission's Secretary discussing 
whether any complaints were received concerning well yield or water quality and how 
each was resolved. In addition, DTI shall replace any potable water supply system that 
it damages dudng construction and cannot repair to Its former capacity and quality. DTI 
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will identify in its report to the Commission's Secretary all potable water supply systems 
damaged by construction and how they were repaired. 

DTI's Spill Prevention, Containment and Control (SPCC) Plan will be included in the 
plans for all construction items and is provided in Appendix 2-B. If it is not feasible to 
comply with these requirements, DTI will file with the Commission's Secretary, a list of 
the site-specific locations where it is not feasible and provide a justification of why it is 
not feasible for review and written approval of the Director of the Office of Energy 
Projects (OEP) prior to construction. The Commission's Plan and Procedures 
(Appendices 1-A and l-B) and the SPCC Plan (Appendix 2-B) will be followed to protect 
the potable water sources discussed in this report. 

2.2 SURFACE WATER RESOURCES 

Identify aft perennial surface waterbodies crossed by the proposed project and 
their water quality classification. (380.12(dX1)). 

Surface waterbodies crossed by the pipelines were identified using field surveys, aerial 
photographs, and USGS topographic maps. Waterbody crossing widths were obtained 
during the field surveys. Additional information on fishery resources is discussed in 
Resource Report 3. 

V 

Different stream crossing techniques will be utilized depending on the type of waterbody 
traversed and are discussed in Section 2.2.7. The Commission's Plan and Procedures 
will be followed and is found in Appendices 1 -A and 1 -B. 

2.2.1 Existing Surface Water Resources 

2.2.1.1 PL-1 EXT2 Pipeline and Access Roads 

The proposed PL-1 EXT2 pipeline will cross waterbodies located in the 
Kettle-McEIhattan Creek, Bald Eagle Creek, Crooked-Standing Stone Creek, 
Penns-Middle Creek, Kishacoquillas-Jacks Creek, and Tuscarora-Buffalo Creek 
watersheds. The waterbodies crossed by the proposed pipeline are summarized in 
Table2.2.1-1. This table also includes spdngs and ponds identified during field 
reconnaissance. The waterbodies crossed by access roads for the proposed pipeline 
facilities are summarized in Table 2.2.1-1. Refer to Appendix 2-C for access road 
mapping. 

2.2.1.2 TL-492 EXT3 Pipeline and Accsss Roade 

v 

The proposed TL-492 EXT3 pipeline will cross waterbodies located In the PA Fork of 
Dunkard Creek, Garrison Fork of Dunkard Creek, Cappo Run, Hamilton Run, Bloody 
Run, Roberts Run, Blockhouse Run, Taylor Run, Hoover Run, TustJn Run, Toms Run, 
Upper WV Fork of Fish Creek, and the PA Fork of Fish Creek watersheds. The 
waterbodies crossed by the proposed pipeline are summarized in Table 2.2.1-2. This 
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table also includes springs and ponds identified during field reconnaissance. The 
waterbodies crossed by access roads for the proposed pipeline facilities are 
summarized in Table 2.2.1-2. Refer to Appendix 2-C for access road mapping. A 
legend has been developed for Appendix 2-C. 

2.2.1.3 TL-536 Pipeline and Access Roads 

The proposed TL-536 pipeline will cross waterbodies located in the Genesee River, 
Orebed Creak, Redwater Creek, Honeoye Creek, Plank Creek, and Butter Creek 
watersheds. The waterbodies crossed by the proposed pipeline are summarized in 
Table2.2.1-3. This table also includes springs and ponds identified during field 
reconnaissance. The waterbodies crossed by access roads for the proposed pipeline 
facilities are summarized in Table 2.2.1-3. Refer to Appendix 2-C for access road 
mapping. A legend has been developed for Appendix 2-C. 

2.2.1.4 TL-453 EXT1 Pipeline and Access Roads 

V 

The proposed TL-453 EXT1 pipeline will cross waterbodies located in the West Branch 
Genesee River, Middle Branch Geneses River, Geneses River, Marsh Creek, Turner 
Creek, North Branch Cowanesque River, and Ludington Run watersheds. The 
waterbodies crossed by the proposed pipeline are summarized in Table 2.2.1-4. This 
table also includes springs and ponds identified during field reconnaissance. The 
waterbodies crossed by access roads for the proposed pipeline facilities are 
summarized in Table 2.2.1-4. Refer to the Construction Alignment Sheets for access 
road mapping. 

2.2.2 Contaminated Sediments 

Identify all waterbody crossings that may have contaminated waters or 
sed/menW. (38o.12(dX1)). 

Locations of contamination were researched with the National Sediment Inventory (NSI) 
data sites closest to the pipeline crossings (USEPA, 1998) for PL-1 EXT2, TL-492 
EXT3, TL-536, and TL-453 EXT1. According to the data, no known sources of 
sediment contamination were identified within 150feet of any area disturbed by 
construction. If any contaminated sediments should be identified, the Commission's 
Plan and Procedures (Appendices 1-A and l-B) will be followed to ensure minimal 
impacts to waterbodies with contaminated sediments. DTI will follow all federal, state, 
and Commission guidelines when working in and around all waters, including the 
303(d)-Iisted waters. Following these guidelines will result in minimal impacts. Crossings 
will be conducted at times of low flow with stream by-pass systems in-place, which are 
designed to minimize impacts to the stream channel by re-routing stream flow around 
the work area; therefore, keeping the disturbance confined within the work area via 
barriers. All excavated matedal attributed to the pipeline installation process will be 
replaced within the pipeline trench, and subsequently stabilized with a permanent seed 
mix, soil supplements, end mulch. For water body crossings, the excavated matedal will 
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be replaced within the pipeline trench and be stabilized in accordance with the 
Commission procedures and federal and state permit requirements. 

2.2.3 Public Watershed Areas 

Identify municipal water supplies, watershed areas, designated surface water 
protection areas, and sensitive waterbodles crossed by the project. 
(380.12(dX1)). 

2.2.3.1 PL-1EXT2 

Watershed areas were determined from USEPA (2004) and PaDEP (2004) data. 
Based on this data, the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline is located within six watershed areas: 
Penns-Middle Creek, Kettle-McEIhattan Creek, Bald Eagle Creek, Crooked-Standing 
Stone Creek, Kishacoqulllas-Jacks Creek, and Tuscarora-Buffalo Creek. Of the 
16municipalities crossed by the proposed pipeline, eight have municipal water 
authorities. They are located in the Bald Eagle Creek, Kishacoquillas-Jacks Creek, and 
Penns-Middle Creek watersheds. Three of the eight municipal water authorities have 
public water supply wells within a one-mile radius of any area disturbed by construction 
(Table 2.1.2-1). 

V 

Degraded waters were also identified using Section 303(d) of the Clean Water Act. This 
list identified five waterbodies crossed by the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline as being impaired by 
abandoned mine drainage (AMD) and pesticides. These waterbodies are Bald Eagle 
Creek, Beech Creek, Twomile Run, Kettle Creek, and West Branch Susquehanna 
River. The impacted waterbodies are summarized in Table 2.2.3-1. 

Water quality impairment in Bald Eagle Creek includes pesticides and fish consumption 
advisories due to the pesticide Mirex or polychlorinated biphenyls (PCBs) in the Spring 
Creek Watershed. The pesticides Kepone and Mirex, which were produced at a 
chemical plant near Spring Creek, contaminated the ground water due to inadequate 
treatment facilities. The contaminants entered the groundwater to Spring Creek and 
tributaries then into sediments. Spdng Creek then flows into Bald Eagle Creek. The 
chemical plant along Spring Creek is now an EPA Superfund Site listed under 
CERCLIS. A PaDEP Watershed Restoration Action Strategy 0NRAS) has been 
developed for the Bald Eagle Creek Watershed. DTI proposes to HDD Bald Eagle 
Creek, and therefore, no impacts are expected to result from the stream crossing. 

According to the PaDEP, five surface water users and one public surface water user are 
within three miles downstream of the proposed pipeline. A landowner has notified DTI 
that a reservoir located east of the proposed pipeline is their pdvate water supply 
source. Table 2.2.3-2 summarizes the surface water users. DTI will notify downstream 
water supply intake owners one week prior to instreem construction. 

The Bald Eagle Creek watershed is on the WRAS due to water quality impairments that 
affect, or could affect, the three natural/recreation areas, 14ClassA trout waters, 
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11 high quality streams, and 11 exceptional value (EV) streams within its boundary. 
Several categories of 303(d) list impairments are listed as follows: 

• metals and low pH from AMD in Beech Creek watershed; 

• siltation from agriculture in Fishing Creek watershed; 

• industrial discharges: 

pesticides in Bald Eagle Creek; 

fish consumption advisories due to PCBs in Spdng Creek watershed; 

pesticides degrading groundwater and springs that feed Slab Cabin Run; 
and 

pesticides degrading two famous Class A trout streams, Logan Branch 
and Spring Creek. 

Pipeline construction and operation are not expected to impact potable surface water 
supplies because of DTI's adherence to the Commission's Plan and Procedures 
(Appendices 1-A and l-B). 

2.2.3.2 TL-492 EXT3 

Watershed areas were determined from USEPA (2004), NRCS (2004), and PaDEP 
(2004) data. Based on this data, the TL-492 EXT3 pipeline is located within 12 PA 
watershed areas (PA Fork of Dunkard Creek, Garrison Fork of Dunkard Creek, Cappo 
Run, Hamilton Run, Bloody Run, Roberts Run, Blockhouse Run, Taylor Run, Hoover 
Run, Tustin Run, Toms Run, and the PA Fork of Fish Creek), and one WV watershed 
area (Upper WV Fork of Fish Creek). Of the five municipalities crossed by the proposed 
pipeline, none have municipal water authorities. 

According to the PaDEP, no surface water users and no public surface water users are 
within three miles downstream of the proposed pipeline. Additionally, the WVDEP 
did not indicate that there were any known surface water users or public surface water 
users (Appendix 2-A). 

The PaDEP WRAS has listed the Upper Monongahela River watershed, Subbasin 19G, 
which includes Dunkard Creek, as being degraded. WRAS are developed in 
cooperation with federal, state, and local agencies, watershed-based organizations, and 
the public for those watersheds most in need of restoration. 

The Dunkard Creek watershed is on the WRAS due to water quality impairments. 
According to the WRAS State Water Plan 19G, the subbasin is part of HUC 
Area 5020005, Lower Monongahela River, which is a Category I, FY99/2000 priority 
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watershed under the Unified Watershed Assessment developed by the PaDEP in 1998. 
Several categories of 303(d) list impairments are listed as follows: 

• 10 NPDES source discharges, all from sewage treatment plants; 

• AMD; and 

• erosion and sedimentation. 

A Rivers Conservation Plan has been completed for Dunkard Creek, which outlines five 
categories of management options for the watershed. 

Degraded waters were also identified using Section 303(d) of the Clean Water Act. The 
impacted waterbodies are summarized in Table 2.2.3-3. 

Pipeline construction and operation are not expected to impact potable surface water 
supplies because of DTrs adherence to the Commission's Plan and Procedures 
(Appendices 1-A and l-B). 

2.2.3.3 TL-536 

Watershed areas were determined from USEPA (2004) and PaDEP (2004) data. 
Based on this data, the project area falls within the upper Allegheny Watershed. Within 
the Upper Allegheny Watershed, the TL-536 pipeline is located within six sub-watershed 
areas: Genesee River, Orebed Creek, Redwater Creek, Honeoye Creek, Plank Creek, 
and Butter Creek. 

According to the PaDEP, no private surface water users and no public surface water 
intakes are within three miles downstream of the proposed pipeline. 

Additionally, none of the watersheds crossed by the TL-536 pipeline are listed under the 
PaDEP's WRAS. 

Pipeline construction and operation are not expected to impact potable surface water 
supplies because of DTrs adherence to the Commission's Plan and Procedures 
(Appendices 1-A and l-B). 

2.2.3.4 TL..453 EX'r l  

Watershed areas were determined from USEPA (2004) and PaDEP (2004) data. 
Based on this data, the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline is located within seven watershed areas: 
West Branch Genesee River, Middle Branch Genesee River, Genesee River, Marsh 
Creek, Tumer Creek, North Branch Cowanesque River, and Ludington Run. Of the 
three municipalities crossed by the proposed pipeline, none have municipal water 
authorities. 

V 
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According to the PaDEP, no surface water users and no public surface water users are 
within three miles downstream of the proposed pipeline. 

Additionally, none of the watersheds crossed by the TL-453 EXT1 pipeline are listed 
under the PaDEP WRAS. Degraded waters were also identified using Section 303(d) of 
the Clean Water Act. The impacted waterbodies are summarized in Table 2.2.3-4. 

Pipeline construction and operation are not expected to impact potable surface water 
supplies because of DTrs adherence to the Commission's Plan and Procedures 
(Appendices 1-A and l-B). 

2.2.4 Sensitive Surface Waters 

Identify municipal water supplies, watershed areas, designated surface water 
protection areas, and sensitive waterbodlea crossed by the project. 
(380.12(dX1)). 

Sensitive surface waters may include waters that do not meet water quality standards 
associated with their designated beneficial use, waters that have been designated for 
intensified water quality management, waterbodies that contain threatened or 
endangered species or critical habitat, waters less than three miles upstream of potable 
water intake structures, outstanding quality waterbodies, waters of particular ecological 
and recreational importance, waterbodies located in sensitive and protected watershed 
areas, or physically unstable waterbodies. The waterbodies crossed by the pipeline 
facilities that meet the requirements of sensitive waterbodies are listed in Table 2.2.4-1 
for PL-1 EXT2, Table2.2.4-2 for TL-492 EXT3, Table 2.2.4-3 for TL-536, and 
Table 2.2.4-4 for TL-453 EXT1. 

2.2.5 Hydrostatic Test Water 

Prior to placing the pipeline into service, the new pipeline segment will be hydrostatically 
tested to check its structural integrity. The new pipeline first will be cleaned using a 
cleaning pig propelled by compressed air. The pipeline then will be filled with water, 
without the use of additives, obtained from a surface water source or a potable water 
supply and hydrostatically tested in a manner that meats or exceeds the Minimum 
Federal Safety Standards. Hydrostatic test water volume and discharge locations are 
summarized in Table2.2.5-1 for PL-1 EXT2, Table2.2.5-2 for TL-492EXT3, 
Table 2.2.5-3 for TL-536, and Table 2.2,5-4 for TL-453 EXT1. Consultations with NMFS 
for using the test waters are outlined in Section 3.5. 

2.2.6 Construction and Operation Impacts to Surface Water 

2.2.6.1 PL-1EXT2, TL-492 EXT3, TL-536, and 17.-453 EXT1 Pipelines 

Pipeline construction and hydrostatic testing for PL-1 EXT2, TL-492 EXT3, TL-536, and 
TL-453 EXT1 could affect surface waters, on a temporary basis, in a variety of ways. 

2-14 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 
DTI will utilize the Commission's Plan and Procedures (Appendices 1-A and 1-B) to limit 
the effects of clearing and grading of stream banks, blasting, in-stream trenching, trench 
dewatering, and backfilling operations on aquatic habitat. Some potential for increased 
sedimentation, turbidity, decreased dissolved oxygen concentration and increased 
water temperature do still remain, however. Releases of chemical and nutrient 
pollutants from excavated sediments are also a possibility. Implementation of DTI's 
SPCC Plan (Appendix 2-B) will significantly reduce the potential for introduction of 
chemical contamination, such as fuel and lubricants into the streams. 

DTI will verify pipeline integrity by conducting a series of hydrostatic tests. These tests 
consist of pressurizing the pipeline with water and checking for pressure losses due to 
pipeline leakage. The hydrostatic test water is typically recovered from nearby 
waterbodies and could temporarily affect downstream users and aquatic organisms 
(primarily fish) if the diversion constituted a large percentage of the source's total flow or 
volume. To limit the impact of hydrostatic test water withdrawal, intake volumes will be 
limited to no more than 25 percent of the stream's flow rate at the time of withdrawal. 

V 

Potential impacts include temporary disruption of surface water supplies, temporary loss 
of habitat for aquatic species, increased water temperatures, depletion of dissolved 
oxygen levels, and temporary interruption of spawning, depending on the time of 
withdrawal and current downstream users. These impacts will be minimized by 
obtaining hydrostatic test water from bodies of water with sufficient flow or volume to 
supply required test volumes without significantly affecting downstream flow. Impacts to 
spawning would further be avoided by performing hydrostatic testing during 
non-spawning periods. The PFBC and NMFS were consulted regarding spawning 
and/or rearing areas for waterbodies crossed by the PL-1 EXT2 and TL-453 EXT1 
projects (Appendix 3-A). The PFBC was consulted regarding spawning and/or rearing 
areas for waterbodles crossed by the TL-492 EXT3 and TL-536 projects. In regard to 
the PL-1 EXT2 pipeline, the Juniata River serves as a significant spawning or rearing 
area for commercially or rocreationally important fish species, specifically the American 
shad, according to NMFS. Refer to Section 3.5 for NMFS consultations. The Middle 
Branch Genesee River serves as a significant spawning or rearing area for the 
American brook lamprey, according to the PFBC. Refer to Section 3.5 for PFBC 
consultations. 

V 

Potential impacts resulting from the discharge of hydrostatic test waters into streams 
and upland vegetation areas would be limited to erosion of soils and some subsequent 
degradation of water quality from increased turbidity and sedimentation. High velocity 
flows could cause erosion of the stream banks and stream bottom, resulting in 
temporary release of sediment. Erosion caused by the discharge of hydrostatic test 
water will be minimized by controlling the discharge rate using energy dissipation 
devices (e.g., holding tanks, filter bags, strew bale structures and splash plates). 
Erosion and sedimentation controls will be installed along the pipeline corridor to 
ensure, to the maximum extent practicable, that no significant erosion of native soils or 
sedimentation occurs. Refer to Resource Report 1 for additional information on 
hydrostatic testing and erosion and sedimentation control. 
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2.2.7 Waterbody Construction and Mitigation Procedures for PL-1 EXT2, 
TL-492 EXT3, TL-536, and TL.453 EXT1 

DTI will use the Commission's Procedures for crossing waterbodies. For PL-1 EXT2, 
the Juniata River and the Bald Eagle Creek are proposed to be constructed by HDD. 
Site-specific plans for these crossings are provided as Figures 1.2-29 and 1.2-31. 

For PL-1 EXT2, the West Branch Susquehanna River crossing exceeds 100 feet in 
width. Due to the terrain in the area, the crossing is not suitable for HDD. DTI will 
coordinate with the responsible agencies to construct this crossing using a cofferdam 
method. 

Construction across cold water fishery (CWF) streams will occur dudng the low-flow 
period between June 1 and September 30, unless the timeframe for construction is 
extended by agreement with the responsible agencies. CWF include those waters with 
a water classification of CWF or high-quality (HQ)-CWF, as Identified In Table 2.2.1-1 
for PL-1 EXT2, Table 2.2.1-3 for TL-536, and Table 2.2.1-4 for TL-453 EXT1. 

The PaDEP sets construction restrictions of no construction between March 1 through 
June15 for stocked streams, and October1 through December31 for wild trout 
streams. 

PL-1 EXT2, TL-536, and TL-453 EXT1 will have CWF time restrictions for construction, 
and TL-1 EXT2 and TL-453 EXT1 will have stocking and wild trout time restrictions. 

A HDD Contingency Plan will be prepared and submitted to the Commission for all 
locations where HDD is proposed. The plan will address handling and releases of 
ddlling mud, sealing of abandoned ddll holes, and cleanup of inadvertent releases. 

For TL-453 EXTI, at the request of the PFBC, the Middle Branch Genesee River, the 
Main Branch Genesee River, and the West Branch Genesee River (TL-453 EXT1 
crosses an unnamed tributary of West Branch Genesee River, not the West Branch 
itself) were evaluated by DTI to be constructed by HDD. Based on the evaluation, DTI 
proposed to cross these streams according to the Commission's Procedures, as per 
coordination with the PFBC regarding the American brook lamprey, which is further 
discussed in Section 3.5. 

The following crossing techniques will be utilized throughout the remainder of the 
project area. 

2.2.7.1 Dry Ditch Method 

All waterbody crossings, up to 30 feet wide at the water's edge at the time of 
construction, would be dry crossings using one of the following dry ditch crossing 
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techniques, depending upon the amount of water in the stream at the time of 
construction: 

Flume Pipe Method 

Most stream crossings encountered during pipeline construction are small enough to 
apply the flume pipe method. The flume pipe method is typically used in combination 
with an equipment crossing and starts with the initial installation of a flume in the stream 
at a location over the proposed ditch line. Flume pipe should be installed after any 
necessary blasting has been conducted. (No matedal will be removed from the stream 
until the flume is in place.) The flume is sandbagged at each end to direct the stream 
flow through the flume, and the outlet is protected with riprap to minimize scour. The 
pipeline trench can then be excavated (while dry), the pipe installed and backfilling 
completed with the flume pipe in place. Spoil piles will be kept a minimum of 10 feet 
from the water's edge and will be contained by sediment barriers. Trenching and 
backfilling must be completed within 72 hours, and the disturbed stream banks must be 
stabilized with riprap or vegetation before the flumes for the pipeline and equipment 
crossings are removed. (Refer to Appendix 1-E for typical waterbody crossing 
methods.) 

Cofferdam Method 

This method may be used for wider channel crossings, and will be designed so as not to 
prevent the flow of the stream. A cofferdam will be constructed within the construction 
ROW from non-erodible materials (riprap, sand bags, jersey barriers, commemial 
cofferdam products, etc.) enclosing approximately half the streambed in a semi-circle. 
The cofferdam should seal tightly to the streambed to minimize water from entering the 
area. Pumps will be needed to keep water out of excavations. All earth disturbances 
will occur in the dry behind the cofferdam. The pipe will be installed and the disturbed 
areas backfilled and stabilized, and sediment barriers at the waterline in good working 
order before the cofferdam is removed. Stabilization will be with either dprap or 
vegetation. The cofferdam is then set up from the opposite bank and extends far 
enough to include the tie-in point in mid stream. The remainder of the pipe is installed 
and the tie-in weld is made. Clean up follows the same procedures as just descrtbed. 

Pump Around (Dam and Pump) Method 

The pump-around method is a construction technique utilizing a pump and hoses to 
convey water around and past the trench area (refer to Appendix 1-E for typical 
watarbody crossing methods). This method is typically used for streams whose 
configuration does not allow a flume to be Installed. The following restdct~ns apply 
when using the pump around method: 

sandbag bulkheads or dams shall be constructed above and below the trench 
area; 
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• stand-by pump(s) and hose(s) must be on-site during the crossing; 

downstream flow must be maintained throughout benching, pipe laying and 
backfilling operations; and 

• filter bags can be used to maintain clean water. 

a. The dam and pump method may be used without prior approval for 
crossing minor water bodies where fluming is not required by these 
Procedures. 

b. Prior written approval from the Director of OEP is required to dam and 
pump where: 

I. fluming is required by the Commission's Procedures; or 

ii. the water body is greater than 10 feet wide. 

C. To request approval to use the dam-and-pump method, the project 
sponsor shall file with the Commission's Secretary a project-specific plan 
for review and written approval by the Director of OEP before construction. 
This plan must list all water bodies where the dam-and-pump method 
would be used and describe all measures that would be used to maintain 
downstream flows, including: 

i. number and capacity of active pumps; 

il. number and capacity of backup pumps; 

iii. the types of dam to be used upsbeam and downstream of the 
crossing: 

iv. how sbeambed scour would be prevented at the pump discharge; 
and 

V. how the operation would be monitored if the crossing is prolonged 
beyond one normal construction day. 

In some Instances, the flow In the channel to be crossed can be diverted into an existing 
side channel braid using the diversion channel method. Occasionally, it may be cost- 
effective to build a temporary channel for diverting flow around the work area. As noted 
above, all extraordinary work areas required to Implement the diversion channel method 
are subject to the same review, landowner contact, and permitting as other work areas. 
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2.2.7.2 Wet Trench Method 

On occasion, it will not be practicable to construct a stream in the dry or by trenchless 
construction, particularly stream channels located within wetlands with standing water or 
saturated soil. These streams will have to be crossed using the wet-ditch or "wet 
trench" crossing method in which the minimum equipment necessary to install the 
crossing will operate in the stream flow. 

The wet trench stream and river crossing technique is typically used to cross 
intermediate streams and major rivers. The trench is excavated by construction 
equipment operating from stream banks or barges. The excavated material is stored on 
the banks inside straw bale and/or silt fence barriers. The following stipulations apply to 
wet trench construction: 

all appropriate erosion and sediment controls (as directed by steam crossing 
permits) must be in place prior to in-stream construction; and 

where conditions require construction equipment refueling within 100 feet of 
streams, the contractor must follow the procedures described in DTI's SPCC 
Plan. 

Sediment barriers will be in place at the water's edge and around spoil storage areas 
prior to the start of trenching. Spoil storage areas will be located at least 10 feet from 
the water's edge. Trenching and backfilling (not including blasting) must be completed 
within 48 hours, unless site-specific conditions make completion within 48 hours 
impractical. (Refer to Appendix 1-E for typical waterbody crossing methods.) 

The SPCC Plan to be used for this project is included in Appendix 2-B. If additional spill 
prevention measures are needed for the crossings, they will be included on the 
appropriate site-specific plans. 

2.2.7.3 Temporary Bridges 

Temporary bridges will be Installed to cross the intermittent and perennial streams. 
These temporary structures provide an in-stream work surface and vehicle access 
throughout the construction period without interrupting the stream flow. The trench will 
be excavated either with a conventional backhoe or with crane equipment and clamshell 
bucket At small stream crossings, the pipe segment will be assembled at the bankslda 
work area for the full crossing distance, moved into position with side boom tractors, 
and lowered into the trench. After installation of the pipe, the bench will be beckfilled 
with the excavated, native soil. Appropdate erosion and sedimentation control 
measures will be installed at drainage run areas if perceptible water flow is observed in 
these areas dudng conskuction. The need for permanent access road use will be 
necessary for maintenance. All appropriate permits for permanent pipeline skeam 
crossings will be acquired. 

2-19 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 

V 

2.3 WETLANDS 

Project construction will result in temporary and permanent impacts to several types of 
wetland systems. Field surveys were conducted in order to identify the total number of 
wetlands crossed by the project and the overall wetland impacts associated with the 
project. The classification, milepost, linear traverse, and acreage of impact of total 
wetlands crossed by the project are shown in Table 2.3-1 for PL-I EXT2, Table 2.3-2 for 
TL-492 EXT3, Table 2.3-3 for TL-536, and Table 2.3-4 for TL-453 EXTI. Table 2.3-5 
presents the total acreage and acreage of each wetland type that would be affected by 
construction for PL-1 EXI"2, Table 2.3-6 for TL-492 EXT3, Table 2.3-7 for TL-536, and 
Table 2.3-8 for TL-453 EXT1. Wetland delineations were completed between May 2004 
and August 2004. Additionally, information on wetland habitats was obtained from the 
National Wetlands Inventory (NWl). NWl utilizes the wetland classification system 
described in the Classification of Wetlands and Deepwater Habitats of the United States 
(Cowardin, et al., 1979). DTI anticipates filing Section 404 permit applications with the 
Baltimore District of the USACE. Because of new regulations, isolated wetlands are 
now considered waterways of the state, and thus require a permit through state 
agencies. The PaDEP has not reviewed or granted any isolated permit requests since 
the new regulations became effective; however, the PaDEP anticipates that the 
applicable permit will he some type of "State Water Quality Discharge Permit." As this 
state permitting process is currently under legislative review, PaDEP advises to consult 
the PaDEP and PA State websites for current rulings before submitting the application. 
A list of federal and state permits currently applicable to this project is presented in 
Resource Report 1. Copies of the Wetland Delineation Reports are provided in 
Appendix 3-B. NWI maps are shown on Figures 1.2-1 through 1.2-28 for PL-1 EXT2, 
Figures 1.2-32 through 1.2-36 for TL-492 EXT3, Figures 1.2-38 through 1.2-42 for 
TL-536, and Figures 1.2-45 through 1.2-51 for TL-453 EXT1. 

The wetland classification method used by NWI includes four hierarchical levels: 
system, subsystem, class and subclass. All wetland system types crossed by the 
pipelines are palustrlne. The palustrine system has no subsystems; the classes within 
the palustrine system include emergent, scrub-shrub, and forested areas. Additionally, 
non-vegetated open water areas will be crossed. 

2.3.1 Wetland Resources In the Project Area 

2.3.1.1 General 

The proposed pipeline facilities include the centedine (including beth permanent and 
construction ROW), access roads, and pipeyards. All wetlands crossed by the pipelines 
are pelustrine and include the following subtypes: emergent, scrub-shrub, forested, and 
open water. 

V 
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Emergent Wetlands 

The emergent wetland cover type is characterized by erect, rooted, herbaceous 
hydrophytes, excluding mosses and lichens (Cowardin, et al., 1979). Freshwater 
emergent wet/ands are often associated with abandoned agricultural areas and fringes 
of waterbodies, beaver ponds, and other wetland systems. The vegetation in this 
wetland type consists of a variety of emergent and other rooted herbaceous species, as 
well as submergent species such as pondweeds. 

Within the project area, the plant species that are representative of this wetland type 
include vadous communities of broad-leaved cattail (Typha latifolie), dear-tongue grass 
(Dichanthe/lum c/andestinum), spotted Joe pye-weed (Eupatodadelphus macu/etus), 
spotted jewelweed (Impatiens capensis), New York aster (Aster nov/be/g/t), wool grass 
(Scirpus cypefinus), sedges (Carex spp.), soft rush (Juncus effusus), and smartweed 
species (Polygonum spp.). 

Scrub-Shrub Wetlands 

The scnJb-shrub wetland cover type includes all wetlands dominated by woody 
vegetation less than six-meters tall (Cowardin, et al., 1979). Shrubs and small trees 
typically dominate these wetland areas. 

Spedes composition of scrub-shrub species in these wetlands was limited to monotypic 
stands of black willow (Salix nigra). Herbaceous species associated with this wetland 
community and crossed by the proposed pipeline facilities include wool grass (Scirpus 
cyperinus), reed canary grass (Phelads arundinacea), broad-leaved cattail (Typha 
latifolia), soft rush (Juncus effusus), slender rush (Juncus tenuis), sedges (Carex spp.), 
and spotted Joe pye-weed (Eupatoriade/phus maculatus). 

Forested Wetlands 

The forested wetlands are dominated by woody vegetation that is at least six-meters tall 
(Cowardin, et al., 1979). Forested wetlands found along the proposed pipeline facilities 
are limited and consist predominantly of broad-leaved deciduous vegetation. 

Species composition of overstory trees in the project study area typically includes 
monotyplc stands of sycamore (Plantanus occidental/s) and green ash (Fraxinus 
pennsylvanlca). The understory trees typically consist of rnonotypic stands of red maple 
(Acar rubrum). Herbs typically include New York aster (Aster nov/be/g/i), Christmas 
fem (Polystlchum acrostlchoides), soft rush (Juncus effusus), sedge species (Carex 
spp.), and Pennsylvania smartweed (Polygonum pensy/vanicum). 

Open Water Wetlands 

Open water habitats are those where the water depth is permanently over 6.6 feet deep, 
or if under 6.6 feet deep, they do not support emergent vegetation. 
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These habitats do not support emergent or woody vegetation, but may be surrounded 
by vegetated wetland (Environmental Laboratory, 1987). 

2.3.1.2 Surveyed Wetland Resources 

The classification, MP, linear traverse and acreage of impact of forested wet]ands and 
total wetlands crossed by the project are shown in Table 2.3-1 for PL-1 EXT2, 
Table 2.3-2 for TL-492 EXT3, Table 2.3-3 for TL-536, and Table 2.3-4 for TL-453 EXT1. 
Table 2.3-5 presents the total acreage and acreage of each wetland type that would be 
affected by construction for PL-1 EXT2, Table 2.36 for TL-492 EXT3, Table 2.3.7 for 
TL-536, and Table 2.3-8 for TL-453 EXT1. Copies of the NWl wetlands are presented 
on Figures 1.2-1 through 1.2-28 for PL-1 EXT2, Figures 1.2-32 through 1.2-36 for 
TL-492 EXT3, Figures 1.2-38 through 1.2-42 for TL-536, and Figures 1.2-45 through 
1.2-51 for TL-453 EXT1. ROW widths are provided in Resource Report 1. 

2.3.2 Construction and Operation Impacts 

The primary impact of pipeline construction and ROW maintenance activities on 
wetlands would be temporary and permanent alteration of wetland vegetation. These 
effects would be greatest dudng and immediately following construction. In emergent 
wetlands, the impact of construction on vegetation is anticipated to be relatively bdef, 
since the herbaceous vegetation is expected to regenerate quickly. In forested and 
scrub-shrub wetlands, the impact on vegetation would be extended due to the longer 
regenerat]on period of the vegetative types and the maintenance or clearing limits 
allowed by the Commission's Procedures (Appendix l-B). 

All pipeline crossings that impact wetlands will be Installed using open-cut trenching 
methods: a trench will be excavated, pipeline segments will be installed, and the trench 
will be bacldilled. Trenches will be excavated to a depth sufficient to provide at least 
three feet of cover once pipeline segments have been installed. Excavated material will 
be staged in temporary ROW along the pipeline corridor. Once construction has been 
completed, these temporary ROWs will be restored to pre-existing grade and allowed to 
naturally revegetate. 

Drainage impacts, backfill matedals and any construction actions taken to minimize 
impacts to wet]ands will be addressed during the permitting process. 

2.3.3 Wetland Mitigation Procedures 

Mitigation procedures will follow prindples set forth in the Commission's Plan and 
Procedures (Appendices 1-A and I-B) and according to the appropriate federal and 
state permits provided in Resource Report 1. 

V 
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2.3.4 Site-Specific Wetland Impacts 

The total wetlands crossed by the project's access roads and centerline are listed in 
Table 2.3-1 for PL-1 EXT2, Table 2.3-2 for TL-492 EXT3, Table 2.3-3 for TLo536, and 
Table 2.3-4 for TL-453 EXT1 by section, MP, NWl classification, crossing length in feel 
and temporary and permanent impacts in acres for total wetlands. The same data are 
summarized by NWl classification in Table 2.3-5 for PL-1 EXT2, Table 2.3-6 for TL-492 
EXT3, Table 2.3-7 for TL-536, and Table 2.3-8 for TL-453 EXT1. The wetlands are 
shown on the Construction Alignment Sheets (Appendix 1-C). No wetlands have been 
identified in areas that involve steep terrain or sidehill construction on TL-536 and 
TL-453 EXT1. 

2.3.4.1 PL-1 EXT2 Pipeyards 

There are no wetlands affected by the four proposed pipayards. 

2.3.4.2 TL-492 EXT3 Plpeyards 

There is one wetland located in the proposed pipeyards. No impacts to this wetland are 
anticipated. DTI plans to install silt fence and avoid the wetland areas. The wetland is 
listed in Table 2.3-2 and is part of the summary in Table 2.3-6. 

2.3.4.3 TL-536 Pipeyards 

No wetlands will be impacted by the proposed pipeyard. For the wetland located In the 
proposed pipeyard, DTI will install silt fence on both sides of the wetland to protect it 
from construction activities within the pipayard. The wetlands are listed in Table 2.3-3 
and are part of the summary in Table 2.3-7. 

2.3.4.4 TL-453 EXTI Pipeyards 

Thera are no wetlands affected by the proposed pipeyard. 
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Table 2.1.2-1 

PUBLIC AND PRIVATE WATER SUPPLY WELLS FOR THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE 

V 

CRMinoe 
~om 

S y ~ _  P!pellne 
8 y ~ r n  Name ~ Sourc~ Name Type = population (feet) = Milepost 

Public Water Supply Wells 
Chris~m ~ t  C,e~er We~l 2 N 1 O0 6,288.71 S IMP0.00 
Black Hawk Mobile Home Pad( Well #3 C 250 2,888.03 $2MP9.35 
Bka¢~ Haw~ M o ~  Home Pa~ ~l led Welt #1 C 250 3,148..50 $2MP937 
Eml~m MoUle Home Pat',( We~J #1 C 75 481.8.5 S2MP10.59 

Wall #3 C 75 411.82 $2MP10.57 Emplre Moire Home Park 
Bogg8 Townst~p Water AUlhO~ 

To'*m~p Water Au tho r '  
S p ~  To~m~lp Water Authodly 4 
Meedo~ P ~  C*et~ 

S ~  West 
Gm)~o~t PA Inc. 
~ I ~  Tts~lssk~ I~d~f Stain 
Domlr~on Tramm~ssi¢~ I.~dy Station 

Well #1 

BOCD~I Munlc~d AtJfhO~ 

Welt #2 
We~ #1 

Well 
Well #3 

Ddlled Well 
Well 

we~ 1 
wen 2 
Well #1 

C 
C 
C 

C 
N 

3O0 
30O 

2,500 
268 
35 

50O 
150 
18 
18 
50 

1,603.50 
1,794.52 
3,409.~Z 
2,990.67 

956.60 
1 ,~2.09 
6,267.42 

890.71 
2,428.35 

$2MP10.86 
$2M~18.86 
S2MP11.00 
S2~Pa.06 
$2MP22.76 
$2MP13.00 
$2MP14.00 
$3~P25.5 
$3MP25.5 

Buoldall L o ~  on Kettle Creek 5,4,g0.60 S1MP0.00 
BuddaH Lo(:~ on Kettle Creek Well - Mot~ N 50 5,368.12 $3MP16.20 
C l 1 ~  Retreat Center Well #1 N 100 6,380.10 $1MP1.34 

Beflevflta Wei #6 C 26,765 $1MP15.84 
B~Mville Weft #7 

I::~ee~ View Scl~o~ 

West GnBt~lle Ftm 

S~lng 
26,765 

38 
975 Well 

1,139.81 
590.54 

4,204.67 
2,784.19 

$1MP15.71 
SIMP18.g6 
$1MP14.43 

Well N 25 4,730.3~ SIMP15.00 

Prhm~ warm' Supply Wells 
Wise, Wll im K and Bad.r8 K. Not Applk:a~e D 112.00 s S1MP7.80 
Reynok:ls, ~ D. and Sam A. 
~ ,  RIcham and Sandra 

No¢ Ap~lcabls D 
Not Ap~k:~als D 

Not ~ p i k ~ e  
No~ Al~k:at~e 

.o~ ~pk,,ue o N , x ~  

125.00 j 
l ~ . O d  
150.00' 

$1MP10.67 
$1MP10.78 
S21VIP10.16 

Note6; 

1 From penmc~d commpondence with the PaDEP (Appe¢~ 2-A). 

• "N" denotes tn~'slsN non-communlly; "C" dehorn community'; "P" de~oms no'~nnae~t non.communlty; and "D" 
de~ot~ ~ 

s C~dculstad with cootdlnatM ixo~ded by the paDEp Notlhcecym~ Omce ( W l l ~ )  and the PaDEP Sou111ceNml ORce 
(Hae*mm). 

4 Munldpel vmta~ au~'~c~l~u wire ~ l s  ~(thln a one-role mdlu6 of ~ .  

8 From Cons~nc~on Alignment Sheets. 
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Table 2.1.2-2 

P U B U C  AND PRIVATE WATER SUPPLY WELLS FOR THE TL-492 EXT3 P I P E U N E  

System Name t Source Name 

Public Water Supply Wells 

WV3305,?.01 Community of Hundred 

WV9952020 The Spot 

Prlvste Wster Supply Wells 

WV0105341 Hundred-LIttleton PSD 

Private WelP Unknown 

Private Well Unknown 

Distance from 
System Type Milepost Pipeline (feet) 

Community - Closed ~ Not Available Not Available 

Transient Non-Community - Closed ~ Not Available Not Available 

Communtty-SewageTreatment Facilit~ 0.00 

WaterWell 2.67 

WaterWell 2.73 

13,140 

165 Feet to the Right 

105 Feet to the Right 

Notes: 

1 From personal correspondence with the PaDEP and WVDEP (Appendix 2-A). 

USEPA (2005). 

Identified dudng field investigations. 
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Table 2.1.2-3 

PUBLIC AND PRIVATE WATER SUPPLY WELLS FOR THE TL-536 PIPELINE 

Milepost I L°cati°nl 
Public Water Supply Wells 

None I Not Applicable 
Private Water Supply Wells 

2.67 25 Feet to the Right 
3.10 59 Feet to the Right 

Note: 

1 Distance measured 
Alignment Sheets. 

from the centedine of TL-536 using the Construction 

V 
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Table 2.1.3-1 

CERCLIS SITES FOR THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPEUNE 

Site Facility I .D .  Distance from Pipeline (miles) Milepost 
Drake Chemical PAD003058047 19.25 $3MP7.95 

Kline's D u m p  PAD987266616 5.07 $2MP9.58 
Centre Co. Kepone PAD000436261 5.09 $2MP9.32 

V 

V 
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Table 2.2.1-1 

PERENNIAL,  INTERMrI 'rENT, AND EPHEMERAL WATERBODIES CROSSED BY THE PL-1 EXT2 P I P E U N E  

0 h~ 
h~ 
(3 

I 

fO 

fO 
Crmmlng PaDEP Chapter 

.ow c,.o.,,,~ 
SPA-I.F-0~ 

SPA-NAY-083 
SPA.4.F-007 
SPA-LF-006 

$1 MP0.17 
SIMP0.26 
$1 MP 0.24 
$1MP 0.27 

U n , w , ~ T ~ t o  L~ Run 

u . . = ~  T~a,~=,/to t.~ .un 

Perennial 

Perermbd 
F.pheme~ 
P~nnlal  

4.5 
½to2 

<1 

CWF 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 

SPA-LF-004 $1 MP0.3~ Unnamed Tdbul~ to I_k:k Run ~ to 2 CWF 
SPA-NAY-064 $1MP0.54 Unnamed T~g)uta~ to Lk~ Fllun Perlmnial 30 CWF 
SPA-NAY-122 $1MP2.23 Unnamed Tnt)uta~ to ~ Run Penmnial 2 CWF 
SPA-NAY-123 $ 1 M ~  Unnamed TdlxJta~ to Uc~ Run Perennial 10 CWF 
SPA-NAY-125 $1 MP3.57 3 HQ-CWF 
SPA-NAY-124 $1MP3.57 
SPA-NAY-126 SIMP3.Se 
SPA-NAY-127 S1MP3.72 
SPA-NAY-002 $1MP4.22 
SPA-NAY-001 S1 MP4.23 
SPA-NAY-00~ $1MP4.72 
SPA-NAY-004 81MP4.74 
SPA-NAY-006 $I MP5.21 
SPA-NAY-006 
SPA-NAY-007 
SPA-NAY-00e 
SPA-NAY-O09 
S PA-NAY-010 
SPA-NAY-011 

Unnamed T~ou',=y to ~ Run ~ n d  
pecer, nlal WIlIow Run 10 HQ-CWF 

WEOW Run Pec'er~l 20 ~ F  
Unnamed Tdbuta~ to Wlllow Run 4 HQ-CWF 
Unnalned Tr lxJ t~  to ~ Run 
u,,-,,,,~ T ,~=y to ~ Run 
Unnamed Trlbt~al~ Io ~ Run 
oo,~m~ Run 
Unnamed Tr~Jtar~ to Dou~ile~ Run 
u n n ~  x ~ , t o  ~ Run 
Unnamed T n t ~  to D o u g h ~  Flun 
~ T ~ l u ~  to D o u ~ d ~  Run 

unn~.~ T . ~ ,  to Doup~ Run 
unr,am~ "rrb~w to Doug~.V Run 
U~nan~'r,~=J~,/to Dou~eW Run 
U,,n=~ T,=a,W to Do,~.,V ~., 
t ~  T~ut~ to DouparV Run 
~ Tdbuta~ to Dou~he~ Run 
Unnemed Trlx.,ta~ to Dou~e~/Run 
Ullllamed TrlbtJta~ to D o u ~  r~ Run 
~ T d b u ~  to Do~herl~ Run 
Unnamed T d b u ~  to D o ~ [ ~  Run 
Urmmed Tr~,x~/to Barn Run 

S1MP5.21 
$ 1 M P 5 ~ 3  

$ 1 M ! ~ 5 . 2 S  

u m ~ t o  ~ c ~  

Inmrmltte~ Not c.,~;u# HQ-CWF 

$1MP5.27 
$1MP5.27 
$1MP534 

Penmn~ 5 HQ-CWF 
Intemd~e~ 1.5 HQ-CWF 
Inten'nRtecd Not Crossed HC~'WF 
PerennlaJ 1.5 HQ-CWF 
Pere~l~ 1.5 

Inteml~lent 1 HQ-CWF 
I ~  1.5 HQ-C'W F 
perennial < 1 HQ-CWF 
Pere~n~ 6 HQ-CWF 

I ~ w l t  Not ~ HQ-C1NF 
Pemrlnl~ 1.5 H Q-CWF 

Intemtlttefd Not Crowed HQ-CWF 
Peflmnlal Not Crc~sed I-ff2-CWF 

Irdefmltt~lt No( Crossed ~ F  
Pemnnkd 1.5 HQ-CWF 

Intemglle~ 0.5 HQ-CWF 
Intennltte~ 1 HQ-CWF 
Perennial 1 HQ-CWF 

3 
1.5 

SPA-NAY-012 81MP5.36 
SPA-NAY-013 $1MP5.36 
SPA-NAY-O14 SIMPSA1 
SPA-NAY-015 $1 MP5.4,5 
SPA-NAY-018 $1MP5.51 
SPA-NAY-017 $1MP5.59 
SPA'NAY-018 $1MP5.60 
SPA-NAY-019 $1MP5.66 
SPA-NAY-020 S IMP6.31/S1APA 
SPA-NAY-021 $1MP6.88 

~' -"WF 
~Q-C~F 

0. 

0 

o 
o u1 
o 
t~  

I 
Q 

fo 
f l  
fo 

< 
fo 

M 
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Q 
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Q 
Q 
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I k-' 
U# k-' 
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Table  2.2.1-1 (Cont inued)  

Slxl lm In .  '° Mllepoel 
now ~ p , ~  

SPA-NAY-~2 
SPA-NAY4~3 
SPA-NAY-0~4 
SPA-N, AY-0~5 
SPA-NAY-027 

SIMPS.g~ 
SIMP8.63 
S1MPS.gg 
Sl MPg.O0 
S1MPg.10 

SPA-NAY-0L~ S1MP9.O~ 
SPA-NAY-0~8 
SPA-NAY-0~9 
SPA-NAY-~O 
SPA-NAY-(~I 
SPA-NAY-0~ 
SPA-N, AY-0~3 

$1MP9.23 
$1MP9.4~ 
81MP9.56 
81MP~.81 
$1MP10.62 
$1MPl1~2 

SPA-NAY-037 $1 MPI 1.5~ I 
SPA-NAY-0~6 S1MP11.86 
SPA-DLC-O01 
SPA-DLC-O(~ 
SPA-NAY-045 

$1MP1~17 
S 1 ~ 1 ~ 7  

SPA-NAY-046 
SPA-NAY-047 $1MP14.42 
SPA-NAY-048 $1MP14.43 
SPA-NAY-044 

S1MP14~.4 ~ 
S1MPI 4,?.4 

S1MP1531 
SPA-NAY-120 $1MP1~.11 
SPA-NAY-121 Sl MP16.41 
SPA-VRS-011 $1MP17.00 
SPA-VRS-012 
SPA-VRS-013 
SPA-NAY-0~7 
SPA-NAY-0~4 
SPA-NAy-0G5 
SPA-NAY-0~ 

SIMP17.0@ 
$1MP17.22 I 
$1MP19.43 
SIMP22.52 
S1 MP23.72 
$1MP24.74 * 

SPA-NAY-0Q~ $1MP24.78 ~ 
SPA-NAY-040 $1 MP24.83 
SPA-NAY-041 $1 MP24.91 
SPA-NAY-042 $1MP25.00 
SPA-NAY-049 Sl MP25.01 

Unnamed T~ir~ to En~ l.i~dn~ Crllek 

Umam~d Tdbutar~ to F_mt Lk~ng C r ~  
~ Tdl~a~ to East IJc~n~ C r ~  
~ Tdbuta~ to F_~t Liddn~l Cm~ 
E ~ U c ~ C ~  
Uril i l led T d l x l ~  to Ea~ LJck~ Criwik 

M~wW~t Run 
Unmu~l T Y d ~  to C~t~lo Run 
U~nemed Tr~uta~ to Carlisle Run 
t~narned Tributary ~o C~ll~e Run 
Umamed T ~ a ~ / t o  C a ~ e  Run 
Jun ta  F ~  
U~nan~d Tdbuta~ to Slmdes Run 
Spd~ Unnamed Tdlx~n/to Stmdes Run 
UrcBmed Tdbuta~ Io Slmdee Run 
Unnamed Tdbut~y to S~0d~ Run 
Umarn~ T ~  to SUod~ Run 

I ~  od Tltl0ulal~ to Stmdim Run 

Umamed T,~.~a~ to St~oU~ ~n 

Elult Bnmch of Stand~ Stone Creek 

Unmu~ed Trl)ular~ Io S ' t a ~  Stoile Creek 
u ~  T _~2~ ~ S ~  S~ C~ 
Lk~emed Tdbut~ Io S~u~ir~l Sl~e Creek 
Unnam~ T,buta~ to S~da@ Stone C ~  
s~n~ U n ~ d  T , ~  to S ~ d n ~  stone c . ~  

( 

Cromdng PIOEP Chapter 93 
CIiimlfleation = Flow Width (~,~) 

P~re~n~ 5 HQ-CWF 
Peceml~d 1 HQ-CWF 
p ~ n i a l  1 HQ-CWF 
Pecl~daJ 1 ~ F  
pec~mlal 1.5 HQ-CWF 
Pe~l~rf~d 1.5 HQ-C'WF 
Per@~nlal 4 HQ-CWF 
Per~'~ l  18 ~ F  

1 per~n~ 

E p ~  
E p ~ n ~  
pem~nlal 

pe~mntal 

Not Cmssad 

1.5 

2.5 

3OO Personal 
Pere~nl~ 1.5 
pecemdal 1 
p ~ i a l  1 
Pere~niaJ 

1.5 Interrn~e~t 
Perennlel 4 
Perennial 5 

20 Ephemeral 
Inte~llteN 

N o l ~  

HQ-CWF 
4 

HQ-CWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
V~NF 
WWF 

HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ~'WF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ~'WF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF Intemlltle~ 

Pereclntal ~O C'WF 
Inten~itlent No( Croaed CWF 
Perennial 6 HQ-CWF 
Per~mnlal 1.5 HQ-CWF 
Pece~ l  Not ~ HO-CWF 

Inten/dllBnt Not Cro~ud HQ-CWF 
Intemlltt~ Not C n : ~ l  ~ F  
Interm~t~ 1.5 HQ-CV~F 
Pemnn{al No( Cro~med HQ-CWF 
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Tab le  2.2.1-1 (Cont inued)  

b'~r~zm I,D. ) Mlkmp~lt 
Row c,o,.,~,,  ( , ,o,,a,,~ 

SPA-NAY-043 
SPA-NAY-OSO 
SPA-NAY-061 
SPA-NAY-062 
SPA-KLF-016 
SPA-KLF-017 
SPA-KLF-018 
SPA-KLF-019 

S1MP25.01 
$1MP25.91 
$1MP2~.25 
$1MP26.31 
S2MP0.0~ 
S2MP1.72 
S2MP2.B9 
$2MP3.54 

SPA-KLF,-~ S2MP3.8~ 
SPA-KLF-(~I $2MP~.88 
SPA-KLF-0~2 S2MP3.88' 
SPA.-GTR-001 S~MPS.08 
SPA-GTR-0(~ ~2MPe.0e 
SPA-GTR-OOQ 82MP6.0e 
SPA-GTR-00~ $2MP8.21 
SPA-VRS-00~ $2MP17.84 
SPA-VRS-010 S~MPI8.42 
SPA-NAY-0~6 $2MP19.~5 
SPA-NAY-0~0 S~MP19.28 
SPA-NAY-056 
SPA-NAY-059 
SPA-NAY-(E~ 

$2MP19.39 
$2MP19.86 
S~MP19.80 

SPA-NAY-067 S2MP19.81 
SPA-NAY-061 S2MP20.1O 
SPA-NAY-0E~ S2MP20.26/S2AR11 
SPA~AY-0~3 $2MP20.30 
SPA-NAY-064 $2MP20.67 
SPA-NAY-005 $2MP21.35 
SPA-NAY-066 $2MP21.40 
SPA-AES-001 82MP22.11 
SPA-AES-0~ $2MP23.24 ~ Mar~ ~eek 
SPA-KDR-001 $2MP26.01 ~ Run 
S P A - K ~  
SPA*KDR-003 
SPA-AES-O(~ 

$2MP26.C~ 
S2MP2~.O~ 
S~MP26.0~ 

We~eml~xt,/ 

Tdl~Jt~ to Stlmd~ Stol~ Creek 
Untamed TdlxJtary to Standing Stone Creek 
Unrlam~d Tdl~a~ to Stlmd~ Sbcme Crick 

u ~ , n ~  x,tut~ S t = ~  S t ~  cr~,~ 
Oetv~ler Run 
,S~d~ Cree~ 

S~nk~ng c . ~  
Unnl '~d T n ~  m Slr~d~ Creek 

uen~m~ T~bu=~ to G~Jbm~ (~m Run 
Unnamed T r l t x / ~  to Sinldn~l Creek 
Unne~ed Tr~o~m~ to Sinldng Creek 

~ Tdioula~ to BaJd F-.el~ 
~ T d l x . ~  to B~d E a ~  
e~E, ,  w, 
Url~B11ed T d l ~  to B~d F-~e 
Unnamed Tdlxlla~ to Ba~l F.~e 
Unnan~d T~ ,=7  to B~d E~e 

S p ~  Lkvlame¢l T d l ~ t ~  Io Bakl E a p  

Spdn~ Um~med Tdl~al~ to Bald F_~le 
~ Trtbut~ t0 B~¢I F_~e 

Ant~ C r l ~  

Ivlen~ Cceet 
Mamh C, mek 
Un~rred T ~ e r y  to M a ~  Creek 

( 

C¢o~dng P~d~EP Chapter ~1 
Flow ~ ~NR) C l a n l f l c a ~ '  

2.5 Perennial 
Penmotal 4 
Perennial 1.5 
PeR~lnlal 15 
Perennial 
PerimniaJ 
Pemen~ll 

Intermittent 
Perennial 

Pere~nieJ 
PerlmnlaJ 

3 
12 
12 
2 

2.5 
12 

Pere~otaJ 3 
Perlmnlal 1 
Petlmnla] 4 

2 Ephemeral 
lO P~ec, nlal 

Perel~lal 100 
perennial 2 

Intermittent Not Ctoese(I 
Perennial 3 

Irdenotllel~t 1 
PeninnlaJ < 1 

Intemlltte~t 1.5 
Irltermlltent NOt Cro~md 
P ~  NOt Croesed 

HO-C1NF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-.CWF 

CWF 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 

~ ,  WTA 
CWF 
CWF 
C'WF 
CWF 
CWF 
TSF 
CWF 
CWF 
C~NF 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 
C~NF Iotemlittent 

I o t e ~  Not ~ CWF 
Intennntent 3 CWF 
Intenldllmll 4 CWF 

15 
Nol Crossed Intem1~emt 

PerennlaJ 

P ~  
P~ni~l 

~ F  

C ~ F  

~ F  

C W F  

C W F  1 0  
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Table 2.2.1-1 (Cont inued)  

Sulem LD.' I~klpO~ 
ROW cr,=~,,tp (= . ,e ,~ ' )  

SPA-GTR-007 
SPA-GTR-00~ 
SPA-GTI:H]04 

$2MP27.54 
S2MP27.~ 
$2MP28.10 

SPA-GTR-006 $2MP28,15 
SPA-1VRS-001 S3MP0.30 
SPA-VRS-0(~ $3MP0.91 z 

Wmm'body 

Ufmamed T ~ a n / t o  ~ Run 
Unnamed Tdl:~utary to ~ Run 
~ Tdixfmr~ to Coundl Run 
Umam~ T~but~ to Coun~ Run 
Unnamed "X n't~a~ to C_,ounci Run 
sp~s~ u~m~ T ~  to CouP, Run 
C,o~x~ Run 

Cromdng PsDEP Chap tmp  
Clu~fieation Row Width (Net) 

Pmen~l 
No(Crossed 

NO( C , n ~  

CWF 
CWF 
CWF 

perennial 4 CWF 
Perennial 2 CWF 
Pemnn~ 1 CWF 

SPA-VRS-003 S3MP1.13 PerlmnlaJ 1 CWF 
SPA-VRS-O04 S3MP1~21 B4NK~h Creek Pecmlnlal 30 CWF 
SPA-VRS-O~ S3MP1 21 ~ - Beech Ctm~ Perennial 20 CWF 
SPA-KLF-O01 $3MP1.54~ Beech C, nm~ Perenn~ 80 CWF 
SPA-KLF*O0~ S31VlP2~8 Beech CTuk Perennial 50 CWF 
SPA-KLF-003 S31VlW2.34 10 CWF Eel/L~ Run 

S ~ A - K L F ~ I  
u~narn~< T~x~a~/to E~oy Uc~ ~uo 
~ Tdb,ula~ to Two Roc~ Run 
~ TdblJta~ to Two Roc~ Run 
• s ~ p ~  uoo~,~ " r ~ , / t o  w~t B~c~ ~ ~o  
~ Tdbuta~ to We~ Branch Big Run 
W~t  Branch BIll Run 

unnamed T,~U==W to ~ Run 
D ~ n a ~  Unnamed T d b u ~  to Bums Run 
Dmlnege Unnamed T#outa~ to Bums Run 
Pand 

$3MP2.43 
SPA-KLF-004 $3MP3.13 
SPA-KLF-005 $3MP4.86 
SPA-KI.F-006 S3MPS.0~ 

S3MPS.g8 
$3MP6.25 

Perennial 
4 NO( Cmued 

SPA-KLF-O07 

Irl~mdttenl 1 CWF 
Pen~nial < 1 EV 
Pen~rdal < 1 EV 

< 1 EV 
Elo~meral 
Perennial 

Ephemeral 

SPA-KLF-00~ 
SPA-KLF-009 

6 
5 

EV 

<1 

SPA-KLF-010 
S3MP7.07 

Ep~m~ 
4 

S3MP10.31/S3AR12 
SPA-KLF-011 S3MP10.345/S3AR12 
SPA-KLF-012 S3MP10.47/S3AR12 

SPDPA-KLF-001 $3MP12.28 

EV 
1.5 EV 

EV 
EV 

No( ~ -a 
SPA-KLF-013 S3MP12~/S3AR12 Unnarn~ T # o u ~  to ~ Run [n~nnittent < 1 HQ-CWF 
SPA-KLF-014 S3MP12.52/S3AR12 Intemdl/41N < 1 HQ-CWF 

S~PAP14.48 579 Penmnial 
6 

SPA-KLF-015 

In~e~nlttent 

Unnamed T d b u ~  Io Smi~ Run 
Weet Branc~ Su~ue~nna FUver 

Perennial 
4 

Unnamed Tdtxda~ to Ke~tJe Creek 
Lktnamed Tdbuta~ to Kel~e Creek 

U ~  TFd3uta~ to Keltle Creek 
Pond 

SPA-RDW-001 S3MP15.Gg/S3AR14 
WWF 

TSF, CWF 
SPA-RDW-0~ S3MP16.0~ Intermittent 2 TSF, CWF 
SPA-RDW-0(~ $3MP16.44/ Unnamed Tdbuta~f to Kettle Cm(Ik Perennial 10 TSF, CWF 

S3AR14~3AR15 
SPA-RDW-004 $3MP16.46/ Tdbuta~y to Ke~e C,n)ek Perennial 6 TSF. CWF 

S3AR14/S3AR15 
SPA-RDW-0~ S3MP16.47/$3AR 15 7 TSF, CWF -" 

SPDPA-RDW-001 S31VlP16.49 Not Crowed -( 
SPA-RDW-00~ S3MPI7.40 Kettle Creek PerenniaJ 58 TSF 
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Table 2.2.1-1 (Continued) 

LD.' Mllepm~ 
ROW C~o~n~ ( ~ n ~  

Wat~l~dy 
C¢o~dng PIDEP Chaptw 93 

ROW Width (f~t) Clm.dfi=~lon' 

SPA-RDW-006 S3MP17.42 Overflow Ch~'ln~ - SPA-R0W-O07 Interm~tenl 10 TSF 
SPA-RDW-00g S , 3 M P 1 7 . 4 2  B e c k e t , -  SPA-RDW-006 5 TSF 

SPPA-RDW-001 
SPA-RDW-007 

$3MP17.56 
S3MP17.5@ 
$3MP17.61 
$3MP17.64 

SPA-RDW~10 
SSPPA-RDW-O(~ 
S S P P A ~ - 0 0 3  S3MP17.6g 

SPA-RDW-011 $3~7.71 /$3AR16 
SPA-RDW-012 $3MP18.48 

$3MP18.48 S S P P ~ - 0 0 6  
SSPPA-RDW-004 $3MP18.49 
SSPPA-RDW-006 S3MP1 g.0~ 

SPA-RDW-013 S3MPlg.06 i 
SPA-RDW-O18 S3MP19.05 

SSPPA-RDW-007 $3MP19.0~' 
SPA-RDW-014 S3MP19.0g 
SPA-RDW-015 $3MP19.10 
SPA-RDW-O17 $3MP19.13 

SSPPA-RDW-008 $3MP19.17 
SPA-RDW-,018 $3MP19.50 

S3MP19.g7 SPA-RDW-019 
SPA-RDW-020 S3kq~20.g6 
SPA-RDW-(]Q1 $3MP20.96 ~ 

SSPPA-RDW-00~ S3MP20.gB 
SPA-VRS-007 $3MP21.45 

s~ng 
Twomlle Run 
OverflOW Or, arln~ - SPA-ROW-007 
s~p 

H~Ir~ 
T~mrnile Run 

s~r~ 
Unname~ T#out~ to Twom~e Run 
(~ r f low channel - SPA-RDW-015 
sp~ 
Unnamed T ~ l a r y  to T,~c~cnile Run 
~ T ~ . ~ y  lo Twomile Run 
Lk~neuned Tn~.~y  to T,,~omile Run 

Unnanl~ T~J la~  to Twomlle Run 
Unnamed T d l x ~  to T~0edle Run 
Shtnto~m Run 
Unnamed T~0utary to Sh~tmm Run 

s~ng 

Unnamed Tdbu',~ to Sh~ovm Run SPA-VRS-(X~ $3MP21.46 
k c e u  Roede 

Ephemeral 
.4 

P ~ l a l  
Intermittent 

4 

.4 

N o t ~  
18 

4 

TSF 
2 TSF 

N o t ~  4 

Not ~ .4 
Perennial 20 TSF 
Penmnlal 

4 

4 

4 

Intermittent 

12 TSF 
Not Crossed -4 

Nol Cros~d -4 
No~ Crossed .4 
Nol Crossed 

4 

Intennltte~ 
4 

TSF 
TSF 

Not Crossed -4 
Pemnntal 1 TSF 
Perennial 4 TSF 

2 TSF 

Perenni,~ 
Not Crossed 

2•5 
Pemnnkd 

4 

TSF 
TSF 

perennial 6 HQ-CWF 
Perennial Not ~ HQ-CWF 

-4 Not C, mesed .4 
Pemcmbd 4 HQ-CWF 

Inten~tte~t HQ-CWF 

SPA-AE~0Q3 SIAR1 
SPA-AE~-(~Q4 SIAR1 
SPA-NAY-125 SIAR2 
SPA-NAY-068 SIAR4 
SPA-NAY-0~ SIAPA 
SPA-NAY-070 S1AR4 
SPA-NAY-071 $1AR4 
SPA-NAY-072 SlAR4 

Unnamed T d t x ~  to Lic~ Run 
Unnamed T d b u ~  to Wilk)w Run 
U~named Tr~ut~ to aam Run 
Unnarn~ Tdbuta~ to Barn Run 

unnan.~ Tmx~y to Bac~o~ C . ~  

Intermittent 5 CWF 
Intecmltte~t 5 CWF 

HQ-CWF 
Perennial 4 HQ-CWF 
PemnrCal 3 HQ-CWF 

I~term~e~t 2 ~ F  
Pececm~ 12 HQ-CWF 

Intermittent 3 ~ F  
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Table 2.2.1-1 (Continued) 

S'ne~  In.  ~ 

SPA-AES4X)4 SIAR18 
S PA-AES-005 S 1AR 18 
SPA~r-S-006 S1AR18 
SPA-AE~,007 SIAR18 
SPA-AES-008 S1AR18 
SPA-AES,.009 S1AR18 
SPA-AES-010 S1AR18 
SPA-AES-011 S1AR18 
SPA-AES-012 $1AR18 
SPA-AES-013 S1AR18 
SPA-AES-014 
SPA-AES~)15 
SPA-AES-016 
SP/~AES~17 
SPA-NAY-101 
SPA4~AY-1G2 
SPAWAY-10~ 
SPA4~IAY-104 
SPA-NAY-0~g 

S1AR18 
S1AR18 
S1AR18 
S1AR18 

SIAR18/S2AR1 
S2AR1 
S2AR1 
S2AR3 
S2AR10 

S PA4~AY- 100 S2AR 11 
S PArlAYS)g6 S2AR 13 
S PA~IAY-0~ S2AR 14 
S PAr lAYed7 S2AR 14 
SPA-NAY-0g~ 
SPA-NAY-08~ 
SPA~IAY~0~9 
SPA-NAY-0@0 
SPA-NAY,,O~I 
SPA-NAY-0CZ 

$2AR14 
$2AR15 
$2AR15 
$2AR17 
$2AR17 
S2AR17 

SPA-NAY~0~3 S2AR17 
SPA~IAY~e4 S2AR17 

W ~  

Urlnanwl~ Tdl~v~ bo ~ Cie~ 
unn~m~ T~=~ to Ho~, Cr~ 
~ Tnbuta~ to Standln~l Stone Creek 

U~Nmled Trg~z~ to S1andln,~ Stor~ Cree~ 
Ucu'mmed Tdbutm~ to Standing $Io¢~ Creek 
Unnamed Tdbular~ to Standing Slone C, mek 

Unnamed Tdbuta~ to Stand~ Slene Creek 
Unnamed Tdl~a~ to Standt~ Sto~ Creek 
Unnamed Tdt~a~ to Standin~l Stone Czeek 
Unnamed Tributa~ to Stan¢~ Stone Creek 
U n n e m e d  Trlbuta~ to S tanc~ Stone Creek 
smnu~ S~one Cm~ 
Um, am~ Tdbuta~ to S~'~nli Ston~ Cree~ 
Unnamed Tdl~Jtar~ to Stand~n~ Stone Creek 
~ Td i0u~  to Pe~l~l C_,rsek 
sp.w ,o  
z..~nam~ T~b~,a~ to 8ak~ Eagle C_,~ 
U~larned Tdbuta~ to B4dd Eaglo C n ~  
Unnamed TR~ar~ to I.R~e Mera~ Creek 
Urc~z'ned Tdbu~u7 to Mmsh Creek 
Pond 
Unframed T ~  to Mersh Cm~( 

Unn~uned T~bu~u7 to Coun~ Run 

Unnamed Tdbutan/to Coundl Run 
~ R u ~  

SPA-VRS-014 S3AR2 
SPA-VRS~)15 S3AR2 Council Run 
SPA-VRS-016 Two Rock Run S3AR3 

S3AR3 S PA-V RS~ 17 

Unnamed T~x~u~ to T ~  Rock Run 
U n n ~  Trlbuta~ to ~ Cre~ 
Council Run 

Unnamed Tdbutan/to Two Ro~ Run 

C~o~dng PIDEP Chlpt~ g~ 
Row Wklt~ ( ~ )  P~,,~e,~,~= 

Perennial 5 HQ~'WF 
Perennial 7 HQ~-WVF 
Pemcmkd 6 
Pecennlal 

HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 5 

Perennial 5 HQ-CWF 
Per~nlal 6 HQ-CWF 
Peretmlal 3 HC~3WF 

Intermittent 4 ~ F  
Pececlnlal 6 HO-CWF 

I n t ~  5 
Perenn~ 

Intewnltt~t 
Intermltte~ 

20 Pem~nlal 

~ F  
HQ-CWF 
HQ~WF 
HQ-CWF 
HCPCWF 

Penmn~ 6 HC~WF 
Perennial 20 ~ F  

25 CWF Pecenn~ 
4 Not Crowed -* 

I ~  3 CWF 
Intecndltent 3 CWF 
Intom'dtte~ 
Intem~tent 

4 

CWF 
CWF 

4 

Pere~nieJ 3 CWF 
Inten'nitte~ 3 CWF 

4 CWF Intermittent 
4 

Pe~rennlal 4 CWF 
Perennial 10 CWF 

F_pllemeral 
EV 

6 

1.5 C'WF 
Perer~tal 15 CWF 
PetennlaJ 10 CWF 
Pe~er~iel 20 E'V 
Peren~al 

0 

f l  

M 

I 

fo 

fo 

0 

t~  
Q 
Q 

Q 

t~  

I 
Q 

fo 
f l  
fo 

fo 

M 

0 

M 

Q 

t~  
Q 
Q 

0 
f l  

fo 

o u1 
I k-' 
k-' 
I 
o 
o 
o 



( ! ( 

Table 2.2.1-1 (Continued) 

LD. ~ 

SPA-VRS-018 

M l l ~ t  

S3AR5 
S PA-VRS-019 S3AR7 
S P A - V ~  $3AR14 
S P A - V ~  $3AR14 
S P A - V ~  S3A R 14 
S P A - V R ~  S3AR 16 
S P A - ~  
SPA-VRS-030 
SPA-VRS-0~I 
SPA-VRS-0Q4 

$3AR16 
$3AR16 
$3AR16 
S3AR16 

WstsYeody 

Unn~ned Tnl~la~ to KetUe Oeek 
T~cnile Run 
T~-nlle 

T ~  Run 

Tdbu l~  ~o Twomile Run 

Crossing PsI~P Chapter 93 
Flow Width (tim) c ~  __,:.~oe' 

Intermlffe~t 1 CWF 
Perennial 10 EV 

Internment 1 TSF 
Intermittent 1 TSF 
Perennial 10 TSF 
Pen~lial 3 TS F 
Perennial 
EFt== 
Perenn~l 

Intermittent 

TSF 
TSF 
TSF 
TSF 

SPA-VRS-~ $3AR16 Perennlel 3 TSF 
S P A - V R S ~  S3ARI 6 T~rnl le Run PecennlaJ 3 HQ-CWF 
S P A - V R ~  $3AR16 Ephemeral 3 I ~ F  Unnamed Td~ta~ to Twomile Run 

Tv~mlle Run 
Twomge Run 
Mk~dle Bnmc~ 
Twomge Run 
T w o m f f e ~  

$3AR16 
$3AR16 

S3AR16/S3AR17 
S~'~R16~3AR17 
S3AR16/S3AR17 

SPA-VRS-0~ Penmnial 
Perennial 

HCFCWF 
SPA-VRS-039 
S P A - V ~  
SPA-VRS-0~ 
SPA-VRS-033 

HQ-CWF 
Perennial 20 TSF 
Perec~lal 3 TSF 
Perenni~l 3 TSF 

SPA-VRS-026 S3AR16/S3AR18 T ~ n i l e  Run Perennial 3 HQ-CWF. TSF 
S P A - V ~  $3AR17 Middle Branch Pertmnial 15 TSF 
SPA-VRS-~4 $3AR18 Interrnitte~ 3 TSF 
SPA-VRS-025 $3AR18 
SPA-VRS-040 S3AR19 St'drdo~ Run 
SPA-VRS-105 S3AR20 TdlxJta~ to Shlntown Run 

1 

Unnamed Trlbu~r~ to T'c~"n M e Run 
Unnamed Tdbut~ to T~om~ Run 

Guu De~nalon. 

Pererw'~l 4 TSF 
PerecW~l I 0 HO-CWF 
Perennial 18 HQ-CWF 

Statl Wat~ Quality Cla~lflcalio¢~ PaDEP Chap~r g3 Protected Usee: CWF Cok:l W~ter F-mheqt; HQ = 
EV Excep~onal Value; and TSF = 

Adlace~ ~'aam; no¢ emend by the i ~ 0 e ~  ~n t ~  lS0-focX s~o'y area. 
Spdn~ end poo~ v#dx~ ckBa~aUcm = f lo~ .  
The rngeg0et I= be~d on tha ~uthemm~t ~ r e ~  ¢r~lng.  

HI~ 
Trout S ~  Fl~@~e~. 
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Table 2.2.1-2 

PERENNIAL, INTERMITTENT, AND EPHEMERAL WATERBODIES CROSSED BY THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPEUNE 

De~g~on' State County Wmerbody 
ROW Cro~Ings 

Croe~ng 
W=terbody Width 

Mlle, po~ Type (feet) 

PaDEP 
Chapter 93 

ClsssiflcaUon: 

SWV-KLF-001 WV Wntzal 
SWV-NAY-001 WV Wntzel 
SWV-NAY-002 WV Welzal 
SPA-NAY-150 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-151 PA Gree~e 
SPA-NAY-152 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-153 PA Greene 
SPAoNAY-154 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-155 PA Greone 
SPA-NAY-156 PA Gree¢~ 
SPA-NAY-157 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-158 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-159 PA Grmme 
SPA-NA~-160 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-161 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-162 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-163 PA Gree~e 
SPA-NAY-164 PA Gru~e 
SPA-NAY-185 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-166 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-187 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-168 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-169 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-170 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-171 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-172 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-173 PA Gree~e 
SPA-NAY-174 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-175 PA Greene 
SPA-NAY-176 PA Greece 

Trlbuta~ to Cap~ Run 
TrlbutStlf to Capl:O Run 
Tributary to Cappo Run 
T ~ r y  to Hamilton Run 
Tdl~dlr~ to Pennsylvania Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Tributary to Permsytvania Foal( of DunKard Creek 
TRouta~ to Pe~sylvanla Fock of Dunkard Creek 
T d b ~  to Pemnsyfva~a Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Tdbutary to Pennsylvania Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Tdl:utal~ to Hamilton Run 
Tdbutar~ to Hamilton Run 
Tr~outa~ to Hamilton Run 
Td'outary to Hamilton Run 
T~lout,~ to Garrtson Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Tdbut~ to Gardso~ Fock of Dunkard Creek 
Ganison Fork of Dunkard Creek 
TrixJtary to Gardson Fork of Dunkam Creek 
Tdb(J~/to Garrison Fod( of Dunkard Creek 
Tdl~'t~ tO Ganlson Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Tlfou~/1o Gardson FOfY, o( Ounkard Creek 
TnVoutary to Qarrtson Fork of Dunka~ Creek 
Tributary to Bloody Run 

Run 
T~3uta~ to Bloody nun 
T~0utary to Boody Run 
Beedy Run 
Tr ibu~ to Bloody Run 
Robeds Run 

0.00 

T r i ~  to Blockhouse Run 

0.05 
0.01, 0.01) 0.06 

1.19 
1.19 
1.19 
125 

Ep me,al 
Per~lnial 
Perennial 
Ephemeral 
Ephemeral 
F.pherne~ 
Intermittent 

2 
3 

N/A 
N/A 

3 
2 

WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 

2 WWF 
1.54 Inten~tlent 1 5 WWF 
1.88 Intermittent 1 WWF 
1 .g8 5 WWF Ephemeral 

Intermittent 2.28 2 W'WF 
2.30 Intermittent 2 WWF 

Intermittent 
Ephemeral 
Intermittent 
Pemcmlal 
Ephemeral 
Ep~erneral 
Ephemeral 
Perennial 

Intem'dttent 
Ephemeral 
Perennial 

2.30 
2.89 
2.95 
3.12 
3.16 

3 
1 

3 

N/A 
3 
2.5 

N/A 
WA 

2 

3.24 
327 
3.52 
3.52 
3.86 
3.94 

WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 

4.00 Intermittent N/A WWF 
4.04 Intermittent 1.5 WWF 
4.36 Pemnni~ 1 WWF 

10 Perennial 4.77 WWF 
5.56 Perennial 1.5 WWF 

Blockhouse Run 6.39 Perennial 12 WWF 
6.59 Perennial 2 WWF 
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Table  2.2.1-2 (Cont inued)  

l:)a•ll•W ' S ~  Cow,my 

Cn:~Cng PaBEP 
w ~ e r b ~  width Chapter 

Type (feot) CUas=iflcatloe ~ 
ROW Cros~nll= (~mJnu~ 

SPA-NAY-IT/' PA 
SPA-NAY-178 PA 
SPA-NAY-17g PA 
SPA-NAY-180 PA 
SPA-N&Y-181 PA 
SPA-NAY-18~ PA 
SPA-NAY-183 PA 
SPA-NAY-184 PA 
SPA-NAY-185 PA 
SPA-NAY-186 PA 
SPA-NAY-187 PA 
SPA-NAY-188 PA 

GWPA-LAF-001 PA 
Access Roldl 

SPA-NAY-189 PA 
SPA-NAY-190 PA 
SPA-NAY-191 PA 
SPA-NAY-170 PA 
SPA-NAY-169 PA 
SPA-SRC-001 PA 
SPA-SRC-002 PA 
SPA-SRC-003 PA 

,,~pp,d 
SPA-KF-001 PA 
SPA-KF-002 PA 

Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
G r l ~  

Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
Greene 

TrtlxJtmy to ~ Run 
Tdbuta~ to Tom Run 
Tributary to Tom Run 
Tom Run 

I Td'°utm7 to Tom Run 
Tril~u~ to Tom Run 
Tdbutar~ to Tom Run 
Tdt~4m/to Hoover Run 
Tributa~ to Hoover Run 
Tr~an/ to  Hoov~ Run 
TRoutary to Hoover Run 
Hoover Run 
sp~r~ 

7.00 
7.07 
7.50 
7.84 

Intermittent 
Ephemeral 
Perennial 
Perennial 

1.5 
.= 

WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 

8.33 Perennial 1 WWF 
8.61 Perennial 6 WWF 
8.63 N/A WWF 
9.23 

Ephemeral 
Perennial 
Epr~,~r= 
Ephemeral 
Intermittent 
Perennial 

N/A ~ 

9,24 
N/A 

1.5 

9.26 
9.26 
9.60 
10,55 

WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 

Not C ~  

Greerm Hoover Run AR-17 Perennial 3 WWF 
AR-17 I nteml~tteflt 1.5 WWF G r s e n ~  

Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
Gree~e 

TI~.¢III~ tO Hoover Run 
Td'outa~ 1o Boody Run 
Tdl~Aa~ to Blood~ Run 
Bloody Run 
Tn~.~u 7 to ~,ooo'y Run 
Tributary to Booo'~ Run 
Tributary to Bood,/Run 

AR-7 
AR-6 
AR'-6 
AR-6 
AR'6 
AR-6 

Intermittent 
Perennial 
Perennial 
Perennial 
Perennial 
Perennial 

1.5 
1.5 s 
1.55 
1.5 s 
1.55 
1.5 ~ 

WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 

° - '1  1 t "l 5 Greene PA Fork of Fish Creek Pip~rd Perennial 10 WWF 

= PaDEP Chapter 93 Clasalficat;oq: WWF - Warm Water Fishery. 
At the pip~lne ~ ,  the stream de.lops into a we~and, and therefore, has no stream crossing wtdth. 

* N~ cl~s~ed - seeps ~KI ~'ings. 
) Croases vta an e)dstlng culvert. 
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Table 2.2.1-3 

PERENNIAl., INTERMIt'rENT, AND EPHEMERAL WATERBODIES CROSSED BY THE TL-536 PIPEUNE 

0 

f l  

I 

f0 

r~ 
f0 

Cro~dng 
Strmun I.D.' Mlkq~ost Waterbody Row Width (feet) 

ROW C ~,:,~,~,,tp 
SPA-KDR-004 

GWPA-KDR-001 

SPA..KDR-006 
GWPA-KDR-002 

0.71 
2.00 
2.13 
4.76 
4.80 

Orebed Creek 
seep 
Redwater Creek 
Unnamed T d b ~  to Dutton Hollow Creek 

Dutton Hollow Creek 

Pe~enn~ 
Intermittent 
Perennial 

Internd~e~t 
Intem~ltte.t 

12 

Not Crossed" 
10 

PaDEP Chapter 93 

CWF 
Not Classified J 

CWF 
CWF 

Not Classified 
SPA-KDR-007 4.85 Perennial 3 CWF 
SPA-KDP,-008 4.90 Unnamed Tributarf to Dutto~ Hollow Creek Intorndttent 2 CWF 

GWPA-KDR-003 6.53 Intermittent 4 Not Classified 
Intermittent 

spr~ 
Sprig 
Unnamed Tdbutan/to Dutton Hollow Creek 

5.60 GWPA-KDR-004 
SPA-KDR-O09 5.64 Perennial Crosses RC~N = CWF 
SPA-KDR-010 6.64 Unnamed Tdbuta~ to Dutton Hollow Creek Perennial 10 CWF 
SPA-KDR-011 5.68 Unnamed Tributary to Dutton Hollow Creek F_phemend C .mssee ROW CWF 

Intermittent 
Epherner= 

GWPA-KDR-005 spr~ 
Unnamed Tn'outanf to Butter Creek 

6.47 

Cr -~ ,~  ROW 
7.63 SPA-KDR-015 
8.56 Unnamed Tributary to Butter Creek 

Unnamed TdOulanf to Butter Creek 
SPA-KDR-019 Intermittent 

Not Classified 

Not Classified 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 

SPA-KDR-019 8.59 Intermittent C r n ~ _  ROW HQ-CWF 
SPA-KDR-020 8.63 Butter Creek Pere~lnial 20 HQ-CWF 
SPA-KDP,-021 8.71 Unnamed T ~  to Butter Creek Ephemeral C _r,'u~___ ROW HQ-CWF 

Intermittent Unnamed T r ~  to Butter Creek 
Unnamed Tributan/to Butter Creek 
Unnamed T n ~  to Butter Creek 

8.95 SPA-KDR-022 
Not Crossed 
Not Crossed 
Not C r n ~ , ~  

SPA-KDR-016 
SPA-KDR-017 
SPA-KDR-018 

AR-2 

AR-2 Butter Creek 

Ephemer~ 

Perennial 

HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-C1NF 

D. 

0 hh 

O 
O 
U1 
O 

t~  

I 
o 

f0 
f l  
f0 

< 
f0 

M 

0 

M 

o 

' GAI des~g~d0n. 
2 PaDEP Chapter 93 ~ :  CWF = C~d Water Flsher/ancl HQ = High Quality. 
3 Seep6 and spdngs are not dum'f,~¢l by PaDEP Chapter 93. 
4 a Not ~ by the proposed i~peline or ROW, but exists within the project environmental study area. 

NOt croeaed by the propoeed i ~ n e ,  but ctoesee ROW. 
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Table 2.2.1-4 

PERENNIAL, INTERMITTENT, AND EPHEMERAL WATERBODIES CROSSED BY THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPEUNE 

Stream I.D. ~ M'~pe~ 
Not Croeud a SPA-KDR-023 

SPA-KDR-024 0.30 
SPA-KDR-0Q5 C , ~  AR-1 
SPA-KDR-026 2.26 

3.42 

w ~  
Unnamed Trrou~u~ to Wee1 Brerch GerMNee River 

SPA-SRC-001 

Unnamed Tflbut~u~ to We~l Branch Genesee River 
Unnamed Tdb~an/to Weet Branch Genesee Rivet" 
Middle Bmnc~ Genesee River 

PPA-SRC-002 C rc~,a AR-4 
SPA-SRC-012 4.29 Geneeee River 
PPA-SRC-001 Not C,~eee~ Pond 
SPA-SRC-011 6.48 

Unnamed Tdbutan/to Geneeee River 
Pool 

Row 
Intemli~en~JEphe me ral 

Perennial 
Ephen~r~ 

Crolllng 
Width (feet) 
NOt C ~  

15 
Not Crossed 

P=DEP Chapter 93 
t '~lnRlfipjd~nrl | 

HQ-CWF 
H Q - C W F  
H Q - C W F  

Perennial 20 HQ-CWF 
Perennial 2 CWF 

Pool NOt Crossed 
Perennial 30 

Not Applicable * 
C W F  

SPA-SRC-010 8.60 
SPA-SRC-009 6.76 

6.84 SPA-SRC-(X)8 
SPA-SRC-007 

UnrNs..~l Tflbutary to Turner Creek 
Unnamed TrilxXary to Turner Creek 
Unnamed Tn]x.C~f to Tumer Creek 
Unnamed Trllx~ry to Turner Creek 

8.82 Unnamed TrbJtan/to Turner Creek 
SPA-SRC-006 8.64 U ~  Tdbuta~ to Turner Creek 

SPA-SRC-0GSA Not ~ Unnamed T~0uta~ to Marsh Creek 
SPA-SRC-005B 9.68 Unnamed Tributary to Marsh Creek 
SPA-SRC-013 9.73 Marsh Creek 
SPA-SRC-004 Not 
SPA-SRC-003 

GWPA-SRC-O01 
Not C-. Oe~a~ 
Not C~u~,~ 

C~,,=,~ AR-8 SPA-SRC-0G2 

Unnamed Tributary to Marsh Creek 
Unnamed Tributary to Marsh Creek 
Sp~r~ 
Unnamed Tributary to North Branch Cowanesque River 

Nor~Omamental 
Ephemeral 
Perennial 
Pere~d~ 
Pere~nlal  
Spr~ner~ 
Ephemeral 
Perennial 

Not Crossed 

20 
4 
6 
2 

Not AppIV'=hl= 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 

Not Crossed CWF 
Perennial 5 CWF 
Perennial 10 CWF 
Perennial Not Crossed CWF 
Perennial Crosses ROW= 

Not Crossed 
Not Crossed 

Spdng 
Perennial 

CWF 
Not Appl~.~e 

C~/F 

' GA~ dealgna,o~ 

PeDEP Chapter 93 Cla~alficatlons: CWF = Co~l Water Rehery and HQ = High Quality. 

a No m ~  or cros~ng widths are provided because the slmam does not cross the i~oeline, but exists within the e ~ a l  s ~  area. 

4 Pools, ponds, and springs are not classified by PaDEP Chapter 93. 

s Not crossed by proposed pipeline, but crosses ROW. 
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V 

Table 2.2.3-1 

DEGRADED WATERBODIES WITHIN THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE AREA 

Waterbody 1 Milepost Impairment Cause 

Beech Creek S3MP1.21 Metals AMD 

Twomile Run $3MP17.59 Metals AMD 

Kettle Creek $3MP17.40 Metals AMD 

West Branch Susquehanna River $3MP14.48 Metals AMD 

Bald Eagle Creek $2MP19.05 PCBs Industrial Point Source 

Note: 

1 PaDEP (1998). 

V 
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Table 2.2.3-2 

SURFACE WATER SUPPLY WATERSHED AREAS CROSSED BY THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPEUNE 

County Munidlxdity System Name Use Type 

Distance Upstream 
of Surface 

Stream Name Milepost Water Intake (feet) 

St=dace W C v  Umrs 

Mifflin Union Chemgm Inc., Union Mill Division Industrial Kis~acoquilas $1MP19.43 Downstream 1 

Unio~ Ford New Hot]and Inc. Industrial K~hacoquilas $1 MP19.43 Downstream ~ 

Oliver Strodes Mill Pits and Plant Strodes Run Not Crossed = Not Crosseo "t 

Union Jam~ Hauthwo~' 

Mining 

Ir~aUon 

Unnamed Tn'outary to Strode~ Run $1MP16.11 2,3133 

Unruffled T r ~ l ~  to Stmdes Run $1MP16.41 3,750 ~ 

S1MP17.00 Unnamed Tdbutm~ to Strode~ Run 

K]shacoquilas 

Unnamed Tdbutan/to Frog Hollow 

$1MP19.43 

$1MP21.90 

7,152 ~ 

Downstream I 

11,180 a 

Centre Herds Tus~y Mounta~ SId Area" Commercial 

Pu~lc Water Supl~y Se-I~ce WCor Uxro  

Galbraith Pond Not Crossed 2 Not Crossed 2 

Centre Benner ~ State Pu~ic Spdng Creek Not Crossed z Not Crosse~ 
Correctional Facility '= 

Private Wata¢ Supply Surface Water UNto 

Centre Boggs Merdll Fisher Water Mlbst~rg Reservoir Not Crossed = Not C r o ~  
supply 

Surface water intake is located upstream of PL-1 EXT2 pipeline crossing. 
Surface water intake is located within • three-n~le radius of PL-1 EXT2 pipeline, b~t is not crossed. 

s Straight line distance from stream cros~ng to surface wator kltake. 
4 From tek~one communication with the PaDEP (Appendix 2-A). 

0 

(3 

M 

I 

fO 

f ?  
fO 

0 

t~  
Q 
Q 

Q 

t~  

I 
Q 

fO 
f l  
fO 

fO 

M 

0 

M 

Q 

t~  
Q 
Q 

0 
(3 

fO 
f ?  

PO 
0 
U1 

I 

I 
0 
0 
0 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 

Table 2.2.3-3 

DEGRADED WATERBODIES WITHIN THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPELINE AREA 

Waterbody I Milepost Impairment Cause 

Bloody Run 3.94 Siltation Urban Runoff and Storm Sewers 

Note: 

1 PaDEP (http:llwww.dep.state.pa.usldeputatelwatermgtlwqplwqstandardsl303d- 
04 15s. pdf). 

V 
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Table 2.2.3-4 

DEGRADED WATERBODIES WITHIN THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPELINE AREA 

Waterbody ~ 

Marsh Creek 

North Branch Cowanesque River 

West Branch Genesee River 

GeneseeRiver 

Milepos~ 

9.68, 9.73, 
and 

Not Crossed 3 

Not Crossed ~ 

0.30, AR-1, 
and 

Not Crossed 3 

4.29 

Impalrment(s) 

Organic Enrichment, Low Dissolved Oxygen, 
Urban Runoff, and Siltation 

Siltation and Nutrients 

Organic Enrichment and Low Dissolved 
Oxygen 

Siltation, Organic Enrichment and Low 
Dissolved Oxygen, and Point Source Organic 
Enrichment and Low Dissolved Oxygen 

Cause(s) 

Agriculture and 
Storm Sewers 

Agriculture 

Agriculture 

Agriculture and 
Municipal 

Notes: 

1 

2 

3 

PaDEP 303(d) list (2004). 

Milepost at which a stream within the contaminated watershed is crossed by the proposed pipeline. 

Not crossed by the proposed pipeline, but exists within the environmental study area. 
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T a b l e  2.2.4-1 

S E N S m V E  S U R F A C E  W A T E R B O D I E S  C R O S S E D  BY  T H E  PL-1 E X T 2  P I P E U N E  

LD. t 
i~ow c, , ,=, ,~,  

s t m  w~b~r Ou~'t~ 
IIIlepo~ W ~  Cl~fl¢=tlon = S4m~h,e Wm~edT ~ 

SPA-NAY-125 
SPA-NAY-124 

SPA-NAY-I~I 

SPA-NAY-127 

SPA-NAY-01~ 

$1MP3.57 
SIMF~.57 

SIMP3.Sg 

$1MP3.72 

$1MP4.22 
SPA-NAY-001 $1MP4.23 
SPA-NAY-0(X~ $1MP4.72 
SPA-NAY-004 SIMP4.74 

SPA-NAY-006 SIMPS.21 
SPA-NAY-O06 $1MP5.21 
SPA-NAY-007 Sl MP5.23 
SPA-NAY-0~e S1MP5.25 
SPA-NAY-O0~ S1MP5~7 
SPA-NAY-010 SIMPS.27 
SPA-NAY-011 $1 MP5.34 
SPA'NAY-012 $1MP5.36 
SPA-NAYS13 SIMP5.36 
SPA-NAY-014 $1MP5.41 
SPA-NAY-015 SIMPS.4,5 
SPA-NAY-O16 
SPA-NAY-017 
SPA-NAY-018 
SPA-NAY-019 
SPA-NAY-O~O 

SPA-NAY4~I 
SPA-NAY-0~2 

$1 MP5.51 
$1MP5.59 
SIMP5.60 
$1MP5.65 
$1MF~.31/ 

SIAR4 
S1MP6.88 
$IMP6.93 

T r ~ u ~  to Willow Run 
WIIow Run 

Wiow Run 

Unnamed Tdlx~u-/to Willow Run 

Unnamed T ~  ~o Dou,~ert~ Run 
Unnamed Tdbuta~ to Dou~hedy Run 
oo~t~ty Run 

~ Tdbuta~ to ~ Run 

Unnllfr)ed T ~  Io ~ Run 
Unnamed Tdlx~a~ to Dou~e~ Run 

l,,Innm~ed Td'outary Io ~ Run 
u,=a~x~ T,=.,t~ ,o Oow~x.V R~  
~ T # O ~  I0 Dot~erty Run 

UrmmTled T d b u ~  to D o ~ h ~  Run 

u n ~  TRY==7 to ~,W=,V Run 
Unnamed Trtlx~a~y to Barn Run 

Unmum~ T~0u~a~ to ~m Run 

I"IC~F, WTA 

HQ-~F, WTA 

I~F, WrA 

HQ~F 
I"~F 
~ F  
I"~F 

HQ*CWF 
H~F 
I"~F 
HQ.CWF 
t-IQ-~F 
I-~F 
HQ-~F 
H(~CWF 
I~F 
I"~F 
~ F  
H~F 
I"~F 
I-I~F 
I-K~F 
I'~F 

H~F 
HQ-CWF 

Ou'o~andino or e~ce~ q~, watem of partlo.~ar e ~  

Ou~m,~In0 or e ~  quallty;, watem of part.far eo04ogk~al 

O~s'larl~ng or ~ qu~ll~, watonl of ~u~tcuhlr ecological 
and r a c ~  ~lx~ance. 

outstar~W or e = e p t ~  qu=~ v . 
OutmnuJng o; e x ~ c x ~ u  qu,=~. 
O~n~ or ex~l~ quallty: and waters ~ do n~ mul 
t~e w~m qe~'y s ~  ~ v,~1~ the waters' 
d~gna~d b,meec~ me [30~d)r~s~o) l ~ r ~ .  

o u n , x e ~  or m~p~on~ q ~ .  

outstano~r~ of exc~p~o~ q ~ / .  
~ r ~  or e:=ep0=~ quay. 
ou=t='x:~ or o:,,=,pt~ q ,~  v . 
o u m m r ~  or e=ep'u~ q u ~ .  

~ a n ~ I r ~  c. ex,~o(~n= quay. 
Outmandlr~ or e~<~el q ua~. 
ou~e~ or ~ ~,~'/. 

o ~ i r ~  or ex~o~kx',aJ qu~/. 
Outstan~n~ or e=~o~om~ quay. 
O u ~  or ex~l~on~ quallty. 

Ou~sn~J~ or e x ~ a u l  ~=l~y. 
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T a b l e  2.2 .4-1 ( C o n t i n u e d )  

I.O ~ Mllepoel 

SPA-NAY-0~3 $1MP8.63 
SPA-NAY-0Q4 SIMP8.99 
SPA-NAY-0Q5 Sl MPg.00 
SPA-NAY-~Q7 SIMPg.10 
SPA-NAY-026 $1MP9.08 
SPA-NAY-(~8 $1MP9,23 
SPA-NAY-0~9 $1MP9.49 
SPA-NAY-030 $1 MP9.56 
SPA-NAY-0Q2 $1MP10.62 
SPA-NAY-OQ3 Sl MPI 1.52 
SPA-NAY-037 Sl MP11.55 
SPA-NAY-0~6 $1MPll.86 
SPA-DLC-001 $1MP12.17 
SPA-DLC-00~ $1MP12.27 
SPA-NAY-,045 S1MP14.24 
SPA-NAY-O46 $1MP14.24 
SPA-NAY-047 $1MP14.42 
SPA-NAY-048 S1MP14.43 
SPA-NAY-044 $1MP15.31 
SPA-NAY-120 $1MP18.11 
SPA-NAY-121 $1MP16.41 
SPA-VRS-011 SIMP17.00 
SPA-VRS-012 $1MP17.09 
SPA-VRS-013 S1MP17.22 
SPA-NAY-O67 $1MP19.43 

SPA-NAY-035 $1MP23.72 
SPA-NAY-0~8 $IMP24.74 
SPA-NAY-0~I $1MP24.78 
SPA-NAY-040 $IMP24.83 
SPA-NAY-041 $1 MP24.91 
SPA-NAY-042 $1MP25.00 
SPA-NAY-048 $1MW25.01 
SPA-NAY-043 $1MP25.01 

Wmtadlx~ly 

Urmamed Tdl~Jta~ to Ea~ Ucldng Creek 
Un~emed Tn~la~/to F.ast U c k ~  CrN~ 

Unnamed Td l~J~  to East Llckin~ Creek 
Unnam~ Tr~x~m/0o Emt Ud, dng C . ~  
U ~  Tdbut=7 to East ~ Creek 
E=t LW~W~ Cr~W 
~ Trfo~m~ to EMt L i c ~  Cre~ 
~ R u n  
Unnan'md T~0utary to C,~lm Run 
Unnamod Tfll~m~ to ~ Run 
~ Tdbuta~ to Cadede Run 
Unnamed T~Jta~  to Cadiale Run 
~ R I w ~  
U~mm~d Tdbut~  to Strode~ Run 
Spdr~ ~ Tflbula~ m SVo~es Run 
Unnamed Tdbuta~po ,S~0des Run 
Unnamed T d l x ~  to Suod~ Run 
Unnamed Tn~x~u~ to S~od~s Run 
U m a n ~  rrroum~ to Saodes Run 
~ T~auta~ to SUodes Run 
Unnam~ Trn~a,y to SUodes Run 
Unnamed T d l x ~  to SUod~ Run 
Unnamed Tn~Jta~ to Sbod~ Run 
~hacoq~as Creek 

Ea~ Brlmch of Standin~ Sto~e Creek 
Unnamed T d l ~  to Sta~llng Stone Creek 
Unnarm,d T~out~ to .S=nd~ S ~ e  Creek 
Unn~n~l T ~  to ~ Slot~ C t ~  
Unnamed T~butan/to Stancling Stone Creek 
unnan~ T~uta~/to S=ncV~ Stone Cr,~ 
Spdng Unnamed TrUx~ar~ to Slandtn~l $1o~ Creet 
~ T d b ~  to Slandln~ S~ne C~m~k 

I Sta~Wm~ O u ~ _  
C I ~ o ~  e 

HO-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
H Q ~ F  
HQ-CWF 
I-K~PC'WF 
HQ-C'WF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
~ F  
~ F  
HQ-CWF 
HO-C1NF 

WWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-C'WF 
HQ-CWF 
HCI,,C'WF 
HO,CWF 
HO-CWF 
HQ-C'WF 

CWF, WTA 

HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
~ C W F  

out~nc~  a~ e~,~'~,~ clu~- / . 

o ~ u ~  or ex~m~or~ q,.~ ~ . 

o~mn~n~ or ex~o~x~ q u ~ .  
out~an~ng or ex~ep~o~ clua ~ . 
ouw,~d~ or ~emkx~ ClUa ~ . 
Out,,a~Sn~ or ~ p ~ r ~  q u ~ .  
Out,.~lanolr~ cx eXCel~nal qual~. 
~ t~reata¢~ or ~lan~emd s p ~  ~ c~cal hab~at 
ouw, a ' , ~  or , ,=~k=m q u a .  

outm~r~ or e ~  q u ~ .  

outm~n~ of excep~n~ query. 
ou~an~ng or ~ q u ~ .  

o u w ~  or e ~  ClU~9. 

Wmm thal do nol me~ Itm v.~t~r quaBty standards assod~ted 
me waUws' dee~nat~ bene4~c~ use [~00<~(b)  re~,g]; 

8rid ~ I ~  than ~ree rr~es t ~ o ~ e ~  of pOlZlb4e ~ e r  

o u ~ r ~  o r e = e ~  q ~ .  

cut==,~l~ or e)¢ep~<x~ quality. 

0 

(3 

M 

I 

fO 

fO 

0 

t~  
Q 
Q 

Q 

t~  

I 
Q 

fO 
f l  
fO 

fO 

M 

0 

M 

Q 

t~  
Q 
Q 

0 
(3 

fO 

o u1 
I 

I 
o 
o 
o 



( ( ( 

T a b l e  2 .2 .4-1  ( C o n t i n u e d )  

Sa~m LO' M I k ~ t  
ROW Cromdn~l ~Contlnued) 

SPA-NAY-(]50 $1 MP25.91 
SPA-NAY-061 $1MP26.25 
SPA-NAY-062 $1MP26.31 

SPA-KLF-016 S~MP0.0~ 
SPA-KLF-017 S2MP1.72 
SPA-KLF-018 $2MP2.99 
SPA-KLF-019 $2MP~.54 
SPA-KLF-O~O S~MP'3.88 
SPA-KLF-~I $2MP3.88 
SPA-KLF-0~2 S~MF~.88 
SPA-GTR-001 S2MPS.0e 
SPA-GTR-O0~ S2MP~.08 
SPA-GTR-00~ S 2 ~ P B . O g  

SPA-GTR-009 $2MP6.21 
SPA-VRS-O0~ S2MPIT.IB4 
SPA-VRS-.010 $2MP18.42 
SPA-NAY-0~ $2MP19.05 

SPA-NAY-0~0 $2MP19.28 
SPA-NAY-066 $2MP19.39 
SPA-NAY-I~0 $2MP19.65 
SPA-NAY-058 $2MP19.80 
SPA-NAY-067 $2MP19.81 
SPA*NAY-061 $2MP20.16 
SPA-NAY-06~ $2MP20.28 

/S2AR11 
SPA-NAY-0~ $2MP20.30 
~PA ,-I'~AY-0~4 s2M~ao.e7 
SPA-NAY-G65 S2MP21.35 
SPA-I~Y-06~ $2MP21.40 
SPA-AES-002 $2MP23.24 

SPA-KDR-001 $2MP26.01 
SPA-KOR-01~ $2MP26.0~ 

W,tod~dy 

Unnamed T~out~f to S~mdJ~ Stone Creek 
Stend~ Stone Cre~ 

U ~ n e m e d  T~outar~ S t a r ~  S l o n e  Creek 
D e l v ~  Run 
S/nldn~ Ca'e~ 
Unrmmed Tdbu t~  to Sinldn~ Creek 
s ~  c_,~ 
unnemed T ~ t ~  to S~dr~ Creek 
S~Jng Cree~ 
Unnem~ T~bu~ to G~bro~ Gap Run 
U ~ = ~ T ~ / ~ S ~  C ~ k  
Unnamed Tdl~,da~ 1o SInldn~ Creek 

umam~ T,but~/=o S~Un9 C r ~  
Unn~,n~ T r i l x ~  to ~d~l Ee~k~ 
L/nn~,~l T d l x ~  ~ Bedcl F . . ~  
B ~ E ~ e  

u, ma,ned Trm~u~a,y m B~ Eap 

Unnamed T ~  Io Bak:l ~ 
Unnanled T ~  Io B~d ~e 
~ Unnm~mned T ~  ~ Bak:l ~ 
unnan~ Trmu~w ~o B~ F_a~ 
Unn~'r~ Tdbuta~y m Bak~ Ea~ 

S p ~  UNlame~ Tdbula~ to Bald E a p  
~ Trg~za~ ~0 B~cl E a ~  

ur~u~d Tr~xr~y to e~d Ea~  
t.it~ Man~ C~eek 

~ - ~  Ru~ 
V~z~ Creek 

s u ~  wm~- out.ty 

HQ-CWF 
HQ-C'WF 
HQ-CWF 

HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 

HQ.CWF, WTA 

,s.mm~-, wm+ueo~ 

Ou~a,~r 5 or e=:ep~n~ q u ~ , .  
Ou'cmm~ng or e x c e p ~  quam 7 
O ~  or excel~onal q ~ ,  or0~Jed less than 
three milee u~l~eem of pozlable w~ter Int~,e mmctme. 

O u ~ , ~ r  5 or exoe~ona~ quail. 
CWF Outstandlr~ or m~:eplk:~ q ~ .  
CWF Ot)l~andin~ or e~p~q~lsd qUai l .  
CWF O u l S ~  Or oxcep~oned ~m~b/ .  

CWF C~..~an<~h'~ or ex~c~om~ quamy. 
or e ~ p ~ o ~  quail. 

CWF Outstanc~n 9 ~ excep~k~ qo~,y. 
CWF C)u ln lnc~ o~ e x o e s ~  ~ . 
C- '~ /F C ~ 3 ( ~  or o x ~ ( k ) n s d  c J u ~ .  
CWF Located tn eemdt~ and protected watemhed areas. 
CWF Located bl een~lttve and protected watershed 8reds. 
TSF Wmem tPt~ do n~ meet f~e water quuJtty I;tandan~ smocked 

w ~  the wam~' dee~neted beo(dlc~ use (303(d)/305(b) ~ng]; 
wxf located In mm~4fve and protected ~ areas. 

C'WF Located t~ eenslflve encl FXOteCtm:l vnm)mr~d areas. 
CWF Located in sensltlve and protected watershed areas. 
CWF Located ~ 84mcq~ve and protected ~qttershed areas. 
CWF Located In s(msltJve and pn:~tected ~ 8reu+ 
CWF 
CWF 
CWF 

CWF 

Located In senellJve and peotoctod watershed areas. 
Located In eemJN~e and p(otected watershed ames. 
Locs ted  ~ e e n e ~  and  pmlec l ed 'wa l emhed  areas+ 

Located in eensa~ and pr0~cted ~ ar~s. 
CWF Located n ~ s R i w  end protected watend~ed arees. 
CWF Located In ~ and p~otected w a t ~  aree~. 
CWF : Located In eeneltlve and protected w~tershed areu. 
C W F  

I-IQ-GWF 

Waters 11tat do n~ meet ttm water quality slandard~ ~ a t e d  
the v~e~ '  c ~ n a t e d  ~ use [~O<d)~OS(b) ~ ] .  

Waters ff~t do not meet ffm water ~ / ~  slan~axds ~ l a t e d  
v d ~  ~ e  waters '  1 ~  g~+q: l  l~<~flclal u se  [303(cI}i+~o)  listing]. 
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Table  2.2.4-1 (Cont inued)  

LO' unepo= 
ROW Cn~ntp (Coa~M~ 

SPA-KDR-003 $2MP26.0~ 

SPA-VRS-O0~ $3MP1.13 

SPA-VRS-004 S3MP1.21 

$3MPI.21 

SPA-VRS-006 
SPA-KLF-001 S3MP1.56 

SPA-KLF-0~ $3MP2.28 

SPA-KLF-006 $3MP4.66 
SPA-KLF-006 S3MPS.00 
SPA-KLF-007 S3MPSJ~ 

SPA-KLF-~8 $3MP6~5 
SPA-KLF-00~ $3MP7.07 
SPA-KLF-010 $3MP10.31 

/$3AR12 
SPA'KLF-011 S3MP10.35 

/$3AR12 
SPA-KI.F-012 S3MP10A7 

/$3AR12 
SPA-KLF-013 $3MP12.29 

/$3AR12 
SPA-KU:-014 $3MP12.52 

/$3AR12 

sam water Ouallt,/ 
w,tm~dy Cmmleadon' 

Manlh Creek CWF 

Coullc~ Run C'WF 

Beech Cmek CWF 

C'WF 

Bealc~ml~ - ~ m ~  Creek 
Beech Creek CWF 

Beech P.Jeek CWF 

~ Tdl~dlr~ to Two Rock Run EV 
Unnm~ecl T~oulm~ Io Two FIoc~ Run EV 

EV S ~  U ~  Tdbu~uy to We~t Branch 
B~Run 

w - ,  ~ c ~  B~R~ 
Dndnage Unnamed Tributary to Bums Run 

Dr~lage Unnamed Trllxltary Io Bums Run 

O~r~ge Unnarnecl T ~  to Burrm Run 

EV 
EV 

EV, WTA 

EV 

EV 

~ W n w t ~ c t y  Crmw~ 

We~e*~ ~ do n~ m ~  ~ w~m~ c ~  8 t a n d ~  m ~ o ~ e ~  
me .mrs' ~ ~ ~ 130~d)ra0r~o) ~ 1 .  

~ o~ or du~neted to be added Io tt~ ~ Rlvem 
I n ~  or a state dve~ Invef~o~7; loca~m:l I~ ~ l ~ , , m  and 
p~ected w~m~ed areas; a~d wa~s that do nol meet the 
w~t~" qusJ~y ~l~ndard~ M~oo~lled ~h lhe w~tem' d~i~neled 

use F~x~mo~fm ~r~l. 
Rh,em on or de~m,~gn~ed Io be added Io lhe Ne~om,~de Rive~r~ 
Inve~ory or a slate dyer Inv~to~, locamd in samlth, e and 
ptolected wmendmd armm; and watem trod do nol meet the 
w e t ~  query m n a a r m  amodz~ed ~,~h tt~ * tara '  O e e ~ t , ~  
b ~  u~ Iao~d)r~s(b) ~ n g  I. 
Rlvem ~ or de~gnated to be add~l ~o the Nationwide ~ 
Invemo~ or a sla~ r ~ r  I n v e ~ ,  located In N n ~ v e  and 
protected watmsh~d meas; and waters fl~at do not meet ~he 

.so [~(oT~o~o) ,~,~. 
Rl'4~rs on or designated to be 8tided lo the ~ e  Rtvem 
Invonloty or a state river kwentory; located ~1 8~ls~flve and 
p~ected ~ areas; and watem lhat do not meet ~e  
w~t~ qua~ ~tandm~ a s s o c ~  w ~  the waten~ d ~ g n a ~  

out~anc~ or e=~o~x~ ~ .  
out,mm~ or =~ptton~ ~ .  
Outstanding or e x ~ , c x ~ t l  quality. 

o u ~ a n ~  or ecel:~,o~ clua ~ . 

Outstano~ or exceptional quay, wa~,~s o~ pa~ 
eco~g~ and recmatkm~ Vnpo~ance. 
OutstmcJk~ or exceptk~al quality. 

Outstmx~ n g or e~p~¢~]~l q u ~ .  

Unnamed T~,daW to Smith Run HQ-CWF Outstarcl~g or e~c~p~xx~ quality. 

Unnamed Tr~otary Io ~ Run HQ-CWF Outstanding or excep~onaJ query. 
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T a b l e  2 .2 .4 -1  ( C o n t i n u e d )  

v.o' n, a00olx~., 
n,,~w c~,..0.lp. (co,~a...d) 

SPA-KLF-015 S3MP14.48 

SPA-RDW-006 $3MP17.40 

SPA-RDW.007 S3MP17.5~ 

SPA-RDW-011 $3MP17.71 
/S3AR16 

SPA-RDW-,012 $3MP18.48 

SPA-RDW-0~0 S3MP20.g~ 
SPA-RDW-0~I $3MP20.96 
S P A - ~  S~MP21.45 
S P A - ~  $3MP21.46  

Stat~ Watw O w ~ /  
W~. 'body Cke~lne~oa'  

Weet B,'anc~ SunquC~nna FWer 

Kettle Cr~k 

T ~ n i l e  Run 

Huqng Br'~ch 

Twomge Run 

WWF 

TSF 

TSF 

TSF 

TSF 

Sh~ovm Run HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF Unnlned T d b u ~  Io ~ Run 

Tl~mn~ Io Shimo~m Run 
Uunamed Tdbut~  ~o Sh~nto~m Rue 

~ F  
HQ-CWF 

Senm'Uv~ W m d ~ , / C r l t ~  

Rivers on or de~dgnated to be added to the Nationwide Rl~rs 
I n v e ~  or a ~ate r~ver invet¢o~, a~l outsland~g o¢ 
e~ceptlonal quean, v,~ters that do not meet the water qualty 
standards ~ the waters destgnmed be~f lc~ use 
[3o~o7-~,<o-/~r~l. 
w ~ s  lhat do nol m ~ t  ff~ wat~w qualily standan~ ~ : ~ a l e d  

the . = ~ w  ~W~gn=~ b ~  u,~ [ 3 o 3 ( ~ )  ~,~g]; 
and sudace wat~m that t~ve been described 1~ ~¢n~led 

Walem ~lal do nol meet Ihe wets- query ~ d a r d ~  a~c~ab~ 
• ~h the ,,ram' m,~F~med bew~c~ use [3O~dy3O~) ~ 1 .  
Walem that do not meet the water quality [303 (dyS05(b) 

Wale¢~ Itmt do not meet Itm water quality slandards ss~oOa~d 
~ ~ '  ,~, ,-~,~. ~ b o ~ ) ~  ~ p0~oy'a0FXb) ~I. 

, ~ m ~ r ~  or excep~x~ quaY/. 
o u = ~ r ~  or o ~  quarm t . 
O~standln~ or ~ ,~ .~n81 quality. 
ouwmn~ or ox,~on~ qu~,.  

SPA-NAY-125 S1AR2 UnnanwId Trll~Jtanf to Willow Run HQ-CWF, WTA 

SPA-NAY-0~ SIAR4 Unnamed Tdbutl~ to Barn Run HQ-CWF 
SPA-NAY*0~I SIAR4 HQ-CWF 

SIAPA 
SIAPA 

SPA-NAY-070 
SPA-NAY-071 
SPA-NAY-072 SIAR4 
SPA-NAY-073 S1AR4 
SPA-NAY-074 S 1 AR4 
SPA-NAY-075 S1AR4 
SPA-NAY-077 SIAR4 
SPA-NAY-079 S1AR4 
SPA-NAY-076 $1AI~ 
SPA-NAY-0~0 S1ARTA 
SPA-NAY-061 SIAR7A 
SPA-NAY-0~2 SIAR7A 
SPA-NAY-083 

U ~  T I I ~ I ~  Io Barn Run 

U~1~m:l Tflbula~f Io B l a ~  Creek 

Unnemed Tdbuta~ 1o Elmt ~ C.,mek 
~ T d b t ~  to F.Mt Llckin~ Creek 

Unnamed Tn'butary to Eu l  L I c ~  Creek 
Unnamed Tdbuta~ Io Eut  IJcking Cr~k 

~ Tribu~ ~o EMt Lidd~ C~Nk S1AR7A 

HQ-GWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-GWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HO-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
~ F  
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 

ou~ma~r~ or ,~nI ' ,~al q u a .  
ou~mcnr~ ~ , , ~  quamy. 

C X ~ a n d ~  or excepto~al quality. 
ou~m~ng or e = ~ x ~  quamy. 

o = m , = ~  o,,. _~,.,,-.~,k~ q u ~ .  
or o ~  qua,'/. 

o u ~ m ~  or ~ q u ~ .  
ou~m~nl  ~ ~ quamy. 
Ommancrmg ~x ex~p~onal qual~. 
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T a b l e  2 .2 .4-1  ( C o n t i n u e d )  

s a w ,  LD' " , , p o ~  

SPA-NAY-084 S1ARTA 
SPA-NAY-0~ S1ARTA 
SPA-NAY-0~ S1AR7A 
SPA-NAY-0~7 S1AR7A 
SPA-NAY-11g S1AR11 
SPA-NAY-10~ SIAR14 
SPA-NAY-107 S1AR14 
SPA-NAY-10~ S1AR14 
SPA-NAY-110 S1AR14/ 

S1AR16 
SPA-NAY-111 SIAR16 
SPA-NAY-112 SIAR16 
SPA-NAY-113 S1AR16 
SPA-NAY-114 S1AR16 
SPA-NAY-115 S1AR16 
SPA-NAY-116 SIAR16 
SPA-NAY-117 S1AR16 
SPA-AE~-018 S1AR17 
SPA-AES,,019 SIAR17 
S P A - ~  SIAR17 
SPA-AES-~I SIAR17 
SPA-AES-0~ S1AR17 
SPA-NAY-118 S1AR17 
S P A - ~  SIAR18 
SPA-AES-004 S1AR18 
SPA-AES-005 S1AR18 
SPA-AES-O06 S1AR18 
SPA-AES-007 S1AR18 
SPA-AES-0(~ S1AR18 
SPA-AES-0~ SIAR18 
SPA-AES-010 SIAR18 
SPA-AES-011 SIAR18 
SPA-AES-012 Sl AR18 
SPA-AES-013 SlAR18 
SPA-AES-014 S1AR18 
SPA-AES415 S1AR18 
SPA-AES-016 S1AR18 

Wsterbod~ 

Unnamed T d l x ~  to E~t L I c ~  Cre~ 
~ e d  Tdbuta~ to Esst ~ Creek 
Unnamed T d b u ~  Io Eaet I.Ickir~ Creek 
Unnlmled Trll~ar~ to East Lk:k~ Creek 
U~anud Tdbutn~ to ~rode~ Run 
Urn.lined Tdbuta~ to Stand~ Stone Creek 
u , ~ n d  T ~ = y  = Ston=w S'U~ Cmo~ 
LW1amed Tdlxf, tu~ to Stsndln~l Stone Creek 
l~n~rnod Tributary to Standing Stone Crook 

~ TdlxJt8~ tO S~ncl~ Slone Cree~ 
UrNmed T~aut=7 to Stmx~n~ Stone Cree~ 
unnamed T~x~u7 Jo Ston~,~ S ~ e  Cre~ 
Umam~d Tr~utaqf to S = n ~  Stone C * ~  
Unnamed Tdbul~ to Standing Stone Creek 
Unnamed Tdlx~zu~ to Stancflng Stone CrNk 

smm=,~ stone c , ,~  
umarn~ Trmum,y ~o Sm,<~ S=o~ C,m~ 
Unnamed Tdbuta~ to Smr~ng Sm~ Creek 

U~lemed T d b u ~  to Slar, d ~  St~e Creek 

u , ~ o d  T~o==y ~o s = d ~  Sto,e C,o= 
Unnamed T ~ . / t o  Smn~ng Smae Creek 
Unnanted Tdlxt, a~ 1o Standlr~ Stone C,~ek 
Unnam~ T ~  to Starting St~e Cm~ 
Unnamed T~ut~/~o Starter Sto~ Cm~ 

Unnamed T ~ .  to Stan~n~ Stone Creek 

stst= wm~ ¢~gty 

I'K)-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 

HQ-CWF 
HQ.CWF 
HQ-CWF 
~ F  
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
~ F  
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 

HQ-CWF, MF 
~ F ,  MF 
HQ-CWF, MF 
HQ,-CW F, MF 
HQ,.CWF, MF 
HQ,'CW F, MF 

~ F  
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
HChCWF 
HQ-C'WF 
~ F  
HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 
I-~F 

O u ~ a r ~  or e=e]~'~d qu~d~. 
O~la~n~ or ex~tJo~ que~. 

~ ~ ) ~ o ~  ~ .  
Ou~'mn~r~ c~ ~ qua~y. 

ouu~ncru~ o~ e~mUo¢~ qu~. 

o~u ,~Jr~  o~ e x ~ r , ~ , ~  ~r,am. ~ . 

= e ~  q~Jt 7. 
o , ~ t ~ ( ~ 0  or ex,~p~,o~ q,e ,  v . 
( ~ n ~ r 5  or e x ~ o ~  cram ~ . 
( ~ m ~ r 5  or e = e ~ o ~  m,oJ~ / . 

oumt=xJr~ ~, ~ quemy. 
,~JUU~,dl~ ~ e = a ~  quota,/, 

Oumm,~ng or e x ~ F ' ~ l  qua ~ . 

Cutstandlng or ~ quallr/, 
O u ~ n ~  or ex~pUo~ q u ~  t. 

o u ~ t ~  or e~aUona) ciuaJ~. 
(:>.~m~r 5 or e=e~:~ )  q u ~ .  

Ommnd~ or ex~)~m('ml qua-/. 

0 

f l  

M 

I 

fo 

fo 

0 

t~  
Q 
Q 

Q 

t~  

I 
Q 

fo 
f l  
fo 

fo 

M 

0 

M 

Q 

t~  
Q 
Q 

0 
f l  

fo 

Po 
o 
u1 
I )-, 

~o )-, 
I 

o 
o 
o 



( ( 

T a b l e  2_2.4-1 ( C o n t i n u e d )  

( 0 

(3 

H~ 

I 

SPA-NAY-101 SIAR18/ 
S2AR1 

SPA-NAY-10Q S2AR1 
8PA-NAY-O~ ~2AR10 
SPA-NAY-100 S2ARtl 

SPA4~Y-092 $2AR17 
SPA-NAY'0e3 $2AR17 

SPA-NAY-084 S2AR17 
SPA-VRS-014 S3AR2 

SPA-VRS-015 S3AR2 

8PA-VRS-016 S3AR3 
SPA-VRS-017 S3AR3 
SPA-VRS-019 S3AR7 

SPA-VRS-0~ $3AR16 

SPA-VRS-0~' $3AR16 

S P A - ~  $3AR16  

S P A - V ~  $3AR16 
S P A - V I : ~  S3AR16/ 

S3AR17 
SPA-VRS-0~3 $3AR16/ 

S3AR17 

Sta~ Water Omdlty 
W ~  Cl~caUon' 

Slmldlng Stone C,m~ 
~ T d ~  to Stano'Ing Storm C~e~ 

Unnam, ed Tdbut~f,to Standl~ Stone Crae~ 
~rta~l~l Tdl~u~ to Bald E a ~  Cree~ 
Unnamed T ~  to BaJd EagleCme~ 

Coundl Run 
Unna~led Tlfl0~t~y to Roc~ Run 

Cou~l Run 

HQ-CWF 
HQ-CWF 

HQ-CWF 
CWF 
CWF 

CWF 
EV 

CWF 
CWF 

Coundl Run CWF 

Two Roc~ Run EV 
EV Unnamed Tdbutar~ 1o Two Roc~ Run 

I ~  Tdbuta~ Io Two Rod( Run EV 

Two~le Run HQ..CW F 

Unnamed Trlx~a~ t0 T~0~nile Run HQ-CWF 

Twomlte Run I.-IO-CW F 

Tv~ndM Run ~ F  
"Twocn~ Run TSF 

T~orttle Run TSF 

., s e ~ t v e  W~erbody Crlterl~ 

~ i ~  or e x c e ~  q u a .  
Ou~Sandin~ ~ ex~p~o~ q~amy. 

o==an~, w or e x ~  q~. 
Located tn sensitive and protected waten~ed areas. 
Located ~n = m ~ e  and I~Ote~l  ~ areas. 

W ~ t ~  that do not me~t ~ w~er quaflty ~ d ~  usoclated 
*~th me wmm' d~gmmm mmem~ use poa<cP~0~o) ,s~ng]. 
ov, m , ~  o~ e=:el~a~ qua ~ . 
R/veto on or ~ to be eddecl to the ~ Rive~ 
Inv~otmy or a s~ate river Invenll~. Iocatecl tn N~'~dttve ~md 
x o ~  v ~  a.n~s~ ~nd warm that do not ~ l~e 

W m  that do not meet the water quaJlty standar~ associated 

Wa~em ~at ~o not mee~ ~e  wate~ quality star~an~ assoc~eted 
w~ me *ater's d ~ n a t ~  ~n~nc~ use (:x:~d~'~o~o) u~ng]. 
ou~er~r~ ~ e ~ r ~  cl~ ~ .  

Ot.emtandlf~ or exceptlon~ q~lllty;, watem that do not mee( the 
wate~ queJlly stan~an~s assoc~ted w~'~ the waters desl~ecl  

use pc~a730r~) I ~ ] . .  
OutstaYing or e~cel~onal quality;, water~ that do nol meet t~e 
wa~" que~ty s ~ s ~ s  e e ~ c ~ d  v~t~ ~e  we~e~s ( ~ e d  

Oulatandlng or exx~o~xml quarry;, waters that do not meet the 
water quality standards associated ~ the watts de~gnated 
~ e ~  use a<~aT'aor~) ~ngj. 
O~slm~dlng or exce~on~ qu~l~, veatem lt~d do no~ meel the 
wsmr c~u~y star,ares sssoc~a~m ~ t ~  ~ s  ~ m ~ r ~ t ~  

Wate~ that do not mee~ ¢,e water qu~City ¢a~dards a~oda~ed 
v ~  the Watgf's de~nGte£1 ~ ~ e  [3~(d)/305(b) llstlng I. 
Wat~s mat do not meet t~e wa~r quality mandan~ assoclat~l 

the wm~s des~nat~ mme~c~ use (3o3(o73O5~o) ns~g~ 
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T a b l e  2 .2 .4 -1  ( C o n t i n u e d )  

81rlmm LD' M l l e p o a  W~ed)ody ClamdS:sllon' S,ns~ve w m r t ~ f  Cdter~ 

S P A - ~  S3ARle /S3  
AR18 

Twamae Run 

"Unnamed Td0uta~  1o Twon'dfe Run 

HQ-CWF, TSF 

SPA-VRS-~4 S3AR18 TSF 

S P A ~  $ 3 A R 1 8  Unnamed Tdbutm7 to TwomUe Run TSF 

SPA-VRS-040 S 3 A R 1 9  Shinto~l Run HQ-CWF 
SPA-NAyol0~ S 3 A R 2 0  Tdbutlm/to Sh~own Run 

Watem that do not rneet the v~ter quality slandards assocta~l 
~ wme~ c~nate~ ~ use [ ~ d ) / ' a ~ )  ns~gl. 

W~lenz that do not meet b3e wete~ quality ~tandands msoclaled 

w=em mat do ~ , , ~  the .a t=  query ~ . ~ s  aasoc~ted 

ou~anczw or ex=~o~= queV- , 

t 

St~to W~t~r Qua/~y C l a ~ l f l c ~  

P~DEP C I ~  9~ ProlBct~d I.,hw~ 

PFBC: 

CWF 
HQ 
EV = 
TSF = 
W W F  = 
MF  = 

WTA = 

Cold Water Fishery 
H~gh Query 
FJcepeor~ Value 
Trout Stoddl~ Fishery 
Warm Wale~ Flsl'en/ 
aera~y Rs~y  

Wlkl Trout Clam A SVeam 
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Tab le  2 .2 .4-2  

S E N S m V E  S U R F A C E  W A T E R B O D I E S  C R O S S E D  B Y  THE TL-492  EXT3 P I P E L I N E  

Stream I.D. ~ 
ROW Crm.dnip 

SPA-NAY-151 

Mllepoet 

S PA-NAY- 152 
SPA-NAY-153 1.25 
SPA-NAY-154 
SPA-NAY-155 
S PA-NAY- 163 
SPA-NAY-164 
SPA-NAY-165 
SPA-NAY-166 
S PA-NAY- 167 
SPA-NAY-168 
SPA- NAY- 169 

SPA-SRC-O01 

SPA-SRC-002 

SPA-SRC-(X)3 

1.19 
1.19 

1.54 
1.88 
3.16 
3.24 
3.27 
3.52 
3.52 
3.86 
3.94 

Wmorbody 

Unnamed Tdbuta~ to PA Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Unnamed Tdbuta~ to PA Fod¢ of Dunkard Creek 
Unnamed Tdbuta~ to PA Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Unnamed Tributa~ to PA Foal( of Dunkard Creek 
Unnamed Trlbula~ to PA Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Unnamed Trg3ula~ to Garrison Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Unnamed Tdbuta~ to ~ Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Unnamed Tdbuta~ to Garrison Fork of Dunkard Creek 

Tdbuta~ to Garrison Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Unnamed Tributa~ to Garrison Fork of Dunkard Creek 
Unnamed TributarJto ~ Fork of Dunkard Greek 
Bloody Run 

State Water 
Oumlty 

Classification ~ 

WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 
WWF 

AR-6 Unnamed Tributmy to Bloody Run WWF 

AR-6 Unnamed Tn'butary to Bloody Run WWF 

AR-6 Unnamed Tn'buta~ to Bloody Run WWF 

Sensitive W m d ~ y  Criteria 

WRAS plan. ~ 
WRAS pa~n. 
WRAS plan. 
WRAS pan. 
WRAS plan. 
w ~ s  p4an. 
WRAS p ~ .  
WRAS plan. 
WRAS plan. 
WR~S I~an 
WR~S p~n. 
Waters that do not meet the water quality 
standards associated with the watem' deeignated 
beneficial use [303(dy~Co) listing]. 
Waters that do not meet the water quality 
standards associated with the waters' desigllated 
benefctal use [303(d)/305(b) listing]. 
Waters that do not meet the water quality 
standards associated with the waters' de~gnated 

use [303 (d ) r~o )O~] .  
Watem that do not meet the water quality 
standards assec~l.ted with the waters' designated 
beneficial use [303(dy30~(b) listing]. 

Not~ :  

1 
I 
3 State Water Ou~ C~s,sJfica~on - PaDEP Chapter 93 Protected Use: WWF = Warm Water Fishery. 

WRAS -Watershed Reatora~on Action Strategies (PaDEP). 
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Table 2.2.4-3 

S E N S m V E  SURFACE WATERBODIES CROSSED BY THE TL-536 P I P E U N E  

State Water Quality 
Stream I.D. 1 Milepost Waterbody Classification = Sensitive Waterbody Criteria 

ROW Crossings 

SPA-KDR-015 7.63 Unnamed Tn"outary to Butter Creek HQ-CWF Outstanding or Exceptional Quality 
SPA-KDR-019 8.56 Unnamed Tributary to Butter Creek HQ-CWF Outstanding or Exceptional Quality 
SPA-KDR-020 8.63 Butter Creek HQ-CWF Outstanding or Exceptional Quality 
SPA-KDR-021 8.71 Unnamed Tributary to Butter Creek HQ-CWF Outstanding or Exceptional Quality 
SPA-KDR-022 8.95 Unnamed Tributary to Butter Creek HQ-CWF Outstanding or Exceptional Quality 

Acm.m Roads 

SPA-KDR-016 AR-2 Unnamed Tributary to Butter Creek HQ-CWF Outstanding or Exceptional Quality 
SPA-KDR-017 AR-2 Unnamed Tdoutary to Butter Creek HQ-CWF Outstanding or Exceptional Quality 
SPA-KDR-018 AR-2 Unnamed Tributary to Butter Creek HQ-CWF Outstanding or Exceptional Quality 
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t GAI designation. 

State Water Quality Classifications: PaDEP Chapter 93 Protected Uses: HQ-CWF = High Quality-Cold Water Rshery. 
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T a b l e  2 . 2 . 4 - 4  

S E N S m V E  S U R F A C E  W A T E R B O D I E S  C R O S S E D  B Y  T H E  T L - 4 5 3  E X T 1  P I P E U N E  

S ~ m  L D . '  I ~ t  Wmd)edy 

SPA-KDR-0~6 

Wlltlr 
OuaOlty 

Ckmmmoatlon ~ 

226 Mldole Branch Geneue Rtv~ HO-CWF, TSF 

SPA.SRC-002 N o t ~  ~ Tdbutexy to Noah Brzmch ~ F~ver CWF 

S P A ~  Not Cmeeed Unnamed Tributary to We~t Branch Genesee Rh,e~r 

SPA--KDR-0~4 0.30 

AR-1 

Nol Croeud 

SPA-KDR-~Q5 

~ T d b ~  to West Bnmch Ge¢~eee River 

U(lnemed Tdbcltary to West Branch ~ River 

unnamed T~x~uy to Ma,~h C ~  SPA-SRC-OOSA 

~ F ,  
TSF, WTA 

HQ-C'WF) 
TSF, W'rA 

HO-CWF, 
TSF, WTA 

CWF 

SPA-SRC=O06~ 9 . ~  Unn~n41d T d b ~  to Mam~ Creek CWF 

SPA-SRC-013 9.73 Mam~ Creek CWF 

Unnamed Tdl~Jtary to Marsh Creek ,SPA-SRC-004 

SPA"~RC-0(~ 

Not C¢o~ed 

N o t ~  ~ Trlbutar/to Mamh Creek 

CWF 

CWF 

SPA-SRC-012 4.29 ~ RMI¢ CWF 

Protected r, eh species (Amecica~ brook lamprey) md 

Watem that do not meet ~e  water query standards eesoctated 
v~h the *mere' d e e ~ e d  beneao~ u~e [303(dy'J~Co) k~ng]. 
W ~  tha~ do not meet lhe watm quaJtty standan~ auodated 
wah U',) waters' d ~ r m ~  m)('~',c~ uso [303(d)raOS('o) ) ~ ] ,  

Wrests thai do nol meet the water qua~W standards associated 
*~h the warns' du~gnmed ~nef~leJ use [303(dy305Co) ~ng], 
and ou~mnding o~ exce1~x~ qua', / . 
Walem that do not meet the ~ l e r  quality alandan~ eesoc~ted 
v/~th the watom' ~ benelc~ use 1303(dy'J05Co) ~ngI ,  
~,n~ o(.~)a~,ng o," o,o)ps, o ~  quay. 
WeCms thai do not meet the water quality slandan~ ae~c~aled 

wato(s lhat do n0t meet the wat~ quality slan(~u~ ees0dated 
~ t ~  *atem' dee~r~ed Z)em~c~ ~e  [3Oo(~y30r~o) ~n~1. 
W,eers that do not meet the water query standen~ assodmed 

Walrus thai do not meet the water quality standarda eesoc~eded 
with me wat,n' ~ n . ~  ~ use [3O~d)r~Ko ) h~n¢. 
Watecz tl~t do nol meet the water quallty ztandar~ ~sodmed 

W~em that do no¢ meet the water quak'ly slandwdl associated 
the waters' designated ~ c ~  u~e [300(dy30~Co ) ~n9]. 

N o ~ :  

1 
I StatgWlll~Qu~qyClam~calk]l¢ PaDEPC~93Pro tec tadUM~:  C'WF=CoklWmrFtlh~n~,~'~dHQ=H~hQu~dity. 

PFBC: TSF = Trout Stocked ~ and ~VTA - Clas~ A Wld Trout. 
NOt c~oeud by p m ~  p ~ ,  but eds~  w~ttln the e n ~  study area. 
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V 

Table 2.2.5-1 

HYDROSTATIC TEST INFORMATION FOR THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE 

V 

Pro]~ s~mem 
SeclJon 1 1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

SeclJon 2 1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

- - g  

Section 3 1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

R ~ S ~  

244rich 
Makdine 

PL-1 EXT2 

Water Source 
Test Segment 1 

Juniata River 

Junlata River 

Test Segment 3 

Kishacoquilles Creek or 
Test Segment 4 
Kishacoquillas Creek or 
Test Segments 1,2, 3, 
and 4 from Section 2 
Bald Eagle Creek and 
Test Segments 2 and 3 
Test Segments 3 and 4 

Test Segment 4 

Bald Eagle Creek and 
Test Segments 5 and 6 
Test Segment 6 

Bald Eagle Creek 

Bald Eagle Creek 

Badd Eagle Creek 
and Test Segment 7 
Test Segment 6 

Test Segment 2 and 3 

West Branch Susquehanna 
River end Test Segment 3 
West Branch 
Susquehanna River 
West Branch 
Susquehanna River 
Test Segment 4 

Test Segment 5 

Test Site (mllepoet) 
Fill 5.62 (Section 1 ) 
Empty 0.0 {Section 1) 
Fill 12.24(Section 1) 
Empty 5.62 {Section 1) 
Fill 12.24 (Section 1) 
Empty 15.31 {Section 1) 
Fill 15.31 (Section 1) 
Empty 17.44 (Section 1) 
Fill 17.44 (Section 1) 
Empty 17.44 {Section 1) 
Fill 26.87 (Section 2) 
Empty 26.87 (Section 2) 

Fill 6.82 (Section 2) 
Empty 26.87 (Section 2) 
Fill 9.77 (Section 2) 
Empty 6.82 (Section 2) 
Fill 12.23 (Section 2) 
Empty 8.77 (Section 2) 
Fill 15.68 (Section 2) 
Em~ 12.23 {Section 2) 
Fill 15.82 (Section 2) 
Empty 16.68 (Section 2) 
Flit 19.05 (Section 2) 
Empty 15.82 {Section 2) 
Fill 19.05 (Section 2) 
Empty 19.65 (Section 2) 
Fill 19.65 (Section 2) 
Empty 24.26 (Section 2) 
Fill 24,26 (Section 2) 
Empty27.26 
Fill 5.95 (Section 3) 
Empty 27.26 
Fill 12.02 (Section 3) 
Empty 5.95 (Section 3) 
Fill 14.68 (Section 3) 
Empty 12.02 (Section 3) 
Fm 14.68 (Section 3) 
Empty 20.33 (Section 3) 
Fil 20.33 (Section 3) 
F-ram 22.51 (Sect~n 3) 
Fill 22.51 (Section 3) 
Empty 25.62 {Section 3) 

Initial Fill 
(approx. 
aa.ona) 

667,960 

789,535 

365,592 

253,180 

235,636 

1,201,441 

495,493 

~0,620 

293,168 

410,840 

16,695 

384,266 

71,550 

549,202 

358,218 

869,680 

721,608 

287,824 

687,841 

259,285 

370,030 
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V 
Table 2.2.5-2 

HYDROSTATIC TEST INFORMATION FOR THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPELINE 

Segment 
1 

Pipe 
Size 

24-Inch 
Mainline 
TL-492 
EXT3 

Water Source 
West Fork of Fish Creek 

I 

I Test Segment I (push ahead) 

Test Site (milepost) 
Fill 0.00 
Empty 5.65 (push ahead) 
Fill 5.65 
Empty 10.77 

Initial Fill 
(approx. 
gallons) 
662,186 

595,101 

V 

V 
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v 
Table 2.2.5-3 

HYDROSTATIC TEST INFORMATION FOR THE TL-536 PIPELINE 

Initial Fill 
Pipe Size Water Source Test Site (milepost) (approx. gallons) 

20-Inch Mainline Genesee River Fill 0.00 792,000 
TL-536 Empty 9.49 

v 
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V 
Table 2.2.5-4 

HYDROSTATIC TEST INFORMATION FOR THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPELINE 

Pipe Size Initial Fill 
Segment (inches) Test Site (milepost) (approx. gallons) 

1 24 MP0.0 to MP0.7 8,800 

2 24 MP6.0 to MP6.1 5,500 

3 24 MP6.6 to MP6.67 10,600 

4 24 MP11.5 to MP11.6 3,500 

5 24 MP0.0 to MP11.5 1,365,000 

Not.__ee: Water sources will be the Middle Branch Geneses River at MP2.26 and the 
Geneses River at MP4.29. The water will be withdrawn and trucked to the five 
test segment sites listed above. 

V 

V 
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V 

Table 2.3-1 

SUMMARY OF WETLANDS CROSSED BY THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE 

V 

Map NW1 Croulng 
D~dgnatton Mllel~st Clm.dflclllorl I ( f l i t )  = (sere) 

Pert A. WetJands Crmmed by the PIpeline wtth HDD st Juniata Rivert Bald F-agle Creekp 

Area krea 
Affected Affected 

Length of During During 
Construction Operation 

(ml,.) = 
and 1-99/S.R. 0026 

0" WPA-LF-007 $1MP0.23 PEM 
WPA-LF-006 $1MP0.25 PFO 15 
WPA-LF-O05 S1MP0.40 PEM 114 
WPA-LF-O04 $1 MP0.47 PFO 0" 

$1MP1.14 PEM 0" 
W PA-AES-005 $1MP2.20 

$1 MP2.23 
$1MP2.28 

PEM 
PEM 
PEM 

36 
38 
0" 

WPA-AES-006 
WPA-NAY-047 
WPA-NAY-048 $1MP3.56 PEM 414 
WPA-NAY-O01 $1 MP4.23 Rivedne/PEMPFO 182 
WPA-NAY-004 $1MP5.21 97 
WPA-NAY-005 $1MP5.27 
WPA-NAY-006 $1MP5.33 
WPA-NAY-008 $1MP5.50 
WPA-NAY-009 $1 MP5.58 
WPA-NAY-010 $1MP5.64 
WPA-NAY-011 
W PA-NAY-012 

$1MP6.71 
$1MP6.83 

WPA-NAY-013 $1MP6.86 
WPA-NAY-016 

WPA-VRS-003 

$1 MP8.62 
$1MP8.84 WPA-NAY-016 

WPA-NAY-017 $1MP9.80 
WPA-NAY-020 S1MP11.b'7 
WPA-NAY-019 Sl MP11.63 
WPA-NAY-021 $1MP14.28 
WPA-NAY-022 $1MP14.41 

$1MP18.99 
$1MP17.29 
$1 MP22.51 

WPA-VRS-004 
WPA-NAY-018 
WPA-NAY-023 

SIope/PEM 
SIope/PEM 

Deprewdonal/PEM 
Sk~oemBWPFO 
SIope/PEM/PFO 

SIope/PEM 
Depn~nal /PEM 
Depressional/PEM 
Depmseionat/PEM 

S;ope/PEM 
S[oWPEM 

Depresslonal/PEM/PFO 
~ E M  

~preesionaVPEMmFO 
Depre~alonal/PEM 
Depre=~o~aUPEM 

PEM 
PEM 

D e p ~ E M  
PEM 

WPA-NAY-024 
$1MP25.86 
."gZ, l ~  

WPA-KLF-024 S2MPO.03 PEM/PFO 
WPA-KLF-O25 $2MP2.07 PEM/Fdnge 
WPA-KLF,O26 S2MP2.99 PEM/Frlnge 
WPA-KLF-027 PEM/PFO 

PEM 
PEM/PFO 

?T-J;~ ;411 ;E.?~; 
$2MP3.48 

7 
108 
38 
52 
o" 
0 ° 

0.14 
0.02 
0.30 

3663 
0" 
0" 

< 0.01 
0.03 
0.02 
0.01 
0.06 
0.39 
0.31 
0.10 
0.02 
0.11 
0.18 
0.05 
0.02 
0.06 

167 0.09 
400 0.66 
169 0.25 

3.74 
0.03 
0.02 

25 0.02 
33 0.03 

0.16 36 
0" 

157 
o" 

550 
9O8 

13 
0 • 
o • 

lt191 
0" 

0.28 
0.19 

< 0.01 
0.37 
1.16 
0.08 
0.01 
0.01 

$2MP3.88 
WPA-KLF-029 $2MP3.97 259 0.28 
WPA-KLF.,030 $2MP4.03 PEM 63 0.07 
WPA-GTR-001 $2MP5.06 470 0.80 PEM 

PEM WPA-GTR-003 S2MP6.0@ 77 0,14 
WPA-GTR..005 $2MP6.13 PEM 627 0.64 
WPA-GTR-006 $2MP6.32 PEM 0.65 

$2MP12,54 
$2MP12.59 PEM 

PEM/POW/PFO 

422 
0 • 

274 
243 

o" 

0.04 
0.22 
0.06 
0.00" 

WPA-WJW-002 
WPA-NAY-029' $2MP19.14 
WPA-NAY-030' $2MP19.24 PEM 

0.00 e 

0.01 
0.02 
0.00 ° 

< 0.01 ~ 
0.01 
0.01 

<0.01" 
0.09 
0.04 
0.02 

< 0.01 
0.02 
0.01 
0.01 

<0.01 ° 

0.01 
0.02 
0.09 
0.05 
0.82 

< 0.01 u 
<0.01 = 

0.01 
0.01 
002 
0.02 
0.04 

< 0.01 = 
0.11 
0.20 

< 0.01 
< 0.01" 
< 0.01 

0.27 
< 0.01 

0.06 
0.01 
0.11 
0.02 
0.09 
0.10 

< 0.01 
0.06 
0.06 
0.00" 
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Table 2.3-1 (Continued) 

V 

V 

Map NWl 
Dularmtlon Milepost Claulflelltton 1 

Part A. Wet~nds Crmmed by the l~pellne wlth HDD at Junlata 

Length of 
Cro~dn 9 

(re,t)' 
River, Bald 

Area Area 
Affected Affected 
During Dudng 

Commuctlon 0 1 ~ i o n  

F.Jgle Creek, and I-~D/S.R. 5626 

WPA-NAY-O26' $2MP19.28 PEM 
WPA-NAY-'027 $2MP19.40 PEM 

156 
0" 
0" 

0.04 
< 0.01 
< 0.01 WPA-NAY-028 $2MP19.64 PEM 

WPA-NAY-031 $2MP20.15 PEM 33 0.07 0.01 
WPA-NAY-032 PEM 156 0.22 0.04 

PEM/PFO 
$2MP21.37 
$2MP26.01 48 

0" 
WPA~ES-002 

PEIWFringe 

0.07 

0.04 
0.00 '~ 
0.00 ° 

WPA-AES-003 $2MP26.07 PEM < 0.01 
WPA-GTR-,O04 $2MP28.06 PEMPFO 627 1.07 @09 
WPA-KLF-O01 $3MPI.22 50 0.07 0.01 

S3MP1.58 29 
0" 

PEM 
PE~PSS 

0.07 WPA-K/.F-O02 

0.01 
0.00 ° 

WPA-KLF-003 $3MP1.60 0.02 
W PA-KLF-O05 $3MP2.32 PSSIPEM 12 0.11 0.01 
WPA-KLF-O06 $3MP2.37 PEM 0.01 

PSS $3MP2.38 
$3MP3.13 

10 
0* WPA-KLF-007 
8 

0" 
WPA-KLF-008 
WPA-KLI=-(X)9 

WPA-KLF-012 

0.01 
0.01 

<0.01 $3MP3.22 
Fringe/PEM 

PEM 

0.01 
0.00 = 

< 0.01 
0.00 ° 

< 0.01 
0.00 = 

WPA-KLF-010 $3MP3.24 PEM/PFO 36 0.14 0.01 
WPA-KLF-011 $3MP3.28 PEM/PFO 42 0.07 0.01 

$3MP4.58 PEM 0.50 0.10 415 
O* WPA-KLF-013 $3MP4.70 PEM 0.02 < 0.01 

WPA-KLF-014 $3MP4.99 PEM 36 0,06 0.01 
WPA-KLF-015 $3MP5.18 PEM < 0.01 
WPA-KLF-010 $3MP5.19 PEM 
WPA-VRS-O01 $3MP7.89 PEM 

$3MP8.59 WPA-KLF-017 
WPA-KLF-018 $3MP8.76 
WPA-KLF-019 $3MP10.47 
WPA-K1.F-020 
WPA-KLF-021 

0.03 

0.02 

3 
0 ° 
O" 
O* 0.01 

118 0.15 0.03 
56 0 .~  0 . ~  

PEM/SIope 
PEM/SIope 

PEM 
$3MP10.56 
$3MP12.29 

,'j :/~I ;.III =E* ~'.k I B  I!:'~_ ]~ [@ E ]IP~ 
WPA-RDW-001 

,]:(Z 0.04 
< 0.01 
< 0.01 

1 
0" 
o" 

< 0.03 

Depre~61o~al/Fdnge/PEM 
DetomukxmJ/PEM 

S op PEM 
Rivedne/PFO 

WPA-RDW-O02 

< 0.01 
0.00 ° 
0.00" 
0.00 ° 

<0.01 
0.00 ° 
0.00" 

S3MP14.54 

8 0.01 < 0.01 
29 

PEM 29 0.03 
O" 

< 0.01 

WPA-RDW-003 $3MP15,20 PEM < 0.01 
WPA-RDW-004 $3MP15.4,5 PEM 47 0.03 0.01 
WPA-RDW-035 $3MP15.58 PEM 0.04 0.01 
WPA-RDW-006 $3MP15.58 PEM 
WPA-RDW-007 $3MP15.60 PEM 

$3MP16.03 

< 0.01 
0.01 

58 
O" 
O* 

269 0.42 

$3MP16.31 

< 0.01 
0,00 ° 

< 0.01 
0.00 = 

67 
0" 
0" 
0" 

WPA-RDW-011 S3MP16.39 PEM 
WPA-ROW-012 $3MP17.61 PEM 
,W:J?L~WA'Lr~'£ $3MP17,69 PEM 

0 0 6  
<0.01 

0.03 0.01 
< 0.01 < 0.01 
<0.01 

0.02 
< 0.01 
< 0,01 

WPA-RDW-015 $3MP18.00 PEM 23 0.03 0.01 
WPA-RDW-016 $3MP18.46 PEM 29 0.01 < 0.01 
WPA-RDW-017 $3MP19.07 PEM 272 0.29 0.07 
WPA-ROW-018 S3MPlg.13 PFO/PEM 23 0.04 0.01 
WPA-RDW-01g 0.05 01 PEM/PFO 0.01 
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T a b l e  2 .3-1 ( C o n t i n u e d )  

v 

V 

Map NWI 
Deslgnatk)n Milepost Ctmlf lcat ion ~ 

Plut A. Wetland Croued by the PIp~lne with HDO at Junlata 

Area Ama 
Affected Affected 

Length of Dudng Dudng 
Crossing Construction O ~  

(fe~)'  1 ~ )  1 ~ )  
Rlver, Bald Eagle Creek, and F99/S.R. 0026 

WPA-RDW-020 S3MP19.49 PEM 99 0.16 0.03 
WPA-RDW-O22 $3MP19.96 PEM 64 0.10 0.01 
WPA-RDW-023 $3MP20.95 PEM/PFO 103 0.15 0.02 
WPA-VRS-002 $3MP21.46 PEM 86 

ACCeN Roads 
WPA-NAY-036 PEM 
WPA-NAY-035 
WPA-NAY-034 
WPA-NAY-033 
W PA-NAY-04,5 
WPA-NAY-046 
WPA-AES-004 
WPA-NAY-041 
WPA-NAY-O40 
WPA-NAY-O39 
WPA-NAY-O37 
WPA-NAY-038 
WPA-VRS-005 
WPA-VRS-006 
WPA-VRS-007 
WPA-VRS-028 
WPA-VRS-027 
WPA-VRS-026 
WPA-VRS-(~5 
WPA-VRS-024 
WPA-VRS-023 
WPA-VRS-0~2 
WPA-VRS-021 
WPA-VRS-020 
WPA-VRS-O19 
WPA-VRS-O18 
WPA-VRS-017 
WPA-VRS-016 
WPA-VRS-015 
WPA-VRS-014 
WPA-VRS-013 
WPA-VRS-012 
WPA-VRS-011 
W PA-VRS~ 10 
W P A - V ~  
W P A - V ~  
WPA-VRS-029 
WPA-VRS-030 
WPA-VRS-031 
WPA-RDW-O08 
WPA-RDW-009 
WPA-RDW-011 
WPA-VRS-032 
WPA-VRS..033 

AR4 ($1) 
AR4 ($1) 
A m  (Sl) 
AR4 ($1) 

AR16 ($1) 
AR16 (Sl) 
AR17 ($1) 
AR3 ($2) 

ARt1 ($2) 
AR13 ($2) 
AR17 ($2.) 
AR17 ($2) 
AR1 ($3) 
AR2 ($3) 

A m  (SO) 
AR3 ($3) 
AR3 (S3) 
A m  (s3) 
AF~ (SO) 
AR3 (SO) 
A m  (SO) 
A m  (s3) 
AR3 ($3) 
A m  (SO) 
A m  (s3) 
A m  (S3) 
A m  (SO) 
A m  (so) 
AR3 (SO) 
~ 3  (SO) 
A m  (so) 
AR3 (SO) 
AR3 (SO) 
AF~ (SO) 
A M  (so) 
AR7 (SO) 

~ 1 2  (so) 
.,m14 (so) 
AR14 (SO) 
A R 1 4 ( ~ )  
AR14 (SO) 
AR17 ($3) 
AR17 (SO) 

J:IZ 
PEM 
PEM 
;J=IZ 
PEM 
PEM 
PFO 
PEM 

PEM/POW 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 

PFO/PEM 
PFO/PEM 

0" 
0* 

160 
0* 
12 
0* 
88 
O* 
O" 
12 
O" 
0" 
0" 
13 
0" 

PEM 29 
PEM/POW 7 

PEM 0* 
PEM 
"J:l~ 

PEM/POW 
PEM/POW 
PEM/POW 

27 
0* 
23 
O" 
29 
O* 
O* 
O* 
o" 
o* 
o* 
o" 
o* 
o* 
O* 
31 
0" 
47 

152 

PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
;J=i~ 

PEM 

0.09 0.02 

0.01 0.01 
0.05 
0.13 
0.05 
0.01 
0.02 

0.05 

0.01 

0.13 
0.05 
0.01 
0.02 

0.10 0.10 
0.02 0.02 

0.01 
0.01 0.01 
0.01 0.01 
0.02 0.02 

< 0.01 < 0.01 
0.01 0.01 
0.01 0.01 
0.02 0.02 
0.01 0.01 
0.01 0.01 
0.02 
0.01 
0.05 
0.01 
0.02 

0.02 
0.01 
0.05 
0,01 
0.02 

0.03 0.03 
0.01 0.01 
0.01 0.01 

< 0.01 < 0.01 
0.01 0.01 

< 0.01 < 0.01 
0.01 0.01 
0.01 0.01 
0.01 0.01 
0.01 
0.02 
0.01 

X*) 
0.02 
0.01 

PEM < 0.01 < 0.01 
PEM I < 0.01 < 0.01 
PEM 8 0.03 0.03 

0.03 8 
0" 

0.03 PEM/Unear 

0.12 0.12 
PEM 2 < 0.01 < 0.01 
PEM 355 0.56 0.56 
PEM 117 0.98 0.98 

0.02 
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Table  2.3-1 (Cont inued)  

Map 
Designation Mllepoat 

Access Roads (Continued) 
WPA-VRS-034 AR18 ($3) 
WPA-VRS-O35 ARle ($3:1 
WPA-NAY-042 AR21 ($3) 
WPA-NAY-O43 AP.21 ($3) 

Part B. 

Part C. 

Part D. 

Area Area 
Affected Affected 

Length of During During 
NWI Cromting Construction Operation 

Ctasslficatlon' (feet) = (acre) (acres) a 

PEM 59 
PEM 0" 
PEM 0 = 
PEM 0 ° 

Part A Totals 15,031 
Change in Wetlands Croimed by Conventional Lay at 
Junlata RIv~ and HDD at Bald Eagle Creek and I-g9/S.R. 0026 
Change In Wetlands Crossed by Conventional Lay at 
Bald Eagle Creek and HDD at Junlata River and k99/S.R, 0026 
Change in Wetlands Crossed by Convontlonml Lay at 
1-99/S.R. 0026 and HDD at Junlata River and Bald Eagle Creek 

0.02 0.02 
0.01 0.01 

• 0.01 • 0.01 
• 0.01 
20.45 
0.00 ° 

0.49 

0.00 

> 0.01 
5.94 
0.00 = 

0.00 

0.00 

V 

N o t e s :  

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

? 

a 

PEM - Palusbtne Emergent Wetland; PSS - Paluatffne ScnJb-Shrub Wetland; PFO - Palustrtne Forested 
Wetland; and POW - Palustrine Open Water Wetland. 

"Length of Crossing" is the length measured along the centedine in plan view on the Construction Alignment 
Sheets. 

A 10-foot wk~lh of wetlends along the centedtne of the permanent ROW above HDD and conventional lay 
paths will be affected by construc0on end maintenance dunng operation of the pipeline for pedodic 
corrosio(vleak surveys; a 50-foot width of wetiands along the centedine of the permanent access roads was 
used to calculate area affected during operation 

The wetland is in the construction/operation ROW but is not crossed by the proposed ceofedine. 

Affected areas of less than 0.01-acre were counted as 0.01-acre in the totals. 

The wetland is not in the 10-foo1 operation maintenance width along the proposed centedine. 

The HDD path for Bald Eagle Creek v, dfl pass under this wetland. 

There are no wetlands in the HDD/conventional fay proposed constructlon/operation ROW. 

V 
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Table 2,3-2 

SUMMARY OF WETLANDS CROSSED BY THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPELINE 

Map 
ROW Crmmkt~l 

Area Area 
Affected Affected 

Length of During During 
NWI Crossing Construction Operation 

State County Impected Milepost ClessificatJon = (feet) = (acres) 4 (acree) s 

WWV-NAY-002 
WWV-NAY-001 
WPA-NAY-049 
WPA-NAY-050 
WPA-NAY-061 
WPA-NAY-052 
WPA-NAY-054 
WPA-NAY-053 

Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
No 

Yes 

0.00 
0.06 
0.45 
1.07 
1.19 

WV Greene 
WV Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 
PA Greene 

1 25 
1.46 
1.87 

PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 

PEM/PFO 
PEM/PFO 

PEM 

Not Crossed a 
Not Crossed a 
Not Crossed e 
Not Crossed ° 
Not Crossed ~ 

37 
Not Crossed" 

31 

0.02 
0.03 
0.03 
0.01 

< 0.01 = 
0.07 
0.01 
0.03 

0.001 
0.00 
0.01 
0.00 I 

< 0.01u 
0.01 
0.00" 
0.01 

WPA-NAY-055 Yes 2.24 PEM 280 0.16 0.07 
WPA-NAY-056 Yes 2.94 PEM 96 0.12 0.04 
WPA-NAY-057 Yes 3.06 PEM 4 0.02 0.01 

3.93 
3.99 
4.35 
4.74 
4.96 
5.14 
5.55 
6.99 
7.07 

WPA-NAY-058 
WPA-NAY-~59 
WPA-NAY-060 
WPA-NAY-061 

Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 

PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 

Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 

86 
Not Crossed e 

134 
154 
47 

Not Crossed ~ 
224 
170 
41 
70 
46 
51 
86 Yes 

WPA-NAY 062 
WPA-NAY-063 
WPA-NAY-064 
WPA-NAY-065 
WPA-NAY-066 
WPA-NAY-067 
WPA-NAY-068 
WPA-NAY-069 

0.17 
0.01 
023 
0.26 
0.03 
0.04 
0.36 
0.24 
0.03 
0.04 
0.07 
0.08 
0.08 WPA-NAY-070 

7.10 
7.82 
8.33 
9.23 

0.04 
0.001 
0.06 
0.07 
0.02 
0.001 
0.10 
0.09 
0.01 
0.02 
0.02 
0.02 
0.04 

0 

f l  

M 

I 

fO 

fO 

0 

t~  
Q 
Q 

Q 

t~  

I 
Q 

fO 
f l  
fO 

fO 

M 

0 

M 

Q 

t~  
Q 
Q 

0 
f l  

fO 

(3 

C~ 
U1 
I 

k-' 

k-' 
I 

C~ 
C~ 
C~ 
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Table 2.3-2 (Continued) 

I~p ~ lgn~ioe '  
Row Croeain~ ~oo~Unu~ 

WPA-LAF-001 PA 
WPA-NAY-071 PA 
WPA-NAY-072 PA 

I WPA-NAY-060 PA 
~ ~ y = r d  

County Impactad Milepost 

Greene 
Greene 
Greene 
Greene 

Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 

10.55 
AR-17 
AR-6 
AR-7 

Length of 
NWl Crossing 

Classification = (feet) ~ 

PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 

WPA-KF-001 PA Greene Yes Pfpeyard PEM 

Area Area 
Affected 
During During 

Construction Operation 
(,,=re,)' 

Not Crossed" < 0.01" 0.00 ~ 
Not Croseeo  ~ 0.16 0.16 
Not Crossed a 0.14 0.14 
Not Crosesd 1° 0.06 0.06 

Not Crossed ~ 0.00" 0.00 
Totals 1)557 2.49 1.01 

Not=: 
1 

3 

4 

8 

7 

8 
IP 

tO 

11 

GAI designation. 
PEM - Palustrine Emergent Wetland; and PFO - Paluatrine Forested Wetland. 
"Length of Crossing" is the length measured along the centedine in plan view on the Construction Alignment Sheets. 
The proposed construction ROW width is 75 feet. The affected wetland area calculations are based on a polygonal shape, not linear. The 
crossing width at the pipeline is the actual width of the delineated polygonsJ shape in the ROW. If the polygon wetland area encompasses 
the entire 754oot construction ROW, then the area of the polygon within this 75-foot construction ROW is used to calculate temporary 
wetland Impacts. 
A 10--foct width of wetlands along the centedine of the permanent ROW conventional lay paths will be affected by construction and 
maintenance during operation of the pipeline for periodic corrosion/leak surveys; a 50-foot width of wetlands along the centedine of the 
permanent access roads was used to calculate area affected during operation. 
The weIfand is in the construction/operation ROW, but is not crossed by the proposed centerline. 
The wetland is not in the lO-foct operation maintenance width along the pmpeaed conterline. 
The wetland is not crossed by the pipeline or ROW, but exists within the environmental study area. 
Affected areas ot less than 0.01-acre were counted as 0.01-acre in the totals. 
Wetland WPA-NAY-060 also crosses the ROW. Impacts for the pipeline crossing are included in the ROW crossing section of this table. 
No impacts are expected as DTI proposes to protect the wetland from impacts with silt fence. 

0 

f l  

M 

I 

fO 

fO 

0 

t~  
Q 
Q 

Q 

t~  

I 
Q 

fO 
f l  
fO 

fO 

M 

0 

M 

Q 

t~  
Q 
Q 

0 
f l  

fO 

PO 
0 
U1 
I 

I 
0 
0 
0 
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Table 2.3-3 

SUMMARY OF WETLANDS CROSSED BY THE TL-536 PIPELINE 

V 

Map 
Designation' Ml =o,t 

NWl 
Clmmiffcatlon = 

Length of 
Crmming 

NOt C ~  

Afflmted 
Dudr~ 

Construction 
(,,=re)' 

0.05 

Affl.l.,'ted 
During 

Opemtl .on 

r WPA-KDR-024 0.01 PEM/PFO 
WPA-KDR-001 0.61 PEM 210 0.17 0.14 
WPA-KDR-002 0.91 PEM 320 0.50 0.14 
WPA-KOR-O03 't.41 PEM 135 0.18 0.03 
WPA-KDR-O04 2.12 PEM 34 0.03 0.01 
WPA-KDR-005 2 . 4 1  PEM/PFO/POW 1.67 0.24 

2.g6 
1,030 

778 
WPA-KDR-007 1~079 

42 
3.12 

1.30 
2.08 PEM/POW 

5.68 

0.00' 

';~'J~ =~i]: E,Ik 

0.18 
0.28 
0.01 WPA-KDR-008 3.46 PEM 0.06 

WPA-KDR-009 3.72 PEM 150 0.13 0.03 
WPA-KDR-010 3.96 PEM 390 0.35 0.09 
WPA-KDR-011 4.13 PEM 128 0.11 0.03 
WPA-KDR-012 4.77 PEM/PFO Not Cro~md" 0.05 0.00' 

PEM 17 0.01 < 0.01 = 
PEM/PFO WPA-KDR-014 0.37 

1.11 
8.44 

WPA-KDR-015 PEM 
23O 

1,071 
239 

6.63 
0.05 
0.24 
0.05 WPA-KDR-016 6.98 PEM 0.35 

WPA-KDR-017 7.19 PEM 795 0.62 0.17 
WPA-KDR-018 7.95 PEM 278 0.29 0.06 
WPA-KDR-019 8.61 PEM 214 0.70 0.06 
WPA-KDR-O22 8.69 PEM 176 0.68 0.04 
WPA-KDR-023 6.84 PEM/POW 101 0.29 0.02 

PEM Not Croesed 0.00 
0.00 v 
0.00 ~ 

F~peyam 
PIpeyard 

State Line Station 
Not Cro~med 
Not Crossed 

PEM 
WPA-KDR-O20 
WPA-KDR-021 
WSL-AES-002 PEM 

Totals 11.10 

0.00 
0.00 
0.00 
1.88 

~ t o l l :  

1 

2 

3 

4 

GAI dealgne~on. 
PEM - Palustflne Emergent Wetland; PFO - Palustrine F o r e ~  Wetland; and POW - Palustdne Open 
Wote~ WeUsnd. 
"1.ength of ~ i n g "  is the feng~ measured along the cente~ne in ~ view on the Cort61nJclton Alignment 
Sheets. 
The proposed conslnctlon ROW w|dth is 75 fenL The affected wetlend area calculallons are based on a 
potygon~ ~ n e .  not llnear. The crowing wtdlh ot ~e  pipelk~ is the actual wkJth of the d(~lneatod 
polygo~ m in the RCM/. ff the polygon wedand area encompaues the entire 75-foot ¢onstmotton 
~ ,  then the area of the polygon wffi'dn this 75-foot construction ROW is used to calcuisto tamPOrarY 
wedand impact. 
A 10-foot ~dth o( wettEutds along the centedine o1 the ~ ROW above HDD end conven~enal laY 
paths w41] be affected by cen~nctlon and mabYmnence during opemtlen of the pipeline f(x periodic 
corroalon/lesk sm~ys; a 50-foot wk~h of wetfeeds a lo~ the centadlne o( the pen~ammt acce~ roads ~ s  
used to calculate area affected dudng operation 
The we6lmd is in the constmctlorVoperotlon ~ ,  but is not crossed by the p ~  ¢entedine. 
The wetland is not in the 10-foot opecatlon maintenance wldth along the proposed centorllne. 
Affected meas of ~ than O.01..acre were counted as 0.01..ente in the totals. 
No impac~ are expected as OTI proposes to protect the wetland from impacts wflh slit fence. 
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Table 2.3-4 

SUMMARY OF WETLANDS CROSSED BY THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPELINE 

Map Du~instion' 
WPA-KDR-025 
WPA-SRC-001 
WPA-SRC-OQ2 
WPA-SRC-040 
WPA-SRC-039 
WPA-SRC-031 
W PA-SRC-030 
WPA-SRC-029 

Milevost 
2.25 
4.26 
4 2 9  
4.42 
4.59 
6.06 
6.60 

Impactsd 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
No 

Yes 
Yes 

NWl 
Clessification= 
PEM/PFO/POW 

PEM 
PSS 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 

Length of 
Cro~dng 

(feet)= 
270 

82 
53 
43 

Not Crossed a 
Not Crossed' 

27 

Ares Afhmted 
During Con~ruction 

(.¢r~s}' 
0.47 
0.13 
0.12 

( 

Area Affected 
During Operation 

0.12 
0.03 

6.62 Yes PEM 288 

0.03 
0.03 0.02 
0.00 0.00 
0.01 o.oo' 

0.01 0.03 
0.12 0.42 

WPA-SRC-0~8 6.75 Yes PEM 194 0.29 0.09 
WPA-SRC-027 6.83 Yes PEM 92 0.14 0.04 
WPA-SRC-026 6.97 Yes PEM 43 0.04 0.02 

Yes 
Yes 
Y e s  

Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
Yes 
No 

Yes 
No 

Yes 
Yes 
Yes 

WPA-SRC-025 
WPA-SRC-024 
W P A - S ~  
WPA-SRC-022 
WPA-SRC-021 
WPA-SRC-020 

7.45 
7.46 

PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 

PSS/PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 

PEM/PSS 
PEM 
PEM 

PEM/PFO 

7.48 
7.68 
7.72 
7.74 
7.68 
8.59 
9.61 

No Ml~oo= L~t~ 

Not Crossed ~ 
Not C ressed ~ 
Not Crossed ~ 

148 
35 
17 

Not Crossed ~ 
Not Crossed ~ 

21 
Not Crossed a 

301 
Not Crossed = 

20 
Not Crossed' 

155 
37 

Not Crossed' 
33O 

9.68 
9.81 
9.85 
9.86 

WPA-SRC~19 

10.24 

0.02 
0.01 
0.01 
0.25 
0.06 
0.03 

< 0.01e 
0.14 
0.03 
0.00 
0.50 
0.00 
0.02 
0.01 
0.29 
0.05 

< 0.01" 
0.41 

o.o(f 
< 0.01w 
< 0.019 

0.07 
0.02 
0.01 
o.oo" 
0.00 a 
0.01 
0.00 
0.14 
o.oo" 
0.01 

< 0.01" 
0.07 
0.02 
o.oo" 

WPA~RC-016 

10.35 0.15 

WPA-SRC-017 
WPA-SRC-016 
WPA-SRC-035 
WPA-SRC-034 
WPA-SRC-033 
WPA-SRC-015 
WPA-SRC-013 
WPA-SRC-O12 10.31 
WPA-SRC-011 10.33 
WPA-SRC*010 

Yes 
Yes 
Yes 

0 

f l  

M 

I 

fO 

fO 

0 

t~  
Q 
Q 

Q 

t~  

I 
Q 

fO 
f l  
fO 

fO 

M 

0 

M 

Q 

t~  
Q 
Q 

0 
f l  

~0 

P0 
0 
U1 
I 

k- '  
(.0 
k- '  
I 

0 
0 
0 
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Table 2.3-4 (Continued) 

Map Deaign~on' 
WPA-SRC..009 
WPA-SRC-008 
WPA~SRC-002 
WPA-SRC-(X)3 
WPA-SRC-O04 
WPA-SRC-005 
W P A ~  
WPA-SRC-O07 
WPA-KDR-024 

MllalpOSt 
10.49 
10.53 
11.00 
11.07 
11.42 
11.47 
11.50 
11.52 

Access Road 1 
WPA-SRC-036 Access Road 4 
WPA-SRC-037 Access Road 4 
WPA-SRC-038 Access Road 4 
WPA-SRC-014 
WPA-SRC-041 = 
WHS-AES-001 

A ~ a =  Road 6 
Propoeed Access Road 

Haofson Station 

Impacted 
Yes 

NWl 
Classification = 

PEM/PFO 

Length of 
Croaudng 

(feet) = 
24 

Affected 
During Coflsbucflon 

(acre) '  
0.05 

Area Affected 
During Operation 

(acres) = 
0.01 

Yes PFO/PEM 19 0.08 0.01 
Yes PEM 11 0.01 < 0.01 w 
Yes PEM 243 0.39 0.11 
Yes PEM 111 

PEM 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 

PEM/PSS 
PEM 

PEM/PSS 
PEM 
PEM 
PEM 

Yes 
Yes 
Yes 

Not C r n ~ , ~  
Not C n'u=m=~ ~ 
Not Cr _,~u==d ~ 
Not C ~ '  
Not Crossed ~ 
Not Crossed ~ 
Not Crossed 7 
Not Crossed' 
Not Crossed ~ 
Not Crossed' 

Totals 

Y e s  

Yes 
Y a s  

Yes 
Yes 

0.15 0.05 
0.01 < 0.01 ~ 

< 0.01 = 0.00 a 
0.03 0.01 
0.03 0.03 
0.19 0.19 
0.12 0.12 
0.06 0.06 
0.06 0.06 
0.00 0.00 
0.00 
4.76 

NO 
No 0.00 

1.62 

N O t I ~ :  

1 
= 

= 

4 

GAI ~ .  
PEM - Palus~tne Emergent Wetland; PFO. Paluatrine Forested Wetland; and POW - Palustdne Open Water Watland. 

of Cro~aln~ is the length measured along the centedine in plan view on the ConstnJction Alignment Sheets. 
T I~  proposed cons~JclJon ROW width is 75 feet. The affected wetland area calculations are based on a polygonal shape, not linear. The 
cro~dng widlh at the pipeline is the actual width of the delineated polygonal shape in the ROW. If the polygon wetland area ar~compesses the 
entire 75-foot c o n ~  ROW, then ~ area of the polygon within this 75-foot construction ROW is used to calculate temporary wetland 
impacts, 
A lO-foot width of wetlands along the ¢entedine of the permanent ROW above HDD and conventional lay paths will be affected by construction 
and maintenance during operation of the pipeline for periodic corroaion/lesk sun/eys; a 50-foot width of wetlands along the centedine of the 
pem~anent access roads was used to calc~ate area affected during operation 
The wetland is not ~ by the pipeline or ROW, but exists within the environmental study limiL 
The wetland is in the constnJcffon/operetlo~) ROW, 10ut is not creased by the proposed centedine. 
The wetland is not in ffm lO-foot operation maintenance width along the proposed centodine. 
Affected areas of less than 0.01 -acre were counted as 0.01 -acre in the totals. 

0 

f l  
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Table 2.3-5 

SUMMARY OF WETLANDS AFFECTED BY 
CONSTRUCTION AND OPERATION OF THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPEUNE 

Part A. HDD at Junlata River, Bald Eagle Creek, and 1-99/S.R. 0026 

NWl Classification I 

Length of 
Crossing 

(feet) 

Area Affected 
During Construction 

(acre) 

Area Affected 
During Operation 

(acre) 
PEM 11,965 15.99 5.13 

PEM/PFO 2,675 4.02 0.57 
PEM/POW/PFO 243 0.06 0.06 

0.02 PEM/PSS 0 0.00 
PSS/PEM 12 0.11 0.01 

PSS 0 0.01 0.00 
0.08 PFO 29 

PFO/PEM 36 0.06 
PEM/POW 71 0.10 

Part A Totals 20.45 15,031 

0.04 
0.03 
0.03 
5.94 

V 

Part B. Change in Watiands Crossed by Conventional Lay at Junlata River and HDD at 
Bald Eagle Creek end 1-99/S.R. 0026 

NWI Classification I 
PEM 

PEM/PFO 
PEM/POW/PFO 

Length of 
Crossing 

(feet) 
0 
0 
0 

~uAf fec ted  
Dudng ConstrucUon 

( ~  
0 

Area Affected 
During Operation 

(scre) 
o 
0 
0 

PEM/PSS 0 0 0 
PSS/PEM 0 0 0 

PSS 0 0 0 
PFO 0 0 0 

PFO/PEM 0 0 0 
PEM/POW 0 0 0 

Pert B Totals 0 0 0 

V 
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Part C. 

Table 2.3-5 (Continued) 

Change in Wetlands Crossed by Conventional Lay at Bald Eagle Creek and 
HDD at Junlata River and 1-99/S.R. 0026 

NWl Classification I 

Length of 
Crossing 

(feet) 

Area Affected 
During Construction 

(acre) 
+0.12 

Area Affected 
During Operation 

(acre) 
PEM 0 0 

PEM/PFO 0 0 0 
PEM/POW/PFO 0 + 0.35 0 

PEM/PSS 0 0 0 
PSS/PEM 0 0 0 

PSS 0 0 0 
PFO 0 0 0 

PFO/PEM 0 0 0 
PEM/POW 0 0 0 

Part C Totals 0 + 0.47 0 

Part D. Change in Wetlands Crossed by Conventional Lay at 1-99/S.R. 0026 and HDD at 
Junlata River and Bald Eagle Creek 

V 

NWI Classification' 
PEM 

Length of 
Crmmlng 

(feet) 
0 

Area Affected 
During Con~ructlon 

(acre) 
0 

Area Affected 
During Operation 

(acre) 

PEM/PFO 0 0 0 
PEM/POW/PFO 0 0 0 

PEM/PSS 0 0 0 
PSS/PEM 0 0 0 

PSS 0 0 0 
0 
0 

0 PFO 
PFO/PEM 0 0 
PEM/POW 0 0 0 

Part D Totals 0 0 O 

Note:  

1 PEM 
PSS 
PFO 
POW 

Palustrine Emergent Wetland; 
Palustrine Scrub-Shrub Wetland; 
Palustrlne Forested Wetland; and 
Palustrine Open Water WetJand. 
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Table 2.3-6 

SUMMARY OF WETLANDS AFFECTED BY 
CONSTRUCTION AND OPERATION OF THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPELINE 

Length of Area Affected Area Affected 
NWI Crossing During Construction During Operation 

Classification' (feet) (acre) (acre) 
PEM 1,520 2.41 1.00 

PEM/PFO 37 0.08 0.01 
Totals 1,557 2.49 1.01 

Note: 

1 PEM 

PFO 

Palustrine Emergent Wetland; and 

Palustrine Forested Wetland. 

V 

V 
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Table 2.3-7 

SUMMARY OF WETLANDS AFFECTED BY 
CONSTRUCTION AND OPERATION OF THE TL-536 PIPEUNE 

Length of Area Affected Area Affected 
NWI Crossing During Construction During Operation 

Claeaification 1 (feet) (acre) (acre) 

PEM 4,975 6.59 1.29 

PEM/PFO 230 0.47 0.05 

PEM/PFO/POW 1,030 1.67 0.24 

PEM/POW 1,180 2.37 0.30 

Part A Totals 7,415 11.10 1.88 

V 

Not._~ee: 

1 PEM - 

PFO - 

POW - 

Palustdne Emergent Wetland; 

Palustrine Forested Wetland; and 

Palustdne Open Water Wetland. 
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Table 2.3-8 

SUMMARY OF WETLANDS AFFECTEO BY CONSTRUCTION ANO 
OPERATION OF THE TL.453 EXT1 PIPELINE FOR CONVENTIONAL LAY 

Length of Area Affected Area Affected 
NWl Crossing During Construction During Operation 

Classification I (feet) (acre) (acre) 
PEM 1,413 4.22 2.44 

PEM/PFO 354 0.46 0.16 
PEM/PFO/POW 270 0.47 0.12 

PEM/PSS 155 2.35 2.13 

PSS/PEM 301 0.50 0.14 
PSS 53 0.12 0.03 

0.01 PFO/PEM 19 0.08 

Part A Totals 2,565 8.20 5.03 

V 
Not.~..~e: 

f PEM 

PSS 

PFO 

POW - 

Palustdne Emergent Wetland; 

Palustrine Scrub-Shrub Wetland; 

Palustrine Forested Wetland; and 

Palustdne Open Water Wetland. 

v 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

w 

V 

APPENDIX 2-A 

CORRESPONDENCE FOR THE PL-1 EXT2 PIPELINE 

V 
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Pennsylvania Department of Environmental Protection 

Rachel Carson ~ :a~  Office Building 
I'.O. Box 855~ 

Harrisburg, PA 17105-8555 
August 11, 2004 

Bureau o fWatenhed  M ~ n g e m e a t  717-78"/-5259 

~ ¥od~ne 
570 Beatm Road 
Mo~ovviHe, PA 15146-1300 

Re: 

 004 

• " GA~ CONSULTANTS #NC. 
PROJ. N O .  - 

Location of Downstream Surface Water Users 
Joint Permit Application for I ~ m ~ o n  Transmission Inc. 
~,mim~ Hunfingdo .n, ~ CenU~ a~l CrOon Counties, Pemsytvm~ 

Dear Mr. Yoclna~: 

The Bu~u o f W ~  M~g=~t has complete d your requ~ for information regarding the 
~oCation of public wa~ supply ~ou~es ~ ~ water usc~ that am on~-mil~ downstream on water 

dies that cross the proposed natura[gas pipeline. T~. analysis'includ~i surface water intakes 
downstresm of your project area as identified on tlm Blah~ bf_tlls, McVeytown, Belleville, Barrville, 
Centre Hall, 1~ngovilk, BelleRmte, SnowShoes NE,, Renovo West, and Tamarack Pa 7.5-mlnute 
qmdm~gles. Based ~ o n  our G.IS c t m d ~ ,  t~ffi~ ~m no (0) imb ".~ wat~  s~pply s ~ c e  ~ ~ ~ 
there are three O) ~ water us=s for indusUial and ~ purposes located wRhin one-mile 

ofth~ natural gas pipeline. Locamd within a on.mile  radius of~he natural gas pipeline are 
~ - f o u r  (24) pubh.'o wah~r s~pply groundwater wells. Please see the attached tables ~oI information 
r~ding these v~ILs. 

-r~ ~ is cun~ e~ting t~ ~:of o~r ~xisting OIS dam~ mga~t~ 
PWS ~.urce locations, This location xequest should be ~ with the. ~prolxiam regional or district 
office. 

• . o 

The D c ~ z t m ~ / ~ m o ~ ' , h e  mtabl iahm~'aud delineation of a,~vllhead protection area to 
protect public water supplies from contamimlfio~ For your information, ~ regulations d e ~ e  
wv]/head protection areas ~s fvliows: 

Zo~ I - The ~ zone/mmediamly surrounding a well, spring or 
/nfiRm~n gal/ery which s l ~  be a 100 - 400 foot radius d e p e M ~  on 
site.specific muzce m l  aqu/f~ 

- TIz zone ~ncompassing the portioa of  the aquif~ tl~ough which 
wa~e~ is d iv~ed  to a we~l or flows W a s F ~  or h ~ x a ~ n  gall~7. • 
Zone TI shall be a one-half mile radius around the source unless a more 

d e ~ m ~ n i s  approv~  

www.dep.state.pa.us ~ , ~  on ~ v,~- 
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Z o ~  m - The zone beyond Zone H that contdbutes ~ water end 
groundwate¢ to ZonoI ami Zone II. 

In light of recent events, the Departm~ of Envlronmental Protection has temporarily suspended 
to preci~ he,ions of any p,bllo water supply souses ~lud~ intakes, wellheads. ~ .  as a 

precautionary action, Due to flxis restric~n, the Bureau of Wamrsl~ Management is not permitted to 
release any maps showing the looation (~clud£ug latitude and longitude) of PWS wells or ~ water 
intakes to the public. As stated above, our GIS datalmse ~ that tlzm are three (3) surface water 
inm,k~ lo~¢d  within one-mile downstretm of the pipeline" that m'e used fgr industrial ~ ~ 
purposes and there m-e twenty-four (24) public ~ supply groundwater wells within a one-mile 
of the pipeline. 

For information regarding the location of any prl#'at¢ water supply wells within your project " 
area, contact the Water Well Records Section'of the Bureau of Topographic and. Geoldgi~ Survey at 
717-702-2017 or visit their website to access the PA Crrou.dwater Information b~'1em (PaGWIS, onl#~ 
water well database) at.http'J/www.dc~.state.pa.us/topogeo/grotmdwater/PaOWIS/PaOWISMain.~. 

If you have ~y questions con~nlng the location request or mqulm ,~d~.~1 eformation. 
please contact me at 717-772-4050. 

Sh=em  

Aflame M. Pl 'oc~ 
Geotog~ Specb~st 
Source Prote~lon Section 
Division of W ~ s h o d  Protection 
Burma of Watmhed Mamgc~ent 

PADEP/NCRO/WaU~ Sui~ly Mamgement 
Pm)EP/SWRO/Water Sm, ly Mamgement 



.f .f 
Public Water Susm4v Sourc~ 
Dominion Transmission Inc. 

~---lt~s. ll.,,,thsodoa, M m ~  C _*-_tre. and Clinton Counties. P,~-svlvm~., 

Table I: Public Water Supply Groundwat~ were located within a 1-mile r a d ~  of the natural gas pipeline 

4140046 [ 002 
4~4oo92 oo~ 
'4140092 '002 
4140101 
4140101 
414ozts 
4140118 

4140122 
41~I~ 
4140840 
4,140892 
4180031 
4180031 
4180840 
4iso84o 
4340821 
4440010 
4440010 
4440310 
4440317 
44@.346 

001 
OO2 
007 

. 007 
oo7 
001 
003 
001 
001 
001 
O02 
ooi 
002 
001 
O06 
O07 
001 
0 0 - ~  

001 

Drilled Well #I [ Black Hawk Mobile Home Park ! EmOte Moblle Home Park I cC ' I 250 
Well#1 
Well #2 
Well #I 
Well #2 
Well #I 
w~#~ 
Well #I 
Wen 
Well #~ 
Drilled Well 
wdl 
Well I 
Well2 
W ~  #I 
Well - Motel 
Wdl#1 
Bollovtlle Well #6 

i 

Boll~iI1e Well #7 

Wdl 

~mpire Mobile Home Park 

s ~  w,~ A~_~ " 

M .mdo,w~ Psy~hia~o 

Sumet West Rmmurant 
Gr~ PA lae. 
:~nion Tram Letdy S , ~  
v ~ x i ~  Tram L ¢ ~  Station 
~ktai/L0dse on Kettle Creek 
~d~u~,Lodee,on Kettle Creek 
Chris~n Re,feet Cmter 
Lewistown B~m ~ AUh 
LewisWwn Boro Muni Auth 
Pletmnt View Sc,h~l 

West Oranville F~e Co. 

C 
C 
C 
C . 
C 
P 

C 
75 
75 
3OO 
3O0 

2500 
2500 
2500 
268 

P 
P 
P 
P 
E 
R 

• . R  

R 
. P  

F C" 35 
N. 500 P 
P 150 P 
P 18 P 

R 18 
~0 

P 
N P 

5O P 
N I00 

26765 
26765 

38 

C 
C 
P 

.p 

R 
P 
P 
P 

P 
N 

975 
25 

(~x4)364-!5~2 

~4)355-33o~ 
(81,4)355-7543 
(814)355-7543 
~t4)355-7.543 

(s]~)355-.s675 
(814)359-2783 
(814)355-47.61 
(57o~-o~ 
(sTo)s~.Osoo 

• (sT.oyr~-u#2 

(7,17")734-3627 
(TsT~a4s-o~67 

C7~67-63~ 
(7~7)242-o262, 

NA 
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 g ai c o n s u l t a n t s  
• tztralforoIbl 0 Ideas Into rea l i ty  

" r  

Date: 

ProJect/Admln. No.: 

GAI Consultants, Inc. 
570 BeattyRoad MonroevIIle, PA 15146 

Tel 412.B56.6400 Fax 4t2.856.4970 
www.g=loon= ultant=.com 

August 17, 2004 

C040177.40 

Call From: 

Company: 

MandyGaydash Tel No.: 412.856.6400 

GAI Consultants, Inc. 

Adanne M. Proctor Tel No.: 717.772.4050 

PA DEP - Bureau of Watarshed Management 

Surface Water Intakes 3 miles downstream of PL-1 Ext. 2 Pipeline 

Call To: 

Company: 

Subject: 

cG: 
I / - - i  , I • 

Summary of Discussion, Decisions, and Commff=nents: 

Called Adanne Proctor at 10 AM.on August 17, 2004 regarding any surface water Intakes 3 mites 

downsVeam of the proposed PL-I Ext 2 p~eline. 

Adanne celled back at t:10 PM on the same day. The following is the summary of her findings: 

• (2) Surface water Intakes, both used for Itdgaticn 

Tusay Mountain SId Resort, Centre Co., Harris Twp. 

H a ~ ,  James, Mifflin Co., Union Twp. 

O1 
O 

. . J  

• {1) Public surface water supply used for community purposes 

- RockvLew State Correctional Facility, PWSID 4140098, Source ID 001, population 2700 

O 

Q. 
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CENTRAL FILES  g ai  c o n s u l t a n t s  
blmlfotnQl~g ~ ~ telll~t 

August 5, 2004 

Project C040177.40 

Ms. AJ-lanne M. Proctor 
Source Protection Section 
Division of Watershed Pmtectfon 
Bureau of Watershed Management 
Rachael Carson State Office Building 
P.O. Box 8555 
Harrisburg, Pennsylvania 17105 

Dominion Transmlsston, Inc. 
Proposed PL-1 Extension Pipeline 
Location of Downstream Surface Water Users 

ProJect No. 
AMD __._____ 
DWO _.______ 
LRD ________ 

Pt' ..___.___.._ 
TNK --__._____ 
HAT._._.__...__ 

P, JH ...._.__..__ R ~ t o . . c ~ % p , . ~ % . ¢ _ ~  

JunI=~ta, Huntingdon, Mifflin, Centre, and Clinton Counties, PennsyNanta 

Dear Ms. Proctor: 
GAJ Consultants, Inc. (GAJ) Is preparing an application for the Federal Energy Regulatory Commission for 

~ l ~ a  Dominion Trensmlsalon Inc. (DTI) natural gas pipeline project that pa~ses through Junlata, Huntingdon, 
Mifflin, Cenbe, and Clinton Counties. All surface water intakes that are downst~rn of watarbody 
crossings need to be Included. Therefore, we are requesting information regerdlng the IocaUon of public 
water supply sources and surface water users that are one.mile downstream on watarbodles that cross 
the propoeed PL-1 extension pipeline. 

The quad sheets that cover the project area are Btalrs Mills, McVeytown, Beltevllle, Berrville, Cantre Hall, 
Mlngovlfle, Ballefonte, Snow Shoes SE, Snow Shoes NE, Renovo West, and Tamarack. Drawings 
(2004-177.-40-A001 through A026) are attached showing the exact proposed location of the pipeline for 
your use. Also attached are the stream tables. 
If you have any questions concerning the location request or require additional Information, please 
contact LIsa Keck or myseJf at 412-856-6400. Your timely response to this request would be greatly 
appreciated. 

8incereh/, 
GAJ Consultants, Inc. 

Precha Yodnane, Ph.D., P.E, 
Project Manager 

PY:MLGIJlm 
0417740~4d~o22 

q~v  ~ac~men~ 

i Beatty R o a d  Monroevllle~ PA 1';146 Tel 412,856-6400 Fax 412.856,4970 www.ga[consultantSo¢Om 
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Mandy Gaydash - RE: Water Supply Request (re.semi) 
I I I  I I I  I I I  I I  I I I  J i l l  

From: 
To: 
Date: 
Subjec~ 

"Proctor, Adanne" <arpmctor@state.pa.us> 
"Mandy Gaydash" <m.gaydash@gaiconsultants.com> 
9/22/2004 1:49 PM 
RE: Water Supply Request (re.send) 
, , , , , , ,  , 

Mandy, 

This is to Inform you that there are no new surface water users or groundwater wells serving public water 
supplies found within a one mile radius or three miles downstn~m of the Indicated pipe yards. For information 
regarding the location of any private water supply wells within your project area, contact the Water Well ReCords 
Section of the Bureau of Topographic and Geologic Survey at 717-702-2017 or visit their webslte at 
htto:/N/ww.dcnr.state.oa.us/toooaeo/aroundweter/PaGWtS/PaGWlSMaln.eao to access the PA Groundwater 
Infonnagon System (online water we# database). 
Please contact me If you have any questions or require additional Information. 

Thank you, 
Adanne 

Arlanne M. Proctor 
Source Protection 
Bureau of Watershed Management 
PA Dept. of Environmental Protection 
phone: (717) 772-4050 
fag: (71}') 787-9549 

----Original Mesage - - -  
From1 Handy Gaydash [mallto:m.gaydash@gak:onsultents.com] 
Sent= Wednesday, September 22, 2004 10:15 AM 
To: a~roctor@sl~e.pa.us 
C¢ Kant C~cktey; I ~  Flevin; Usa Keck 
S, , Id=~ Water Supply Request (resend) 

Dear Ms. Proctor, 

GA[ Consulter, s, Inc. (GA|) |e preparfng an 8pp|lc~lon for the Federe| Energy Reguleto~/Comm}sslon 
(FERC) for a Dominion Tmnsmlaslon Inc. (DTI) natural gas pipeline project that passes through Junlate, 
Mifflin, Huntingdon, Centre and Clinton Counties. FERC requires a list of all surface water Intakes end 
surface water users that are 3 mllea downstream of water body crossings. FERC also requires a list of all 
public and private water supplies within 1 mile of the proposed pipeline. As discussed, GAI has attached 
the ahepefllea for this project to Bid you In suppling the above referenced resources (file name PL- 
l_plpeyards.txt). The shapefiles attached show the location of the proposed pipeyard facilities for the 
project and ere not for public viewing. 

The Qued sheets that cover this project area ere Belleville, Mlngovlile, end Renovo West. 

If you have any quastlona conceming the Iocetlon request or require additional Information, please contact 
Lisa Kack or myself at (412) 476-2000. Your timely response to this request would be greatly appreciated. 

Sincerely, 
Mandy Gaydash Seade 

~e://C:Documcms%20and°/a20S ett{ngs\Oucst~ocaP/~20Sct~\Tcmp\GW} ~ 0 1  . ~  9/22/2004 
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APPENDIX 2-A 

CORRESPONDENCE FOR THE TL-492 EXT3 PIPELINE 

V 
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V 
Penns~4vania Department of Environmental Protection 

R~ehd Car~,,, State Otr~ee Building 
P.O. Box 8555 

Harrisburg, PA 1710~8~55 
October 26, 2004 

Bureau of Watemhed M~u~,emeat 717-787-$259 

V 

GAI C o ~  Inc. 
Attn: ~ Yodm~e 
385 East Wazerfi'ont Drive 
Homestead, PA 15120-5005 

Re: Location of Pubtic Water Supply Sources and Surface Water Users 
Dom/nion Transm/ssion Inc. - Proposed TL-492 Extension Pipeline 
Qre= Cou=y, p ~  

Dear Mr. Yodmme: 

The ~ of Wa~ed Management has completed your reque~ fur k£urmafion reganling the 
location of public water supply (PWS) groundwate~ wells ~ a one-mik radius of the pLpeHne and 
PWS surfacc water intakes m~d inivate surface ~ u.wrs wlthin tln'ee nn'les d o ~  on war~r 
bodies that c~oss the proposed TL-4~ ~m=sionp~pel/~e. The analysis included PWS sources wi~n 
the vicinity oftho Ixoposed ~ n  as/dentified on the Hunda~d, Holbrook, New Fre=port, and 
Wsdestown, Ps 7.5-mim~ quadrangl~ Based upon our ~ S  database, t h ~  are no (0) PWS 
g r o ~  wells located within a ono-mHe tad/us of the proposed TL-492 extension p/peline and ~ 
(0) PWS ~ water intakes or prlvate surface water users located within zhree miles downstream of 

The ~ is cun~ evaluating tl~ a,:cura'y of our existing GIS ~ rega~ 
PWS source ]oca~ona This location request should be verified ~ the appropdate regional or district 
o~r.e. 

The ~ Ixomotes ~ establishment and dd/neation ofa ~Ilhead Frotec~n mza to 
prom~ public water suppl/es from comzminatior~ For your/n~rmafion, current ~ define 
weIR~eed Izrotect/on areas as follows: 

Zonal- The ~ ~ne i=ma~mly sunuuading i we~ sla'ing or 
~ gallery whkh ~aall be a I00 - 400 fl)ot radit~ d ~  on 
si~-speci~ source ~1 aqu/fer ~ 

Zone n - The zone mx.npas~ the port~n of~ Jqulf= ~=ough which 
wmer is diverted to a we/l or flows to a spr/ng or infiltration galle=y. 
Zone It shall be a one-halfrafle tad/us around the source unk~  a morn 

delineation is z~rprove& 

~ ~ o ~ o ~  ~ www.dep.state.pa.us ~ = l ~ d ~  
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V 

Z o ~  ~ - The zone beyond Zone H tlmt ~ sm'fl~e wa~r  m~d 
E r o ~  ~o Zon~ I and Zon~ II. 

In light of  recent events, the ~ of Euvironmemal Pro~ction has mmporm~y suspeoded 
acc~s to p r e c ~  lomfiom of  any public wa~r s,pply sources including ~ s k e ~  w e ~  ~ ~ a 
precautlom~ action. I)ue m tl~s ~ tt~ Bumm~ ofWatershed ~ is not pem~ed  ~o 
release ~ny rasps showing ~Ze locs~ion ( inchu t~  Iatimde and lo~itude) of  PWS wells or su~w~ water 
intakes ~o the public. As stated a b o ~  o ~  OIS dmbase indicat~ thst tIz=e are no (0) pubtic w ~ r  
supply g r o ~  we~s wlthln a one-mile radius of  the p~pel~ne m~d no (0) sur/~e water i n ~ e s  
k~aed  within ~hree miles downstream of  the pipeline. 

For infornmtlon reg~iin8 the location ofm~, p ~ a ~  v,~cr supply wells within your p~oject 
con~ct the Water Wen.Records Section ofthe Bureau of Topographic and Geologic Survey at 

717-702-2017 or visit thelr webs~e to ~cem the PA ~ o u n d , ~ e r ~ g ' ~ > s t e m  6PaGR~, o~dine 
water ~ n  ~ a b a ~ )  ~t h~p'l/www.dcur.st~e.pa.m~opogeo/gro~WI .S/PsGWISMain.asp. 

If you have m2y qumtiom co~emlng the locm~n req, est or require ~ti t ional  i n fo rma l , ,  
please con~u~ me at 717-772-4050. 

V 

Enclosm~ 

co: PADKP/SWRO/W~ Supply MsmSement 

Ar~m~ ~£ Pm~or 
Geolog~ Special~ 
Sour~ Pmtectlon Section 
D'rvision of W a ~ ' ~ l  Protection 
Bumsn of Watershed l~lmgement 
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 g ai c o n s u l t a n t s  

~ l ~ r m l ~  ~ mtO ~ . ~  

October 15, 2004 

P~ect c040177.40 

IVIS. Adanne M. Proctor 
Source Protection Section 

of Watershed Protection 
Bureau of Wlder~ed Management 
Rachae) Carson State Office Building 
P.O. Box 8555 
Harrisburg, Pennsytvanla 17105 

Dominion Transmission, Inc. 
Proposed TL 492 Extanslon Plbellne 
Location of Downstream Surface Water Users 
Greene, Permsytvanla 

V 

Dear Ms. Proctor:. 
GAI Con~dtents, inc. {GAI) is preparing an application for the Federal Energy Regulato W Commission for 
a Dominion Transmission Inc. (DTI) natural gas plpe~ne project that passes through Greene County. All 
surface water ]ntakea that are downstream of waterbody crossings need to be inc~ded. Therefore, we 

requsst~g Informaticn regardklg the location of public water supply souroea and surface water users 
that are le=s than three mile= ~ m  on w'~erbodte= that cross the proposed TL-492 extension 
pipeline. Also, we are requesting ~formatJon on mun~pel water authorities that have public water supply 
wells within a one-mile radius of the pipeline. 

The quad sheets that cover the project area ere Hundred, PA; Ho[brook. PA; New Freepqrt, PA; and 
Wadestmm, PA. Drawings (2004-177-40-A053 through A056) ere attached showing the exact proposed 
location of the pipeline for your use. 

If you have any que=tlons concerning the location request or require addi~onel Informatfon, please 
contact Lisa Keck or myea~f at 412-476-2000. Your timely response to this request would be greatly 
apwedsted. 

Sbcerely, 
GAI Cor~ultan~, Inc. 

~m Yodnane, Ph.D., P.E. 
Project Manager 

PY:MLG/cwl 

A1t~l~enls 

V 
I~ll~rgh OliVe 385 East ~t~fmnt Drive Hom~t~l, PA 15L20-5005 1" 412.476.200~ F 412.4761Q20 ~.galc~nr, ult~nts.c~ 
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From: MAVIS LUCAS 
To" ANNE HOWELL 
Dab; 1111104 11:47AM 
lubJ~d; Dorn~ion Request 

3 fBdli~u I o r~ t l  wl~in 3 mi~ clovm~egm - Hundm(I - Lit~to~ PSD - VW0105341 sewage ~ t m e n t  
facil~, Community of H-ndm~ VVV3305201 and The Spot WV@952020 ere groundwater facJlRiet Them 
is no mur~pa! water authority v~t~in a I mile radiui of l)ipei~ne in WEST VIRGINIA. They'l( have ~n Check 
w ~  ~e State of Penney~venia for Iny f zO(~ ,  tt~y may have. 

M ~  L L u c .  
Enwo.men~ Resource Specialist tl 
WV DMslon of Water and Waste MalwIQement 
801 57th Street SE 
Charleston. WV 253042345 
Phoee: (304) 928-0499 EExt. 1026 
F~: (304) ~ . 0 4 ~  
rn~amQw~lep.o~ 

V 
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October 28, 2004 

Project C040177.40 

  gai consultants 

Ms. Je~sica Gmsthouse 
Public Informmio~ Office 
West Vkglnia Dependent of Environmen~ Protection 
601 57 =' Street 8 .E.  
ChwlNton, West Virginia 26304 

Oomink~ Tranlmlssio~. Ino. 
proposed TL-492 Extension Pipeline 
Location Of Downstream 8urfaea warm" Users 
Wetzel C~nty, West V~lnia 

V 

Deer Me. Greathou=e: 
OAt Consultent¢ Inc, (GAd) is preparing en appltcstlon for the Federal Energy Regulatory Comm(s=lo~ 
(FERC) for e Dotal.ion Transm;,,sio~ Inc. (DT#) netur~ gas pipeline projecl Ihat crones • poltion of 
WeO~l County All surface water Intakes that are daw/lstream of watefooay crossings are a requ~ement 
to be irtc~ded M the FERC report. Therefore, we are requesting InfoffnetIon regKding the Ioca~o~ of 
pubic weter supply so~rces and surface weter usw8 that We l~e  ~6rt three m~tes dowrts~m on 
W|I~eT|30C~ll ~et cmu the proposed TL-492 extensi~ pipeline. NI0. We are requesting information on 
mtmicipal water auth(xit~m that have public water supply wells within a o~e-m~e m::~us of the pipl~ine, 

The quad sheet ttlat cover= the project area w/thin West Virg~le Is Hundred, PA; 
Drawing (2004-17740-A053) Is eltached showing the exac~ DrOpOSlKI location of the Dipe~e for your 
use. 

ff youhlve any questions concerning the Iocabon request o¢ require edd~io~al infotmeSoa, please 
(;0~ltact lisa Ked( or mysedf at 412-476-2000. Your timely response to this ~equest would he greatly 
epprKMled. 

SIn~eJy, 
~ed Ccmnsu~tan~. inc. 

Preohe Yodrmne. Ph.D.. P.E. 
Project Manager 

PY:MLe/mlm 
o41Tr~4Cz-~t.k~n~ 

.~tadwente 

P~Cf,~'qh O~e ~$ ~ W3"~WrOflt O~ve 11~11¢StC4d, PA 151~0"$0Q'; 1" 412.476.Z000 F 412.~76.20Z0 www.9~dconsul 

J 

i~t6.G0m 
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Joe Mtuehin HI 
Governor 

@ 
STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES 

GAI Consultants, Inc. 
% Dr. Preeha Yodnane, P.E. 
385 East Waterfront Drive 
Homestead, PA 15120-5005 

January 25, 2005 JAN 2 8 2UU5 

GAI CONSULTANTS INC. 
pRoJ. NO 

RE: Information Requests Concerning Public Surface Water intakes for Dominion 
Transmission, Inc. TL-492 EXT3 Natural Gas Pipeline Project in Wetzel County, 
WEST VIRGINIA 

Dear Dr. Yodnane: 

In response to your informational requests dated January 14, 2005, based on cm'rent 
information, there is no public Surface Water Intake within one mile of the proposed natural gas 
pipeline in Wetzel County. 

I hope the information provided helps you with the completion of this project. If you have 
any questions, please do not hesitate to contact Dr. Jonathan Feng, GIS Adminis~'ator, at (304) 558- 
6764. 

Sincerely, 

William J. T~mey,  C.P.G., Manager 
Source Water Assessment and Protection 

Enclosure 

WJT/jf 

W BUREAU FOR PUBLIC HEALTH 
OFFICE OF ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH SERVICES 

Capitol and Wmhington Streets 
I Dav/s Square, Suite 200 

ChaHe~on, West Virginia 25301-1798 
Telephone: (304) 558-2981 FAX: (304) 558-1291 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 

OENTR/ L FILES  g ai c o n s u l t a n t s  
trensformlng ~deal: Into teJlhty 

January 14, 2005 

Project C040177.40 

Mr. William Toomey 
Wellhead Protection Program 
Environmental Engineering Division 
815 Quarrier Street, Suite 418 
Charleston, West Virginia 25301 

Dominion Transmission, Inc. 
Proposed TL-4g2 EXT3 Pipeline 
Wellhead Protection Areas 
Wetzel County, West Virginia 

Dear Mr. Toomey: 
GAI Consultants, Inc. (GAll is preparing an application for the Federal Energy Regulatory 

~lrCommission for a Dominion Transmission, Inc. (DTI) natural gas pipeline project that passes 
through Wetzel County. We are requesting information regarding the location of all Wellhead 
Protection areas that are within one-mile or crosses the proposed TL-492 EXT3. 

The proposed pipeline crosses onto the Hundred Quadrangle. Drawing (2000-177-40-A053) is 
attached to show the exact proposed location of the pipeline for your use. 

If you have any questions concerning the location request or require additional information, 
please contact Mr. Kent Cockley or myseff at (412) 476-2000. Your timely response to this 
would be greatly appreciated. 

Sincerely, 
GAI Consultants, Inc. 

Precha Yodnane, Ph.D., P.E. 
Project Manager 

PY:KF:MLSfJco 
0417740-~'-¢~1st]¢o41 

A~.m~ments 

v 

irgh Offlca 385 East Waterfront Ddve Homestead, PA 15120-5005 T 412.476.2000 F 412.476.2020 www.galconsultan~.com 
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Steven Crescenzo - Re: Wetze] Count~ Wellhead Protection Parle i 

From: 
To: 
Data: 
Subject: 

"J Feng" <jfengG~Nvdhhr.org> 
<m gaydash@gaiconsultants.com> 
01112/2005 4:02:59 PM 
Re: Wetzel County Wellhead Protection 

There Is no public water system near your project area. The c~osest one 
is the Hundred Littleton PSD, which is about 4 miles south-west to the 
end of the pipeline in Wetzel county. I will send you a letter after I 
receive your request. 

V 

Jonathan Feng, Ph.D. 
GIS Administrator - Source Water Assessment Program 

West Virginia Department of Health and Human Resources 
Bureau for Public Health 
Office of Environmental Health Services 
Environmental Engineering Division 

Capitol and Washington Streets 
1 Davis Square, Suite 200 
Charleston, West Virginia 25301-1798 
Charleston, WV 25301 
jfeng@wvdhhr.org 
(304) 558-6764 

>>> "Mandy Gaydash" <m.gaydash(~gaiconsultants.com> 1112/2005 3:45:31 PM 
> > >  

Dear Mr. Feng, 

As per our conversation on Tuesday, January 11, I have attached a 
shapefile depicting the proposed TL-492 Ext 3 pipeline that runs from 
Greene County, Pennsylvania into Wetzel County, WV. I have sent Mr. 
Wiltiam Tommey an official letter that will be arriving at your old 
address. Please use this shapefile to complete our request. 

The shapefile (s in the UTM, NAO 1983, Zone 17, FootUS coordinate 
system. 

Thanks for your time, 

Mandy 

P.S. I will be out of the office for the next two weeks. Please send 
a~ e-mall responses regarding this request to Krlsty Fiavin 
(k. flavin@galconsultants.com). 

V 

Mandy Gaydash Seade 
Senior Environmental Specialist 
Pittsburgh Office 
385 East Waterfront Drive 
Homestead, PA 15120-5005 
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Steven Cres,cenzo,,- Re,{,Wetzel C,ount~ Wellhead Protection . . . .  P,a,~]e 2| 

m.gaydash@gaiconsultants.com 

Phone: 412.476.2000 
Main Fax: 412.476.2020 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTtCE 
The documents and materials transmitted herewith contain confidential 
and proprietary information belonging to the sender and are ~egally 
privileged. They are solely for the use of their intended recipient 
If 
you are not the intended recipient or the person responsible for 
delivering e-mail to the intended recipient, you have received this 
e-mail in error. Inform the sender of the error and remove this 
e-mail 
from your system. If this transmission includes design data and 
recommendations, they are provided only as a matter of convenience and 
should not be used for final design and/or construction. 

V 

V 
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Steven Crescenzo - Wetze l  County Wel lhead  Protection 

From: 
To: 
Date: 
Subject: 
CC: 

Mandy Gaydash 
j f~ng~wvdhhr.org 
01/12/2005 3:45 PM 
W~z~l County Wellhead Protecedon 
Cocldey, Kent; Cresceazo, Steve**; Flavin, Kristy 

Dear Mr. Fcng, 

As per our conversation on Tuesday, Sanuary 1 l, I have attached a shapefde depicting the proposed TL-492 Ext 3 pipeline 
that runs from Greene County, P~nsylvmfia into Wetzel County, WV. I have sent Mr. William Tommey an official letter 
that will be arriving at your old ~ldress. Ple,~qe use this shapcfile to complete our request. 

The shapcfile is in the UTM, NAD 1983, Zone 17, Foot_US coordinate system. 

T'n=nk~ f'qr yea,r time _ . . . . . . . . . . . .  

Mandy 

P.S. I will be out of the offi¢~ for the next two we.~ks. Plea~ send all e-marl responses regarding this w.,qu¢~ to 
Flavin (k. flavin@ aaic ons uRants .coral. 

q • f n d y  Gayd~h Sesrle 
Senior Environmental Specialist 
Pimb~rgh Office 
385 East Water~ont Drive 
Homestead, PA 15120-5005 
m.g.avdash(~g.a/consultan is.corn 

Phone: 412.476.2000 
Fax: 412476.2020 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
The documents and materiJds transmitted herewith contain cxmfidential and propr/etary inform~io~ belenging to the sender 
amd are legally privileged. They are solely for the use of their intended recipienL If you are not the intended recipient or the 
person responsible for delivering e-mail to the intended recipient, you have received this e-mail in error. Inform the sender 
of the error and remove ~ e-mail from your system. If  this transmission includes design data and recommendations, they 
~'e provided only as a matter of convenience and should not be used for final design and/or ~ i o n .  

v 

file:llC:\TEMP~GW} 0000 I . H T M  02/10/2005 
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APPENDIX 2-A 

CORRESPONDENCE FOR THE TL-536 PIPEUNE 

v 
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Pennsylvania Department of Environmental Protection " 

+ + 

Rachel Carson State Office Building 
P.O. Box 8555 

Harrisburg, PA 171.05-8555 
October 26 , 2004 

Bureau of Watershed Management 717-787:5259 

GAI Consultants, Inc. 
Attm P~-ccha Yodnan~ 
385 East warm-front Driw 
Homestead, PA 15120-5005 

t(¢: Location of Public Water Supply Sourccs and Surface Water Users 
Dominion T r y . "  sion Inc. - Proposed TL-536 Extension1 P/pelkm 
Potter Couaty,' Peamsylvaaia 

2 ¢t " 

Dear Mr. Y.oda~: 

The Bureau of W ~  Management has completed your r ~  for information regarding tlm 
~ o c a t i o n  of public water supply (PWS) groundwater wells within a one-mile radius of  the pipeline and 

PWS surface water intakes and private smfa~  watt, users within t h r~  miles d o ~  on watcz 
bodies that cross the proposed TL-536 extension pipeline. Tim analysis included PW~ sources within 
the vicinity of the proposed ~ v s i o n  as identified on the Oswayo and EUisburg,.Pa 7.5-minut~ 
quadrangles. Based upon our GIS database, there am'no (0) PWS groundwater wells located within a 
one-mile radius of the proposed TL-536 extension pi i~l i~  and no (0) PWS ~ water intakes or 
private surface water users located within three miles downstream of the pipeline. 

The Deparancat is ourrcmly evaluating tl~ acCutaoy of our c0dsting GIS database mgarcting 
P.WS source locations, This location request should be verified with the appropriate regional or district 
o~ce. 

Tim I ) ~ n t  promotes the establishmemt and dclineation o f a  w~llhead protection area to 
protect publio wate~ supplies from contamination For your inforn~fion, current ~-~lations define 
wellhead protection areas as follows: 

V 

Zo~ I - Th~ protvotivv zone ~ l y  surrounding a well spring or 
hxfiltmti~ g~Ika-y which shall by a I00 - 400 foot radius depending on 
sitv-spccif~ som~ and aquif~ chamct~dst~ 

- T h e z o ~  e m o ~ a s s i n s  t ~  portion of tim aquifer through which 
wme~ tq diverted to a weR or flo.ws to a spring or i~[]~-atk~ galk~y. 
Zone H shall be a one-l~R'mile radius arou~i the source u~ess a more 
~ c x i  c~1~m~Zion ~ ~ m v ~ L  
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• ~ - TI~ zone beyond Zon~ !I that contn%u~es ~ water and 
groundwater to Zone I and Zone If. 

In ligl~'ofzecent events, th~ Department of Environmont~ Prote~ion has temporarily suspended 
access to ~¢¢~-'iseIocations of any public water supply sources in~lud/ng intake.s, welIhe, ads, etc. as a 
pr(~r.anfionary a~dbm Due to.this restriction, t l~ Bureau Of Watershed Mauag6~ment is not permitted to 
release any maps showing the location (including latitude and longiiu~) of PWS wells or surface water 
intakes to the public. As stated abov~ our GIS databam indicates that them are no (0) public water 
supply groundwatez wells witKin a one-mile radius ofthe pipeline and no (0) sm'face wate~ intakes 
located within three miles do wnstre~ra of the !6ipelta¢. 

For infurmat/on regarding th~ location of  any private water supply v~Ils Within your project 
area/contact the Water Well Records Section of  the Bureau of Topographic and Geologic Survey at 

"" 717-702-2017 or visit their websit~ to ~ the PA Ground~.ter Information Sy~em (PaGWI8, online 
w&er well database) at ht~://www.dem'.st~e.pa.us/topogeo/groundwater/PaGWIS/PaGWISMain.asp. 

I f  you have any questions cOnCerning th~ location request or require additional information, i 
please contact me at 717-772-4050. 

Enslosur~ 

cc: • PADEP/NCKO/Wat~ Supply Management 

Sincerely, 

Aria  ProOf 
Geologic Specialist • 
Sourc~ Protection S~-tion 
Division of.Wate~st~ed Protection • 
Bureau of Watershed lvfanagemeut 

v 
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October 15, 2004 

Project C040177.40 

 g ai c o n s u l t a n t s  
~lnl£otmln9 ~n$ Into r tb l~ 

Ms. Arianne M. Proctor 
Source Protection Section 
Division of Watershed Protection 
Bureau of Watershed Management 
Rachael Carson State Office Building 
P.O. Box 8555 
Harrisburg, Pennsylvania 17105 

Dominion Transmission, Inc. 
Proposed TL 536 Extension I Pipeline 
Location of Downstream Surface Water Users 
Potter, Pennsylvania 

V 

Dear Ms. Proctor: 
GAl Consultants, Inc. (GAl) is preparing an application for the Federal Energy Regulatory Commission for 
a Dominion Transmission Inc. (DTI) natural gas pipeline project that passes through Potter County. All 
surface water intakes that are downstream of wated)ody crossings need to be Included. Therefore, we 
are requesting Information regarding the location of public water supply sources and surface water users 
that are less than three miles downstream on waterbodles that cross the proposed TL-536 extension 
pipeline. Also, we are requesting Information on munldpal water authorities that have public water supply 
wells within a one-mile radius of the pipeline. 

The quad sheets that cover the project area are Wellsville, NY; Oswayo, PA; Etllsburg, PA; and 
Allentown, NY, Drawings (2004-177-40-A057 through A060) are attached showing the exact proposed 
location of the pipeline for your use. 

If you have any questions concerning the location request or require additional Info~nation, please 
contact Lisa Keck or myself at 412.-476-2000. Your timely response to this request would be greatly 
appreciated. 

Sincerely, 
GAI Consultants, Inc. 

Precha Yodnane, Ph.D., P.E. 
Project Manager 

PY:MLQ/cwl 
o41774o-53~-~22 

Attachments 

V 

sburgh Omce 385 East Waterfront Drive Homestead, PA 15120-5005 T 41Z.J,76.2000 II = 412.476.2020 ww~.gaMo~s~mts.com 
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APPENDIX 2-A 

CORRESPONDENCE FOR THE TL-453 EXT1 PIPELINE 
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Pennsylvania Department of Environmental Protection 

Rachel Carson State •Office Building 
P.O. Box 85.55 

Harrisburg, PA 17105-8555 
• October 26, 2004 

Bureau of Watershed Management 717-787-5259 

GAI Consultants, Inc. 
Attn: Prcc.ha Yodnane 
385 East Waterfront Drive 
Homestead, PA 15120-5005 

• Re: Location of Public Water Supply Sou~. and Surf~e Water Users 
Dominion Transmission Inc. - Proposed TL-453 Extension I Pipeline 
Potte¢ County, P~nsylvania 

Dear Mr. Yodnane: 

The Bureau of Watershed Management has completed your request for information regarding the 
~PwsCation ofpublic w~t. er supply (P.WS) groundwater wells within a one-mile radins of the p~pcline and 

sur~ce water intakes and prtvz~ mn'fac~ w ~ r  users wRh/n three miles d o w n s t r ~  on ~ 
bodies tl~ crees the proposed TL-453 extension pipeline. The analysis included PWS som~es within 
the vic'mity of the proposed extension es identi~ed on the EIlisburg, Ulysses, and~n Valley, Pa 
7.5-minu~ quadrangles. Based upon our GIS database, there are no (13) PWS groundwater wells.located 
within a one-mile radius of the proposed TL-453.extensionpipeline and no (0) PWS sin-face water 
intakes or private surface water us¢~ located within'three miles downstream of the pipeline. 

The D e ~  is curre~ly evaluath38 the accuracy of our existing OIS databese regarding 
PWS source locations. This location request ~ u l d  be ~ = i f i ~  with the appropriale regional or district 
o~ic6. 

The I ~  promotes the establishme~ Ar~l delineafidn of a wellhead protec6on area to 
protect public water supplies from c o ~ ~  For your h~form~, n, cmrent regulations.define 
welIhmd Iz~tectio n areas as follows: 

Z o ~  I - Tho ~ zor¢ ~ l y  su=ou~ding a wen, spdng or 
infilma/on g~e ry  wI~ch shall be a 100 - 400 foot rsdins depend/ng on 

• site-spec/fic source and aquifer characteristics. 

V 

• ~ - T ~ m ~  ~ o . ~ u s ~  ~ po~ion o f ~  a q u ~  ~ u g h  which 
w a d i s  d i v = ~  ~ a wdl.or f l o ~  to a s p ~ g  or infi~r~io, gaH=y. 
Z o ~  H shall be a oz~-balfmi~ radius around the sour~ u n l ~  a more 
deta/led &I /noa~n  is approved. 
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-. The zone beyond Zone H that' contributes surface water and 
• • ~oundw'~e~ to Zone I and Zone IL 

In  light of re~mt ewnt% tho D c p a r t ~  ofEnvironme.nml Prote~.'0n has t~porarily suspe~cle~i 
access to l~ecis~ Ioc~ions of any publ/.c water supply sources indu~ug ~ ,  w ~ ,  etc. as a 
precautionary action, Due to ~ restriction, tl~ B~re~u of W a t ~ l ~  ,Management is not pertained to  
mlea~ any maps showing the location (including latitude and long,uric) of PWS weds or surface water 
inf~e~ to fl~ public. As  stated ~)o~., our GL.~ ~ fi~dicatcs that t.her¢ arc no (0) public w ~ s r  
supply ~oundwater wells w/thin a ono-m~e radius ofth~ pipd/ne and no (0) surface wa/ar/ntakes 
Iocale~ within tliree miles downstream of the p~peHn~. ' . 

For information regm-ding the location of auy private wa~ supply Wells w/th/n your project 
area, contact tho Wat¢~ Well Records Se-~or/of the Bureau of Topographic and Geologic.Survey at 
717-702-2017 or v/sit the/r Webs/te to access the P~I Groundwater .~formarion ,5~ystem f'PaGW~, online 
water wel~ database) at http://%~w.dcm,state.pa.us/topoge,9/groundwat~/PaGWIS/PaGWISMain.as p. 

If you haw qu tions conc aing lo tion or require additbnal. n, 
please contact me at 717-772-4050. " .. 

Enclo~.u~ 

CO: P A D ~ C R O / W a ~  Supply Mmage~nt  

Arianne M. Proctor 
Geologic Spedal/st 
Source Protection Section . 
Division of Watemhe~Protection 
Bureau ofWat~Ixxl Mauagcm~t .  
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 g a i  c o n s u l t a n t s  

~ r m l n g  Ig~Nil ~ re~flty 

October 15, 2004 

Project C040177.4.O 

Ms. Artanne M. Proctor 
so = Prot= n se on 
Dtvlslon of Watershed Protec~on 
Bunmu of Wa~rshed Management 
Rachael Carson State Office Building 
P.O. Box'8555 
Harrisburg, Pennmjlvanla 17105 

Dominion Transmission, Inc. 
Proposed TL-453 F_xtenslon 1 Pipeline 
LocaUon of Downstmem Suffuse Water Users 
Potter County, Pennsyhranla 

Dear Ms. ~ n  
GAI Consultant6, in~,. (GAI) is prepa~g an appflcaffon for ff~e Federid Energy Regulatory Commission for 
a Dominion Transmlsslon Inc. (DTI) natural g~  pipeline project that passes lhmugh Potter .County. All 
surface water intake~ that are downstream of watedoody o"o~lngs need to be Included. Then#ore, we 
am requesting (nformatlon regarding ~e location of pubic water supply souroes emd s u ~  water users 
that are less than three miles downstream on waterbodles that Gross the proposed T1..-663 extension 
l ~ e .  A~so, we ~ re~.,~ng ~donnat~on on mun]clp~d warm a ~  ~ t  have publM warm" suppty 
we~J w~dn a one-m~e radius of the l~¢~Ine. 

The quad sheets that cover the project area are Bllsburg, PA; Ulysses, PA; and Hanlson Valley, PA. 
(2004-177-40-A061 through A065) am sttad'~ed showlng the sxsct proposed location of the 

pipeline for your use. 

ff:~ou have any quesUons con~rnlng the Io~tion request ¢x require additional Information, plea,se 
oontact L~m Keck or my~M~f at 412.-476-2000. Your lime~y respo~e to this request woukl be greatly 
appred~te~. 

GAJ CorBultanla, Inc. 

~ Y~:lnane, F~.D., P.E. 

PY:MLG/mlm 

Attactunems 

I ~ h  O ~  3iL~ ~ Wmt~rfroclt DHv~ H0mes~ld, PA 15120-S00S T 41.2.476.2000 F 412.476.2020 www.allconsut~nts.corn 
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APPENDIX 2-B 

SPILL PREVENTION, CONTAINMENT AND CONTROL PLAN 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 
APPENDIX 2-B 

SPILL PREVENTION, CONTAINMENT AND CONTROL PLAN 

V 

V 

2-B.1 SPILL PREVENTION METHODS 

Construction activities related to natural gas pipelines and aboveground facilities 
sometimes require storage of hazardous and non-hazardous products and wastes. All 
efforts will be made to prevent spills of any amount of these products. The scope of this 
plan is intended to cover activities related to construction of aboveground facilities, 
associated pipelines and appurtenances. The following items will be followed to help 
avoid spills and minimize the impact of spills that accidentally occur:. 

Bulk quantities of both diesel fuel and gasoline may be stored at the work area in 
aboveground tanks, which will be diked, or smaller containers. Secondary 
containment will also be provided for leading/unloading areas. No underground 
tanks will be used. A Material Safety Data Sheet (MSDS) for each hazardous 
material will be on site. 

Fuel will be stored at the equipment staging area and as much equipment as 
practical will be refueled there. Any equipment that must be refueled in the field 
will be fueled from tanks carded to the work area. 

Lesser quantities of fuel and solvents and lubricants (i.e., motor oils, hydraulic 
fluid) may be stored at the work area as necessary to service equipment 
provided that this storage does not conflict with other parts of this plan. 

All fuel storage areas will be located at least 200 feet from active private water 
wells, and at least 400 feet from municipal water wells. Equipment servicing, 
lubricating, and refueling will also be in accordance with these requirements 
whenever possible. 

Use of hazardous materials for vehicle maintenance will follow the same 
requirements mentioned above for equipment refueling. Impervious or sorbent 
materials will be placed under the work area before the work begins. Additional 
sorbent materials will also be readily available. Waste materials created during 
maintenance (i.e., used oil) will be collected for proper disposal. The work site 
and the vehicle will be inspected after the maintenance work is complete to 
ensure that all hazardous materials are propedy contained. All waste material, 
including partially used or empty containers, discarded parts, dirty rags, and used 
sorbent material, as well as discarded hazardous materials containers (i.e., oil 
cans, grease tubes) will be collected and placed in open-top drums for proper 
dL x aL 

All motor fuel, lube oil, chemicals, and other polluting substances will be tightly 
sealed and clearly labeled during transportation and storage. 

2B-1 
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Fuel trucks, pumps, mechanics' vehicles, and contractor personnel vehicles will 
be equipped with spill kits containing absorbent materials approved for petroleum 
products. 

Runoff resulting from construction equipment washing operations will not be 
permitted to directly enter any waterbody or wetland area. 

Construction equipment, vehicles, materials, hazardous materials, chemicals, 
fuels, lubricating oils, and petroleum products will not be parked, stored, or 
serviced within 100 feet of all water bodies and wetlands. 

All equipment will be inspected daily for leaks prior to beginning work in water 
bodies or in wetlands. Steps will be taken to repair leaks or remove the 
equipment from service, if necessary. 

2-B.2 MITIGATION AND CLEANUP METHODS 

In the event of a spill into or in the vicinity of water bodies or wetlands, the following will 
Occur:. 

• the source will be immediately stopped; 

• the spill will be contained by placing sorbent booms or constructing dikes; 

the spill will be collected with sorbent materials, skimmed off water surfaces with 
booms, and/or the contaminated soil will be excavated; and 

• the waste materials will be properly disposed in accordance with DTrs policy. 

The affected areas will be restored as closely as possible to their previous condition. 
Spills of oil or petroleum products should be reported immediately to the Environmental 
Services Department at DTI at 304-627-3000 (available 24 hours). Environmental 
Services will contact the State and Federal environmental agencies for notification 
requirements. If personnel in the Environmental Services section cannot be contacted, 
then the Project Supervisor should make the necessary notifications. 

A reportable release is a quantity or an unknown quantity of regulated substance 
released to or posing an immediate threat to surface water, groundwater, bedrock, soil 
or sediment. The term does not include the following, provided the owner or operator 
has control over the release, the release is completely contained, and within 24 hours of 
the release, the total volume of the release is recovered or removed in the corrective 
action: 

W 

2B-2 
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a release to the interstitial space of a double-walled above ground or 
underground storage tank; 

a release of less than 25 gallons to a containment area, structure or facility 
around an above ground storage tank; 

a release of less than five gallons to a synthetic surface, such as asphalt or 
concrete, which prevents migration of the regulated substance to surface water, 
groundwater, bedrock, soil or sediment; and 

• a release of less than one-gallon to surface soils. 

All reportable releases defined above must be reported to the appropriate state and 
federal agencies as soon as practicable, but no later than two hours after the 
confirmation of a reportable release. Telephone numbers for appropriate state and 
federal agencies are listed below in Section 2-B.3. 

Owners end operators must provide written notification to the appropriate regional office 
and to the county emergency management agency within 15 days of the reportable 
release. An Environmental Incident Report form is included, and should be submitted in 
accordance with the above listed requirements. For spills not deemed reportable, it is 
strongly recommended that the facts concerning the incident be documented and a 
record maintained for one year. If a spill should occur, immediate action will be taken to 
ensure that the impact of the spill is minimized, and to see that appropriate cleanup 
action is immediately undertaken. 

2-B.3 STATE AND FEDERAL AGENCY CONTACT INFORMATION 

2-B.3.1 PL-1 EXT2 Pipeline 

Pennsylvania 

PaDEP Central Office (Harrisburg): 800-541-2050 
(available 24 hours/day, 7 days/week) 

PaDEP Southcentral Regional Office: 717-705-4700 

PaDEP Northcentral Regional Office: 570-327-3636 

Emergency Management Directors: 

Juniata County: 717-436-2181 

Mifflin Counly:. 717-248-9645 
717-248-9607 

2B-3 
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Emergency Management Directors (continued): 

Huntingdon County: 

Centre County: 

Clinton County: 

Federal 

National Response Center:. 

2-B.3.2 TL-492 EXT3 Pipeline 

Pennsylvania 

PaDEP Central Office (Harrisburg): 

PaDEP Southcentral Regional Office: 

Emergency Management Director:. 

Greene County: 

West Virginia 

Office of Emergency Services: 

Wetzel County: 

Department of Environmental Protection: 

Federal 

National Response Center. 

2-B.3.3 TL-536 Pipeline 

Pennsylvania 

PaDEP Central Office (Harrisburg): 

PaDEP Northcentral Regional Off'w,e: 

814-643-6613 
814-643-6617 

814-355-6745 

570-893-4090 

800-424-8802 

800-541-2050 
(available 24 hour~day, 7 days/week) 

717-705-4700 

417-869-6040 

304-558-5380 

304-455-8224 

304-558-5929 

800-424-8802 

800-541-2050 
(available 24 hours/day, 7 days/week) 

570-327-3636 

2B-4 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 

V 

Emergency Management Directors: 

Potter County: 

Federal 

National Response Center. 

2-B.3.4 TL-453 EXT1 Pipeline 

Pennsylvania 

PaDEP Central Office (Harrisburg): 

PaDEP Northcentral Regional Office: 

Emergency Management Directors: 

Potter County: 

Federal 

National Response Center:. 

814-274-8900 

800-424-8802 

800-541-2050 
(available 24 hours/day, 7 days/week) 

570-327-3636 

814-274-8900 

800-424-8802 

V 

2B-5 
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CG5 t 222 6~99 

,-1 P N G  rl C N G T  , - I  E O G  D H G I  13 V N G  

Envlrenmestal Spill Repert 

Divislon Date of Spill 

District 

Location 

Materml(s) Spilled (Attach MSI3S) 

Person Discovering Spill 

Quantity 0el ) SptJled 

Time and Duration of Spill - - - - - -  

Courtly State 

Date of Reporl 

Phooe No. of Person Discovering Spill 

Did Sp~! Reach • Stream or Lake or other sertshlve envkonmeats? 

Effect on l~Ish and Wiklllfe 

Quautlty. 

Exhting Poss~le Hazards or lnJer~ to People 

Ctute of Spit/ 

Actions Taken to Control Spill 

Action to Prevmt Future Spiils 

Rem~ks: 

V 

V 

~ o J  B N ~ M ~ F A I .  ~l~Pdt~tINF4ylt'ILg faI-OIVLY:.'~NM~ONMP~NFAL J[Jp,q~II~tI~CTAI'~ WII.L.t~Or£FI ~ ,~IO~..4 rORT.AOINCLA~! 

REPORTABLE SPILL - -  YES _ _  NO 

If lttpOrtahtl: 
Date / r~e  Reported to 
National Re, ponse Center: (1-800424-8S02 or 1-202-t26-2675) 

Da:e/rlme Reported to 

REPORTABLE QUANTITY 

Control Number 
Pax (1.202-267-2165) 

N~ne of Offio~l 

State Bmc:leacy Response Commission~ (See Facility Envkonmemal En~jrocy Plan for Phone Number) 

Date/rime Reported to Name of Oft~ial 

Local B~eq~e~7 Rmponse C~nte~. (See FscitLty ~vkonmamtal Emerlemcy p~ma for Phone Number) 

Date/rime Reported to Name of Officim 

REPORTED BY Pbone Number of Person Reporting Spill 

Itsatln I lattruct/oaa: Ret1~n Orlglaal at O r ~ a t i n  B l.ecmloD; P u  • Copy to E~vlmnme~ta| 
Ol t~I tODUCg THIS FORM AS REQUm]~)) 
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NON-INTERNET PUBLIC INFORMATION 

V 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. PIPELINES 

EXHIBIT F-1 
ENVIRONMENTAL REPORT 
DOCKET NO. CP05-_ -000 

APPENDIX 2-C FOR PL-1 EXT2 

ACCESS ROAD MAPPING 

(UNDER SEPARATE COVER) 
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NON-INTERNET PUBLIC INFORMATION 

V 

COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. PIPEUNES 

EXHIBIT F-1 
ENVIRONMENTAL REPORT 
DOCKET NO. CP05- -000 

APPENDIX 2-C FOR TL-492 EXT3 

ACCESS ROAD MAPPING 

(UNDER SEPARATE COVER) 



Jnofflclal FERC-Generated PDF of 20050421-0185 Received by FERC OSEC 04/15/2005 in Docket#: CP05-131-000 

V 

NON-INTERNET PUBLIC INFORMAT|ON 
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COVE POINT EXPANSION PROJECT 
DOMINION TRANSMISSION, INC. PIPELINES 

EXHIBIT F-1 
ENVIRONMENTAL REPORT 
DOCKET NO. CP05- -000 

APPENDIX 2-C FOR TL-536 

ACCESS ROAD MAPPING 

(UNDER SEPARATE COVER) 

V 


